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Preface 

It is with both pride and sadness that we publish the twentieth and last 
volume of Advances in Clinical Child Psychology. This series has seen a long 
and successful run starting under the editorship of Ben Lahey and Alan 
Kazdin, who passed the baton to us at Volume 14. We are grateful to the 
many contributors over the years and to the Plenum staff for producing a 
quality product in a timely manner. 

This volume covers a diverse array of significant topics. In the open­
ing chapter, Maughan and Rutter explore the research literatures related to 
continuity and discontinuity of antisocial behavior from childhood to 
adulthood. Their review and conceptualization emphasize the significance 
of hyperactivity and inattention, early-onset conduct problems, low reac­
tivity to stress, and poor peer relations as potentially influential variables 
in the persistence of antisocial behavior. Social cognitions, environmental 
continuities, substance abuse, cumulative chains of life events, and protec­
tive processes are considered as well. 

The next two chapters address outcome and process in child and 
adolescent psychotherapy research. Weisz, Huey, and Weersing consider a 
broad range of factors connected to therapy outcome. Their conceptualiza­
tion takes into account the therapies, the therapists' contributions, and the 
children's role in affecting outcome. A major part of this chapter addresses 
ethnicity and culture of treated children and their families in relation to 
effectiveness, matching, and contextual influences. Russell and Shirk re­
view process research for child psychotherapy. Relative to studies of treat­
ment outcome, psychotherapy process has been the ignored stepchild of 
child psychotherapy research. This chapter discusses empirical research 
on what actually transpires between therapist and child during their face­
to-face meetings in clinical sessions. Although not yet extensive, the re­
search is exciting and points to important relations between pathogenic 
processes in children and psychotherapy processes in treatment. The 
"match" between pathogenic and treatment processes is well articulated. 

Foote, Eyberg, and Schuhmann focus on parent-child interaction 
approaches to the treatment of child behavior problems. By addressing 
family relationships, treatment gains with children for oppositional defi­
ant disorder and early-onset conduct disorder might be sustained more 
readily than what can be accomplished with child-oriented approaches. 

The next three chapters address pediatric issues. Rietveld and Prins 
analyze biomedical and psychological factors influencing children's per­
ceptions of physical symptoms, using asthma as the primary example. 
Their insightful analysis has implications for conceptualization, assess-

vii 



viii PREFACE 

ment, and etiological models of psychophysiological problems that chil­
dren encounter. Budd and Chugh provide a thorough review of common 
feeding problems in younger children. Their chapter addresses definitions 
of eating problems, common etiologies, assessment considerations, and 
management approaches. March and Albano describe new developments 
in assessing pediatric anxiety disorders. They evaluate self-report mea­
sures, diagnostic interviews, and behavioral assessment methods, and 
then discuss the role of neuroscience in emerging developmental concep­
tualizations related to child anxiety. 

Chapter 8 by Ayers, Sandler, and Twohey is an exhaustive review 
regarding the conceptualization and measurement of coping in children 
and adolescents. Their review carefully addresses not only the wide vari­
ety of measures and assessment methods but also the extent to which 
situational analysis of coping is incorporated into theory and method. 

The final chapter, by Pumariega and Glover, covers the emerging area 
of services delivery research for children, adolescents, and their families. 
They describe current approaches and ongoing projects, discuss antici­
pated developments in large system studies and in methodology, and 
project what the future needs and benefits will be for child mental health 
services research. 

We want to take this opportunity to especially thank Mariclaire 
Cloutier and Eliot Werner at Plenum for their support over the years; 
however, our involvement with Plenum is far from over. We are pleased to 
announce that the spirit of the Advances series is being continued in a new 
Plenum journal, Clinical Child and Family Psychology Review, which begins 
in 1998. This new journal will publish reviews, conceptual and theoretical 
papers, and related work in the broad area of the behavioral sciences 
pertaining to infants, children, adolescents, and families. Contributions 
will come from many disciplines, including but not limited to psychology 
(clinical, community, developmental, family, school), medicine (family 
practice, pediatrics, psychiatry), public health, social work, and education. 
Topical content includes science and application, and may cover facets of 
etiology, assessment, description, treatment/intervention, prevention, 
methodology, and public policy. Contributions are by invitation only. The 
editors in consultation with the Editorial Board invite highly qualified 
authors to contribute on topics of timely interest and significance. Al­
though solicited, all manuscripts are peer-reviewed and edited. Sugges­
tions for topics and potential contributors are welcome and should be 
submitted to the editors. 

THOMAS H. OLLENDICK 

RONALD J. PRINZ 
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1 Continuities and 
Discontinuities in Antisocial 

Behavior from Childhood 
to Adult Life 

BARBARA MAUGHAN AND MICHAEL RUTTER 

1. Introduction 

Much adult psychopathology has its roots in childhood difficulties; no­
where is that tendency more apparent than in the antisocial domain. From 
the time of the first long-term follow-ups (Robins, 1966, 1978) it has been 
clear that most severely antisocial adults have long histories of disruptive 
and deviant behavior reaching back to childhood. Yet these same studies 
also highlighted an apparent paradox: looking forward from childhood, 
the picture was a rather different one. Most conduct-disordered children 
did not grow up to be severely antisocial adults, and for many, discon­
tinuity, rather than continuity, seemed the more usual course. 

The identification of the mechanisms that account for these patterns 
constitutes a central challenge for developmental psychopathology. Which 
early risks or intervening processes contribute to the long-term persistence 
of antisocial problems in some individuals but allow an apparently more 
benign course in others? Do the majority of antisocial children indeed 
"recover" before adulthood, or do they too face continuing vulnerabilities, 
albeit of a less severe or possibly different kind? And can these varying 
developmental trajectories help us understand the underlying hetero-

BARBARA MAUGHAN AND MICHAEL RUITER • MRC Child Psychiatry Unit and Social, Ge­
netic, and Developmental Psychiatry Research Centre, Institute of Psychiatry, DeCrespigny 
Park, London SE5 SAF, England. 

Advances in Clinical Child Psychology, Volume 20, edited by Thomas H. Ollendick and Ronald J. 
Prinz. Plenum Press, New York, 1998. 
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2 BARBARA MAUGHAN AND MICHAEL RUITER 

geneity within the population of antisocial children, and so illuminate 
classifications of childhood disorders? These questions form the main 
focus of this chapter. 

2. Conceptual and Methodological Issues 

2.1. Heterogeneity 

To begin, we need to consider a number of conceptual and methodo­
logical issues. The first concerns the heterogeneity of antisocial behaviors 
(Rutter, 1997a; Rutter et aI., in press-b). At one extreme, for example, the 
majority of young people are involved in occasional illegal acts; at the 
other, a minority show long-term, persistent difficulties that span not only 
criminality but also severe dysfunction in many life domains (Robins, Tipp, 
& Przybeck, 1991). No one doubts these variations, but opinions differ 
widely on their meaning. Some investigators have argued that aU manifes­
tations of antisocial behavior are best viewed in terms of a single under­
lying syndrome or propensity (Gottfreson & Hirschi, 1990; Jessor & Jessor, 
1977). Others have dealt with the variation in terms of factorially derived 
dimensions involving concealing behaviors (such as theft) and confron­
tational/ aggressive acts (Loeber & Schmaling, 1985) or the presence/ 
absence of destructiveness (Frick et aI., 1993). 

Psychiatric classifications, by contrast, have sought to subdivide dis­
ruptive or antisocial behavior into discrete syndromes. Thus distinctions 
are drawn between oppositional defiant disorder (ODD, involving nega­
tive, hostile, and defiant behavior); conduct disorder (CD, characterized 
by violation of the rights of others and by bullying, cruelty, firesetting, and 
stealing); and hyperkinetic/ attention-deficit disorder, defined in terms of 
hyperactivity, impulsivity, and overactivity (American Psychiatric Asso­
ciation, 1994; World Health Organization, 1992). Further subdivisions are 
made according to whether the antisocial behavior is socialized or un­
socialized, or according to age at onset. The World Health Organization 
(WHO) system, ICD-10, also recognizes the frequent co-occurrence of 
conduct problems with other patterns of psychopathology by introducing 
separate mixed categories for conduct disorder that are associated with 
hyperkinetic disorder or depression. The high rates of comorbidity be­
tween disruptive disorders and a range of other diagnoses (Hinshaw, 1992; 
Hinshaw, Lahey, & Hart, 1993; Loeber & Keenan, 1994; Zoccolillo, 1992) 
raise crucial classification issues (Caron & Rutter, 1991; Nottelman & 
Jensen, 1995). On the one hand, they may suggest boundary problems in 
current diagnostic systems; on the other, co-occurring patterns of symp-
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tomato logy may be of key significance for etiology and outcome. From 
other perspectives again, there have been proposals to classify antisocial 
behaviors according to age at onset (DiLalla & Gottesman, 1989; Moffitt, 
1993a; Patterson & Yoerger, 1993, in press). And most recently, behavior 
genetic strategies have begun to identify subtypes varying in their degrees 
of heritable and environmental risk (Silberg et al., 1996). In the face of these 
contrasting models, we have not organized this review according to any 
specific diagnostic distinctions, but have aimed instead to consider their 
validity in terms of the longitudinal findings we survey. 

2.2. Categories and Dimensions 

A closely related issue, still unresolved, concerns whether antisocial 
behaviors are best conceptualized as qualitatively distinct categories or 
varying admixtures of dimensional traits and risks (Cantwell & Rutter, 
1994; Clark, Watson, & Reynolds, 1995; Waldman, Lilienfield, & Lahey, 
1995). Although much existing literature is premised on categorical 
models, it is far from clear that this is in fact the most appropriate stance. 
Studies in both medicine and psychology suggest that behaviors can 
function dimensionally for some purposes but categorically for others. 
Clearly categorical outcomes (such as the occurrence of a heart attack) may 
have their origins in dimensional variables (such as cholesterol levels), and 
clinically important dimensions can often be identified within quali­
tatively distinct disease categories. Diagnostic assessments of childhood 
disorders show considerable overlap with dimensional syndrome scores 
(Gould, Bird, & Jaramillo, 1993; Jensen et al., 1996), and, as we discuss in 
more detail later, subclinical levels of difficulty frequently show correlates 
and consequences similar to those of more severe disorder categories. 
From a methodological perspective, dimensional approaches offer greater 
power, and categorical models are sensitive to threshold variations (Far­
rington, 1991). In some instances, however, especially when constellations 
of factors are· examined, categorical models can have considerable force 
(Magnusson & Bergman, 1990). At this stage, the issue is an empirical one, 
and longitudinal data offer one important means of testing alternative 
formulations. 

2.3. Continuity and Change 

Turning to questions of continuity and change, several rather different 
concepts need to be examined in studies of behavioral development (Ka­
gan, 1980; Rutter, 1987). First, there is the question of normative consistency, 
or the stability of individual differences over time. In relation to antisocial 
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behaviors, such stability is high. Olweus (1979) estimated disattentuated 
correlations of .60 for measures of aggression over 10-year age spans in 
childhood and early adulthood, with relatively stable individual differ­
ences in aggressive tendencies evident from the preschool years. This con­
sistency extends beyond measures of phenotypically similar behaviors; 
heterotypic continuity (Kagan, 1969)-whereby differing, but conceptually 
coherent, indicators of antisocial tendencies are related across develop­
ment-is also strong. Huesmann, Eron, Lefkowitz, and Walder (1984), for 
example, reported significant correlations between peer-nominated ag­
gression at age 8 and the number and seriousness of convictions, rates of 
drunk driving, and harsh physical punishment of children over 20 years 
later. Rydelius (1988) documented markedly increased risks of violent 
death among previously incarcerated delinquents. Numerous other studies, 
using a range of different indicators, have reached similar conclusions; 
individual differences in antisocial and aggressive tendencies are rela­
tively stable across development. Equally important, this is so even over 
developmental age periods when the overall level of antisocial behavior is 
rising-as in early adolescence-or falling sharply, as in early adulthood 
(Farrington, 1990). 

These age trends form a second key part of the backdrop to studies of 
individual development. Probably the best-known example here is the 
age-crime curve. Beginning at the age of criminal responsibility, rates of 
recorded male crime show a gradual increase over the early teens, a sharp 
rise in the later teens, then an equally sharp decline in the midtwenties. 
Studies of offenders reveal a similar pattern. In the United Kingdom, for 
example, less than 5% of males are convicted of offenses in the early teens 
and again in the mid twenties, but some 12% of young men are likely to be 
involved with the criminal justice system in their late teenage years (Far­
rington, 1992; Home Office, 1995). Self-reports highlight a similar pattern, 
suggesting that illegal behaviors are so common as to be virtually norma­
tive among boys in adolescence (Elliott, Ageton, Huizinga, Knowles, & 
Canter, 1983). Although age trends in disruptive and antisocial disorders 
have been less systematically documented, they too show a marked ado­
lescent peak. Before age 11, rates of oppositional and conduct disorders 
occur at around 6% in boys and 2% in girls (Offord et a1., 1987). For both 
sexes, rates of oppositional disorders then rise to levels as high as 15-16% 
among 13- to 16-year-olds, with a sharp decline thereafter (Cohen et a1., 
1993b). Prevalence curves differ between the sexes in conduct disorder. 
Rates for boys fall after the early- to midteens, whereas those for girls 
increase to around age 16, then decline steeply. In early adulthood, some 
6% of males and 0.6% of females have been reported as meeting criteria for 
antisocial personality disorder (Newman, Moffitt, Caspi, Magdol, & Silva, 
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1996); rates fall further in the later adult years (Robins et al., 1991). Drug 
and alcohol disorders emerge for the first time in the late teens. They too 
show a marked male preponderance and a decline in prevalence with age 
across the adult years (Anthony & Helzer, 1991; Helzer, Burnham, & 
McEvoy, 1991). 

Individual trajectories will not, of course, necessarily follow this same 
pattern. Indeed, longitudinal studies of offending (Blumstein, Cohen, 
Roth, & Visher, 1986: Farrington, 1986a; Nagin, Farrington, & Moffitt, 1995) 
have highlighted the very different implications that emerge from cross­
sectional and longitudinal designs. Longitudinal analyses make clear that 
the adolescent peak in offending is composed of at least two elements: an 
increase in the prevalence of offenders, along with an adolescent increase in 
rates of offending among those already involved in crime (Farrington & 
West, 1993; Nagin et al., 1995). Alongside relatively stable individual differ­
ences in antisocial behaviors, the developmental picture also gives clear 
evidence of important within-individual change. 

2.4. Reports and Reporters 

Research on antisocial behaviors draws on a variety of accounts: 
reports from parents, teachers, and peers; self-reports; and official records. 
Multiple informants have been seen as essential in assessing child psycho­
pathology, yet epidemiologic studies have consistently found that agree­
ment among them is poor (Achenbach, McConaughy, & Howell, 1987). To 
some extent, these differences will reflect meaningful source variations: 
Some behaviors are situational, and others are only known to particular 
reporters. In addition, each source is prey to particular types of bias. These 
measurement issues are of central importance in all research on child 
psychopathology. In the present context, three main issues need to be 
stressed. First, different accounts may suggest quite different patterns of 
stability and change in antisocial behaviors. Self-reports, for example, 
suggest longer-term persistence in illegal activities and antisocial lifestyles 
in early adulthood than is reflected in official records (Graham & Bowling, 
1995; Nagin et al., 1995), and stability coefficients may differ depending on 
whether they are based on parent, teacher, or self-reports. Second, in 
longitudinal as in cross-sectional analyses, differing methods of combin­
ing reports may give rise to differing conclusions (Canino, Bird, Rubio­
Stipec, & Bravo, 1995). Third, attention to measurement error and method 
factors is crucial in deriving appropriate estimates of effects. In principle, 
analyses based on observed measures could either over- or underestimate 
the true extent of continuity. In practice, most empirical demonstrations to 
date have found higher levels of continuity when measurement error has 
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been taken into account (see, e.g., Fergusson, Horwood, & Lynskey, 1995; 
Zoccolillo, Pickles, Quinton, & Rutter, 1992). Latent class or latent variable 
models (Dunn, Everitt, & Pickles, 1993; Waldman et al., 1995) offer impor­
tant advantages here, though their assumptions may not always mirror the 
constructs investigators are aiming to test. Advances in both measurement 
and analytic strategies are central to progress in understanding behavioral 
development. 

One final reporting issue is more specific to longitudinal studies: the 
reliability of retrospective reports. Although prospective evidence on con­
tinuities in antisocial behaviors is expanding rapidly, large-scale retrospec­
tive studies of adult samples, such as the Epidemiologic Catchment Area 
studies (ECA; Robins & Regier, 1991), and the National Comorbidity Study 
(Kessler et al., 1994), continue to provide key data sources, especially for 
small or extreme groups. Direct tests of the reliability of retrospective 
reports of childhood problems remain limited (Maughan & Rutter, 1997). It 
seems likely that the presence or absence of childhood symptoms can be 
documented reliably in adulthood using appropriate interviewing styles 
(Holmshaw & Simonoff, 1996), but accuracy in the timing and dating of 
symptoms is much more questionable (Angold, Erkanli, Costello, & Rutter, 
1996), especially when recall is for events many years in the past. Retro­
spective accounts typically involve some "telescoping," with events 
brought closer to the present, or systematically moved further into the 
past, than contemporaneous reports suggest (Menard & Elliott, 1990; Sud­
man & Bradburn, 1973). Simulations (Guiffra & Risch, 1994) have shown 
how relatively small tendencies to forget events in the past could mimic 
true cohort effects, giving rise to spurious conclusions on secular trends. 
Although retrospective reports continue to provide important sources of 
data, we have, whenever possible, sought to confirm and complement 
them with prospectively ascertained accounts. 

2.5. Gender Differences 

Male gender is perhaps the best established correlate of antisocial 
behavior, and many (though not all) measures of antisocial difficulties 
show a marked male preponderance. In principle, these consistent gender 
differences could provide a rich source of hypotheses about the etiology 
and maintenance of conduct problems in both sexes. In practice, with only 
a few notable exceptions, the research literature to date has concentrated 
almost exclusively on males. As a result, it is still unclear how far gender 
differences in antisocial behavior reflect biosocial influences, differences in 
vulnerability to environmental adversity, or variations in parental rearing 
and cultural expectations. The dearth of empirical data is compounded by 
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concerns that current diagnostic criteria fail to detect behaviors relevant in 
assessing conduct disorder and its sequelae in girls (Zoccolillo, 1993). 
Loeber and Hay (1994) have charted early stages in the development of 
gender differences in aggression and conduct problems, and one of us 
(Rutter, Giller, & Hagell, in press-a) has recently summarized current 
evidence on the biological, social, and developmental factors that may 
contribute to evolving differences between the sexes in expressions of 
socially disapproved behaviors. In the present chapter, we have noted 
similarities and differences between the sexes in longer-term continuities 
in antisocial behavior so far as current data allow, in the hope that these 
will act as a stimulus to further research. At this stage, however, the 
important task of tracing the development of girls' antisocial behavior is 
only in its earliest stages. 

3. Continuity and Change: Longitudinal Findings 

With these issues in mind, we turn to a brief overview of existing 
longitudinal findings. Much early evidence centered on clinical and high­
risk samples, or community samples drawn from severely disadvantaged 
inner urban areas (Offord & Bennett, 1994). Much of the most detailed 
and informative evidence still comes from studies of this kind. More 
recently, however, these sources have been supplemented by large-scale 
retrospective investigations and by prospective follow-ups of more so­
cially representative groups. We begin by surveying evidence from "broad­
range" childhood-adult studies, examining adult outcomes for groups 
assessed at differing points in childhood. Then, to fill in the developmental 
picture, we provide a brief summary of continuities over more focused age 
periods. 

3.1. Broad-Range Childhood-Adult Studies 

Diagnostic criteria for antisocial disorders have been much influenced 
by Robins's (1966) early findings that the central adult outcome of child­
hood conduct problems lies in the pattern of severe antisocial difficulties, 
evident across domains of functioning, typified by antisocial personality 
disorder (ASPD). Taking this focus, both prospective and retrospective 
evidence has confirmed early studies with striking consistency. In replica­
tions of her original child guidance study, Robins (1978) found that the 
great majority of severely antisocial adults had shown similarly severe 
behavior problems in childhood. "New onset" of antisocial behavior in 
adulthood was infrequent, occurring in only 5-12% of cases. Looking 
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forward from childhood, persistence was much less strong; between 23% 
and 41% of severely antisocial children went on to become antisocial 
adults, but the majority, whatever the severity of their initial difficulties, 
seemed, on these criteria, to have "recovered." 

Very similar estimates emerged from retrospective reports of child­
hood conduct problems collected in the ECA studies (Robins et al., 1991). 
Rates of ASPD rose with the number of childhood symptoms but never 
went above half, even among those reporting multiple childhood prob­
lems. The number of childhood problems functioned dimensionally as a 
predictor of later disorder and was a better predictor than any individual 
type of early behavior problem. The same pattern of childhood-adult 
continuities held for both men and women, and across different age co­
horts, despite marked secular changes in overall rates of childhood diffi­
culties. Finally, early-onset conduct problems seemed especially ominous 
in terms of persistence: The average age at onset of the first childhood 
symptom was 8-9 years, and 80% of future cases reported occurrence of at 
least one symptom by age 11. 

Childhood conduct problems and aggression also show robust links 
with later offending (Farrington, Loeber, & Van Kammen, 1990a; Hama­
lainen & Pulkkinen, 1996; Huesmann et al., 1984; Magnusson, 1988; Moffitt, 
1994; Pulkkinen & Pitkanen, 1993; Robins, 1993; Stattin & Magnusson, 
1989). Here, much of the available evidence is prospectively ascertained 
and based on representative samples. Modest associations with early adult 
offending have been reported from behavioral observations made as early 
as age 3 (Caspi, Moffitt, Newman, & Silva, 1996), and later in childhood, 
stronger links are found. Stattin and Magnusson (1989), for example, ex­
amined associations between teacher ratings of aggression at ages 10 and 
13 and offending up to age 26 in a socially representative Swedish cohort. 
Among males, the majority of delinquents and recidivist offenders were 
drawn from early aggressive boys. Aggression predicted to violent crimes, 
damage to public property, and most strongly to diversified offense pat­
terns, including both acquisitive and other crimes. Among females, ag­
gression also predicted later offending, but only from age 13. 

For men, offense histories paint a similar picture. In U.s. samples, 
between 31% and 71% of juvenile offenders have some subsequent arrests 
in adult life (Blumstein et al., 1986), and comparable patterns have been 
documented in European cohorts (Farrington & Wikstrom, 1994). Individ­
ual offenders vary widely in the length and seriousness of their criminal 
careers. As many as half of the men who come in contact with the criminal 
justice system do so only once; at the other end of the spectrum, all studies 
reaching into adulthood have also identified small groups of chronic male 
offenders with extended criminal "careers," who account for large propor-
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tions of recorded crime (Farrington & Wikstrom, 1994; Wolfgang, Figlio, & 
Sellin, 1972). Typically, these chronic offenders show an early onset of of­
fending and engage in a diverse range of offenses, both violent and non­
violent. 

Offense histories have been less widely documented for women, but 
available evidence suggests that they differ in important ways (Home 
Office, 1995; Krazter & Hodgins, 1996; Wikstrom, 1990). First, recidivist 
criminality is relatively unusual among women, and the great majority of 
those who receive official convictions receive only one. Second, ages at 
offending show a much less marked peak in the teens than for males, and 
relatively stable (though very low) proportions of women continue to 
receive first convictions well into their twenties. In one u.K. birth cohort, 
for example, the median age for first convictions among women was 22 
years, and one-fourth of female offenders had their first conviction after 
age 28 (Home Office, 1995). In a large-scale Swedish cohort (Krazter & 
Hodgins, 1996), adult-onset cases accounted for the largest proportion of 
crimes up to age 30. Whereas adolescence-related factors seem of major 
importance in understanding criminality in males, female offending ap­
pears, on this evidence at least, to be less clearly age related. 

In addition to these specifically antisocial outcomes, it has long been 
clear that childhood conduct problems are associated with later risks of 
much wider kinds (Robins, 1966). Some of these-most notably elevated 
rates of alcohol and substance use (McCord & McCord, 1960; Robins, 
1966; Robins & McEvoy, 1990; Vaillant, 1983) and "dramatic" personality 
disorders-fall within a broadly "externalizing" spectrum of difficulties. 
In addition, small-scale follow-ups of referred and high-risk samples have 
pointed to increased risks for a range of other adult disorders (Zoccolillo, 
1992). Using ECA data, Robins and Price (1991) confirmed this same picture 
in community samples, documenting significant relationships between 
childhood conduct problems (often below current thresholds for disorder) 
and later phobia, major depressive episode, obsessive-compulsive dis­
order, schizophrenia, panic disorder, manic episodes, and somatization. In 
general, these risks were dependent on the presence of externalizing dis­
orders in adulthood, though there were also modest direct associations 
with childhood conduct problems. Some evidence (Quinton, Rutter, & 
Gulliver, 1990; Robins, 1986) suggests that risks of affective disorder are 
higher for women than for men. In addition, where depressive phenomena 
are associated with ASPD, they seem almost exclusively of a relatively 
mild kind, as judged by the type of symptomatology rather than chronicity 
or degree of social impairment (Rutter, Harrington, Quinton, & Pickles, 
1994). Thus, bipolar disorders and unipolar disorders with marked vegeta­
tive features are rare. 
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Finally, other findings suggest that the legacy of childhood conduct 
problems extends well beyond conventional assessments of psychopathol­
ogy or crime. Zoccolillo et al. (1992) assessed functioning in work, mar­
riage, and social relationships, as well as in offending, in an early adult 
follow-up of a high-risk sample (children raised in group care), together 
with an inner-city comparison group. In addition to those meeting criteria 
for ASPD, the great majority of previously conduct-disordered subjects 
showed poor outcomes in two or more of these domains. Problems in 
individual role areas were not uncommon in subjects without childhood 
conduct problems; the characteristic feature of the outcome for conduct­
disordered children, however, lay in the pervasiveness of their difficulties 
across domains. This pattern has since been replicated in other samples 
(Maughan, Pickles, & Quinton, 1995; Quinton, Pickles, Maughan, & Rutter, 
1993). 

These findings raise central questions about the nature of the long­
term risks associated with childhood conduct problems and the mecha­
nisms by which they are sustained. In particular, they argue that later 
outcomes are not confined to severe personality difficulties and crimi­
nality, but show effects on interpersonal relationships and social function­
ing on a much more extensive scale. It is unclear at this stage how far these 
problems constitute an inherent part of the conduct disorder syndrome, or 
secondary features, arising as a consequence of early impairments. The 
samples assessed in this way so far have been at high psychosocial risk, or 
from disadvantaged inner-city areas. In more middle-class groups, adoles­
cent conduct problems appear to hold few implications for early adult 
work histories, family relationships, or friendship patterns (Jessor, Dono­
van, & Costa, 1991). Psychosocial adversities-all too often faced by 
conduct-disordered youth-may thus playa central role in the long-term 
persistence of poor functioning. 

3.2. Assessments over More Focused Age Spans 

These findings provide a broad overview of childhood-adult links 
but tell us little about developments over the intervening period. No 
prospective studies have yet provided detailed coverage of continuities 
across the full age span from early childhood to adult life. Follow-up data 
on representative samples are, however, available over more focused pe­
riods. Beginning early in childhood, these show that behavioral precursors 
of stable antisocial difficulties in late childhood and early adolescence can 
be reliably detected in the preschool years (White, Moffitt, Earls, Robins, & 
Silva, 1990). In epidemiologic studies, between 50% and 75% of children 
who meet criteria for disruptive disorders before adolescence continue to 
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do so in their early teens, and a further proportion go on to show predomi­
nantly emotional difficulties (Esser, Schmidt, & Woerner, 1990; Graham & 
Rutter, 1973; Moffitt, Caspi, Dickson, Silva, & Stanton, 1996; Offord et al., 
1992; Rutter, Tizard, Yule, Graham, & Whitmore, 1976). These findings may 
underestimate the extent of continuities (Fergusson et al., 1995). Many 
childhood-onset behavior problems persist; a minority, however, do ap­
pear more transitory. 

Male gender, hyperactivity, aggression, poor verbal skills, low school 
achievements, and problems in peer relationships, along with indicators of 
family disruption and adverse parenting, have emerged as central risks for 
childhood-onset conduct problems (for reviews, see Dishion, French, & 
Patterson, 1993; Earls, 1994; Robins, 1991). Quite different factors appear to 
presage onset in adolescence. First, male-female ratios are less marked at 
this stage, and many adolescent-onset cases do not show aggression or 
learning problems, though links with family disadvantage and poor social 
competence remain (McGee, Feehan, Williams, & Anderson, 1992). In 
addition, the quality of peer relationships varies with age at onset in key 
ways. Early-onset delinquents frequently show marked problems in rela­
tionships with peers. Adolescent-onset offending, by contrast, is associ­
ated with sociometric popularity and relatively intense peer orientation 
(Stattin & Magnusson, 1995), and is heavily influenced by peer delin­
quency (Patterson & Yoerger, in press). 

Prospective studies of epidemiologic samples are now beginning to 
detail developments between the late teens and early twenties. At this 
stage, continuities in broadly externalizing disorders are most marked 
among those who showed severe or aggressive conduct disorder in ado­
lescence (Cohen, Cohen, & Brook, 1993; Feehan, McGee, & Williams, 1993). 
New onset of CD / ASPD (cases not showing comparable symptomatology 
at previous study contacts) is relatively rare, occurring in only around 10% 
of cases (Newman et al., 1996). Increased risks for later mood and anxiety 
disorders have been noted in a number of samples. In the Dunedin Multi­
disciplinary Health and Development Study, for example, emotional dis­
orders at age 18 were the most common consequences of nonaggressive 
CD at age 15, and occurred at only slightly lower rates than in groups with 
internalizing disorders in the mid teens (Feehan et al., 1993). Increased risks 
of depressive symptomatology in early adulthood have also been docu­
mented in the British National Child Development Study (Rutter, 1991; 
Rutter et al., in press-b). Comorbidity with other disorders is associated 
with increased risks for a range of aspects of later adolescent functioning. 
Lewinsohn, Rohde, and Seeley (1995), for example, found that whereas 
only 5% of adolescents with pure disruptive disorders reported suicide 
attempts, over one-third with comorbid disorders did so. Bardone, Moffitt, 
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Caspi, Dickson, and Silva (1996) provide some of the few prospective data 
on early adult outcomes of CD in girls. Adolescent CD exclusively pre­
dicted ASPD symptoms and substance dependence; it was also associated 
with increased risks for anxiety disorders and polydrug use, though not, in 
this sample, for depression. 

Studies using empirically derived syndrome scores, rather than diag­
nostic categories, have reported similar findings. In a large-scale u.s. 
study, Achenbach, Howell, McConaughy, and Stanger (1995) found that 
preadult aggressive syndrome scores showed strong predictive links with 
aggression in early adulthood. Delinquent syndromes also showed clear 
specificity for males, though a wider range of earlier predictors, including 
small contributions from both somatic complaints and earlier attention 
problems, were associated with later delinquency in females. Similar pat­
terns have been reported in Dutch samples (Ferdinand & Verhulst, 1995). 
In addition, whereas high scores on global measures of externalizing 
problems in early adulthood were only predicted by previous externaliz­
ing scores, early adult internalizing problems were predicted by both prior 
internalizing and externalizing scores. 

3.3. Secular Change 

These findings are drawn from study cohorts spanning a range of 
historical eras, and from retrospective data for subjects of different ages 
collected at particular points in time. Inevitably, each of these sources 
confounds effects associated with chronological age with either general 
historical (period) effects, or secular influences specific to individual co­
horts (Rutter, 1995). The last 50 years have seen major increases in rates of 
conduct problems and juvenile offending in most Western societies, along 
with a narrowing of the sex ratio for many, though not all, types of offense 
(Smith, 1995). Cohort and cultural differences in rates of antisocial behav­
iors, and in peak ages of offending, have been documented in both retro­
spective and prospective studies (see, e.g., Harada, 1995; Robins et al., 1991; 
Tracey, Wolfgang, & Figlio, 1990), and a range of social structural factors 
advanced to explain them. Over such a relatively short period, increases of 
this magnitude must reflect changes in the environmental risks for anti­
social behavior. Changes in family structure and functioning, increasing 
mobility and declines in the cohesiveness of local communities, along with 
changes in the pattern of crime opportunities, seem likely to be among the 
central factors involved (Smith, 1995). 

The factors involved in variations in overall levels of antisocial behav­
ior will not necessarily, of course, be the same as those affecting individual 
differences, though the two may overlap. Moffitt (1993a), for example, has 
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argued that secular increases in crime rates largely reflect "adolescence­
limited" behaviors and have few implications for persistent offenders 
whose criminality extends across the life span. Data from the ECA studies, 
by contrast, showed that secular changes in rates of childhood conduct 
problems were associated with parallel increases in adult ASPD (Robins et 
al., 1991), and that patterns of childhood-adult continuity were similar 
across all the age cohorts studied. Two different processes may thus be 
involved here, one influencing the proportions of adolescents expressing 
relatively time-limited antisocial tendencies, the second affecting expres­
sion of an underlying liability to persistent antisocial behavior of a pos­
sibly quite different kind. In addition, secular change in opportunity struc­
tures around the transition to adulthood, or the increased availability of 
alcohol and drugs, may also impact on risks for the persistence of conduct 
problems from adolescence to adult life. Though relatively little examined 
as yet, these issues constitute important areas for future study. 

4. Accounting for Continuities and Discontinuities 

As these findings make clear, any comprehensive model of continu­
ities in antisocial behavior must account for both continuity and change, 
the stabilization of antisocial tendencies in some individuals, but their 
more temporary expression in others. A variety of models has been ex­
plored to account for these patterns. Some have focused on individual 
susceptibilities, others on variations in age at onset, and yet others on the 
role of intervening experiences in fostering or inhibiting persistence over 
time. We begin by examining the role of individually based risks. 

4.1. Individual Susceptibilities and Their Expression 

Hyperactivity /impulsivity, low autonomic reactivity, sensation seeking/ 
risk taking, aggressivity, cognitive impairments or executive planning 
deficits, and problems in social cognition have all been identified as risks 
for persistent antisocial behavior (Stoff, Breiling, & Maser, 1997). It is 
unclear at this stage how far these reflect different facets of the same risk 
dimension, or differing routes to long-term impairment. Each is likely to 
include heritable elements; indeed, twin studies have shown that anti­
social behavior that persists to adulthood includes a clear genetic compo­
nent, whereas adolescent delinquency seems largely environmentally de­
termined (DiLalla & Gottesman, 1989; Lyons et al., 1995; Simonoff et al., 
reported in Rutter et al., in press-b). In addition, however, heritable factors 
will depend crucially on environmental effects for their expression. AI-
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though we must await multivariate quantitative genetic studies to identify 
the behaviors for which genes code, several pointers to the form of the 
associations are already available. Here, adoption studies have reported 
gene-environment interactions for a number of antisocial outcomes (Boh­
man, 1996; Cadoret, Yates, Troughton, Woodworth, & Stewart, 1995; 
Crowe, 1974). Though neither the genetic nor the environmental influences 
involved here has been specified in any detail as yet, the pattern of find­
ings points to what has been described as genetic control of sensitivity to 
the environment (Kendler & Eaves, 1986): The genetic factors contributing 
to antisocial traits depend heavily for their expression on exposure to 
adverse environmental circumstances. As we examine evidence of indi­
vidual risks for persistent antisocial behaviors, we highlight some possible 
avenues for effects of this kind. 

4.1.1. Hyperactivity 

Hyperactivity, impulsivity, and attentional difficulties have consis­
tently been identified as among the more important markers of poor long­
term outcome for conduct problems, at least in males. When the two 
disorders co-occur in childhood, conduct problems appear to arise as a 
complication of hyperactivity. Hyperactive symptoms emerge first in com­
orbid groups (Barkley, Fischer, Edelbrock, & Smallish, 1990), and early 
hyperactivity predicts the development of conduct problems, but the re­
verse does not apply (Taylor, Heptinstall, Chadwick, & Danckaerts, 1996). 
In addition, behavior genetic analyses suggest that etiological factors for 
"pure" CD and the comorbid pattern differ in important ways. Comorbid 
groups include a strong genetic component, whereas pure CD, especially 
when defined in terms of adolescents' own accounts, seems largely envi­
ronmental in origin (Silberg et al., 1996). 

Prospective studies have now examined the specific contributions of 
hyperactivity and conduct problems to later outcomes at a number of 
stages. Kindergarten measures of restless, impulsive behavior predict 
early onset delinquency (Tremblay, Pihl, Vitaro, & Dobkin, 1994), and 
hyperactivity is associated with the persistence of CD across childhood 
and adolescence (August & Stewart, 1982; Schachar, Rutter, & Smith, 1981). 
Taylor et al. (1996) followed subgroups of boys from an epidemiologic 
sample over longer age spans, from early childhood to age 17. Although 
the threshold for conduct problems fell below diagnostic criteria for con­
duct disorder in this study, the findings were striking in pointing to 
hyperactivity as the main risk for poor later outcome. Defiant and disrup­
tive behaviors, problems in peer relationships, and poor social adjustment 
at age 17 were all most strongly predicted by early hyperactivity; the only 



CONTINUITIES AND DISCONTINUITIES IN ANTISOCIAL BEHAVIOR 15 

sequelae specific to conduct problems were behavior problems in school 
and aggression. In a similar way, Farrington et al. (1990a) found that a com­
posite measure of hyperactivity-impulsivity-inattention, though strongly 
related to indicators of early conduct problems, independently predicted 
both early onset and chronicity of offending among males up to age 25. 

These findings leave little doubt that hyperactivity constitutes a central 
marker for the persistence of poor global functioning. Several key questions 
remain to be addressed. First, it is unclear which aspects of this complex­
temperamental impulsivity, motor restlessness, or inattentiveness-convey 
the prime risk, and whether it functions predominantly as a dimensional 
risk factor, a discrete diagnostic category, or as part of a wider constellation 
of problem behaviors. Genetic analyses (Silberg et al., 1996) suggest that 
the genetic effect extends beyond the small group of children who show a 
severe hyperkinetic syndrome. The genetically influenced risk characteris­
tics may thus also operate more widely and depend on co-occurrence with 
other risks for effects on persistence. Parental emotional disorder, family 
discord, and negative parent-child relationships, especially negative ex­
pressed emotion toward the child (Rutter & Quinton, 1984; Rutter et al., in 
press-b; Taylor et al., 1996) are all known to be associated with the per­
sistence of disruptive disorders across childhood and adolescence. 
Markers of this kind may provide valuable starting points in examining 
gene-environment interactions that may be specific to the persistence of 
antisocial behavior across development. Alongside these issues, we need 
to know more about the role of hyperactivity in girls and to clarify the basis 
for the genetic vulnerability. Although the genetic component is especially 
associated with hyperactivity, overactivity or inattention need not neces­
sarily constitute the key susceptibility trait. 

4.1.2. Neuropsychological Deficits, Cognitive Impairments, and School 
Achievements 

Neuropsychological deficits (Moffitt, 1993b) offer a second possibility 
here. Depressed IQ scores, most marked on measures of verbal skills, have 
been widely documented among both juvenile and adult offenders (Hir­
schi & Hindelang, 1977; Wilson & Herrnstein, 1985), and modest but 
consistent longitudinal associations have been reported between early 
childhood verbal skills and criminality in adult life (Stattin & Klackenberg­
Larssen, 1993). Tests of executive function have also been found to discrim­
inate between antisocial and nonantisocial adolescents (Moffitt, 1993a). 
These latter deficits seem especially characteristic of comorbid CD / 
attention-deficit/hyperactive disorder (ADHD), but not of CD alone (Pen­
nington & Ozonoff, 1996). 
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Poor verbal skills and difficulties in executive planning might contrib­
ute in quite direct ways to the onset and persistence of antisocial behav­
iors. Moffitt (1993a), for example, has argued that relatively subtle neuro­
psychological deficits (whether genetically or environmentally mediated) 
may in stressed family environments initiate a chain of developments 
culminating in conduct problems. Early temperamental and communica­
tion problems may challenge parenting capacities and possibly also com­
promise attachment bonds. As the child enters school, so new environ­
mental demands compound the process, and problems in peer relations 
and learning difficulties are added to an escalating pattern of risk. 

Spiraling difficulties of this kind, affecting relationships and social 
competence in a range of domains, may cumulate across the life course. 
During schooling, they are likely to have particular implications for 
achievement. Criminological theories have posited a particular role for 
poor school achievement in the genesis of delinquency, running through 
effects on self-esteem, or reduced attachment to the school system as a 
support for conventional values (Hawkins & Lishner, 1987). In the most 
recent review of the extensive literature on academic performance and 
delinquency, Maguin and Loeber (1996) concluded that intelligence and 
attentional problems were likely common causes for both difficulties, but 
that academic performance made additional contributions to the predic­
tion of delinquency when both socioeconomic status (SES) and prior con­
duct problems were controlled. 

These models suggest rather different predictions for the persistence 
of antisocial behavior beyond the end of schooling. On the one hand, 
because verbal deficits and reading difficulties themselves persist (Maughan, 
Hagell, Rutter, & Yule, 1994; Rodgers, 1986), associated antisocial behaviors 
might also be expected to show high levels of persistence. On the other, if 
much of the initial impetus for delinquent activity among low achievers 
arises from relatively phase-specific stressors in adolescence, links be­
tween reading problems and antisocial behaviors might decline in adult­
hood, as other sources of accomplishment become available. In relation to 
reading difficulties, the limited prospective evidence available to date 
favors the second of these accounts. Poor-reading males in an inner-city 
sample showed somewhat elevated rates of offending in the teens but no 
excess of officially recorded crime or self-reported antisocial behaviors in 
adulthood (Maughan, Pickles, Hagell, Rutter, & Yule, 1996). These young 
men left school at a time when opportunities for skilled manual work were 
relatively plentiful; importantly, social outcomes for women with child­
hood reading problems were rather less positive (Maughan & Hagell, 
1996). Contextual effects of this kind may hold important implications for 
later outcomes. 
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4.1.3. Aggressive and Other Behavioral Trajectories 

Among specific manifestations of antisocial difficulties, aggression 
has long been canvassed as a key element in persistence (see, e.g., Stattin & 
Magnusson, 1989). IndividJal differences in aggression show considerable 
stability from early childhood onward (Olweus, 1979), and Robins (1978) 
argued that in the absence of later-onset major mental disorders, violent 
and aggressive patterns do not appear in adults if they have not been 
evident earlier in life. Violence is a dominant component of antisocial 
personality disorder in both women and men (Robins et al., 1991), and 
chronic male offenders show high rates of interpersonal as well as criminal 
aggression (Farrington & West, 1993). Genetic influences, however, seem 
less marked for violent than for nonviolent crime, and specific links with 
aggressive outcomes have proved elusive, reflecting the strong overlaps 
between aggression and other indices of antisocial behavior in adult life. In 
general, early family risks seem similar for both violent and nonviolent 
crime (Farrington, 1989). Once again, the key may lie in the interplay 
between individual and environmental characteristics. Henry, Caspi, 
Moffitt, and Silva (1996), for example, found that although violent offend­
ing in the late teens showed links with temperamental lack of control in 
early childhood, effects were most marked in the small group where 
temperamental difficulties were combined with disrupted parenting. In a 
similar way, Moffitt et al. (in press) found that elevated serotonin levels 
were predominantly associated with violent convictions among young 
men who grew up in incohesive and conflictual families. 

Behavioral trajectories might offer alternative approaches to examin­
ing variations in persistence. Building on factor-analytic findings (Loeber 
& Schmaling, 1985), Loeber (Loeber et al., 1993; Loeber, DeLamatre, 
Keenan, & Zhang, 1997) has proposed that there may be different behav­
ioral trajectories associated with progressions in overt, confrontational 
behaviors; covert, concealing acts; and aspects of antisocial behavior re­
flecting conflict with authority. Some individuals will show escalations in 
all three types of deviance, whereas others may take more "exclusive" 
routes. Empirical tests thus far have shown that although boys showing 
overt, aggressive behaviors often progressed to more covert types of devi­
ance, the reverse pattern was much less common. Hypothesized progres­
sions within each pathway were more evident for boys with persistent 
difficulties than for "experimenters," and although ADHD was associated 
with initiation into all three types of deviance, it showed no additional 
links with escalating difficulties beyond that point. 

To date, these models have only been applied to boys up to the 
midteens. From the opposite developmental perspective, a number of 
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investigators have explored offense histories of known chronic offenders, 
in an effort to identify early behavioral trajectories characteristic of long­
term persistence in crime. In practice, however, although chronic offenders 
have long been known to account for disproportionate numbers of serious 
and violent offenses, only a minority are convicted of any serious violent 
crime (Weitekamp, Kerner, Schubert, & Schindler, 1995). In the Cambridge 
Study in Delinquent Development, chronic offenders (all of whom had 
been convicted of at least nine offenses) accounted for exactly equal pro­
portions of both serious and nonserious offenses; "the chronic offenders 
committed more serious offenses in total purely because they committed 
more offenses in total" (Farrington & West, 1993, p. 498). 

Chronic offenders may nonetheless show characteristic patterns of 
escalation in offense seriousness. This possibility raises difficult methodo­
logical issues: Because later offenses are committed at older ages, and 
older offenders in general commit more serious crimes, it is important to 
disentangle general age-related changes from those reflecting escalation 
within individual careers. Strikingly, Weitekamp and colleagues (1995) 
found that the mean seriousness of early offenses committed by chronic 
offenders in the Philadelphia cohorts was no higher than that of early 
offenses committed by youth with much shorter criminal careers. In the 
Cambridge study, Farrington and West (1993) noted an increase in the 
seriousness of chronic offenders' crimes between the third and tenth of­
fenses; after this, seriousness levels began to fall, probably reflecting 
changes in the types of offenses more usual at older ages. The issue is a 
complex one; to date, however, it has proved difficult to identify charac­
teristic behavioral features of the criminal careers of chronic offenders. 

4.1.4. Multiproblem Groupings 

Hyperactivity, aggression, and cognitive deficits frequently overlap. 
The prime risks for poor adult outcomes might thus emanate from just one 
of these domains, or might lie in multiproblem subgroups showing all of 
these difficulties. To test these possibilities, Magnusson and Bergman 
(1990) advocated a different style of analysis from the usual variable­
oriented approach, focusing instead on "person-oriented" clustering of 
problems within individuals. Using this strategy, they found strong sup­
port for a multiproblem model in a cohort of 13-year-old boys. High scores 
on aggressiveness, motor restlessness, lack of concentration, and low 
school motivation always occurred in multiproblem groupings; impor­
tantly, these groups also showed low autonomic activity. Pervasively poor 
outcomes in the mid twenties (including psychiatric hospitalization, as 
well as criminality and alcohol problems) were most strongly concentrated 
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in the multiproblem group. Equally striking, neither poor peer relations 
nor early adolescent aggression showed any links with adverse later out­
comes when it occurred alone. Pulkkinen (1992; Hamalainen & Pulkkinen, 
1996), clustering cases in terms of prosociality, aggression, and school 
achievement, confirmed a similar pattern. Constellations of individual 
susceptibilities, rather than individual risk traits, may thus play a key 
role in long-term persistence. 

4.1.5. Depression, Anxiety, and Shyness/Withdrawal 

Childhood conduct problems also show frequent overlaps with both 
anxiety and depression (Hinshaw et al., 1993; Loeber & Keenan, 1994), and, 
as we have seen, antisocial behavior is associated with increased risks of 
affective disorder in adult life. Early links between conduct problems and 
depression seem likely to reflect correlated or shared risks (Fergusson, 
Lynskey, & Horwood, 1996), and the mixed pattern appears to share more 
in common with pure conduct than pure emotional difficulties (Stein­
hausen & Reitzle, 1996). From the limited evidence available to date, 
comorbid depression has little effect in modifying the course of antisocial 
behavior. In a follow-up of a child guidance sample, Harrington, Fudge, 
Rutter, Pickles, and Hill (1991) found that adult outcomes for a small group 
showing mixed CO and depressive disorders were closely similar to those 
with CD alone. Both groups faced high risks of ASPO, officially recorded 
crime and alcohol abuse/ dependence, and lower risks of major depressive 
disorders than subjects with a primary diagnosis of depression. 

Risks for adult depression might arise in a variety of ways. Continu­
ities from earlier mixed disorders may provide one route, though ques­
tionnaire-based data suggest that this is unlikely to be the whole story 
(Rutter, 1991). Antisocial adolescents showed elevated rates of emotional 
distress in early adulthood, independent of levels of emotional problems 
in the teens. Instead, effects may be dependent on later antisocial lifestyles. 
Robins (1978) was among the first to note that job troubles, poor marital 
relationships and other concomitants of ongoing antisocial difficulties 
could function as stressors in adult life. Champion, Goodall, and Rutter 
(1995) tested this directly in a follow-up of community samples in the late 
twenties. Childhood behavioral deviance showed strong links with se­
verely adverse life events in adulthood, in particular those known from 
other studies to act as "provoking agents" for psychiatric disorder (Brown 
& Harris, 1978). In many instances, these were dependent on features of 
the young people's behavior; in addition, early deviance was also associ­
ated with increased rates of independent life events, especially those 
reflecting more chronic psychosocial difficulties and lack of supportive 
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adult relationships. Both directly and indirectly, early behavior problems 
appeared to place individuals in adult environments carrying heightened 
risks for affective disorder. 

Links between anxiety and antisocial behaviors have proved more 
complex (Lahey, McBurnett, Loeber, & Hart, 1995). Both anxious and shy 
children have been found to be at reduced risk for delinquency (Loeber & 
Keenan, 1994), and Lahey and Loeber (1991) found that prepubertal boys 
with comorbid CD and anxiety showed fewer symptoms of aggression 
than those with conduct problems alone. At the same time, Tremblay et al. 
(1994) found that low kindergarten anxiety showed small but positive 
effects in the prediction of early adolescent delinquency. The key may lie in 
the frequent overlap of two related but distinct aspects of anxiety I shyness: 
behavioral inhibition and social withdrawal. Assessing these separately, 
Kerr, Tremblay, Pagani, and Vitaro (1997) showed that it is behavioral 
inhibition that acts as a protective factor, rather than a lack of social 
connections with delinquent peers. In their study, inhibited-aggressive 
boys were protected against delinquency, while withdrawn-disruptive 
boys were at risk for both ongoing antisocial behaviors and depression. 
The poor outcomes associated with shy Iwithdrawn and aggressive groups 
in other studies (see, e.g., Fleming, Kellam, & Brown, 1982; McCord, 1988; 
Serbin, Moskowitz, Schwartzman, & Ledingham, 1991) may thus largely 
reflect patterns of this latter kind. 

4.2. Age at Onset 

A more explicitly developmental approach to conceptualizing varia­
tions in persistence has emerged from studies of age at onset. Early onset is 
among the strongest predictors of continuities in disruptive disorders 
across childhood (Loeber, 1982), and early onset delinquency shows simi­
lar links with persistence in adult crime (Farrington et al., 1990b). Risks for 
childhood- and adolescent-onset antisocial behaviors differ in systematic 
ways, and, as we have seen, although adult offending shows a clear 
heritable component, adolescent delinquency is largely attributable to 
shared environmental effects (DiLalla & Gottesman, 1989; Lyons et al., 
1995). 

Building on these observations, a number of investigators have pro­
posed divisions according to age at onset (DiLalla & Gottesman, 1989; 
Hinshaw et al., 1993; Patterson & Yoerger, 1993). The most comprehensive 
model is Moffitt's (1993a) developmental taxonomy, which divides the 
overall "pool" of antisocial children into two distinct groups: a small, 
early-onset group showing many of the risks discussed thus far, and 
assumed to show strong persistence of antisocial behavior into adulthood, 
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and a second, adolescent-onset group, accounting for the short-lived rise 
in prevalence rates in adolescence. These "adolescence-limited" delin­
quents are argued to display a much less pervasive array of early risks and 
difficulties; instead, their delinquent behaviors are largely prompted by 
status frustration during adolescence, and by social mimicry of delinquent 
peers. Importantly, they are also argued to be of relatively limited dura­
tion. 

If confirmed, this model could provide a powerful organizing frame­
work. Initial tests on childhood and adolescent data seem promising 
(Jeglum Bartush, Lynam, Moffitt, & Silva, 1997), identifying a childhood­
onset factor showing the hypothesized links with childhood hyperactivity, 
poor verbal skills, impulsive personality traits and increased risks of vio­
lent offending, and a separate adolescent-onset factor, more strongly asso­
ciated with peer delinquency. Several questions do, however, arise. First, 
as we have seen, by no means all childhood-onset conduct problems 
persist into adolescence (Moffitt et al., 1996). This suggests that early-onset 
cases include a separate "childhood-limited" group, not facing a severe 
long-term prognosis. It is unclear at this stage whether this group is 
characterized by less severe individual vulnerabilities, less serious or per­
sistent environmental risks, or positive protective factors. It constitutes 
an important focus for future developmental studies. 

Second, a main prediction of the model is that adolescence-onset 
groups will desist from antisocial behavior once they gain access to adult 
statuses and roles. Nagin et al. (1995) found only mixed support for this 
proposition in the Cambridge study males. By age 32, men whose official 
crime records were limited to the teens and early twenties had, as ex­
pected, made good adjustments in their working lives and showed little 
evidence of severe discord in relationships with their wives. In other 
respects, however, their adult functioning was by no means problem-free. 
Antisocial lifestyles continued, though registered crime did not. In this 
disadvantaged sample, a variety of factors may have contributed to this 
pattern. Further tests, in more diverse social groups, are needed to deter­
mine the basis for such ongoing difficulties. 

Third, we need to know why early onset is associated with long-term 
risk: Does it serve primarily as a marker for other early vulnerabilities; as 
an index of severity; or does early onset per se affect the likelihood of 
persistence? The few direct tests of this last possibility have produced 
inconsistent findings. Nagin and Paternoster (1991), for example, found 
evidence for "state dependence"-prior involvement in offending itself 
influencing the likelihood of future involvement-in self-reports of rela­
tively minor offending in the late teens. Over more extended age ranges, 
however, Nagin and Farrington (1992) found that associations between age 
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at onset and persistent offending were almost entirely accounted for by 
time-stable individual differences. And Tolan and Thomas (1995) found a 
small but significant effect for age at onset on later involvement in offend­
ing across adolescence, most marked for persistence in serious crime; age 
at onset was less influential than psychosocial variables and also of rather 
less importance for females than for males. 

Is early onset also associated with persistence in girls? Retrospective 
reports of age at onset were very similar-and early-for both males and 
females who met criteria for ASPD in the ECA samples (Robins et al., 1991), 
but other findings suggest a more mixed picture. Adolescent, but not 
childhood, aggression appears to predict offending in girls (Stattin & 
Magnusson, 1989), and affiliations with deviant peers only become marked 
for girls in adolescence (Cairns, Cairns, Neckerman, Gest, & Gariepy, 
1988). As we have seen, official offense histories suggest much more diver­
sity in the onset of criminality in women than in men (Home Office, 1995; 
Krazter & Hodgins, 1996), and Tolan and Thomas (1995) found age at onset 
a less important factor in predicting persistence of self-report offending 
among females in the late teens. More detailed studies, focusing specifi­
cally on antisocial women and girls, are needed to resolve these questions. 

Finally, for both males and females, there is the important issue of 
"adult" onset. DiLalla and Gottesman (1989) proposed the inclusion of a 
separate group of "late bloomers" in their developmental model, and it is 
clear that using either diagnostic criteria or offense histories, small but 
nontrivial groups of individuals appear in prevalence estimates for the 
first time in adult life. Surprisingly little is known about these groups. 
Some severe antisocial behaviors are known to develop in the context of 
major mental disorders, or in response to trauma; new onset of pervasive 
antisocial behavior in adulthood may predominantly reflect influences of 
this kind (Hodgins, 1993). In relation to offending, alcohol- and drug­
related crime may also play an important part (Kaplan, 1995), and feminist 
sociologists have argued for some routes into adult crime particular to 
women, reflecting rational responses to severe environmental pressures or 
demands (Daly, 1993; Heidensohn, 1994). Comprehensive developmental 
models need to provide a more systematic picture of these important 
groups. 

5. Mechanisms for Stability and Change: Person-Environment 
Interactions 

The identification of individual vulnerabilities associated with per­
sistence, or subgroups that follow differing developmental trajectories, 
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constitutes an important first step in understanding continuities over time. 
On their own, however, these approaches tell us nothing of the mechanisms 
that contribute to the stabilization of antisocial tendencies in some individ­
uals but their more time-limited expression in others. Implicitly or explic­
itly, much early research from a clinical perspective assumed a relatively 
autonomous unfolding of pathogenic processes. Sociological accounts, by 
contrast, attributed continuities at the individual level to parallel consis­
tencies in the environment. More recent evidence suggests a more complex 
pattern, whereby development occurs as a joint function of organismic and 
environmental forces, and the expression and maintenance of antisocial 
tendencies depends crucially on the evolving interplay between individ­
ual and environmental effects (Magnusson & Cairns, 1996). In the sections 
that follow, we outline some of the key processes that seem likely to be 
involved here. 

5.1. Social Cognitions 

A first route for the stabilization of behaviors may run through views 
of the self and others. Social psychology suggests that most effects of 
experience operate through cognitive transduction, and that the self is 
made up of an arrangement of schemas representing past experiences and 
personal characteristics, as well as future hopes and fears (Markus & 
Cross, 1990). Aggressive individuals have been found to show characteris­
tic patterns here, believing, for example, that behaving aggressively in­
creases self-esteem and helps avoid a negative image in the eyes of others 
(Slaby & Guerra, 1988). Among delinquents, Oyserman and Markus (1990) 
found an imbalance between fears and expectations for the future: Al­
though young offenders feared negative outcomes such as being on drugs, 
many lacked the "possible selves" that could provide an organizing vision 
of ways to avoid such adverse outcomes. 

Dodge and colleagues (Dodge, Bates, & Pettit, 1990a; Dodge, Pettit, 
Bates, & Valente, 1995) have explored some of the bases of such cognitions 
in early childhood experiences of abusive parenting. They have elaborated 
a general model of social information processing, positing five sequential 
stages in responding to social cues: encoding, interpretation, response 
accessing, response evaluation, and enactment. Aggressive behavior 
seems associated with particular biases or deficits in information process­
ing at each stage; aggressive individuals search for fewer cues before 
interpreting others' actions, overattribute hostile intent in ambiguous situ­
ations, and are more likely both to select and to generate aggressive 
responses. Followed prospectively, abused children were at increased risk 
of acquiring subsets of these biased processing patterns. Importantly, 
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social-cognitive processes mediated links between preschool abuse and 
risks for conduct problems some 5 years later (Dodge et al., 1995). 

The longer-term role of social cognitions remains to be established. 
Similar cognitive biases have, however, been identified among incarcer­
ated delinquents (Dodge, Price, Bachorowski, & Newman, 1990b), and 
among partners in distressed and violent marital relationships (Bradbury, 
Beach, Fincham, & Nelson, 1996; Holtzworth-Munrow & Anglin, 1993). 
Biased social cognitions, in relation to both the self and others, seem likely 
to be among the mechanisms that foster persistence in deviant behaviors, 
or militate against the possibility of change. 

5.2. Accentuation Effects 

A second mechanism for the stabilization of behavior reflects what 
Elder and Caspi (1990) have described as the accentuation principle: that 
new or challenging experiences, though often assumed to prompt change 
in behavioral development, may in some circumstances function to rein­
force existing patterns. Previously vulnerable individuals are most suscep­
tible to the effects of stressors (Rodgers, 1990), and in novel, uncertain, or 
unpredictable situations, individuals must have recourse to their own 
inner resources in deciding how to act (Caspi & Moffitt, 1993). For anti­
social children and adolescents, new environmental demands-whether 
prompted by developmental transitions or situational stressors-may 
only go to reinforce deviant tendencies. 

Effects of this kind have been noted in a range of domains (Rutter, 
1994). The hostile attributions of aggressive boys are most apparent in 
ambiguous situations, or those lacking familiar cues. In a similar way, the 
increase in delinquent activities associated with unemployment is most 
marked for young men with previous histories of delinquency (Farring­
ton, Gallagher, Morley, St. Ledger, & West, 1986), and the rise in norm­
breaking shown by early maturing girls (Stattin & Magnusson, 1990) is 
most apparent for those showing behavior problems before the main 
changes of puberty occur (Caspi & Moffitt, 1993). In each case, new, chal­
lenging, or stressful life experiences have been found to accentuate pre­
existing behavioral tendencies. 

As these examples suggest, both the biological and the social role 
changes of adolescence and early adulthood hold the potential for accen­
tuation effects of this kind. It is less clear at this stage how far they carry 
long-term implications. In relation to early puberty, for example, Stattin 
and Magnusson (1990) found that by age 15, most differences in deviance 
between early and later maturing girls had diminished. The most clear 
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consequences for early adult development arose if girls had dropped out 
of school; then, educational attainments continued to be compromised 
many years in the future. As in other arenas, the effects of adverse experi­
ences seem likely to be most marked if they close off later opportunities or 
trap individuals into adverse circumstances that provide few avenues for 
escape. 

5.3. Environmental Continuities 

If changed environments can contribute to the persistence of anti­
social behaviors, continuities in environmental conditions also playa key 
role. For many antisocial children, adverse environments are likely to 
persist across development. Many antisocial children grow up in dis­
advantaged and disorganized neighborhoods, antithetical to development 
at any stage. The same communities that lack adequate supports for early 
parenting or health care of young children offer limited activities and poor 
supervision for adolescents, and restricted work opportunities in adult life 
(Caspi & Moffitt, 1995). To date, research linking macrosocial, contextual 
processes of this kind with more individually oriented measures is still in 
its infancy (see, e.g., Farrington, Sampson, & Wikstrom, 1993; Sampson, 
1992), and there have been few direct tests of the impact of such broader 
ecological consistencies on the course of behavioral development. In child­
hood, much of the effect of neighborhood disadvantage seems mediated 
via family risks (Rutter et aI., 1975; Sampson, 1992). In adolescence and 
adulthood, more direct effects may arise. As we have seen, much current 
evidence on the long-term outcomes of conduct problems derives from 
disadvantaged samples, likely to have faced ongoing difficulties of this 
kind. Comparative studies in less distressed groups, along with the inte­
gration of community-level indicators in individually oriented analyses, 
are crucial to clarify the processes involved here. 

5.4. Selecting and Shaping Environments 

In addition to these broader environmental consistencies, it is now 
clear that individual actions also playa part in selecting and shaping the 
environments that individuals experience. Both evocative and active 
person-environment interactions seem likely to be involved here (Caspi & 
Moffitt, 1995). Early in childhood, evocative processes may be most salient. 
Child characteristics are known to elicit differing reactions from caregivers 
(Bell & Chapman, 1986; Lytton, 1990), and early oppositional behaviors 
fuel spiraling cycles of coercive interchanges within the family (Patterson, 
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1982). Later in development, as individuals gain increasing autonomy of 
action, so options for more direct selection and shaping of environments 
increase (Scarr, 1992; Scarr & McCartney, 1983). 

Behavior genetic analyses highlighted the importance of such pro­
cesses for the persistence of antisocial tendencies (Kendler, 1995). As out­
lined earlier, genetic and unique environment effects on antisocial behav­
ior become more salient in adult life. Importantly, however, no new genetic 
or familial environment risk factors appear to come lion-line" between 
adolescence and adulthood (Lyons et aI., 1995). Instead, the increased 
impact of genetic influences later in development arises because they 
operate at that stage not only to influence behavior, but also to select 
individuals into interpersonal and social environments congruent with 
their dispositions. In some instances, processes of this kind may reflect 
active selection processes. In others, shaping of environments may arise in 
less direct but nonetheless powerful ways through the cumulating conse­
quences of early impairments. We focus here on three main routes for 
effects of this kind: social selection into adolescent peer groups; the impli­
cations of conduct problems for transitions to adult roles; and assortative 
pairing in the selection of life partners. 

5.4.1. Peer Relations 

Deviant peer relationships are among the most powerful correlates of 
adolescent delinquency (Thornberry & Krohn, 1997). The adolescent surge 
in delinquent involvement is paralleled by markedly similar age trends in 
associations with delinquent peers (Warr, 1993); as peer influences rise and 
fall, so delinquency seems to follow. More debated, however, has been the 
causal nature of the processes involved: Does the association primarily 
reflect niche-picking-a social selection model-or do links with deviant 
peers also serve to promote and sustain antisocial development (Rowe, 
Woulbroun, & Gulley, 1994)? Recent evidence suggests that both processes 
are important and operate in reciprocal ways over time (Thornberry & 
Krohn,1997). 

Social selection in adolescent peer relations has been documented for 
many years (Kandel, 1985). Among boys, the tendency to affiliate with 
others showing similar levels of aggression is clear in late childhood and 
increases as they enter adolescence. For girls, similar processes become 
marked in the early teens (Cairns et aI., 1988). Peer similarities in aggres­
sive tendencies are largely independent of specific individual friendships: 
The membership of social groupings may change, but the quality of ag­
gressive adolescents' networks tends to remain quite stable over time. 
Longitudinal analyses, taking into account individuals' prior levels of 
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deviance, have shown that these deviant peer associations play an inde­
pendent role in both the initiation (Keenan, Loeber, Zhang, Stouthamer­
Loeber, & Van Kammen, 1995) and the continuity of delinquency in adoles­
cence (Fergusson & Horwood, 1996). Earlier antisocial tendencies make it 
more likely that adolescents make delinquent friends, but those friend­
ships in turn playa key role in maintaining deviant behavior. 

Longer-term effects of adolescent peer relationships have been less 
widely studied. For some girls, however, early links with deviant peers 
appear to constitute a key "stepping-stone" in the progress toward cohab­
itation with a deviant spouse (Quinton et al., 1993). For males, Warr (1993) 
has argued that delinquent friendships may be especially "sticky" and 
themselves tend to persist over time. Strikingly, evidence from much later 
in development suggests that continuity in male offending in the twenties 
and early thirties remains strongly associated with links with deviant 
peers (Farrington, 1991; Graham & Bowling, 1995). For some individuals, 
adolescent peer relationships may mark early steps in a chain of develop­
ments that contributes, directly or indirectly, to ongoing deviance. 

5.4.2. Early Adult Role Transitions 

The social role transitions of adolescence and early adulthood provide 
other routes for shaping environments. Sociological analyses have con­
firmed that choices made at this period have major implications for subse­
quent life-chances (Hogan & Astone, 1986), and developmental studies 
suggest that differing transition patterns can also have powerful effects on 
later psychosocial development. In some circumstances, these can be posi­
tive, offering breaks from the past and escape from risk trajectories (see, 
e.g., Elder, 1986). In others, these same role transitions can function to 
reinforce and amplify earlier difficulties, cutting off opportunities, and 
trapping individuals in increasingly deviant, unsupportive, or stress­
prone interpersonal and social worlds (e.g., Caspi, Elder, & Herbener, 1990; 
Kerner, Weitekamp, & Stelly, 1995; Rutter, Champion, Quinton, Maughan, 
& Pickles, 1995). 

For many conduct-disordered adolescents, their impulsive behavioral 
style contributes to a pattern of accelerated early-adult role transitions that 
cut short education, compromise employment options, and precipitate 
early entry into heterosexual relationships and family formation. In the 
National Comorbidity Study, for example, early-onset CD was associated 
with a more than doubled risk of drop out from high school and showed 
continuing, though less marked, effects on later educational transitions 
(Kessler, Foster, Saunders, & Stang, 1995). Other studies suggest that these 
effects are not simply a function of prior associations between conduct 
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problems and poor school achievement. Early exit from schooling is most 
marked for young people showing both aggressive/antisocial and aca­
demic problems, but conduct problems alone also have an effect (Cairns, 
Cairns, & Neckerman, 1989; Maughan, Gray, Smith, & Rutter, 1985). 

Not surprisingly, depressed educational qualifications affect entry to 
the workforce (Stanford et al., 1994). In addition, conduct problems may 
influence early labor-market involvement more directly through reduced 
efforts at job search or problems in relationships with colleagues and 
employers (Caspi, Wright, Moffitt, & Silva, in press). For some young 
offenders, the stigmatizing effects of arrest and imprisonment will com­
pound these difficulties, further compromising job prospects (Kerner et al., 
1995; Sampson & Laub, 1993). Moffitt et al. (1996) found that both early­
and adolescent-onset behavior problems were associated with increased 
risks of unemployment in the late teens in males; for girls, however, 
adolescent CD appears to have fewer implications for early labor force 
indicators (Bardone et al., 1996). 

Patterns of early partnership and family formation may be more 
consequential for women. Teenage pregnancy in particular is known to be 
associated with a plethora of adverse consequences for both mother and 
child (Furstenberg, Brooks-Gunn, & Chase-Lansdale, 1989). In both clinical 
(Kovacs, Krol, & Voti, 1994) and epidemiologic samples (Bardone et al., 
1996), conduct-disordered girls have been found at increased risk. These 
tendencies may be becoming more marked over time. Cohort comparisons 
(Maughan & Lindelow, 1997) suggest that as secular changes have favored 
delayed entry to parenthood, and access to contraception and abortion has 
become more widespread, so the groups selected into early motherhood 
have become more behaviorally deviant. 

5.4.3. Assorting on Deviance 

Early and unsupportive marital relationships may also reinforce 
problems in individual functioning. In the Dunedin study, girls with ado­
lescent CD were over five times more likely than others to have entered a 
cohabiting relationship by age 21. Many of these relationships lacked 
support; by their early twenties, almost half of these girls had already 
received some form of physical violence from a partner. As yet, relatively 
little is known of the more proximal processes involved in these effects. 
Risks of unsupportive partnerships do, however, seem to depend in part 
on assorting on behavioral deviance. Quinton et al. (1993) found that girls 
with histories of conduct problems were much more likely than their peers 
to enter first cohabiting partnerships with deviant men. These relation­
ships reflected the end point of a series of prior influences, including 
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adolescent associations with deviant peers, lack of supportive guidance 
from families, early pregnancy, and the lack of a "planning" disposition 
among many of the girls themselves. Similar evidence of assortment on 
deviance is emerging in other samples (Peters, Serbin, & Schwartzman, 
1996). 

5.5. Alcohol and Substance Use 

We cannot conclude this section without noting the strong and mutu­
ally reinforcing associations between drug and alcohol problems and anti­
social behavior (see, e.g., Kaplan, 1995; Tonry & Wilson, 1990 for over­
views). It is beyond the scope of this chapter to review the extensive 
literatures that have examined these associations. For our present pur­
poses, just a few key links can be highlighted. First, childhood conduct 
problems are strong predictors of alcohol and drug use (Robins & McEvoy, 
1990), and deviant adult lifestyles further increase the probability of heavy 
alcohol consumption (Kerner, Weitekamp, Stelly, & Thomas, 1996). The 
complex links between alcohol and aggression have been much debated 
and are likely to include pharmacological, psychological, and social effects 
(Fagan, 1990). In the case of drug use, U.S. data suggest that although small 
groups of heavy polydrug users account for a large proportion of preda­
tory crime, in the majority of cases, links are much less apparent (Chaiken 
& Chaiken, 1990). Possibly as important for the persistence of antisocial 
behavior, heavy alcohol use also compromises many other aspects of social 
functioning; marital relationships and job stability are likely to be espe­
cially vulnerable (Sampson & Laub, 1993; Vaillant, 1983). As we discuss in 
later sections, these often playa key role in desistance from crime. In 
addition to their direct links with aggressive or criminal acts, alcohol and 
drug use may thus contribute to the maintenance of antisocial behavior in 
more indirect ways, through jeopardizing adult roles and relationships 
that themselves offer options for change. 

5.6. Cumulating Consequences: Indirect Chains 

Taken together, these findings clearly argue that important routes for 
continuities in antisocial behavior run through selection into adverse envi­
ronments and the cumulating consequences of early behavior difficulties 
(Rutter et al., 1995). Through their characteristic patterns of peer and 
partnership choices, many conduct-disordered youth will enter their early 
adult years with limited material resources, restricted labor-force pros­
pects, unsupportive personal relationships, and responsibilities for depen­
dents. From a developmental perspective, the key questions concern the 
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extent to which these patterns contribute to the persistence of poor func­
tioning, and the extent to which, if such negative outcomes are avoided, 
opportunities exist for trajectories to be redirected over time. 

A number of investigators have now shown that processes of this kind 
do indeed contribute in important ways to the persistence of antisocial 
behavior over time. Adverse outcomes at one stage of development ele­
vate risks of persistence at the immediately succeeding stage, acting as 
"stepping-stones" into increasingly more deviant pathways. The models 
advanced-variously described as stepping-stone effects (Farrington, 
1986b), processes of cumulative continuity (Caspi & Moffitt, 1995), indirect 
chain mechanisms (Rutter, 1997b; Rutter & Rutter, 1993), or, more specifi­
cally in the criminology field, processes of social exclusion and marginal­
ization (Kerner et ai., 1995)-all suggest that continuities in antisocial 
behavior depend not only on trait persistence, but also crucially on indirect 
mechanisms of this kind. 

Several empirical demonstrations of these effects have now been 
reported. Fergusson and Horwood (1996), for example, found that affilia­
tion with delinquent peers accounted for a substantial proportion of the 
continuity between childhood behavior problems and adolescent offend­
ing. Direct behavioral continuities were apparent, but peer-mediated ef­
fects accounted for up to half of the associations observed. Caspi, Elder, 
and Herbener (1990), tracing adult outcomes of men with early histories of 
temper tantrums, reported a similar pattern. Impulsive personality styles 
persisted to adulthood; in addition, however, progressive deteriorations in 
occupational status derived in part from indirect effects of truncated edu­
cational careers. In a parallel way, Kerner et a1. (1995) argued for dynamic 
processes in the development of criminal careers, whereby the cumulating 
effects of behaviors, attributions, sanctions, and stigma across the life 
course progressively limit options for escape into nondeviant pathways 
and increase risks of persistence in crime. And, as we have seen, similar 
processes appear to contribute to girls' risks of cohabitation with a deviant 
spouse (Quinton et ai., 1993). Lack of family support in adolescence, lack 
of a "planning" disposition in approaching life choices, and association 
with deviant peers each, in succession, increased girls' risks of achieving 
deviant partners. Pathways to more distal outcomes depended crucially 
on these intervening links. 

5.7. Breaking the Chain: Turning Points in the Life Course 

A key corollary of these models is, of course, that those who avoid 
such adverse consequences should show a much reduced likelihood of 
persistence in deviant behaviors. For those at greatest risk, supportive 
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adult roles or relationships have been argued to function as turning points 
in the life course, offering opportunities for the redirection of more long­
standing deviant trajectories (Caspi & Moffitt, 1993; Pickles & Rutter, 1991; 
Rutter, 1996; Sampson & Laub, 1993). Three broad categories of experience 
seem likely to offer the potential for turning points of this kind: those that 
open up new opportunities; those that result in a radical environmental 
change (perhaps especially in terms of close relationships); and those that 
have marked effects on the self-system, or on views and expectations of 
others (Rutter, 1996). 

5.7.1. Testing for Change 

Many apparent changes in behavior represent no more than error, or 
random fluctuations between measurement points (Fergusson et al., 1995; 
Moffitt, Caspi, Harkness, & Silva, 1993). To demonstrate systematic change, 
several methodological steps are required. First and most basic, longitudi­
nal, repeated measurements on the same individuals are needed both 
before and after the postulated turning point. Weak measures of behavior 
may give rise to artifactual impressions of change. Multiple indicators 
provide one safeguard here, along with the use of statistical techniques 
designed to take account of measurement error and persistent unobserved 
heterogeneity between individuals (Nagin & Paternoster, 1991; Sampson & 
Laub, 1993; Zoccolillo et al., 1992). Second, as we have seen, there is a need 
to explore a wide range of later outcomes, to distinguish heterotypic 
continuity from change (Robins, 1986; Zoccolillo et al., 1992). Third, equally 
careful attention is needed in delineating aspects of the experiences postu­
lated to be involved in turning-point effects. Marriage per se, for example, 
may have little effect on desistance from offending (West, 1982). A more 
specific focus on those aspects of relationships theoretically assumed to be 
of importance-harmonious, supportive marriages that can foster posi­
tive social bonds-has revealed a quite different pattern (Quinton & Rut­
ter, 1988; Sampson & Laub, 1993). 

Two additional points need stressing. To detect possible turning 
points, analyses must focus on those segments of a study population for 
whom new experiences have the opportunity to have effects. In disadvan­
taged and deviant samples, these may be quite small; few previously 
deviant individuals may achieve harmonious marriages or strong attach­
ments to work (Quinton & Rutter, 1988). Because of this, conventional tests 
of the proportion of sample variance explained by such experiences may 
suggest quite minor effects. Instead, analyses must be designed to focus on 
those subgroups in the population in which change may be expected 
(Pickles & Rutter, 1991; Zoccolillo et al., 1992). And finally, causal assump­
tions will be most convincing if reversal effects are also observed. 
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5.7.2. Positive Adult Experiences 

A number of studies, including a range of checks of this kind, have 
now demonstrated that positive adult experiences can act as turning 
points out of deviant, antisocial trajectories. For both sexes, supportive 
marital attachments have proved central here. Especially for men, positive 
labor force involvement and geographical moves to new living environ­
ments also appear to play key roles. Sampson and Laub (1993), for exam­
ple, found strong effects of positive marital attachment and bonds to the 
labor force in reducing risks of offending in adult life. The effects were 
similar for previously incarcerated delinquents and in a control group, and 
held when the effects of early heavy drinking were controlled. In addition, 
although the most marked changes were associated with roles and rela­
tionships formed early in adulthood, later improvements in job stability or 
marital attachment were also followed by later decreases in crime. 

Farrington and West (1995) used additional strategies to examine the 
effects of marriage on offending. In samples matched for age and severity 
of prior offending, married men committed significantly fewer offenses in 
the 5 years following their marriage than those who remained single. In 
addition, some reversal effects were evident. Men whose marriages broke 
down offended at rather higher rates during periods of separation and 
were more likely to offend than those who remained with their wives. 
Focusing on women, Quinton and Rutter (1988) found that marriage to a 
nondeviant, supportive partner had marked protective effects against 
parenting problems in their sample of institutionalized women; and Zoc­
colillo et al. (1992) found similar positive effects of marriage on continuities 
between CD and problems in social functioning in these same samples. 
Importantly, although women's likelihood of achieving a supportive part­
ner was influenced by dispositional protective factors, the positive effects 
of a supportive marriage applied even when these were not apparent. 

These findings provide strong support for the role of positive adult 
experiences in influencing antisocial trajectories. As yet, the basis for these 
influences remains to be clarified: Do they emanate primarily, as Sampson 
and Laub (1993) have argued, from the informal social controls implicit in 
adult social bonds, or do the changes reflect more intrapersonal processes, 
arising from enhanced self-esteem or altered social cognitions? Equally 
important, we know very little at this stage of how far such effects general­
ize, or persist beyond their immediate context. Farrington and West's (1995) 
findings that marital separations were followed by somewhat increased 
levels of offending suggest that effects may be time-limited, and context­
dependent. Further tests, exploring the persistence of positive turning­
point experiences across subsequent life transitions, are needed here. In 
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addition, the more extended "timetable" for the transition to adulthood in 
recent generations may hold important implications for the ages at which 
young people gain access to constructive adult involvements (Graham & 
Bowling, 1995), and so for secular trends in persistence in crime. 

S.B. Protective Factors 

To conclude, we turn briefly to the question of individual and social 
factors that may protect against continuance in deviant behavior or crime. 
Here, high-risk designs are needed to identify effects, contrasting the 
development of individuals at equivalent early risk who do and do not 
show the posited protective factors. Several demonstrations of this kind 
have now been undertaken. 

As expected from the consistent associations of antisocial behaviors 
with depressed intellectual skills, IQ shows protective effects against crim­
inality in at-risk groups (Kandel et al., 1988), and interventions designed to 
improve school motivation are also associated with reductions in delin­
quency (Yoshikawa, 1994). As we have seen, behavioral inhibition can 
protect against delinquency in adolescence (Kerr et aL, 1997), and pro social 
tendencies had important effects in moderating longer-term outcomes of 
childhood deviance in other samples (Hamalainen & Pulkkinen, 1996). 

In addition, an individual disposition to planfulness (Clausen, 1991) 
has emerged as of central importance in a number of studies. A planful, 
considered approach to life choices may be especially important for behav­
iorally deviant youth and for those in situations where family or wider 
social supports for life-planning are restricted. Shanahan, Elder, and Miech 
(1996), for example, found that planning was of greatest consequence for 
educational and occupational outcomes in cohorts when institutional 
structures were less supportive of continuance in education. Champion et 
al. (1995) showed that planning was associated with reduced risks of 
exposure to adverse life events, and Quinton and Rutter (1988; Quinton et 
al., 1993) found important effects of planning on later life-course develop­
ments of institution-reared girls. In this sample, planning seemed of cen­
tral relevance for partnership choices, reducing the likelihood that girls 
from high-risk psychosocial backgrounds, or those with histories of CD, 
would enter unsupportive partnerships. No comparable effects were evi­
dent in a community comparison group. There, family supports, along 
with less deviant peer affiliations, seem likely to have offered alternative 
supports for partnership choices. Effects of planning were also less marked 
among institution-reared men (Rutter, Quinton, & Hill, 1990), reflecting 
their generally lower risks of gaining a deviant partner. 

Finally, researchers have begun to investigate psychophysiological 
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factors that may protect against the persistence of antisocial behaviors. 
Raine, Venables, and Williams (1995), for example, have reported that 
antisocial adolescents who desisted from crime in adulthood showed high 
autonomic arousal in the teens, exceeding levels found in a nondeviant 
comparison group. These first findings clearly require confirmation; if 
replicated, however, they may offer important clues to heterogeneity in 
adolescence and provide additional pointers to groups whose deviant 
behavior owes little to psychophysiological predispositions and most to 
environmental and contextual effects. 

6. Conclusions 

Recent years have seen major advances in our understanding of 
developmental continuities in antisocial behavior. It is now clear that the 
long-term risks extend more widely than to severely antisocial outcomes, 
that childhood and adolescent onset behavior problems may vary in both 
risks and long-term consequences, and that although progress to adult 
outcome depends in part on trait persistence, it also turns heavily on 
intervening developments, each holding the potential to maintain or redi­
rect behavioral trajectories over time. Behavior genetic analyses have be­
gun to illuminate the interplay between heritable and experiential risks 
across development, and longitudinal studies are providing an increas­
ingly detailed picture of the complex forces that shape lives through time. 

Alongside these advances, key questions remain to be resolved. We 
have pointed to a number of these in the course of the discussion, and we 
note just a few central issues in conclusion here. First, the heterogeneity of 
antisocial behavior continues to present major challenges. It now seems clear 
that long-term persistence is associated with hyperactivity/inattention, 
generally involves early onset, often includes low reactivity to stress, and 
may be dependent on poor peer relationships. How far these features 
reflect one or several categories, or are better considered in dimensional 
terms, remains obscure; answers to these questions will hold important 
implications for the classification of antisocial disorders. 

Second, though many broad-range mechanisms for the maintenance 
of antisocial behavior have been described, we still know very little of the 
more proximal processes involved in these effects. Assortment on devi­
ance, for example, might reflect a range of processes: active choice of 
deviant partners; limitations on the "field of possibles" from whom con­
duct disordered youth can select their mates; or residue effects, whereby 
antisocial individuals are effectively "deselected" by more conventional 
others. Comparable questions arise in almost all the areas we have sur-
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veyed. To advance theory, and for the lessons they hold for prevention, 
these more proximal processes are key targets for future research. 

Third, we have drawn attention to the indirect causal connections 
through which later experiences serve to accentuate or alter earlier behav­
ioral patterns. We have also shown how individual differences contribute 
in shaping and selecting later environments. But almost nothing is known 
about the role of individual differences in relation to responsivity to envi­
ronments in later adolescence or adult life. Does a harmonious marriage, 
for example, have the same effects in individuals with early-onset anti­
social behavior associated with hyperactivity as in individuals with less 
marked individual-risk characteristics? Does the shaping and selection of 
environments primarily affect outcome for those initially at highest risk? 
To date, these differing issues have in general been examined by separate 
groupings of investigators, each approaching developmental issues in 
antisocial behavior from somewhat different perspectives. The richness of 
research in the field attests to the value of these different approaches. At 
the same time, however, undoubtedly the most major advances of future 
years can be expected from integrations across domains, and from efforts 
to bring together, both conceptually and methodologically, the currently 
separate veins of evidence we have surveyed here. 
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1. Introduction 

Psychotherapy Outcome 
Research with Children 

and Adolescents 
The State of the Art 

JOHN R. WEISZ, STANLEY J. HUEY, 

AND VANESSA ROBIN WEERSING 

After decades of sowing, weeding, harvesting, and winnowing, workers 
in the field of child and adolescent treatment research have produced a 
bumper crop. There are now scores of structured interventions for diverse 
forms of psychological dysfunction across a broad age spectrum. Research­
based treatments exist for a substantial range of clinically significant prob­
lems and disorders. Although a majority of the more than 230 named 
therapies for youths have not been tested empirically (see Kazdin, 1988; 
Kazdin & Weisz, 1996), dozens of such therapies have been subjected to 
empirical scrutiny, with beneficial effects demonstrated in more than 300 
studies. In this chapter, we describe the context of child and adolescent 
treatment and treatment research, summarize findings of that research, 
and offer a constructive critique. Finally, we suggest a number of issues 
that need to be addressed, and approaches that need to be taken, to 
advance the field. Throughout this chapter, we use the term children to 
encompass both children and adolescents, except where a distinction 
needs to be drawn between the two age groups. 
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2. Prevalence of Child Psychopathology and Use 
of Psychotherapy 

Although disturbed children may differ markedly from one another 
in patterns of dysfunction, substantial numbers suffer from some kind of 
significant behavioral, emotional, or mental health problem. Several epi­
demiological studies in the late 1980s (summarized by Costello, 1989), 
taken together, suggested that more than 17% of children in the general 
population met criteria for at least one diagnosis in the Diagnostic and 
Statistical Manual of Mental Disorders, third edition (DSM-III; American 
Psychiatric Association, 1980), and many had multiple disorders; prelimi­
nary findings suggest that prevalence rates will be considerably higher for 
the most recent edition of the diagnostic manual (DSM-IV). Not evident in 
these rates of formal diagnosis are the many children who do not qualify 
for diagnosis but have very significant problems and may well need help. 
Of course, not all disturbed children receive psychotherapy. But the most 
recent estimates available in the United States indicate that about 2.5 
million American children do receive treatment each year (Office of Tech­
nology Assessment, 1986). The annual cost is estimated at more than $1.5 
billion (Institute of Medicine, 1989). The dates cited for these statistics 
reveal a need for more recent data, particularly given the marked changes 
seen in the U.S. mental health care delivery system (e.g., managed care) in 
the mid-1990s. 

3. Distinctive Features of Child Treatment 

Psychotherapy with children bears notable similarities to work with 
adults, but some important differences warrant attention here-differences 
that are relevant to our interpretation of the treatment research literature. 
First, unlike adults, children rarely perceive themselves as "disturbed" or 
as needing therapy. Thus, most treatment referrals, up until late adoles­
cence, tend to be made by parents, teachers, or other adults, who contract 
for the therapy, pay the bill, and identify some or all of the goals the 
therapist is to pursue. The child mayor may not participate in identifying 
target problems or setting treatment goals, or may participate but with less 
ultimate influence than the adults involved. In a sense, in child therapy, the 
child is often "the patient," whereas the parent or other adult is "the 
client." With therapy commissioned by adults, and its goals heavily influ­
enced by adults, it is clear that children may sometimes enter the process 
with little motivation for treatment or personal change, or at least with 
different objectives than those shared by the adults involved. 
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Child therapy also differs from adult therapy in the sources of infor­
mation used by the therapist to shape the goals and directions of treat­
ment. Given developmental limitations in the self-awareness, psychologi­
cal mindedness, and expressive ability of their clientele, child therapists 
must rely heavily on adults for information about the youngsters they 
treat, and this can present problems of several types. First, parents' and 
teachers' reports may be inaccurate, based on distorted samples of child 
behavior, influenced by their own adult agendas, calculated to conceal 
their own failings as parents (including neglect or abuse), or even biased 
by their own pathologies (see, e.g., Kazdin & Weisz, 1996); and levels of 
agreement among different adult informants reporting on the same child 
tend to be low (Achenbach, McConaughy, & Howell, 1987). Even where 
there is no blatant bias or intentional distortion, adult reports of child 
behavior and adult identification of reasons for referral are both apt to 
reflect the values, practices, and social ideals of their cultural reference 
groupl (see Weisz, McCarty, Eastman, Chaiyasit, & 5uwanlert, 1997; Weisz 
et al., 1988; Weisz & Weiss, 1991). 

A third notable difference between adult and child treatment relates 
to environmental selection. To a much greater extent than adults, children 
are captives of their externally engineered environments. Thus, the "pa­
thology" the child therapist treats may reside as much in a disturbed 
environment from which the child cannot escape as in the child's person­
ality. This fact may limit the impact of interventions that focus on the child 
as solo or primary participant, and it may argue for involvement of others 
from the child's social context, but of course, such significant others are not 
always willing or cooperative. So, in a number of ways, the child therapist 
faces challenges that are rather different from those confronted by one who 
treats only adults. This being the case, it cannot simply be assumed that if 
therapy is effective with adults it is also effective with children; rather, a 
separate body of treatment outcome research is required. We turn now to 
that body of research, investigating whether psychological treatment of 
children is beneficial. 

4. Evidence on the Effects of Child Treatment 

Evidence on the effects of child treatment comes in several forms. The 
most widely recognized of these is the clinical trial, an outcome study 

lThe picture can grow complex when these values, practices, and social ideals are not shared 
by others who are involved in the process of therapy (e.g., a therapist and teacher whose 
culture differs from that of the child and family). 
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comparing posttreatment adjustment in a group of children who received 
a candidate intervention to that of one or more control groups who did 
not. It is these clinical trials studies that are most frequently pooled in re­
views and meta-analyses (to follow) and thus constitute most of the evi­
dence discussed in this chapter. However, other approaches to outcome 
assessment should be noted here. In circumstances where all the chil­
dren with a particular condition must receive an active treatment, mul­
tiple baseline designs, ABAB (sometimes called "reversal") designs, and 
simultaneous/ alternating treatment designs are useful. Such approaches 
are often used in treatment research with attention-deficit-hyperactivity 
disordered (ADHD) youth (see, e.g., Pelham et al., 1993), in studies where 
an entire classroom needs to receive an intervention (see, e.g., Wurtele & 
Drabman, 1984), and in cases (sometimes involving rare conditions) where 
only one or two children will be treated (e.g., McGrath, Dorsett, Calhoun, 
& Drabman, 1988; Tarnowski, Rosen, McGrath, & Drabman, 1987). These 
alternative outcome assessment designs have generated a rich body of 
outcome data that, unfortunately, still await an enterprising reviewer. For 
now, though, we will focus on the clinical trials research, which has been 
reviewed rather thoroughly in the form of several meta-analyses, as de­
scribed here. 

4.1. Meta-Analysis: Description, Interpretation, Cautionary Notes 

Research findings on psychotherapy effects can be pooled via a tech­
nique called meta-analysis (see Mann, 1990; Smith, Glass, & Miller, 1980; 
but see also critiques, e.g., by Wilson, 1985). The technique uses effect size 
(ES) as the unit of analysis. ES is an index of the size and direction of 
treatment effects. For most clinical trials, it is the posttreatment mean on 
some outcome measure for the treated group minus the mean for the 
control group, with the difference divided by the standard deviation (SD) 
of the outcome measure. Figure 1 is a guide to interpreting ES values. As 
the figure indicates, ES values may be positive, indicating treatment bene­
fit; zero, indicating no effect; or negative, indicating a detrimental effect.2 

Each ES value corresponds to a percentile standing of the average treated 
child on the outcome measure(s) if that child were placed in the control 
group after treatment. For example, an ES of 0.90 indicates that the average 
treated child scored better after treatment than 82% of the control group. 

2Por clarity, we are describing the situation in which positive scores on an outcome measure 
reflect good adjustment. In the cases where the opposite is true (e.g., where the outcome 
measure is a symptom count), calculations are typically done in such a way that a positive 
effect size continues to imply more improvement in the treatment than the control group. 
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FIGURE 1. An aid to interpreting effect size (ES) statistics. Each ES value corresponds to a 
specific percentile standing of the average treated child, after treatment, across outcome 
measures, relative to the untreated group. Reprinted with permission from Weisz, Weiss, 
Donenberg, Han, and Weiss (1995). 

As an aid to interpretation. Cohen's (1988) guidelines suggest that an ES of 
0.20 may be considered a "small" effect, 0.50 a "medium" effect, and 0.80 a 
"large" effect. 

By averaging across the various outcome measures used, a meta­
analyst may compute a single mean ES for each study (or each treatment 
group) in the collection to be reviewed. This permits computation of an 
overall mean ES for the entire collection of studies; it also permits compari­
son of mean ES across studies differing in potentially important ways (e.g., 
in the type of therapy employed, the target problem being treated, or the 
age or gender of the children involved). The results of such comparisons 
can suggest promising hypotheses--for example, about direct causes, 
moderators, and mediators of treatment outcome. Thus, meta-analyses 
can be useful both descriptively, in summarizing the knowledge base and 
trends therein, and heuristically, in generating questions and predictions 
for further study. 

Like any technique, however, meta-analysis has limitations, some 
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warranting attention here. First, the output of meta-analyses must neces­
sarily reflect limitations of the input. As an example, ES means in the child 
treatment area reflect a limited range of methods, because there are many 
more studies of behavioral (including cognitive-behavioral) than non­
behavioral treatments. Another limitation is the inevitable confounding 
among independent variables (e.g., certain target problems tend to be 
treated with certain methods); such confounding can be addressed partly 
via eliminating and interaction tests (see, e.g., Weisz, Weiss, Han, Granger, 
& Morton, 1995c), but the problem can never be completely solved, and 
this complicates interpretation of findings. More broadly, every meta­
analysis requires scores of decisions (e.g., how inclusive to be across 
studies varying in methodological rigor, which outcome measures to ac­
cept, whether to use raw ES or adjust for sample size), any of which may 
influence the obtained ES values and group means (see relevant findings 
in a methodological meta-analysis by Weiss & Weisz, 1990). Because no 
two investigative teams could possibly make all these decisions exactly 
alike, conclusions of different meta-analyses may differ in part because of 
differences in meta-analytic method, not just because of substantive differ­
ences in study findings. For this reason, convergent findings across sepa­
rate meta-analyses are particularly useful. With these cautionary notes in 
place, we now consider findings of meta-analyses in the child area. 

4.2. Findings from Meta-Analyses of Child Psychotherapy Research 

We know of four published, broad-based child psychotherapy meta­
analyses, that is, meta-analyses involving diverse collections of studies, 
with few limits imposed on the kinds of treated problems or types of 
intervention that are included. Together, these four meta-analyses encom­
pass more than 300 separate treatment outcome studies. In the first of the 
four, Casey and Berman (1985) included outcome studies published be­
tween 1952 and 1982, involving treatment of children aged 12 and younger. 
The mean ES was 0.71 for those studies that included treatment-control 
comparisons; in percentile terms (see our discussion of Figure I), the 
average treated child scored better after treatment than 76% of control 
group children, averaging across outcome measures. In a second meta­
analysis, Weisz, Weiss, Alicke, and Klotz (1987) reviewed outcome studies 
published between 1952 and 1983, involving children aged 4-18. The mean 
ES was 0.79, indicating that, after treatment, the average treated child was 
at the 79th percentile of control group peers, across outcome measures. 

The third broad-based meta-analysis was carried out by Kazdin, Bass, 
Ayers, and Rodgers (1990a). It included studies published between 1970 
and 1988, with children aged 4-18. For the subset of studies that compared 
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treatment and no-treatment control groups, the mean ES was 0.88; this 
indicated that the average treated child scored higher on outcome mea­
sures, after treatment, than 81 % of the no-treatment comparison group. For 
studies in the Kazdin et al. collection that involved comparison of treat­
ment groups to active control groups, mean ES was 0.77; the average 
treated child was functioning better, posttreatment, than 78% of the control 
group. The fourth broad-based meta-analysis was conducted by Weisz et 
al. (1995c); it included studies published between 1967 and 1993, involving 
children aged 2-18. The mean ES was 0.71; this indicated that, after treat­
ment, the average treated child was functioning better than 76% of com­
parison children in the control groups. (For more detailed descriptions of 
the procedures and findings of both broad-based and more narrowly 
focused meta-analyses, see Weisz & Weiss, 1993.) 

These four broad-based meta-analyses present a uniformly positive 
picture. Their mean ES values ranged from 0.71 to 0.84 (0.84 is the esti­
mated overall mean for Kazdin et al., 1990), hovering near Cohen's (1988) 
threshold of 0.80 for a "large" effect. (Note, however, that recent analyses 
[in Weisz et al., 1995c] suggests that true population ES means, adjusting 
for heterogeneity of variance, may be closer to the "medium" level.) Figure 
2 shows findings from the four child meta-analyses presented together 
with the findings of two frequently cited meta-analyses with older groups­
that is, Smith and Glass's (1977) meta-analysis of primarily adult psycho­
therapy outcome studies, and Shapiro and Shapiro's (1982) meta-analysis 
of exclusively adult outcome studies. As the figure suggests, mean effects 
found in child meta-analyses fall within the range of effects found in these 
two adult meta-analyses. Thus, the evidence suggests that empirically 
tested child and adolescent treatments may approximate the effects of 
empirically tested adult treatments. 

4.3. Findings of Focused Meta-Analyses 

Complementing the broad-based analyses just described, some meta­
analysts have addressed rather specific questions by focusing on select 
subsets of treatment outcome studies. Meta-analyses focused specifically 
on cognitive-behavioral therapy have found substantial positive effects 
across a range of target problems (Durlak, Fuhrman, & Lampman, 1991) 
and on impulsivity considered alone (Baer & Nietzel, 1991). And Dush, 
Hirt, and Schroeder (1989) found significant positive effects associated 
with the specific cognitive-behavioral technique of self-statement mod­
ification. Two teams (Hazelrigg, Cooper, & Borduin, 1987; Shadish et al., 
1993) have found respectable mean effects of family therapy, somewhat 
higher for measures of individual family members' behavior than for 



56 JOHN R. WEISZ ET AL. 

AOULT CHILO 

1.0 

0.9 

LARGE 0.8 

0.7 

0.6 

MEDIUM 0.5 

0.4 

0.3 

SMALL 0.2 

0.1 

0.0 
so"''' SHAPtRO' CA.SIEY WEISZ KAlDIH 

• "lAM 5HAP111O I. fl£R~ ET...... ET A,L, 
(11m (1M2) (1M5) (1.7) (1WO, 

FIGURE 2. Mean effect sizes found in the predominantly adult meta-analysis by Smith and 
Glass (1977), in the exclusively adult meta-analysis by Shapiro and Shapiro (1982), and in four 
broad-based meta-analyses of psychotherapy outcome studies with children and adoles­
cents. Reprinted with permission from Weisz, Donenberg, Han, and Weiss (1995). 

family interaction measures. Moderate positive effects have been found 
for interventions used to prepare children for medical and dental proce­
dures (Saile, Burgmeier, & Schmidt, 1988), and for psychotherapeutic inter­
ventions administered in school settings (Prout & DeMartino, 1986). fi­
nally, illustrating the range of questions to which meta-analysis may be 
relevant, Russell, Greenwald, and Shirk (1991) used a sample of treatment 
studies to test whether child language proficiency improved with psycho­
therapy; it did, particularly with therapies that emphasized spontaneous 
verbal interaction. 

4.4. A Sampler of Additional Meta-Analytic Findings: 
Outcome as a Function of Therapy, Therapist, and Child Factors 

A potpourri of other meta-analytic findings illustrates both the de­
scriptive summarizing, debate-provoking, and hypothesis-generating/ 
research-provoking potential of the technique. In the two meta-analyses 
from our lab (Weisz et aI., 1987; Weisz et aI., 1995c), we found that studies 
involving behavioral treatments (e.g., behavioral contracting, modeling, 
cognitive-behavioral therapy) generated larger effects than studies using 
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nonbehavioral treatments (e.g., insight-oriented therapy, client-centered 
counseling). (The Casey-Berman [1985] meta-analyses showed the same 
effect at p = .06; Kazdin et al. [1990a] did not address the question.) By 
contrast, meta-analyses have generally not found that treatment outcomes 
differ reliably for different types of treated problems (e.g., internalizing vs. 
externalizing; for one exception, see Casey & Berman, 1985, pp. 392-393). 

The relation between treatment outcome and age has varied across 
meta-analyses. However, the meta-analysis involving the most recent col­
lection of studies (Weisz et al., 1995c) found that mean ES was larger for 
adolescents than for children. Notably, this main effect was qualified by an 
age x gender interaction (shown in Figure 3): Mean ES for samples of 
predominantly or exclusively adolescent girls was twice as large as mean 
ES for adolescent boys and for children of both genders. One possible 
interpretation might be that adolescent girls are more likely to be treated 
for internalizing problems than are younger children or adolescent boys; 
however, we found no reliable difference in mean ES for internalizing 
versus externalizing problems, and in any event, the age x gender inter­
action shown in Figure 3 was not qualified by type of treated problem 
(internalizing vs. externalizing), type of treatment (behavioral vs. non­
behavioral), or level of therapist training (professional vs. clinical trainee 
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FIGURE 3. Mean effect size for samples of predominantly male and female children (11 years 
of age and younger) and adolescents (12 years of age and older). Reprinted with permission 
from Weisz, Weiss, Han, Granger, and Morton (1995). 
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vs. paraprofessional). Perhaps there is something about the treatments 
encompassed in these studies in the 1995 meta-analysis that fits the charac­
teristics and needs of adolescent girls particularly well. If so, we are left to 
speculate about what that elusive quality may be. 

Two additional findings illustrate two additional ways meta-analytic 
data can be used. First, meta-analysis can be used to assess the holding 
power of intervention effects. We have found in both our meta-analyses 
(Weisz et al., 1987; Weisz et al., 1995c) that treatment effects measured 
immediately after treatment are quite similar to effects measured at follow­
up assessments, which average about 6 months after treatment termina­
tion. This suggests that treatment benefits tend to be durable, at least 
within typical follow-up time frames. 

A second finding (from Weisz et al., 1995c) concerns the specificity of 
treatment effects. Obviously, children differ markedly from one another in 
problem profile, and the various therapies differ from one another in the 
problems they are designed to address, but do these individual differences 
actually influence treatment outcome? Some (e.g., Frank, 1973) have ar­
gued that psychotherapy has general, "nonspecific" effects (e.g., helping 
people through such unfocused means as promoting a feeling of being 
understood, or inducing an expectancy of relief). In an alternative view, 
therapies help in specific ways, and thus have their most pronounced 
influence on the specific problems they are designed to address. 

In Weisz et al. (1995c), we addressed this controversy by testing 
whether effect sizes were larger for the specific problem domains targeted 
by a treatment than for other, more incidental domains. As an example, we 
asked whether a treatment designed to reduce anxiety produced bigger 
changes in anxiety levels than in related but more peripheral problems 
such as depression. Across multiple comparisons like these, our analyses 
showed that ES means were about twice as large for the specific problems 
addressed in treatment as for related problems that were not specifically 
targeted. This suggests that the tested child psychotherapies are not 
merely producing global or nonspecific good feelings that influence di­
verse outcomes equally; instead, the treatments appear to have rather 
precise, focused effects consistent with the specific changes they were 
designed to bring about.3 

3An alternative perspective on these findings warrants consideration as well. If one focuses 
on the "nonspecific factor" of client expectancy, it might be argued that the findings cut in the 
other direction; that is, because the domains targeted in treatment may be the most reactive 
for the client, those outcome domains would be expected to change more than nontargeted 
domains, given the impact of client expectancy. In summary, the findings support the notion 
that outcomes are target-problem-specific, but the precise mechanism driving this specificity 
may continue to be a matter of debate in the field. 
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To summarize the evidence, meta-analyses of child psychotherapy 
outcome studies point to positive, durable, and problem-specific effects of 
mental health interventions for a variety of child problems. Clearly, child 
psychotherapy research is generating a number of encouraging findings. 
On the other hand, significant limitations in conceptualization, sampling, 
study design, and outcome assessment methodology make research in this 
area less useful and less edifying than it might otherwise be. We turn our 
attention now to some of the limitations of child treatment outcome re­
search, and we offer suggestions for future research that we believe could 
help advance the field. 

5. Representativeness of Outcome Research vis-a-vis Clinical 
Practice 

One significant limitation of child psychotherapy outcome research to 
date is that much of it has been conducted with nonreferred children and 
under conditions that may have rather limited external validity for clinical 
practice. Most of the 300-plus studies in the meta-analyses reviewed ear­
lier (especially the recent and behavioral studies) involved samples, treat­
ments, and/or treatment conditions that are not very representative of 
what typically happens in most clinical practice with referred children. In 
many of the studies, for example, (1) children were recruited for treatment 
and were not actual clinic cases; (2) homogeneous samples were selected, 
with therapy addressing only one focal problem (e.g., a specific phobia) or 
a narrow range; (3) therapists received extensive pretherapy training and 
between-session supervision in the specific intervention techniques they 
would use; and/or (4) the therapy involved more or less exclusive adher­
ence to those specific techniques. In addition, (5) therapy was frequently 
highly structured, guided by a manual, and/or monitored for adherence 
to a treatment plan. 

These features of the experimental studies tend to coalesce around an 
abstract category that we (Weisz, Weiss, & Donenberg, 1992) have called 
research therapy, as distinguished from conventional clinic therapy. Table 1 
summarizes some illustrative differences between the two therapy genres. 
The two are best construed as two poles of a multidimensional continuum; 
certainly no single feature listed in the table under Research Therapy is 
present in all laboratory outcome studies, nor is any single feature listed 
under Clinic Therapy present in all clinic-based treatment. Moreover, we 
do not intend to imply that either pole is somehow "better" than the other; 
rather, the two poles reflect characteristics that are driven in part by the 
rather different objectives and requirements of outcome research and 
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TABLE 1 
Some Characteristics Frequently Associated with Child Psychotherapy 

in Outcome Research (Research Therapy) and in Clinics (Clinic Therapy) 

Research therapy 

Recruited cases (less severe, study 
volunteers) 

Homogeneous groups 
Narrow or single-problem focus 
Treatment in lab, school settings 
Researcher as therapists 
Very small caseloads 
Heavy pretherapy preparation 
Preplanned, highly structured 

treatment (manualized) 
Monitoring of therapist behavior 
Behavioral methods 

Clinic therapy 

Clinic-referred cases (more severe, 
some coerced into treatment) 

Heterogeneous groups 
Broad, multiproblem focus 
Treatment in clinic, hospital settings 
Professional career therapists 
Very large caseloads 
Little/light pretherapy preparation 
Flexible, adjustable treatment (no 

treatment manual) 
Little monitoring of therapist behavior 
Nonbehavioral methods 

clinic treatment, respectively. However, differences between child therapy 
in outcome studies and child therapy in clinics are common enough and 
substantial enough that it is fair to ask whether the positive outcomes 
generated in the research therapy studies, and summarized in the pre­
vious meta-analyses, are representative of the outcomes achieved in actual 
clinical practice with children. 

5.1. Evidence on the Effects of Child Treatment in Clinical Practice 

We sought to find out what outcomes are achieved in clinical practice 
with children, but we found it difficult to locate much relevant evidence. 
We conducted a search (described in Weisz, Donenberg, Han, & Weiss, 
1995b) for published outcome studies that focused on what might fairly be 
called "clinic therapy." The search aimed for studies that involved (1) treat­
ment of clinic-referred (i.e., not" analog" or recruited) youngsters; (2) treat­
ment in service-oriented clinics or clinical agencies, not in research settings 
(e.g., not public schools or university labs); (3) therapy carried out by 
practicing clinicians (as opposed to trained research assistants); and 
(4) therapy that was part of the regular service provided by the clinic, not a 
treatment program designed specifically for research. For inclusion, we 
required that the studies involve direct comparison between youngsters 
who received treatment and a control group who received no treatment or 
a placebo condition. 

Clinic studies that met the criteria outlined here proved to be very 
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rare. We had done one study that met the criteria (Weisz & Weiss, 1989), but 
we found only eight others (spanning a period of 50 years) that seemed to 
fit; most of these had been published many years earlier. The studies all 
compared treatment and control groups, but via several different method­
ologies (for details, see Weisz, Donenberg, Han, & Kauneckis, 1995a). To 
facilitate comparison of findings from these nine studies with the meta­
analytic findings, we computed an ES or ES estimate for each of the nine 
studies (for studies that did not report the statistics needed for standard ES 
calculation, we used estimation procedures described by Smith et al., 1980, 
and Glass, McGaw, & Smith, 1981). As shown in Figure 4, ES values ranged 
from -0.40 to +0.29, with mean ES for the nine clinic studies (0.01) falling 
well below the mean ES of the four broad-based meta-analyses discussed 
earlier (0.77). This certainly points to outcomes of clinic therapy that were 
less positive than the outcomes of research therapy, at least for the pool of 
studies we have identified. 

These findings are complemented by recent evidence on "system of 
care" or "continuum of care" programs for children, that is, efforts to 
provide an array of conventional mental health services to children, often 
with the services organized and coordinated by a case manager (see, e.g., 
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FIGURE 4. Estimated effect sizes for nine studies of clinic-based psychotherapy with chil­
dren and adolescents. Horizontal arrows show mean effect size for four broad-based meta­
analyses of laboratory outcome studies (top), and averaging across the nine clinic-based 
studies (bottom). Reprinted with permission from Weisz, Weiss, Donenberg, Han, and Weiss 
(1995). 
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Stroul & Friedman, 1986). In one of the most recent and ambitious of these 
efforts, the Fort Bragg Project (see Bickman, 1996; Bickman et al., 1995), the 
U.s. Army spent $80 million to provide an organized continuum of mental 
health care for children in the Ft. Bragg (North Carolina) catchment area, 
and to test its cost effectiveness relative to the more typical fragmented 
services in a matched comparison site. The Fort Bragg program apparently 
did produce well-integrated services. It was judged by the American 
Psychological Association's section on Child Clinical Psychology and the 
Division of Child, Youth, and Family Services Joint Task Force to be 

the most comprehensive program to date, integrating many of the approaches 
demonstrated by other service programs ... integrated and flexibly con­
structed, yet comprehensive, [with] services available to be adapted to meet the 
needs of children and their families, rather than a simplistic application of a 
single approach. (Roberts, 1994, p. 215) 

There is good evidence (see Bickman et al., 1995) that the program pro­
duced better access to treatment and higher levels of client satisfaction; the 
program also cost a good deal more than services in the comparison site. 
Unfortunately, clinical and functional outcomes were no better among Fort 
Bragg children than among children in the comparison site. Fort Bragg 
children received more mental health intervention at greater cost, but their 
outcomes were not improved by the increased intensity and cost. 

Rather similar findings have emerged from other studies designed to 
modify, link, or otherwise improve delivery of conventional clinical ser­
vices (see, e.g., Evans et al., 1994; Lehman, Postrado, Toth, McNary, & 
Goldman, 1994). Certainly, a number of alternative interpretations of these 
null findings may be plausible, but one interpretation that must be consid­
ered is this: The various treatments that are linked and coordinated within 
these continua of care may simply not be very effective, individually or in 
combination (see Weisz, Han, & Valeri, 1997). Because there is no indica­
tion that the individual interventions employed in these various continua 
of care have been tested empirically and shown to be effective, it is possible 
that the various interventions are simply not very helpful to children. By 
extension, it is also possible that a broad array of relatively ineffective 
services will not produce much true benefit, regardless of the extent to 
which they are multiplied and organized into continua or systems of care, 
and regardless of whether they are coordinated by case managers. 

To summarize findings on representative clinical interventions with 
children, (1) the limited evidence on conventional clinical treatments pro­
vides little support for their effectiveness, and (2) the modest number of 
available studies on effects of integrating conventional interventions into 
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systems or continua of care also shows little evidence of treatment benefit. 
These conclusions may certainly be reversed or otherwise modified by 
future research findings. But the findings to date offer little support for the 
effectiveness of conventional clinical intervention for young people. 

5.2. Directions for Future Research 

The research findings on community- and clinic-based interventions 
suggest a number of useful directions for future research. First, we cer­
tainly need a richer base of information than is currently available on 
outcomes of treatment under representative clinical conditions. Research 
on this question is difficult but certainly not impossible to carry out, as the 
nine studies shown in Figure 4 demonstrate (for a discussion of the pros 
and cons of various methods, see Weisz & Weiss, 1993). Our base of 
information on psychotherapy effects in public clinics is obviously quite 
thin, but the situation is even worse for other treatment contexts. For 
example, as best we can determine, there is currently no methodologically 
sound investigation of treatment effects in such now-common treatment 
configurations as group and individual private practice and health mainte­
nance organizations (HMOs). We need evidence on the child outcomes 
generated by these forms of practice if we are to know how outcomes 
across the range of today's clinic therapies compare to the outcomes of 
laboratory interventions. Moreover, without such information, we will 
lack the kind of baseline data needed to assess the impact of significant 
changes in clinical practice conditions-for example, such changes as the 
implementation of empirically validated treatments (to follow) or even the 
introduction of managed care. 

If further research on conventional clinical treatment continues to 
show rather poor effects, we will also need research to identify factors that 
account for the difference between the strong positive effects of therapy in 
lab studies and the weak effects in clinical settings. We have made two 
attempts to address this issue (Weisz et aI., 1995a; Weisz et aI., 1995b). In 
both, we used our meta-analytic data sets to assess which, if any, of the 
factors that distinguish research therapy from clinic therapy (e.g., of those 
shown in Table 1) might account for substantial variance in treatment 
outcome. In our most recent effort, using our most compete sample (Weisz 
et aI., 1995b), we examined eight potentially relevant factors and we found 
two that were significantly related to treatment outcome: (1) Behavioral 
treatments generated better outcomes than nonbehavioral treatments, and 
(2) analog cases had better outcomes than clinic-referred children. The first 
finding suggests the possibility that effects of clinic treatment might be 
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enhanced if more behavioral treatments were used in those settings; recent 
evidence does indicate that behavioral treatments are not the first choice of 
most practitioners (see Kazdin, Siegel, & Bass, 1990b), and this suggests 
that such therapies may not be used as frequently as nonbehavioral ap­
proaches. The second finding suggests that even the lab-tested treatment 
methods may be less successful in treating truly clinic-referred children 
than in treating the less disturbed children who are so often the subjects in 
lab studies. This, in tum, suggests that one reason clinical practice out­
comes may be less positive than research therapy outcomes is simply that 
the clients referred to clinics are more difficult to treat. 

A third useful direction for future research is relevant to the current 
emphasis on moving empirically supported treatments into clinical prac­
tice and clinical training programs (Chambless et al., 1996; Task Force, 
1995). At first blush, it would seem that the array of findings presented 
earlier points to a clear need to emphasize empirically supported treat­
ments in clinical practice. The logic is simple: (1) Evidence from clinical 
trials research with children, as summarized in meta-analyses, shows that 
the treatments represented in this literature generally produce positive 
effects; (2) research on conventional treatments in clinical settings has 
shown little evidence of positive effects; thus, (3) to generate beneficial 
effects in clinical settings, we should identify those treatments that have 
been supported in clinical trials and export them to clinics. This logic may 
prove to be sound in the long term; however, it may be a mistake to assume 
that the empirically supported treatments are ready for immediate export. 

The problem is that the subjects and treatment conditions involved in 
tests of the empirically supported treatments tend to differ so much from 
everyday clinic cases and conditions that it is not entirely clear how 
workable or effective the supported treatments will be in practicing clinics. 
Some of the relevant differences are those noted earlier, in our discussion 
of Table 1. For example, consider the samples frequently employed in 
clinical trials research. We cannot be certain that treatments supported in 
clinical trials studies with subclinical samples recruited from schools will 
be equally effective with seriously disturbed children referred to clinics. 
Indeed, in a recent analysis (Weisz et al., 1995b, p.695), we found that mean 
ES in even the clinical trials research was significantly lower for studies 
using clinic-referred children than for those using analog samples. As a 
second example, clinical trials studies frequently focus on homogeneous 
groups, selected for the presence of one or two target problems, and with 
exclusionary criteria applied to exclude children who have additional 
unwanted problems. We cannot be sure that treatments supported with 
such samples will be equally effective with the heterogeneous groups of 
multiproblem children frequently seen in everyday clinical practice. 
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What these concerns suggest is that before manualized treatments 
from the empirical literature are implemented in our clinics and clinical 
training programs, we may need a new genre of treatment outcome re­
search. This research would involve taking empirically supported treat­
ments out of the laboratories where they were developed and experiment­
ing with them in the crucible of clinical practice. The idea would be to find 
out what modifications are needed to make the treatments effective with 
the clientele, and under the real-life constraints, of clinical practice. Several 
investigators have taken steps in this direction, for example, by treating 
truly disturbed children in university-based lab clinics (see, e.g., Kendall, 
1994; Lovaas, 1987). However, more extensive attempts may be needed to 
incorporate lab-tested treatments into clinical practice, and test their ef­
fects, before we can know (1) what changes will be needed to make these 
treatments work with seriously disturbed children, and (2) what steps 
must be taken for the treatments to operate within the policy and person­
nel parameters of most clinics. 

6. Assessment of Therapy Process in Clinical Practice 

To the extent that we begin to focus outcome research on treatment by 
practitioners in clinical settings with referred children, we are apt to need a 
much richer armamentarium than is now available to assess the processes 
that may account for outcome. When treatment works well, we need to 
know what therapy processes were involved, so we can repeat them and 
build on them; and when treatment fails, we need to know what to stop 
doing. This is especially important-but especially difficult methodologi­
cally-in research on nonmanualized treatments in conventional clinical 
practice. By contrast, structured interventions frequently involve detailed 
accounts of the treatment techniques used by therapists, but even those 
treatment studies that involve structured, manual-driven interventions 
rarely include efforts to determine what particular aspects of therapy were 
the "active ingredients" of treatment. 

The typical clinical trial in the child area provides a rather global 
comparison of a control group to a treatment program involving multiple 
techniques. Significant global group differences at posttreatment and 
follow-up are indeed important elements of treatment validation, and for 
cost-effectiveness probably the most useful first step in treatment develop­
ment. However, the lack of specificity regarding which elements of the 
treatment are producing which aspects of client change has led to calls for 
a more fine-grained analysis of the processes of child psychotherapy that 
influence treatment outcome (Kazdin & Weisz, in press; Kendall & Morris, 



66 JOHN R. WEISZ ET AL. 

1991). Kazdin et al. (1990a) reported that one-fourth of their sample of 
223 outcome studies varied some technique components across groups, 
and only 2% evaluated outcome in relation to treatment processes, such as 
the therapeutic relationship; this suggests that there is room for growth in 
research on what therapist, client, and relationship factors over the course 
of the therapy process actually influence change. There are at least four 
ways of construing such research. 

6.1. Treatment Components 

Wherever well-replicated effects indicate that a treatment program is 
effective, a logical next step is to test the effects of various program 
components, in combinations that make sense logically and theoretically. 
At least two variations on this theme are well recognized in the field. A 
dismantling approach involves breaking a program down into technique 
components and varying these across groups; an additive approach in­
volves progressive addition of new components, or combining two or 
more treatments into one. In the Kazdin et al. (1990a) analysis of 223 child 
treatment outcome studies, 26% involved the first approach, to some 
extent, and 19% involved the second approach. If these numbers seem 
surprisingly large, it should be borne in mind that 60% of the Kazdin et al. 
sample of studies involved comparison of two or more treatments, not 
necessarily with a no-treatment or active control group. So, the data sug­
gest that research involving "unpacking" specific treatment components is 
underway in the child area, but that much work remains to be done. 

6.2. Therapist Behavior during Treatment 

A second dimension of therapy process that deserves scrutiny is the 
behavior and style of the therapist, independent of the specific compo­
nents of an outline or manual. For example, a good deal of research has 
focused on therapist directness in communication with clients. In a series 
of studies, Patterson and his colleagues have noted that therapists' direct 
instructions to parents of antisocial children to change their parenting style 
are frequently met with noncompliance in session and resistance to change 
outside sessions (e.g., Patterson & Chamberlain, 1994; Patterson & For­
gatch, 1985). On the other hand, with a similar sample of delinquent 
children, Truax and Wittmer (1973) found evidence that directness by the 
therapist may have positive effects in confronting defense mechanisms in 
psychodynamic child therapy. As the findings of these two investigative 
teams suggest, anyone aspect of therapist style or behavior may have 
differential effects depending on the content and objectives of the treat-
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ment, and, of course, therapist style may well interact with client style and 
personality to shape the ultimate effects. Despite the complexity of the 
task, and the infinite array of therapist style and behavior dimensions that 
might be addressed, research on this theme may be well worth the invest­
ment of time and intellectual resources it will require. Of all the research 
discussed in this chapter, this is perhaps the most relevant to the task of 
therapist training. Many directors of training programs for clinical psy­
chologists and child psychiatry fellows would, no doubt, agree that we 
have a great deal to learn about this task. 

6.3. Child and Family Behavior during Treatment 

A third aspect of the treatment process that requires attention is the 
behavior of treated children and their families over the course of therapy. 
Research on this theme is illustrated by the work of Gorin (1993) and 
Braswell, Kendall, Braith, Carey, and Vye (1985) indicating that positive 
treatment outcomes are associated with clients' active on-task participa­
tion in therapy. Braswell et al. sampled therapist and child behavior from 
several sessions of cognitive-behavioral, behavioral, and attention-control 
treatment of impulsivity and attentional problems. Across groups, mea­
sures of child involvement, as indexed by child requests for information, 
clarification, or elaboration of the task at hand, were significantly related to 
positive outcome. Therapists' attempts to foster child involvement through 
eliciting feedback, encouraging children's performance, and correcting 
mistakes, were also related to outcome. Self-disclosure and non-task­
related verbalization (i.e., off-task involvement) were not related to out­
come. 

Causality is difficult to nail down in such research, and it is certainly 
possible that such client behavior as active participation may be either a 
cause of the ultimate treatment benefit, a signal that the treatment is 
resonating with the client and producing change, or both. But, causality 
aside, the identification of child and family behavior during therapy that 
can predict ultimate outcome can, in principle, provide a much-needed 
tool for therapists: a means of determining-before the entire intervention 
program has ended-whether the treatment is working or not, and thus 
whether adjustments are needed. 

6.4. The Therapeutic Relationship 

The fourth dimension is perhaps the most elusive but possibly also 
the most important. The therapeutic relationship, or working alliance, has 
been construed as involving two interrelated parts: (1) the client's positive 
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emotional connection to the therapist and (2) a shared conceptualization 
between the client and therapist of the tasks and goals of therapy (Bordin, 
1979). In the adult literature, development of a therapeutic relationship has 
emerged as a particularly significant process correlate of positive outcome 
in several studies (Horowitz, Marmar, Weiss, DeWitt, & Rosenbaum, 1984; 
Luborsky, Crits-Christoph, Mintz, & Aurerbach, 1988). Shirk and Saiz 
(1992) have argued that this process variable may be an even more signifi­
cant contributor to outcome for children due to the "involuntary client" 
status of many children at the beginning of therapy, the nonverbal nature 
of many forms of client-centered and play therapy for children, and the 
social deficits that are hypothesized to be central in the development and 
maintenance of many serious child problems (e.g., aggression). But only a 
few studies have examined the therapeutic relationship in the context of 
child treatment. 

Researchers in the child area have studied the therapeutic relationship 
in play therapy (Howe & Silvern,1981; Truax, Altmann, Wright, & Mitchell, 
1973), family therapy (Friedlander, Wildman, Heatherington, & Skowron, 
1994; Pinsoff & Catherall, 1986), individual psychodynamic therapy (Shirk 
& Saiz, 1992), cognitive-behavioral treatment (Kendall, 1994), child behav­
ior therapy (Motta & Lynch, 1990; Motta & Tobin, 1992), and parent train­
ing (Webster-Stratton & Herbert, 1993). However, unlike the consistently 
positive findings in the adult process literature relating the working alli­
ance to therapeutic success, evidence from child psychotherapy has been 
mixed, with Truax et al. (1973) reporting positive associations between 
their measures of the therapeutic relationship and outcome in child psy­
chodynamic psychotherapy, and both Kendall (1994) and Motta and Lynch 
(1990) finding no significant association between relationship quality and 
outcome with cognitive-behavioral treatment for anxiety and behavioral 
therapy for learning and disruptive behavior problems, respectively. The 
lack of agreement across studies is difficult to interpret, given the study-to­
study differences in the way therapeutic relationship has been opera­
tionalized and assessed, and in the types of therapy to which these varied 
assessments have been applied. Table 2 summarizes some of the variations 
across studies. 

Early assessment of the therapeutic relationship focused on evaluat­
ing therapist-generated conditions of empathy, warmth, and genuineness 
by coding therapist behavior in vivo, as observed live or on therapy tapes. 
Little attention was given to the child client's perception of these or other 
therapist behaviors, or to direct assessment of the reciprocal therapeutic 
relationship. The majority of these studies also focused on a single type of 
treatment (nondirective play therapy), involved small numbers of thera­
pists and children, and did not evaluate the association between the 
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therapeutic relationship and treatment outcome (Truax et al., 1973, is an 
exception to this generalization). More recent research has taken a differ­
ent approach emphasizing the development and application of question­
naires designed to assess the perception of the therapeutic relationship by 
key players in the treatment process. However, various investigators have 
differed in their choices of the key players on which to focus (Le., child vs. 
parent vs. therapist), the length and comprehensiveness of their scales 
(e.g., 7 items for Shirk & Saiz [1992] vs. 32 items for one subscale of the 
Smith-Acuna, Durlak, & Kaspar [1991] scale), and typical item content 
(e.g., "How important were the therapist's personal qualities such as 
warmth, sincerity, genuineness, or ability to relate, in the treatment?" 
[Motta & Lynch, 1990] vs. "I wish my therapist would leave me alone" 
[Shirk & Saiz, 1992]). 

To untangle the different effects of the therapeutic relationship re­
ported across studies, our field needs a well-validated set of measures for 
assessing the relationship. Developing such measures for child therapy 
will be a challenging task. Among the difficulties confronted, two are 
particularly notable: (1) the complexity of the relationship concepts in­
volved relative to the limited verbal and conceptual facility of many of the 
children who will be the targets of the assessment; and (2) the need to 
encompass not only the child-therapist dyad, but also various family 
members whose relationship to therapist and child may be critical to the 
success of treatment. It is clear that studying this elusive entity known as 
the therapeutic relationship will be a challenging task, but the rewards of 
success may be very significant. 

7. Ethnicity and Culture of Treated Children and Their 
Families 

Another issue that has remained relatively unaddressed in research 
on child treatments is that of ethnicity and culture. In most child outcome 
studies, the samples are probably predominantly Caucasian, but authors 
have frequently failed to specify sample composition. In the Kazdin et al. 
(1990a) survey of 223 child outcome studies, 80% failed to identify the 
ethnic composition of their sample. While mere reporting of the relevant 
numbers is rare, actual tests of ethnicity as a moderator of outcome are 
even rarer. Some have suggested that treatments tested primarily with 
mainstream samples may not necessarily be optimal for members of ethnic 
minority groups (Gibbs & Huang, 1989; RogIer, Malgady, Costantino, & 
Blumenthal, 1987; Spurlock, 1985; Sue, 1977; Tharp, 1991). The treatments 
may not, for example, take into account the language, values, customs, 
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child-rearing traditions, expectancies for child and parent behavior, and 
distinctive stressors and resources associated with different cultural 
groups. In the treatment setting, such cultural factors may lead to miscom­
munication and misunderstanding between the therapist and the client 
and family, thus increasing the likelihood of premature termination and 
poor treatment outcome (Ho, 1992; Sue & Zane, 1987). Tharp (1991) has also 
suggested that even therapy modality requires attention, and that family 
and group interventions may be more appropriate than individual treat­
ment for many minority youth. Such interventions, Tharp suggests, may 
also generate information on cultural issues relevant to the child, family, 
and community-information the therapist can use in adjusting and fo­
cusing the treatment. 

The published literature on culture and psychotherapy is rich in 
recommendations for how to treat specific ethnic groups but relatively 
poor in controlled empirical assessment. Most of the recommendations 
appear to be based on anecdotal and experiential reports (see Gibbs & 
Huang, 1989; Ho, 1992). The array of hypotheses now available should 
provide fertile ground for experimentation in the future. For the present, 
though, a modest base of evidence suggests trends that bear further study. 
We identified this evidence through the following search procedures: (1) 
We reviewed the Method section of all the articles included in our two 
broad-based meta-analyses of child treatment outcome studies (Weisz et 
aI., 1987; Weisz et aI., 1995c); (2) we carried out a Psychinfo search using the 
keywords therapy, treatment, child(ren), adolescent(s), minority, ethnic, 
black(s), African American(s), Hispanic(s), Latino(s), and Asian(s): and (3) we 
searched reference trails from the studies identified, and from several 
review papers on the subject of ethnicity and child treatment. Through this 
process, we identified 19 treatment outcome studies in which the majority 
of the sample were ethnic minority children or families. The studies are 
briefly characterized in Table 3. Here we consider a few of the findings of 
these studies, and we note four key questions about treatment outcome 
and culture that need attention in future studies. 

7.1. Effectiveness of Treatments with Ethnic Minority Children 

As shown in Table 3, treated children in the 19 studies with large 
minority samples tended to improve more than children in control condi­
tions, although the extent of improvement appears to vary somewhat with 
problem type. As summarized in Table 4, treatment showed a significant 
beneficial effect in 79% of the group comparisons with externalizing prob­
lems, 75% with internalizing problems, and only 43% with other problems 
(e.g., social skills, family functioning). The magnitude of improvement is 
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TABLE 4 
Percentage of Studies Showing Improvement in Externalizing, 

Internalizing, and Other Problems, by Presence or Absence 
of a Culturally Adjusted Treatment Component 

Culturally No culturally 
adjusted adjusted 

component component 

Number of studies 10 9 

75 

Total 

19 
Proportion reporting 5/6 = 83% 6/8 = 75% 11/14 = 79% 

improvement in externalizing (1 mixed 
problems outcome) 

Proportion reporting 5/7 = 71% 1/1 = 100% 6/8 = 75% 
improvement in internalizing (1 mixed 
problems outcome) 

Proportion reporting 4/8 = 50% 2/6 = 33% 6/14 = 43% 
improvement in other problems (3 mixed (2 mixed 

outcomes) outcomes) 

difficult to compare to that seen in meta-analyses cited earlier because of 
numerous study-to-study differences in specific treated problems, types of 
treatment, and so on. Direct within-study comparison is far superior, but 
only one such comparison was identified in the 19 studies: Henggeler, 
Melton, and Smith (1992) found that African-American and Caucasian 
delinquents responded equally well to multisystemic treatment. In gen­
eral, our initial look at the question does not suggest that structured 
treatments are ineffective with samples that include large proportions of 
minority youth. 

7.2. Differential Effectiveness of Various Treatments with Different 
Ethnic Groups 

Another potentially important question is whether outcome is influ­
enced by treatment type x ethnic group interactions. However, we find lit­
tle research bearing on the question. In our sample of 19 outcome studies, 
only one involved an initial step toward such a test. Szapocznik and 
colleagues (Szapocznik et al., 1989; Szapocznik, Kurtines, Santisteban, & 
Rio, 1990) tested the efficacy of structural family therapy (SFT) and indi­
vidual psychodynamic child therapy (IPCT) with Hispanic families of 
boys with behavioral and emotional problems. Following treatment, SFT­
treated children had fewer behavior problems than IPCT children, but 
neither group differed significantly from children in a recreational control 
condition. At follow-up, family functioning had improved substantially 
following SFT and had actually worsened following IPCT. The findings 
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seem consistent with Tharp's (1991) contention that family-based therapies 
are more appropriate than individual treatment for minority children. 
However, 5zapocznik et a1. (1989) did not include comparison groups of 
non-Hispanic youth treated with 5FT and IPCT. So, as best we can deter­
mine, our field still awaits a fully developed test of interactions between 
ethnicity and treatment type. 

7.3. Impact of Matching Therapist and Client on Ethnicity 

Are outcomes enhanced when therapist and treated child are matched 
for ethnicity? No definite answer emerges from the studies we have found. 
Although nine of the 19 studies in the collection involved some attempt at 
ethnicity and/ or language match, none provided a direct test of the impact 
of the match (e.g., by comparing matched and unmatched therapist-child 
pairs). Hayes, Cunningham, and Robinson (1977) did report that counselor 
race (African American vs. Caucasian) did not appear to influence target 
outcomes of test anxiety and poor school motivation among African­
American children, but they did not report substantiating analyses. In 
general, the nine studies in which some form of matching was reported 
appear to show only slightly better success rates than the remaining 10 
studies. Rates of significant improvement in the matching versus non­
matching studies were 83% versus 75% for externalizing problems and 
50% versus 33% for other problems (only one "unadjusted" study in­
cluded any internalizing problem outcome measure, so we do not report 
the comparison here, but see Table 4 for data). Again, we must note that 
such global comparison across studies lacks the precision of the direct, 
within-study tests that are most needed to address the "matching" ques­
tion. Moreover, in most of the studies, ethnicity matching is confounded 
with other efforts to adjust treatments to fit minority youth, and this brings 
us to a related issue. 

7.4. Impact of Adapting Therapies to Fit Ethnic Minority Children 

Perhaps the most overarching issue related to ethnicity and child 
treatment is that of whether standard therapies may be administered in 
standard ways to minority youth, or whether outcomes are improved by 
adapting the therapies to relevant group characteristics. Relevant to this 
question, we found that 10 of the 19 studies involved some sort of treat­
ment adaptation designed to fit cultural characteristics of the minority 
sample. The adaptations ranged from narrowly focused changes, such as 
depicting minority figures in modeling tasks, to such pervasive change as 
redesigning entire programs for a particular minority group. The fact that 
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only one of the "unadapted" studies focused on internalizing problems 
ruled out comparisons on that dimension; however, the percentage of 
comparisons showing significant positive treatment effects was slightly 
higher for externalizing problems (83% vs. 75%) and for problems in the 
"other" category (50% vs. 33%). For reasons noted here, such comparisons 
are suggestive at best. Much to be preferred are direct comparisons of 
adapted and unadapted methods within the same study, but such compar­
isons are difficult to find. One study, by Costantino, Malgady, and RogIer 
(1986) did find that maladjusted Puerto Rican children in a culturally 
adapted modeling program involving Cuento or Folklore Therapy were 
less aggressive following treatment than those in an art/play therapy 
control condition (APT). However, since APT subjects were even more 
aggressive than those in the no-therapy (NT) condition, the findings may 
reflect the ineffectiveness of APT as much as superiority of Cuento Ther­
apy. A more robust test of any culture-specific treatment approach would 
entail comparison with another empirically supported approach (e.g., 
social skills training for aggression). In future research, wherever culture­
linked changes have been made to a standard treatment program, it will be 
important to carry out direct comparison of outcomes for minority chil­
dren receiving the altered program versus outcomes for minority children 
receiving the standard program. Without such comparisons, clear conclu­
sions may continue to elude us. 

To summarize, the state of affairs regarding culture and child psycho­
therapy is this: We have intriguing hypotheses and important questions 
that need attention, but thus far we lack the numerous direct comparisons 
needed to test the hypotheses and answer the questions. With concern 
about culture and mental health in our society growing steadily, the situa­
tion is likely to improve in the years ahead. As the volume of relevant 
research increases, we hope the agenda will include the four themes we 
have identified here. 

8. Sensitivity of Child Treatments to Social and Family 
Contexts 

Most treatment research with children can be faulted not only for 
relative inattention to ethnicity and culture but also for a failure to link 
treatments closely to the contexts in which children live their lives. Most of 
us would agree that children do not develop as solitary beings in a sterile 
environment, but rather as active participants in complex physical and 
social systems. Yet most treatment research with children involves inter­
actions with a single therapist, or sometimes with a small group of un-
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familiar children, in the sterile environment of the therapist's office or 
therapy room. Pretherapy assessment and treatment planning typically 
involve very limited sampling of the child's life circumstances and behav­
ior at home, at school, or with familiar peers, and limited application of 
treatment-related gains to life in those settings. This may limit the capacity 
of the therapist to fit interventions precisely to the conditions and context 
of the individual child's problems. In some cases, the problem may tilt 
treatment development in the direction of "one-size-fits-all" or "cookie­
cutter" therapies. In other cases, therapists may try to adjust aspects of 
their work to fit the child's situation but lack the information needed to do 
so precisely and effectively. 

Some of our most valued theorists and researchers (e.g., Bronfenbren­
ner, 1979, 1986; Masten, Best, & Garmezy, 1991) have emphasized the 
context-boundedness of development and discussed implications for child 
adaptation and dysfunction. Others (e.g., Cicchetti & Toth, 1997; Mash & 
Dozois, 1996) have noted the diverse ways in which the child's contexts 
and ecological systems can influence the development and expression of 
dysfunctional behavior and emotional states. Still others (e.g., Forehand, 
Lautenschlager, Faust, & Graziano, 1986; Kazdin, 1989) have noted that 
even what parents report (e.g., to assessors and therapists) regarding 
deviance and dysfunction in their children can be influenced by such 
diverse factors as parental psychopathology, marital discord, stress in the 
home, and even an intent to conceal harmful parental practices (e.g., abuse 
or neglect). Finally, it seems self-evident that the impact of psychotherapy 
with children may vary depending on the extent to which significant 
others in the child's contexts (e.g., parents, teachers) are involved and 
supportive of the process. The power of all the influences noted in this 
paragraph may be felt disproportionately in childhood, because, as we 
noted earlier, children have so little freedom to select their own contexts. 

The pervasive power of environmental forces in the lives of children 
suggests an important message for treatment planners and treatment 
outcome researchers: Contextual factors and key individuals in the child's 
social environment (e.g., parents, teachers, siblings, peers) may need to 
figure significantly in pretreatment assessment, in treatment planning, in 
treatment delivery, and even in outcome assessment. In general, these 
steps have only been taken in very limited and tentative ways in child 
psychotherapy research to date. There are some exceptions to this general­
ization, however. Noting a few of these may help illustrate what is possible 
in future child psychotherapy research, and why such steps may have 
value. 

As one example, Lewinsohn and colleagues (see Lewinsohn, Clarke, 
Hops, & Andrews, 1990; Lewinsohn, Rohde, Clarke, Hops, & Seeley, 1994; 
Rohde, Lewinsohn, & Seeley, 1994) have created a parent counterpart to 
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their Adolescent Coping with Depression group intervention. The objec­
tive is to promote parental understanding and acceptance of the interven­
tion, and to reduce family conflict by teaching parents the kinds of commu­
nication and problem-solving skills their adolescents are learning. In a 
related approach, Barrett, Dadds, and Rapee (1996) have added a Family 
Management program to a standard child anxiety treatment (from Kendall, 
1994), with the intent of helping parents and children to work as a team in 
managing anxiety and rewarding successful coping. In another program, 
addressing a variety of child problems, Szapocznik and colleagues (e.g., 
Szapocznik et al., 1989) treat Hispanic boys by means of structural family 
therapy. Webster-Stratton and colleagues (e.g., Webster-Stratton, Kolpa­
coff, & Hollinsworth, 1988) have developed a self-administered videotape 
therapy for families with conduct-problem children. And Henggeler and 
colleagues (e.g., Henggeler & Borduin, 1990; Henggeler et al., 1992; Bor­
duin et al., 1995), in perhaps the most context-sensitive approach yet 
developed, send therapists into the settings where juvenile offenders live 
their lives, working with them to develop treatments tailored to the 
strengths and limitations of their family, school, peer groups, and neigh­
borhood. Each of the intervention approaches cited here has shown posi­
tive effects relative to control groups. Although Lewinsohn and colleagues 
did not find that adding parent training alone to their adolescent interven­
tion led to greater reductions in depression than their basic program, 
Barrett et al. (1996) found that adding a family component led to several 
significant improvements over and above the basic individual child treat­
ment program for anxiety. As these examples suggest, there are numerous 
ways environment can be included in treatment, and without the loss of 
basic structure and even manualization. 

Treatment researchers who move in the directions illustrated by these 
research teams will certainly find that their work has grown more com­
plex. This may well be true at every level of the process, from treatment 
planning to outcome assessment. On the other hand, such efforts may be 
essential if we are ever to gauge the impact of making treatments fit the 
contexts in which children are developing. In our view, there is a real need 
to learn what can be gained if we push beyond a narrow focus on child 
characteristics and toward a broader focus on potentiating and inhibiting 
forces in the child's social systems. 

9. Enriching Research Design in Treatment-Outcome Research 

Beyond the substantive issues discussed earlier, there are many ways 
that child treatment outcome research can be strengthened at the level of 
research design. Some of the elements are implicit within suggestions 
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TABLE 5 
Steps toward Enriched Child Treatment Outcome Research 

1. Explication and tests of conceptual basis for treatment 
• Hypothesized causal, maintaining, and exacerbating factors 
• Hypothesized mechanisms by which treatment addresses these factors 
• Tests of the hypothesized mechanisms vis-a.-vis outcome 

2. Tests of other potential mediators of treatment-outcome relation 
• Comprehension of the "lessons" of treatment 
• Therapy "process" factors (e.g., therapeutic bond, alliance, etc.) 
• Out-of-therapy processes (e.g., parent and/or peer support) 

3. Tests of potential outcome moderators 
• Child demographic factors (e.g., age, gender, ethnictiy) 
• Context factors (e.g., family composition, school support) 
• Clinical/personality factors (e.g., comorbid conditions, motivation) 

4. Expanded outcome assessment 
• Broader range of measures (e.g., child symptoms, functioning, satisfaction 

with treatment, environmental change, use of systems) 
• Extended duration of assessment 
• Tests for bonus and incidental effects (e.g, on comorbid conditions) 

5. Tests of varied models of treatment delivery 
• Blunderbuss MaxTreat vs. Rifle models with disaggregated components 
• Booster sessions, checkups (sessions added as assessment shows a need) 
• Deputizing therapists to extend treatment (e.g., parents, sibs, teachers) 

noted earlier, but here we offer a more comprehensive list, summarized 
briefly in Table 5. 

9.1. Explication and Tests of the Conceptual Basis for the Treatment 

First, treatment outcome research could be enriched by a systematic 
effort by investigators to explain the conceptualization that guides their 
treatment and then provide corresponding tests. In many cases, this would 
include explication of the investigator's view as to causal processes that 
contribute to the target problem, with attention to risk factors, primary 
causes, maintaining factors, and exacerbating conditions. Clarification is 
needed as to which of these elements is addressed via the treatment 
program and in what way the elements of the treatment connect to the 
hypothesized causal processes. In cases where the treatment is not con­
strued as addressing causes-and we do not assume here that all effective 
treatments must necessarily address original causes-it is important, 
nonetheless, to specify the hypothesized mechanism by which the treat­
ment is seen as op~rating and having its effects. 
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Of course, all this specification of the conceptual basis for treatments 
is needed so that tests of the treatment models can be carried out. Such 
tests may affirm the hypothesized connection between processes linked to 
dysfunction and specified elements of the treatment, and such affirmation 
may fuel the further development and refinement of treatment. Or such 
tests may disconfirm hypothesized connections and thus suggest the need 
for restructured models, and perhaps restructured treatments. An example 
of the kind of surprise that may await researchers can be seen in the Durlak 
et al. (1991) meta-analysis of cognitive-behavioral treatments (CBT) for 
children. In contrast to the CBT model, which explicitly links behavior 
change to cognitive change, Durlak et al. reported that averaging across 
multiple studies, behavior change was not significantly related to changes 
in cognition. 

9.2. Tests of Other Potential Mediators of the Treatment-Outcome 
Relation 

The kinds of analyses just described are essentially tests of potential 
mediators of the relation between treatment and outcome. There are other 
mediational tests that certainly warrant consideration by researchers. We 
have already stressed the need for therapy process research testing such 
potential mediators of change as therapeutic bond. In addition, there is 
much about the child's comprehension of and participation in treatment 
activities that may playa role in shaping outcome, but this dimension is 
rarely addressed in outcome research. For example, one rarely sees tests 
designed to determine which of the key lessons or skills taught in therapy 
were actually assimilated by the children, and to what degree such assimi­
lation relates to treatment outcome. Beyond such intrachild processes, 
critical mediators may be found in events within the child's social sur­
round. For example, for some children, the degree to which parents or 
teachers are a part of the treatment program and respond by actively 
engaging the child in treatment-related activities may be a critical factor 
mediating child outcomes. We know little about these and numerous other 
mediational possibilities at present, because mediators of any kind are 
rarely tested in the extant literature. 

9.3. Tests of Potential Outcome Moderators 

Earlier, we noted the importance of testing such potential demo­
graphic moderators of treatment outcome as child age, gender, and eth­
nicity. Even when such factors are noted in sample descriptions, their 
significance for outcome is very rarely assessed. Children's clinical charac-
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teristics, such as their level or subtype of the target diagnosis, or their 
pattern of comorbidities, may also moderate outcome of some treatments. 
Beyond these individual child "person" factors, moderators may well be 
found in characteristics of the child's physical and social environment. 
Factors such as family income, degree of crowding, and family composi­
tion (e.g., single-parent vs. two-parent), for instance, may all relate to the 
family's ability to support the treatment process. The general objective of 
all this moderator research is to identify those youth who are most and 
least likely to profit from a particular form of treatment. Findings on this 
question can facilitate diversification of treatment forms and increasingly 
precise matching of treatment forms to types of children. 

9.4. Expanded Range of Outcome Assessment 

Child outcome research could profit from several kinds of expansion 
within the domain of outcome assessment. First, the range of outcomes 
measured has tended to be rather restricted, with emphasis placed on 
symptom or problem assessment. Recently, Hoagwood, Jensen, Petti, and 
Burns (1996) have called for assessment of not only symptoms (e.g., impul­
sivity, anxiety) but also the child's role functioning in usual life contexts 
(e.g., grades in school, participation in peer activities), consumer responses 
to treatment (e.g., child's and parents' satisfaction, perceived improve­
ment), changes in the child's environment that were targeted in treatment 
(e.g., parental discipline practices, classroom disruptions), and system­
related outcomes (e.g., the child's use of mental health services after the 
treatment program ends). Appropriate broadening, even at the "symp­
tom" level, could also include the use of structured diagnostic interviews, 
thus to generate the information needed to assess the clinical significance 
of treatment-related change. 

We also encourage expansion in the duration of outcome assessment. 
In our meta-analyses (Weisz et aI., 1987; Weisz et aI., 1995c), only about one­
third of the studies we found included any assessment other than immedi­
ate posttreatment. And for that one-third, the average follow-up lag time 
was only 6 months. Consequently, we know relatively little to date about 
the long-term holding power of the effects generated by most treatments, 
and thus little about whether and/or when there may be a need for 
treatment enhancement, booster sessions, and the like, to maintain gains. 

One other kind of expansion should be noted here. For those studies 
that include children with comorbid diagnoses over and above the condi­
tion targeted in treatment, outcome assessment might well be profitably 
directed to those comorbid conditions. It is useful to know, for example, 
that treatments targeting anxiety may also have beneficial effects on de-
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pression (see, e.g., Barrett et al., 1996; Kendall, 1994). Such knowledge can 
improve our efficiency in allocating treatments to conditions, in addition to 
helping us expand our models of treatment and outcome. 

9.5. Tests of Varied Models of Treatment Delivery 

Finally, we suspect that there could be considerable payoff from ex­
perimentation with various models of treatment delivery. Along one di­
mension, treatment approaches may range from the Blunderbuss model­
in which all promising techniques are packed into one treatment program, 
in the hope of generating maximum bang for the buck-to the Rifle 
model-precise fitting of a few well-chosen techniques to very specific 
problems. Along another dimension, data from an expanded duration of 
outcome assessment (see above) could go hand-in-hand with efforts to 
extend treatment benefit over time. Such efforts might include regularly 
scheduled booster sessions, brief refresher courses on the basics of a 
previously learned treatment package. An alternative might be the "yearly 
checkup" model, patterned after the "yearly physical," in which assess­
ment is conducted and areas of slippage are addressed by retraining in the 
relevant components of a treatment program. Finally, there is room for 
tinkering with our venerable models holding that treatment must be pro­
vided by qualified experts. Our meta-analytic findings (in both Weisz et al., 
1987, and Weisz et al., 1995c) point to effects (particularly for externalizing 
problems) that are as positive for parents and teachers trained in specific 
therapy techniques as for fully trained professionals in mental health 
careers (see also Christensen & Jacobson, 1993). This suggests that much­
needed person power and outreach may be gained by deputizing and 
training those who live their daily lives in close proximity to our child 
clients, thus to ensure that our treatment programs can be extended into 
the settings where the children live their lives. 

10. Conclusion 

There is much to admire about child psychotherapy outcome research 
to date, including a rich and extensive body of evidence supporting the 
efficacy of a substantial number of treatment programs. However, there 
are also significant limitations in the extant research. These give rise to 
numerous suggestions for reconceptualization, refinement, study of treat­
ment components and processes, tests of client factors that may moderate 
treatment impact, experimentation with treatment delivery models, and 
approaches to outcome assessment. The suggestions are offered with ap-
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preciation for all that has been accomplished thus far, and with optimism 
about all that can be done in the future to enhance the lives of children 
and their families. 
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3 Child Psychotherapy 
Process Research 

ROBERT L. RUSSELL AND STEPHEN R. SHIRK 

1. Introduction 

Relative to studies of treatment outcome, psychotherapy process research 
has been the ignored stepchild of child psychotherapy investigators. In 
their review of the child therapy literature, Kazdin, Bass, Ayers, and 
Rodgers (1990) found that less than 3% of all child therapy studies exam­
ined treatment processes. Although research on therapy process with 
adults has waxed and waned over time in both the behavioral and non­
behavioral traditions (Orlinsky & Russell, 1994; Russell & Orlinsky, 1996), 
the study of therapy process is "perhaps the area of work that is most 
discrepant between child and adult therapy" (Kazdin, 1995, p. 268). In 
recent years, however, there have been increasing calls for studies of child 
therapy processes (d. Kazdin, 1995; Kendall & Morris, 1991; Russ, 1995), 
due, in part, to growing evidence from the adult therapy literature that 
variation in patterns of transactions within sessions contributes to the 
prediction of treatment outcome (d. Orlinsky, Grawe, & Parks, 1994). 

Does the paucity of research on child therapy process mean that we 
must follow the lead of adult process researchers-a form of delayed 
imitation-or essentially start from scratch? In fact, the adult literature is 
rich in studies of therapy process; however, our review of the child therapy 
literature has uncovered a body of research that can provide guideposts 
for the systematic evaluation of processes in child treatment (Shirk & 
Russell, 1996). Although a finished map of child therapy processes does 
not emerge from the historical record, there is something important to be 
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gained by marking the productive paths and blind alleys that have been 
encountered by child therapy investigators over the last 50 years. 

2. Scope and Organization of the Review 

The literature that we review mainly concerns empirical research on 
what actually transpires between therapist and child during their face-to­
face meetings.1 Often these transactions are studied in their own right with 
the aim of discovering what actually comprises "therapy" of one type or 
another. Less frequently, aspects of transactions are measured and related 
to outcomes at the session or treatment level. We restrict our review to 
what we have defined elsewhere as psychotherapy, not behavior therapy, 
research (Shirk & Russell, 1996). Although the distinction is not faultless, it 
is our aim to review empirical investigations of those therapies that give 
prominence to internal, psychological processes in their theories of patho­
genesis and in their attempts to define targets of intervention. If we must 
revert to brand-name labels, such therapies would be considered psycho­
dynamic, client-centered, cognitive, and cognitive-behavioral. 

Our main interest, however, is in compiling and summarizing the 
research record over the past 50 years as it pertains to key emotional, 
interpersonal, and language/ cognitive processes as they have been stud­
ied across types of therapy. As we have argued elsewhere (Russell & 
Orlinsky, 1996; Shirk & Russell, 1996), clients do not respond to brand­
name therapies any more than therapists respond to diagnostic labels in 
the here-and-now of face-to-face therapeutic interaction. However, in all 
therapies, therapist-client interactions are always comprised of and often 
focused on emotional, interpersonal, and language/cognitive processes. 
In ongoing, face-to-face meetings, all three of these dimensions seamlessly 
coalesce. For analytic and expository purposes, we attempt to disassociate 
them and track progress (or lack thereof) in the investigation of each of 
these aspects of therapy process. Studies have been organized within each 
substantive area by decade, and divided for summary purposes into early 
and recent investigations. Detailed critiques of the methodological quality 
of these and other related studies have been offered elsewhere (Greenwald 
& Russell, 1991; Shirk & Russell, 1992; Shirk & Russell, 1996). We conclude 
our review of the substantive findings with summaries of the major meth-

IThe studies reviewed include both children and adolescents. The use of the term child or 
children does not imply that developmental differences are inconsequential but is used rather 
than the more cumbersome phrase children and adolescents throughout the text. Where noted 
in the original studies, the ages of the participants are presented in this review. 
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odological flaws found in this literature and present a set of recommenda­
tions for future research on child psychotherapy process. 

3. Emotion Processes in Child Psychotherapy 

3.1. Early Studies of Emotion Processes 

As one might expect, the very first empirical study of child psycho­
therapy process was focused on "feelings" in client-centered therapy. 
Landisberg and Snyder (1946) conducted a pure process study in which 
they sought to describe what took place in nondirective therapy using a 
client and therapist coding system comprised of eight major and nu­
merous minor categories. The four clients were 5- or 6-year-olds with a mix 
of behavioral and emotional problems. Surprisingly, the authors studied 
contingencies between therapist and client verbal behaviors, possibly the 
first "sequential" process study in the history of child or adult psycho­
therapy research. 

Landisberg and Snyder (1946) reported that the therapists' reflection 
of feelings were most often followed by client information-giving and 
positive action. The authors noted several phase phenomena as well. 
Positive client feelings occurred more frequently in the first two-fifths of 
therapy than negative feelings, and the expression of negative feelings 
increased over the last three-fifths of therapy. Overall, clients' expression 
of feelings, positive or negative, increased over the course of therapy, as 
did their physical action. The authors interpreted these findings as evi­
dence of increased emotional catharsis over the course of therapy. 

The findings of Landisberg and Snyder (1946) suggest that in the 
context of relatively high and stable levels of therapist reflections of feel­
ings, children increase their levels of emotional expression, permitting 
themselves to vent pent-up negative feelings. Of special note is the fact 
that these authors were able to demonstrate effects of therapist technique 
at the level of the exchange and to begin to map changes in therapist and 
client interaction through various phases of therapy, even for clients of 
such a young age. 

Lebo (1952,1955) published two studies concerned with the classifica­
tion of children's behavior in therapy. Dissatisfied with the coding system 
used by Landisberg and Snyder (1946) because it was adopted from the 
adult literature with few changes, Lebo attempted to craft a developmen­
tally appropriate category system. Of note, in his 1955 measure develop­
ment study, Lebo pointed out that emotion expression took form in and 
through both verbalizations and vocalizations, the latter category being 
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especially important for younger clients. Consequently, he included cate­
gories that were meant to capture vocalizations children emit, especially 
during dramatic play (e.g., sound effects, mumblings, cries, etc.). These 
two studies are noteworthy in that they point to the need for developmen­
tally sensitive coding systems for child psychotherapy. 

In 1955, Moustakas presented the first hypothesis-testing study in 
which he compared the expressions and intensities of negative attitudes of 
normal and disturbed 4-year-old children in a four-session course of ther­
apy. His findings were consistent with his hypothesis that disturbed chil­
dren would express more negative attitudes than normal children, and 
that their expressions would also be more intense. Interestingly, the dis­
turbed children's expressions of negative emotions were more diffuse and 
less focused than those of nondisturbed children. Moustakas speculated 
that therapeutic improvement might be signaled as disturbed children's 
expression of negative attitudes approached those of the normal chil­
dren's in terms of frequency, intensity, and focus. In this sense, Moustakas 
may have conducted the first process study of child psychotherapy that 
incorporated social comparisons with a nondisturbed control group in its 
design. 

Moustakas and Schalock (1955) conducted a second process study that 
examined verbal exchanges between child and therapist. In it, 5 normal 
and 5 disturbed 4-year-olds were assigned to client-centered therapies, 
and each of the therapists' and each of the children's turns at talk were 
coded using an extensive coding scheme (82 categories for the therapists 
and 72 for the children). Moreover, anxiety and hostility ratings were made 
at 5-second intervals. As in the previous study, Moustakas and Schalock 
reported that the disturbed children verbally expressed hostility far more 
frequently than did their nondisturbed counterparts. In fact, the disparity 
was enormous: The disturbed group evinced hostility in 418 exchanges, 
whereas the normal children expressed hostility in only 23. Neither dis­
turbed nor normal children sought positive therapist responses in the form 
of displays of affection or rewards. The authors concluded that "such 
approaches as reward, praise, affection, giving reassurance, and so on 
have been overemphasized in such interaction" (p. 150). 

Lebo and Lebo (1957) conducted a study of the expression of aggres­
sion in relation to age, hypothesizing that younger children (4 and 6 years 
old) would be more aggressive in their speech than 9- and 12-year-olds. 
They also expected that younger children would be less polite and abide 
by playroom rules less than older children. Note that these hypotheses are 
clearly developmental in character and, in fact, among normal children, 
seem subsequently to have been well established (Brown & Levinson, 
1987). To test these hypotheses, the authors formed groups of aggressive 
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children, roughly about 28 children in each of three levels of aggression, 
on the basis of teacher ratings. Children participated in three sessions of 
nondirective therapy conducted by the same therapist; roughly 3% of the 
utterances were randomly selected for coding using Lebo's 24-category 
system. 

Lebo and Lebo reported that there were significant effects of age and 
level of aggression on nearly half of the categories. As expected, younger 
and more aggressive children both expressed more aggression and tested 
the limits of the counseling session. Unfortunately, interaction effects were 
not reported, but the authors concluded that the process of therapy, and in 
particular, the expression of affect, differed depending both on age level 
and pretherapy measures of aggressiveness. Such findings appear to be 
consistent with the client-centered assumption that a permissive therapeu­
tic relationship will facilitate expression of negative emotion, especially 
among aggressive children. Unfortunately, no attempt was made to exam­
ine the relationship between in-session expressions of anger and extrases-
sion changes in aggressiveness. . 

In the 1940s and 1950s, then, we see some remarkable initiatives in the 
study of affect in child therapy. Sequential, social comparison, and phase 
analyses were all begun, even if conducted in a rudimentary fashion by 
today's standards. We learn that the expression of affect differs in fre­
quency, intensity, and degree of focus between normal and disturbed 
children in therapy as indicated across several studies, and that age effects 
need to be taken into account as well. Therapist reflection of feelings also 
seems to have proximal effects on affect expression. In their search for the 
active ingredients in child psychotherapy, Shirk and Russell (1996) con­
cluded from these sets of studies that "there may be something corrective 
in therapists' behaviors that formulate, emphasize, and highlight the cli­
ents' moods or feelings or affects, as these create the subjective contexts 
through which objective events are understood" (p. 194). 

Guerney, Burton, Silverberg, and Shapiro (1965) applied a four­
category system to roughly two hundred IS-second samples of six differ­
ent child therapy play sessions. Two of their categories directly concerned 
affect and were labeled positive feeling and negative feeling. The authors 
reported that the therapists' and children's category usage across seg­
ments evidenced a very high ("nearly perfect") rank-order correlation. 
Although findings were interpreted to reflect correspondence between 
therapist and child behavior, or emotional "tracking," there was little 
evidence in the study to support such a phenomenon. There could be a 
near-perfect rank-order correlation between adult and child category us­
age without there being any contingency between them. 

In several studies in the 1970s (Boll, 1971; Siegel, 1972; Truax, Altmann, 
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Wright, & Mitchell, 1973), changes in affect expression in and outside of 
therapy were studied as consequences of different levels of therapist­
offered relationship conditions (genuineness, accurate empathy, and non­
possessive warmth). Boll's study compared sessions of therapies conducted 
by an active, directive therapist with those of a nondirective therapist. 
Each saw four or five children for 15 to 20 sessions. Although only a 
descriptive study, Boll concluded that children seen by the nondirective 
therapist were both more hostile and aggressive over time than children 
being seen by the directive therapist. 

More sophisticated in method was Siegel's (1972) study, in which the 
emotional expressions of 16 children in grades two through four were 
examined across treatments of 16 sessions. Siegel sampled 4-minute ex­
cerpts from sessions 3, 8, 12, and 16, coding the verbal behavior according 
to Lebo's (1955) categories and rating therapist-offered conditions. He 
compared children receiving the highest and lowest therapist-offered rela­
tionship conditions of warmth, genuineness, and accurate empathy. In 
terms of affect, he reported that children in the high condition expressed 
more negative affect in later sessions than did the children in the low 
condition. Interestingly, the same children also produced more verbaliza­
tions labeled as insight. Siegel's research represents one of the first at­
tempts to relate children's in-session behavior to the quality of therapists' 
interpersonal behavior. Although it is tempting to conclude that children's 
emotional expression varied as a function of therapist-offered relationship 
conditions, it is equally plausible that therapists varied their behavior in 
response to variations in children's emotional presentations. 

Truax et al. (1973) also studied the differential effects of levels of 
therapist-offered conditions on emotional expression, only here the effects 
were assessed, not from analyses of later sessions, but as posttherapy 
outcomes. Sixteen therapists, of various schools, treated 16 children aver­
aging 9 years old, who were described as having neurotic or character 
disorders. On teacher and parent rating forms, children with the highest 
therapist-offered conditions changed more than did the children with the 
lower offered conditions on such items as "Less emotionally disturbed," 
"Fears have decreased," "Laughs more," and "More able to express feel­
ings." These results suggest that variation in process may account for 
changes in emotion expression posttreatment. 

In summary, then, in the 1960s and 1970s, studies began to document 
that emotions could be tracked within and across sessions, and assessed at 
outcome from various perspectives. Linkages between emotion processes 
and outcomes, and other aspects of therapy process, specifically, relation­
ship conditions, were demonstrated. Although limited in number, studies 
in this period introduced comparative process and process-outcome 
studies to child psychotherapy research. 
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3.2. Recent Studies of Emotion Processes 

Howe and Silvern (1981) presented a complex measure development 
study that attempted to describe basic underlying factors in child therapy. 
Two raters rated 31 variables across 76 twelve-minute segments that were 
drawn from a variety of therapies. Factor analyses of reliable ratings 
revealed three stable factors: Emotional Discomfort, Fantasy Play, and 
Social Inadequacy. Items on the emotion scale concerned aggression, wor­
ries, conflict in play, quality and intensity of affect, and play disruption. 
Whereas previous studies used only single items to assess affect or emo­
tion expression, notably categories pertaining to aggression or expression 
of feeling, Howe and Silvern attempted to identify the underlying organi­
zation of children's affect expression in therapy. 

The research of Howe and Silvern (1981) suggests that children's affect 
expression in therapy is associated with their play activity. In a compara­
tive outcome study with young children who evinced high levels of sep­
aration anxiety, Milos and Reiss (1982) coded the quality of children's play 
in three treatment conditions-free play, directed play, and modeling-for 
level of emotional involvement and mastery efforts. They found that high­
quality play was associated with lower posttest anxiety scores as assessed 
by level of speech disturbance (e.g., word repetitions, slips, in response to 
separation-relevant questions). This study is particularly noteworthy in 
that it was one of the first to examine within-session process in the context 
of a comparative outcome study. 

Smith-Acuna, Durlak, and Kaspar (1991) developed a set of child 
therapy process scales that assessed therapist and child perceptions of 
therapy. Child clients, (N = 20, mean age = 8.9 years) and their therapists 
rated their perceptions of six sessions of long-term, dynamically oriented 
therapy. Two of the four therapist scales and two of the three child scales 
focused on affect. Therapists rated their own positive and negative affect, 
and their perceptions of their clients' positive and negative affect. Children 
made comparable ratings. The authors reported that, after dropping sev­
eral items from the therapist and client scales, moderate levels of internal 
consistency were obtained. Interestingly, there were no significant correla­
tions between any of the child and therapist scales. However, they noted 
that the lack of association between therapist and client scales, even when 
assessing the same dimension or phenomenon, is not uncommon in the 
adult literature. The authors indicated that comparisons of participant 
ratings with observer ratings were needed in the future. 

Russell, Bryant, and Estrada (1996) examined emotion processes in a 
methodologically oriented paper that integrated empirically derived ob­
servational ratings of molar aspects of child therapy process with both 
exploratory and confirmatory P-technique analyses of ratings of micro-
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analytic processes in the form of therapist utterances. P-technique factor 
analysis was devised to assess underlying patterns of covariation between 
variables rated repeatedly over time for a single subject or across the 
normalized, chained data of several subjects. The authors' goals were to 
discover and compare the underlying structure of therapist participation 
in high- and low-quality sessions of dynamically oriented child therapy 
and to validate it by use of confirmatory factor analyses. 

In order to evaluate the overall quality of therapy sessions, ratings of 
multiple dimensions of process were made first with the Child Psycho­
therapy Process Scales (Estrada & Russell, 1996). Patterned after the Van­
derbilt Psychotherapy Process Scales for adults (Suh, O'Malley, & Strupp, 
1986), these scales involve ratings of videotaped therapy sessions by 
trained observers. Principal components analysis of three segments of 39 
therapy sessions with children between the ages of 6 and 16 revealed three 
factors for child and therapist items, respectively. The three child factors 
were identified as therapeutic relationship, therapeutic work, and thera­
peutic readiness. The three therapist factors referred to technical work, 
therapeutic relationship, and technical lapses. 

After rating sessions with the Child Psychotherapy Process Scales, 
overall session quality scores for the child and therapist scales were rank 
ordered. The discourse of children and therapists in the three highest 
quality sessions and the three lowest quality sessions was then indepen­
dently coded. A total of 907 therapist utterances were rated on 15 language 
interaction scales. In the principal components analysis, the third extracted 
factor for both high- and low-quality sessions concerned affect. Account­
ing for about 10% of the total variance, factor 3, named Positive Regard, 
had two affect-laden items that loaded most heavily: positive evaluation 
and positive affect. The results suggested that therapist participation in 
child therapy sessions of high or low quality was partially organized 
around provision of positive feedback and engagement. However, when 
Russell et al. (1996) attempted to confirm the exploratory analyses by use 
of confirmatory analysis, which posits and then tests a stipulated model, 
the third factor could not be confirmed. 

The authors suggested that the lack of confirmation of the affect factor 
could have been due to the fact that it only had two variables that loaded 
highly on it, and that it accounted for the least amount of total variance. 
This could mean that the therapists' participation in child therapy was not 
organized strongly enough around affect expression to be confirmed. 
Alternatively, this third factor could have been comprised of more error 
variance than common variance, both of which are included in exploratory 
principal components analysis. However, factors in confirmatory factor 
analysis contain only common variance. The authors suggest that more 
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reliable and numerous affect scales need to be developed so as to enable 
improved model-building attempts to understand the underlying organi­
zational structure of therapist affect expression over the course of child 
psychotherapy. 

An alternative approach to evaluating emotion in child therapy has 
been advanced by Russ (1995), who developed the Affect in Play Scale. 
Ratings for amount, type, and intensity of affect are derived from a stan­
dardized, videotaped puppet-play task. One major advantage of this scale 
involves the breadth of affective categories assessed, 11 in all. This repre­
sents a significant departure from earlier studies that tended to focus on 
single emotions (e.g., hostility) or lumped emotions according to positive 
or negative valence. Although the scale has shown promise as a predictor 
of effective coping with invasive dental procedures (Christiano & Russ, 
1996), and has been presented as a potential indicator of treatment respon­
siveness (Russ, 1995), it has not been applied to actual therapeutic trans­
actions. Given the range of emotions assessed by the scale, if modified for 
therapeutic play, it could help clarify the organization of emotion pro­
cesses in child treatment. 

In the 1980s and 1990s, then, we can see a flurry of measure develop­
ment studies that at least partially focus on affect. Interestingly, we see 
developments in the use of different perspectives to assess affect: partici­
pant and nonparticipant perspectives. Moreover, we see a growing interest 
in the identification of the structure of affect expression in child therapy, 
signaled by increasing use of multiple-item scales and factor analyses. 
Finally, the first study intent on confirmation as well as description is 
presented. 

3.3. Summary of Research on Emotion Processes 

Substantively, these studies suggest that emotion expression is a key 
ingredient in many forms of child therapy, from both the child and thera­
pist perspective. Because "emotion" factors do not emerge as the single or 
first factor in these studies, we might infer that child therapy is more 
centrally organized around other interactional phenomena than affect 
expression. Such a conclusion, however, might be premature, simply be­
cause researchers have yet to generate a sufficiently complex method to 
assess emotion processes with the same thoroughness as other phenomena 
(e.g., therapist technique or the alliance). Moreover, because affect expres­
sion seems inherently tied to positivity and negativity, and these cut across 
other domains, it may be difficult to isolate affective phenomena, even 
though few correlations were reported between affect and other factors. 

It is important to note that this literature is plagued both by general 
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design and method problems, and specific shortcomings as pertains to the 
study of emotion in child therapy. On the general level, many of the studies 
provide little information about the specific problems of the child clients 
that are treated; heterogeneity in patient samples is rampant. On the 
therapist side, many studies either use one therapist, often an author of the 
research report, or use multiple therapists, without attending or control­
ling for therapist effects. Assignment of children to treatments is rarely 
randomized, measures are often neither standardized nor appropriately 
normed, and reporting and levels of reliability are often less than optimal. 
Statistical conclusion validity is further jeopardized by low-power, in­
appropriate use of statistical tests, and frequent mixing of sources of 
variation in the data submitted to factor analyses (as is the case in every 
factor-analytic study of child therapy process done in the 1980s and 1990s). 

The most prevalent problems specific to the study of emotion concern 
the degree of underdevelopment of complex coding and rating schemes. 
Most scales have little content validity, if the universe of emotional expres­
sion is the targeted area of study. Furthermore, as was pointed out early in 
the research history, emotion expression cuts across many channels of 
communication, and its study should not be restricted to verbalizations or 
verbalizations plus vocalizations (see Wiener, Budney, Wood, & Russell, 
1989, for review of studies of nonverbal behavior in therapy). Last, there is 
still little focus on the interactional complexities of emotion expression in 
child psychotherapy and its relation to phase of treatment phenomena or 
to outcome. 

To conclude, the history of research on child psychotherapy has al­
ways concerned itself with emotion processes. The focus has been either 
broad-banded or extremely narrow (e.g., focus on hostility) and has cut 
across types of study (Le., pure process, comparative process, process­
outcome) and types of methodology (i.e., use of self-report or objective 
observer scales; sequential or frequency studies). In addition, there is 
indication that emotion expression in therapy and at outcome are both 
affected by the therapists' reflective and empathic engagement. Clearly, far 
more detailed, developmentally informed investigations of emotion ex­
pression in child therapy are called for. Nevertheless, the history of re­
search on this topic provides initiatives that can be fruitfully and program­
matically developed. 

4. Interpersonal Processes in Child Psychotherapy 

Although the importance of the therapeutic relationship was stressed 
from the beginning in the client-centered and psychodynamic traditions, 
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coding systems often did not include categories that directly addressed 
interpersonal phenomena. In the review of interpersonal processes in child 
psychotherapy, we included only those studies that directly assessed inter­
personal phenomena, and not studies that merely emphasized the impor­
tance of interpersonal factors in child treatment. 

4.1. Early Studies of Interpersonal Processes 

A number of early studies examined interpersonal processes as well 
as emotional and language processes in child psychotherapy. For example, 
Lebo (1952, 1955), who evaluated children's emotion expression within 
sessions, also coded verbalizations as markers of interpersonal process. In 
what may have been the first "analogue" study of child therapy, Lebo 
(1955) categorized the verbal behavior of 20 normal children across three 
sessions of client-centered therapy. He reported that there was a significant 
trend across age levels in the children's attempts to form a relationship 
with the therapist, as indexed by their verbal behavior. Lebo interpreted 
this finding to indicate that children become more independent in therapy, 
and in relation to the therapist, with increasing age. 

In a series of studies, Moustakas and his colleagues examined inter­
personal behavior between child and therapist. In their previously men­
tioned 1955 study, contingencies between therapist and child behavior 
were examined, albeit in a rudimentary way. Here, we find the first investi­
gation of therapeutic interaction, that is, an analysis of interrelationships 
between therapist and child behaviors. Although the study included both 
disturbed and nondisturbed children, surprisingly few differences emerged 
in their responses to therapist behaviors. For example, to therapist verbal 
suggestions, the predominant response of both groups was cooperation, 
despite the fact that the disturbed group evinced higher levels of hostility 
within sessions than their nondisturbed counterparts. Similarly, in re­
sponse to children's directive behavior, the therapists' predominant re­
sponse was straightforward cooperation. In fact, one of the most fre­
quently coded therapist behaviors was Attentive Observation, which led 
Moustakas and Schalock to conclude that the essential character of the 
therapist's interpersonal orientation was "being there" for the child. 

In a follow-up study, Moustakas, Sigel, and Schalock (1956) examined 
the interactions of a therapist who treated 2 anxious and 2 withdrawn 
children. Innovatively, the authors also assessed the children's interactions 
with their mothers in the laboratory playroom and at home. Consistent 
with their earlier findings, Moustakas et al. found that approximately 93% 
of the therapist's behavior consisted of attentively observing the child, 
with his most frequent responses involving watching or listening to the 



104 ROBERT L. RUSSELL AND STEPHEN R. SHIRK 

child. The children's behavior was also limited in range, with nearly 95% 
of their time spent in solitary play. This pattern of findings suggests that 
this form of therapy, at least with this therapist, could hardly be charac­
terized as interpersonally interactive; instead, the results indicate that the 
participants were engaged in parallel activities! In contrast, observations 
of the children with their mothers across both situations revealed higher 
levels of interaction than with the therapist. One interesting contribution 
of this study involves its "normative" comparative process design, which 
revealed that "therapeutic" play interactions differed significantly from 
typical play interactions between mother and child. It is not clear, empiri­
cally or conceptually, how the parallel process found in therapy inter­
actions would facilitate change in the presenting problems of these children. 

Although these early studies focused primarily on client-centered 
play therapy, they introduced empirical methods for the microanalysis of 
interpersonal processes in child therapy. Substantive results are sparse, 
although there is some evidence to suggest age differences in children's 
interpersonal behavior in therapy, and for differences in the character of 
therapeutic versus typical play between an adult and a child. The latter 
finding suggests what might be expected: a natural suppression of a 
child:s basic response rate with a stranger in a strange situation, at least in 
the early stages of relationship formation. However, one must wonder if 
this pattern would typify other initial therapy interactions with different 
therapists, with diagnostically different types of children, and of course, 
with different therapeutic parameters. 

Over 15 years passed before there was another study of interpersonal 
processes in child psychotherapy. Across this gap, there was a substantial 
shift in the way that these processes were conceptualized and opera­
tionalized. Three studies conducted in the 1970s examined the therapeutic 
relationship in terms of therapist-offered conditions and assessed these 
conditions with scales measuring accurate empathy, nonpossessive warmth, 
and genuineness. Molar ratings of relational dimensions replaced micro­
analytic coding of verbal utterances. Wright, Truax, and Mitchell (1972) 
conducted a measure development study to determine whether client­
centered scales of empathy, warmth, and genuineness could be reliably 
applied to child treatment. To assess reliabilities of the scales, the authors 
sampled three 5-minute segments drawn from 16 different therapists. Only 
the empathy scale showed adequate reliability, and the authors recom­
mended that further scale development was needed. In the same year, 
Siegel (1972) applied the same scales to an analysis of 4-minute therapy 
segments drawn from the treatment of 16 school-aged children. His results 
indicated adequate reliability for all three scales, ranging from .70 to .84. 
After classifying cases in terms of high versus low therapist-offered condi-
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tions, Siegel found that children in the two groups showed different pat­
terns of verbalization over the course of treatment. Most striking was the 
tendency for children in the high-condition group to show more positive 
statements about the self somewhat early in treatment, then an increase in 
levels of aggressive statements at mid treatment, and then a return to 
relatively high levels of positive self-statements in the final phase of treat­
ment. This was the first study to explicitly document that changes oc­
curred over the course of therapy on key process variables in association 
with the quality of the therapist-offered relationship. The absence of se­
quential data, however, precludes unambiguous inferences about the di­
rection of effect. Furthermore, despite the identification of different pat­
terns of process, no attempt was made to relate these patterns to treatment 
outcome. 

This gap in the literature was partially filled by a study by Truax et al. 
(1973), who examined the association between the quality of therapist­
offered relationship and interpersonal treatment outcomes. Again, children 
were divided into high and low therapist-offered relationship condition 
groups. Among the most important findings of this study were significant 
relationships between parental report of improved relationship function­
ing and group membership. Children in the high therapist-offered condi­
tion showed the greatest gains. Moreover, deterioration effects were noted: 
"Children seen by the therapists in the lower half on therapeutic condi­
tions showed deterioration on five times as many measures as children in 
the upper half on conditions" (p. 317). As the authors noted, "Depending 
on the therapist's level of interpersonal skill, (therapy) can be for better or 
for worse" (p. 317). Although the study was not without serious limitations 
(e.g., lack of random assignment), it introduced the process variation 
design into the child psychotherapy literature. 

4.2. Recent Studies of Interpersonal Processes 

During the 1980s, two studies advanced the investigation of interper­
sonal processes in child treatment. Mook (1982a, 1982b) presented the first 
P-technique study of child therapy, describing the structure of two thera­
pists' and two clients' participation in treatment. P-technique is a form of 
factor analysis that is applied to a matrix comprised of repeated measure­
ments of the same subject on a range of variables. It reveals underlying 
patterns of covariation between the variables over time within a single 
subject. Using this technique, Mook factor-analyzed scores on 28 variables 
assessed at 221 points in time for one therapist-child dyad and 163 points 
in time for another. Variables focused on what Mook called empathy, 
verbal response categories, and grammatical categories. 
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Several factors for both therapists involved the empathic quality of 
the therapist-offered relationship and included such behaviors as encour­
agement, approval, and affirmation. These findings suggested that across 
clients there may be a stable pattern to therapists' behavior, and that it is 
organized around the provision of an empathic relationship. There were, 
however, important differences in other therapist factors, thus indicating 
individual differences across therapists as well. The fact that the therapists 
were utilizing, and supervised in, the "same" therapeutic approach 
(dynamic/humanistic) raises some interesting points. Most obviously, the 
structure of therapist behavior might be quite different across therapeutic 
orientations. On the other hand, even within the same orientation there 
were differences in the structure of therapists' behavior across sessions. As 
we have argued elsewhere, therapist process variation within treatment 
"brands" is likely to account for significant variation in treatment out­
come, and should be addressed by child therapy researchers (Shirk & 
Russell, 1996). 

In an effort to assess level of "involvement" in cognitive-behavioral 
therapy, Braswell, Kendall, Braith, Carey, and Vye (1985) coded child and 
therapist verbal responses assumed to be indicative of level of participa­
tion in therapy. For the child, verbal categories included self-disclosure, 
suggesting positive change in the task, self-evaluations of performance, 
and task-irrelevant statements. For therapists, self-disclosure, emphasiz­
ing feelings, correcting self-statements, asking for feedback, and verbal 
reinforcement were coded. Verbalizations were assessed at three points in 
time within sessions across the course of treatment. Although there were 
numerous correlations between verbal responses and multiple outcome 
measures taken at posttreatment and follow-up, the overall pattern of 
results suggested that indices of active involvement were predictive of 
therapeutic gains. Specifically, children's tendency to make spontaneous 
verbal elaborations about tasks and therapists' encouragement and correc­
tive feedback appeared to be among the best predictors of change in 
teacher ratings of self-control. Again, this study provides some evidence 
that within a well-defined treatment approach, differences in child and 
therapist process account for variation in treatment outcome. 

The early 1990s was marked by a notable increase in the number of 
studies that addressed interpersonal processes. As previously discussed, 
the therapist and child rating scales devised by Smith-Acuna et al. (1991) 
included dimensions that assessed both the therapist's and the child's 
perceptions of the therapist-offered relationship. This study represented a 
shift in the source of interpersonal process evaluations with ratings ob­
tained from both child and therapist perspectives. The study demon­
strated that school-aged children could make reliable judgments of aspects 
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of interpersonal process; however, their perceptions of therapist-offered 
conditions were largely uncorrelated with their therapists' perceptions. 

In an effort to bring focus to the study of interpersonal processes in 
child therapy, Shirk and Saiz (1992) advanced a model of the therapeutic 
alliance in child treatment. Drawing on the work of Bordin (1979) and 
Luborsky (1976), two components of the alliance were investigated, the 
emotional quality of the treatment relationship and the child's collabora­
tion with therapeutic tasks. Shirk and Saiz (1992) hypothesized that a 
positive relationship between child and therapist would promote collab­
oration with therapy tasks. In a study with a diagnostically heterogeneous 
sample of 7- to 12-year-old children who were hospitalized and seen in 
intensive, short-term, dynamically oriented child therapy, children and 
their therapists rated the quality of the working alliance. Reliabilities for 
both therapist and child ratings ranged from acceptable to excellent. More­
over, there were moderate levels of shared variance between therapist and 
child reports of the affective quality of the alliance. For both therapist and 
child reports, the affective quality of the relationship was associated with 
task collaboration in the predicted direction. The alliance scales appeared 
to be promising, especially the dimensions assessing the affective quality 
of the treatment relationship. Regarding task collaboration, Shirk and Saiz 
(1992) suggested that observational ratings might be better for assessing 
this aspect of the alliance than child self-report, given the constraints of 
the child's level of cognitive development and limited therapeutic ex­
perience. 

As previously discussed, Estrada and Russell (1996) developed obser­
vational scales to assess aspects of child therapy process, including partici­
pation in what they called "therapeutic work." Factor analyses of observa­
tional ratings of 117 session segments revealed three therapist and three 
child factors. One of the child factors and one of the therapist factors 
concerned the quality of the therapeutic relationship. As in previous 
studies, items such as Empathy, Warmth, and Positive Relationship loaded 
heavily on the therapist relationship factor; items such as Trust and Open­
ness loaded highly on the child relationship factor. There was evidence of a 
significant degree of covariation between the two relationship factors. In 
addition, factors emerged that concerned participation in the tasks of 
therapy for both children and therapists. Observational ratings of thera­
peutic work for child and therapist were highly correlated. Furthermore, 
there was evidence that technical lapses by the therapist (e.g., low respon­
siveness or inattentiveness) were negatively associated with ratings of the 
child's relationship with the therapist. When viewed in relation to the 
findings of Shirk and Saiz (1992), these results suggest that it is possible to 
reliable assess multiple aspects of the therapeutic relationship from mul-
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tip Ie perspectives, and that aspects of the alliance, specifically, quality of 
relationship and task collaboration, are associated in predictable ways. 

Unfortunately, there have been very few attempts to relate indices of 
the alliance or therapy relationship to treatment outcome. As part of the 
evaluation of a cognitive-behavioral treatment for anxiety disordered chil­
dren, Kendall (1994) assessed the child's perception of the therapeutic 
relationship with a seven-item child self-report scale. Similar to the alli­
ance measure of Shirk and Saiz (1992), the scale tapped the child's feelings 
for the therapist and comfort with talking with the therapist. In this 
controlled outcome study, there was some, albeit limited, evidence for 
associations between alliance scores and measures of treatment outcome. 
From pretreatment to posttreatment and follow-up, 7 of 24 correlations 
were significant in the predicted direction; however, five of these involved 
shared source variance (child self-reports). The strongest pattern of results 
was between alliance scores and child reports of symptoms of anxiety and 
depression, with Significantly less improvement for those cases that re­
ported a poorer therapeutic relationship. The tendency for most children 
to report positive relationships may have limited variability and attenu­
ated other potential relationships with outcome. Multiple perspectives on 
the alliance could potentially address this problem. 

Eltz, Shirk, and Sarlin (1995) examined relationships among maltreat­
ment experience, therapeutic alliance formation, and treatment outcome in 
a sample of psychiatrically hospitalized adolescents. The alliance was 
measured from both the adolescents' and therapists' perspectives at two 
points in time with the Penn Helping Alliance Scales (Alexander & Lubor­
sky, 1987). Results indicated that maltreatment status, multiplicity of mal­
treatment, and type of perpetrator were all associated with initial alliance 
problems. None of these variables was associated with change in the 
alliance over time, which was best predicted by severity of pretreatment 
interpersonal problems. Adolescents who showed more positive change in 
alliance quality, regardless of maltreatment status, evinced greater treat­
ment gains across sources of outcome ratings. These results suggest that 
changes in the pattern of alliance may be a better predictor of outcome 
than "one-shot" assessments of relationship quality. 

In the 1980s and 1990s, then, scale development continued, but at a 
quickened pace and with more theoretical and methodological sophistica­
tion. Noteworthy is the tum to use of multiple-item scales constructed on 
the basis of factor analyses or reliability studies. In these two decades, 
then, there seems to be a concerted effort· to discover and describe the 
underlying organization of the therapeutic relationship in child treatment. 
Finally, we find initial efforts to relate interpersonal processes, specifically, 
the alliance, to treatment outcome. 



CHILD PSYCHOTHERAPY PROCESS RESEARCH 109 

4.3. Summary of Research on Interpersonal Processes 

Methodological and statistical problems are evident throughout the 
history of research on interpersonal processes in child psychotherapy. One 
common problem boils down to the use of just too few therapists and too 
few clients, even in measure development studies, where independence of 
observations is assumed in standard factor analyses, or where there is a 
need for a very large number of repeated measurements in P-technique 
studies that use numerous rating scales. Furthermore, there is a virtual 
dearth of validity studies-concurrent, predictive, or discriminant-that 
might serve as a basis for an assessment of the construct validity of the 
interpersonal dimensions that are purportedly assessed. 

One does note some development in the specificity of the constructs 
that figure in the interpersonal process literature. The field appears to have 
moved from global characterizations of the therapist "being there," 
through an examination of therapist-offered relationship conditions, and 
finally to a components analysis of the therapeutic alliance. However, 
much more is needed to adequately assess the role of various aspects of the 
child-therapist relationship in treatment process and outcome. Clearly, 
more attention must be directed to developmental constraints on the 
complexity of interpersonal information processing in order to guide con­
struction of scales that are appropriate for use with children of varying 
capacities. 

5. Language/Cognitive Process in Child Psychotherapy . 

To be included in this section, studies had to employ category systems 
that targeted speech acts or therapeutic techniques focused on processive 
contents that were neither explicitly emotional nor interpersonal in charac­
ter. In addition, studies that report findings about discourse processes or 
amounts of verbalization were included. 

5.1. Early Studies on CognitivelLanguage Processes 

As we have noted in previous sections, many of the earliest studies of 
therapy process assessed language interaction or speech acts as a means of 
evaluating emotional and interpersonal processes. These studies also shed 
light on the linguistic content of specific forms of child psychotherapy, 
especially client-centered therapy. For example, in the study by Landis­
berg and Snyder (1946), therapists' and children's verbal behavior were 
coded into a set of speech act categories. Three types of verbal behavior 
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accounted for almost 80% of all child-therapist exchanges; these included 
30% therapist nondirective statements, 25% clients giving information, 
and 24% client positive play action. As noted earlier, this was the first 
study to examine dependencies between client and therapist speech. One 
noteworthy finding was that client information-giving and positive play 
action followed therapist reflection of feeling more frequently than any 
other child speech actions. 

Other descriptive findings emerged from early studies of language 
interaction in child therapy. For example, Lebo (1952) found that children's 
most frequently used speech category was descriptions or stories about 
family, school, pets, teachers, the playroom, or the self. These utterances 
accounted for almost one-third of all speech acts. It should be noted that 
this was the first study to focus on narratives in child or adult therapy, thus 
defining a new unit for language analysis. In two later studies, Lebo (1956; 
Lebo & Lebo, 1957) found that the number of verbalizations decreased 
with increasing age (between 4 and 12), and that younger children's speech 
contained more stories, as well as more sound effects and unclassifiable 
statements, than did the speech of older children. These findings suggest 
that therapeutic talk may not increase, at least during the school-aged 
years, as a function of increasing verbal capacity. This conclusion, though 
consistent with clinical observation, is offered tentatively, in that Lebo did 
not assess verbal capacity, nor did he report diagnostic information that 
could represent a potential confound for the reported age trends. 

Other descriptive findings emerged from the studies of Moustakas 
and his colleagues, who classified over 1,000 therapist and 1,000 child 
utterances in nondirective therapy. For example, in their comparison of 
disturbed and nondisturbed children's verbalizations, Moustakas and 
Schalock (1955) found that 67% of the nondisturbed group's behavior 
could be classified as verbal behavior, whereas only 53% of the disturbed 
children's behavior met the same criterion. As the authors noted, the 
disturbed children appeared to be more likely to "act out" rather than 
symbolize their experience compared to the nondisturbed children. In the 
same study, contingencies were also examined. To therapist interpreta­
tions, children most frequently responded with statement of condition or 
action, recognition, or rejection. Conversely, to children's information 
seeking, the therapist most frequently responded with information giving. 
These results point to some basic patterning in child therapy, at least in 
nondirective therapy; however, no attempt was made to examine such 
patterns in relation to outcomes at the level of the session or overall 
treatment. 

In the earliest studies of language processes, then, investigators 
turned to language analysis to assess not only frequency of use of specific 
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speech acts, but also overall verbal output and dependencies between 
therapist and child utterances. With these strategies, they were able to 
provide empirical characterizations of what went on in nondirective ther­
apy, to document age trends during the school-age years, and to begin to 
characterize differences in the quality and quantity of participation in 
therapy of children with or without behavioral disorders. Amount of 
verbalization, information seeking and giving, aggressiveness in speech, 
and reflective and attentive responding seem to be the predominant cate­
gories of use in the earliest studies. 

Two studies appeared in the 1960s that addressed language process. 
Guerney et al. (1965) found that raters could reliably code verbal utter­
ances, and that these utterances appeared to provide an index of the child's 
in-session behavior. Dana and Dana (1969) applied a six category coding 
system, only two of which were focused on vocal and verbal behavior, in a 
comparison of nondirective versus dynamic group therapy with children 
ages 3 to 8. Despite the absence of formal statistical analyses, the authors 
concluded that nondirective treatments tended to inhibit play, vocaliza­
tion, and speech more than dynamic treatments. These results were not 
replicated by Boll (1971), who reported, on the basis of a qualitative anal­
ysis of the data, results that were the opposite of the previous study. It is 
unfortunate that the systematic efforts to code samples of therapy process 
in these studies were not complemented by systematic analyses of the 
resulting data. 

Many of the limitations of early language process research are ad­
dressed in the Truax and Wittmer (1973) investigation of therapists' use of 
confrontation in treatment. In this study, the relationship between a spe­
cified therapist discourse tactic, confrontation, and a specified pathogenic 
process, maladaptive defense mechanisms, was investigated with a sam­
ple of delinquents. Seventy-three adolescents between the ages of 14 and 18 
were treated in dynamically oriented group therapy during residential 
treatment. The study focused on the relationship between degree of con­
frontation of the adolescents' defense mechanisms and treatment out­
come. High- and low-confrontation groups were contrasted by comparing 
change scores on over 20 measures, while controlling for pretherapy levels 
of the target variables. The authors found substantial evidence across most 
outcome measures for a relationship between confrontation of defenses 
and treatment progress. 

This study represents a dramatic shift in the strategy used to investi­
gate process-outcome relations. It attempts to link concrete therapist inter­
ventions and underlying pathogenic mechanisms in the client, and to 
relate the interplay between these units to treatment outcome. This ap­
proach not only represents a major advance in the history of child process 
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research, but it also stands in sharp contrast to most studies of treatment 
outcome that focus on the impact of treatment packages on children who 
share similar behavioral phenotypes. In this sense, this study, undertaken 
in the early 1970s, predates the current focus on change events and plan­
focused interventions that were initiated in the adult literature in the early 
1980s (d. Orlinsky & Russell, 1994). 

The few studies conducted during the 1960s and 1970s provide limited 
substantive findings. As in other areas of process research, there is evi­
dence for reliable coding of child and therapist verbalizations. Initial 
evidence on the impact of types of treatment on language process is 
equivocal, largely because of unsystematic treatment of the coded data. 
The one bright spot to emerge during this period is found in the work on 
specific therapist discourse strategies. This new strategy redirects atten­
tion to specific therapist interventions in relation to specific pathogenic 
processes. Such an approach seems to have the potential to realign studies 
of treatment outcome by addressing the interventions that constitute 
brand-name treatments and the mechanisms that underlie specific dis­
orders. 

5.2. Recent Studies on CognitivelLanguage Processes 

The 1980s witnessed both continuities and new directions in the study 
of language and cognitive processes in child psychotherapy. Mook's 
(1982a, 1982b) studies represent a continuation of the focus on speech acts 
in dynamically oriented child therapy. Several new developments are also 
evident in this work. First, Mook included a new language coding system 
that focused on grammatical variation (present, past, and future tenses) in 
child and therapist language use. Second, a new method for organizing 
language use in therapy, the P-technique, was introduced in order to 
identify the underlying organization of the therapist's or client's participa­
tion over time. Utilizing this approach with two therapists who each 
treated one child, Mook found that the therapists' discourse was orga­
nized around several strategies, including questioning the client about 
neutral and painful topics, information giving, affirmation, and self­
disclosure. For the children, factors emerged that also reflected discourse 
strategies. Talking about uneventful topics, engaging in self-exploration of 
problems and feelings, and information seeking organized the children's 
discourse. Interestingly, there was some evidence for a developmental 
difference in the structures that characterized the children's cognitive and 
language activities; a play factor emerged for the younger child, whereas 
an insight and understanding factor emerged for the older child. 

A series of process-outcome studies in cognitive-behavioral child 



CHILD PSYCHOTHERAPY PROCESS RESEARCH 113 

therapy established several new directions in the study of cognitive and 
language processes. First, these studies marked the expansion of process 
research beyond the relatively narrow confines of nondirective or dynamic 
child therapies. Second, these studies represented the first systematic 
manipulation of cognitive or language processes in therapy, and the first 
analyses of how controlled variations in process related to treatment out­
come. 

Common to these studies is the focus on self-instructional training to 
enhance self-control and an interest in the potential moderating influence 
of the child's age or cognitive developmental level on the efficacy of such 
interventions. Given the emphasis on teaching thinking strategies in self­
control training, a number of investigators hypothesized that such inter­
ventions could interact with children's cognitive capacities to produce 
differential outcomes (d. Cohen & Myers, 1984; Kendall, Lerner, & Craig­
head, 1984). In order to investigate this possibility, Cohen, Myers, and their 
colleagues conducted a series of studies that systematically varied the 
programmed dialogue between child and therapist in self-instructional 
training. In the first study, Schleser, Meyers, and Cohen (1981) taught 
preoperational and concrete operational children of similar age a set of self­
guiding statements in one of two conditions. In the traditional condition, 
the therapist provided the child with direct examples of self-instructions 
(e.g., "What is it that I need to do?"); in the directed-discovery condition, 
children were induced to discover basic self-instructions through dialogue 
with the therapist. For example, the therapist might ask, "What is the first 
thing you need to ask yourself when you start a task?" One of the main 
findings to emerge from this study was that the discovery procedure had a 
differential effect on children at different cognitive levels. Specifically, in 
the discovery condition, concrete operational children showed greater 
generalization to new tasks than preoperational children. Thus, the type of 
programmed dialogue appeared to have an impact on treatment outcome 
for children at different developmental levels. Nichol, Cohen, Meyers, and 
Schleser (1982) conducted a follow-up study in which children were pre­
sented with a linguistic variation of the directed-discovery approach to self­
instructional training. In this study, children were presented with general 
content (e.g., "I'm going to ask myself a question, I have to stop and think 
about what the question is asking") rather than specific self-instructions. A 
comparison group received no treatment. Children at both levels of cogni­
tive development showed greater gains in self-control relative to the no­
treatment group, but again generalization was limited to concrete opera­
tional children in the treatment group. The authors concluded that in 
contrast to preoperational children, concrete operational children learn not 
only a specific set of self-instructions but also a procedure for generating 
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such statements. From the perspective of language process in child ther­
apy, these studies are important in that they draw attention to differences 
in patterns of language interaction within a well-defined treatment proto­
col that influence the generalization of treatment effects, at least for more 
cognitively advanced children. 

In a related study, Kendall and Wilcox (1980) manipulated the manner 
in which self-instructional training was administered to children between 
the ages of 8 and 12. Children in the concrete condition received training 
that involved procedures that were specific to the training task; in the 
conceptual condition, children were presented with procedures that were 
general and relevant to a range of problem situations. The conceptual 
approach produced larger gains than the concrete approach in teacher 
ratings of self-control, and conceptual training was superior in producing 
generalization of behavior change. These results suggest that variations in 
the conceptual level of training instructions influence treatment outcome, 
even for treatments that target the same cognitive skill. Although language 
interaction was not systematically examined in this study, it is possible that 
the two groups might show differences in the character of language pro­
cesses corresponding to the nature of the training tasks. 

Russell, Greenwald, and Shirk (1991) attempted to relate types of in­
session conversational interaction to changes in child clients' language 
achievement and other outcome variables. Eighteen studies were coded for 
one of three types of verbal interaction-spontaneous conversation, task­
framed conversation, or behavioral or non-language-oriented treatment­
that had been purportedly used in the children's treatment. Using meta­
analytic techniques, the authors reported that treatments using spontaneous 
conversation obtained outcome effect sizes over 10 times as large as those 
using task-framed conversation, and over four times as large as those 
treatments that deemphasized verbal interaction. Interestingly, changes in 
language outcomes and other behavioral outcomes were not correlated. 
This study is noteworthy in that it stressed the relationship between types 
of discourse organization and achievement on language tasks, an impor­
tant but often overlooked domain of child functioning. 

Russell, van den Broek, Adams, Rosenberger, and Essig (1993) pre­
sented a study of Richard Gardner's (1971) mutual storytelling technique. 
The authors were interested in identifying if and how the therapist's story 
differed from the child's story, which served as its basis. Three narrative 
dimensions were assessed, including the causal and temporal connected­
ness of the story, the degree of elaboration of subjectivity in the stories, and 
the grammatical complexity of the stories. Sixteen child and therapist 
counterpart stories were coded. Findings indicated that the therapist pro­
vided stories that were more connected causally and temporally, repre-
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senting subjectivity more frequently, but were equally or less complex than 
the children's stories. For the therapist's stories, those segments that were 
most connected causally and temporally also contained the most represen­
tations of subjectivity. The authors concluded that the therapist may have 
been trying to repair, augment, or foster the development of the children's 
theories of mind, specifically, by modeling sensitivity to causal connec­
tions between internal cognitive processes such as intentions, plans, 
wishes, and overt behavior. This was the first study in the child area to 
relate therapist and child narrative activity and to suggest, on the basis 
of empirical findings, how narrative processes might function in child 
therapy. 

In addition to analyzing emotional and relational processes in their 
P-technique study (see earlier sections), Russell, Bryant, and Estrada (1996) 
examined discourse strategies in high- versus low-quality child therapy 
sessions. Exploratory P-technique factor analyses revealed three descrip­
tively comparable therapist factors for both types of sessions-responsive 
informing, initiatory questioning, and positive regard; however, confirma­
tory analyses confirmed only the first two factors. Important differences in 
discourse distinguished high- from low-quality sessions. Specifically, rela­
tive to sessions of low quality, high-quality sessions were organized more 
systematically around two developmentally significant discourse strate­
gies: (1) efforts by the therapist to continue the child's topic of discussion in 
a manner that produced richer information, and (2) attempts to acquire 
new information about the recent past that was focused in relation to the 
child. The authors related these two discourse strategies to findings from 
the developmental literature, which suggest that each is critical for struc­
turing children's basic language and cognitive abilities (Feldman, 1988; 
Shirk & Russell, 1996). 

In summary, recent studies of language and cognitive processes in 
child psychotherapy are marked by a significant shift in strategy and 
target of study. In earlier research, frequencies of nominally scaled lan­
guage categories were tallied, described, and compared. Underlying pat­
terns of organization or molar descriptions of discourse styles were not 

. systematically investigated. Recent studies begin to overcome these limita­
tions. Moreover, one finds initial attempts to evaluate cognitive and lan­
guage processes that have been systematically manipulated in compara­
tive outcome designs. 

Substantively, there is indication that therapist discourse styles influ­
ence outcomes and can be differentiated across high- and low-quality 
sessions. A number of aspects of therapist-child language interaction 
appear to be potential candidates for promoting or enhancing therapeutic 
change, including discovery-oriented dialogue, topic continuation, and 
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narratives that focus on causal connections and child subjectivity. It is not 
clear if all effective treatments are characterized by high levels of these 
processes, or if such processes are differentially relevant to specific types of 
interventions. 

Clear methodological developments emerge in this period as well. 
Meta-analysis of processes, fine-grained linguistic analyses of narratives, 
and confirmatory P-technique studies surface for the first time. Limita­
tions, however, also abound. Small sample sizes, use of few or training 
therapists, and heterogeneous client samples continue to be a problem. 
Furthermore, there appears to be a growing need to devise methods 
whereby findings from P-technique studies can be aggregated system­
atically. Idiographic strategies will need to be augmented in such a way as 
to build an idiothetic science, one built on the confirmation and compila­
tion of N = 1 studies (Czogalik & Russell, 1994). 

5.3. Summary of Research on CognitivelLanguage Processes 

The study of cognitive and language processes in child psycho­
therapy has progressed substantially over its six-decade history. This pro­
gressive trend remedies the oversimplification inherent in the construction 
of mutually exclusive classification systems comprised of a limited num­
ber of categories and in use of the frequency approach (Russell & Trull, 
1986). Contemporary researchers have placed more emphasis on the multi­
plicity of meanings and functions characteristic of human discourse and 
have thus begun to assess each discourse unit on sets of ordinal scales. In 
addition, recent investigators have focused on ways to assess process­
relationships between language units that emerge over time-thereby 
reestablishing a link with the very first child process study. Recent work 
has also considered different language units for analysis, thereby moving 
beyond a singular focus on the utterance. These include narratives, broad 
discourse patterns, and patterns of exchange that typify whole treatments. 
Finally, language processes have begun to be modeled. Here investigators 
are searching to identify and confirm underlying patterns characteristic of 
therapist-child discourse. In these current developments, the structures of 
effective processes are beginning to be discovered. 

Substantially, several language/cognitive processes repeatedly sur­
face as significant constituents of child therapy. These processes might be 
described as information-exchange, cognitive-emotional work, instruc­
tional guidance, and disclosure paired with acknowledgment. These pro­
cesses, although similar to those identified in the adult literature, were 
found to vary developmentally, and in sessions of varying quality. Future 
programs of research will need to address how such processes shape 
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outcomes at the level of the session and the full treatment. Initial inves­
tigations suggest that it may be the form and not the quantity of these 
processes that are predictive of successful outcomes. 

6. Conclusions and Future Directions 

In reviewing the 50-year history of research on child psychotherapy 
process, it is evident that there are both promising beginnings and recur­
rent problems. Although this body of research is often disparaged, present 
authors included, a close look at it reveals some striking facts. First, 
process researchers in the child area have been repeatedly innovative, 
introducing, often before their appearance in the "more developed" adult 
literature, such strategies as sequential analysis, social comparison tech­
niques, analogue process studies, rudimentary phase of treatment analy­
ses, assessment of therapist interventions in relation to pathogenic mecha­
nisms, fine-grained narrative analyses, confirmatory P-technique, and 
meta-analysis of language process in relation to outcomes. Second, al­
though there has been little continuity in programs of research across 
generations, there is notable confluence with regard to the key therapist 
and client variables that are included in process studies, some of which 
have been shown to be related to changes in process and outcomes. Not 
surprisingly, aspects of emotion identification, expression, and regulation; 
aspects of the process and structure of the therapeutic relationship; and 
aspects of therapist and client language use have repeatedly been used to 
assess therapist and client participation in therapy and to index treatment 
mechanisms. Third, although there are many methodological shortcom­
ings in this research, there has been a consistent focus on measurement 
construction that has included a recurrent concern with developmental 
parameters, even in the earliest studies. 

The internal, external, statistical conclusion, and construct validity of 
this body of research would have to be considered less than optimal. The 
methodological problems found in many of these studies cast serious 
doubts about the validity or generalizability of their findings (see Shirk 
and Russell, 1996, for a study by study methodological critique). It is 
important to note that many of the methodological limitations found in 
this research stem from the fact that studies were often conducted with 
samples and therapists of "convenience," a problem that follows from the 
lack of funding for process research. Some of these problems are likely to 
persist as long as funding sources are more inclined to invest in studies 
assessing which of several treatments works best, rather than in studies 
assessing how and which therapeutic processes are responsible for change. 
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There have been, needless to say, a number of productive pathways 
and blind alleys etched across this field of research. Several "method­
specific" and "paradigm-level" blind alleys should be noted. At the 
method-specific level, most process research in the child tradition has been 
conducted by use of nominal coding categories for in-session behavior or 
participant/ observer rating scales administered after sessions. Most of the 
category systems have been constructed with a limited number of mutu­
ally exclusive language categories, and most analyses have consisted of 
simply tallying category frequencies. Several inherent limitations to this 
approach can be noted (d. Russell & Trull,1986; Russell & Czogalik, 1989). 
First of all, it should be noted that language and discourse are the most 
complicated human behaviors; it would be odd if their complexity could 
be adequately gauged by the use of 5 or 10 broad-band categories. Second, 
utterances are typically polysemantic and polyfunctional; they mean more 
than one thing, and they attempt to accomplish more than one act or 
function. Consequently, the multiple meanings and functions of utterances 
can be captured more adequately with a set of ordinal scales on which each 
utterance is rated. Third, the use of the frequency approach, that is, simply 
tallying instances over a segment or course of therapy, reveals little about 
the temporal or causal organization of discourse, or the relationships 
between utterances. The same applies to the analysis of interpersonal 
interactions. Sequential, time series, growth curve, and P-technique 
methods of analysis each offer more sophisticated alternatives to the fre­
quency approach. Fourth, use of the frequency approach has often been 
applied to randomly selected segments of therapy sessions. It is possible 
that the change events responsible for patient improvement are not evenly 
distributed throughout the course of treatment. Discriminative sampling 
procedures aimed at first locating significant change events in therapy 
may provide a better corpus of data on which to apply sophisticated 
analytic strategies to discover mechanisms of change (Russell, 1987). 

Use of participant/ observer scales for assessment of therapy process 
has also been limited at the method-specific level. Most obvious has been 
the lack of the necessary series of studies, including sufficient numbers of 
patients and therapists, to assess an instrument's reliability and validity. 
Scale development in this area has been consistently neglectful in securing 
content validity, particularly with regard to emotion and interpersonal 
processes. Few studies have examined the concurrent or predictive val­
idity of process rating scales. 

Studies that have used coding systems or participant ratings have 
often assessed process at one point in time. Such an approach provides 
little insight into the course of therapy and the pattern of therapeutic 
processes. In some areas, such as the therapeutic alliance, differential 
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patterns in the quality of the therapeutic relationship may be more predic­
tive of outcome than "one-shot" assessments. Research by Patterson and 
his colleagues on resistance in parent training (Patterson & Chamberlain, 
1994; Stoolmiller, Duncan, Bank, & Patterson, 1993) has shown that patterns 
of change in this interpersonal process are better predictors of outcome 
than single assessments or averaged process scores from multiple points in 
time. At present, we know preciously little about the pattern of develop­
ment of most process variables and whether differing linear or nonlinear 
patterns of process are predictive of treatment outcomes. In fact, too few 
studies have examined the relation between process variables, however 
measured, and treatment outcome. This task represents the major chal­
lenge for the next generation of child therapy process researchers. 

At the paradigm level, we saw that many of the studies were aimed at 
describing and comparing treatment "brands" when applied to clients 
whose problems were either poorly described or categorized by diagnostic 
criteria alone. Research on adult psychotherapy has shown that there is 
substantial variation among therapists who deliver the "same" treatment, 
the so-called therapist effect (d. Crits-Christoph & Mintz, 1991; Lambert, 
1989), and developmental research has indicated that children with the 
"same" disorder may not share underlying pathogenic processes (d. Kaz­
din & Kagan, 1994; Shirk & Russell, 1996). Furthermore, it is unlikely that 
therapists respond to the child's diagnostic label any more than children 
respond to the therapist's espoused brand of therapy. In the heart of the 
therapy hour, therapists respond to the verbal and nonverbal activities of 
the child, just as the child responds to the varied actions of the therapist. By 
neglecting these transactions, the time-honored research paradigm that 
organizes outcome and process-outcome studies in terms of treatment 
packages and descriptive diagnostic groupings may miss the real phenom­
ena of therapeutic treatment. Thus, process research should be recali­
bra ted to examine patterns of transactions in and across sessions and their 
relation to changes in children's underlying pathogenic processes. 

Although these blind alleys may seem prohibitive, several productive 
pathways are evident in the history of child psychotherapy process re­
search and worth following. For example, early in this tradition, an interest 
was evident in social comparison methodology as applied to process. 
Exposed to similar treatment conditions, is there a difference in the form 
and function of therapist-client interaction when comparing healthy and 
disturbed children, and do the interactions of the therapists with the 
disturbed children begin to approximate patterns found with healthy or 
healthier children over time? Of equal importance, do disturbed children's 
patterns of interaction with the therapist begin to approximate healthy 
children's interactions with non-mental-health providers? Although these 
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questions are rarely asked, such analyses could provide in-session markers 
of progress (processive outcomes). Recently, investigators have begun to 
devise sophisticated methods for applying social comparison methodol­
ogy to process (Russell, 1995; Stinson, Milbrath, & Horowitz, 1995). 

In the 1980s and 1990s, investigators began to tum to multivariate 
methods for assessing process. This trend was evident in research using 
either microanalytic ratings of in-session behaviors or molar ratings of 
process taken after sessions. Future research should build on this trend, 
with appropriate efforts to establish the reliability and validity of the 
measurement systems, and with concern to replicate and confirm findings 
with additional samples. Consequently, we recommend use of confirma­
tory factor analyses to validate and confirm measurement models sug­
gested by exploratory factor analyses of process. In this regard, replicated 
P-technique factor analyses, based on N = 1 or chained samples, can 
contribute to the nomothetic goals of the more traditional R-technique 
factor analyses evident in this literature. 

Attentive observation or "being there," therapist-offered conditions, 
and the alliance have served as overarching characterizations of the thera­
peutic relationship. There is, however, a trend toward conceptualizing the 
therapeutic relationship as multidimensional and to assess such dimen­
sions with multiple-item scales. These developments in construct and 
scale development should be continued, especially insofar as su,ch vari­
ables have proven to be consistent predictors of treatment progress in the 
adult literature (d. Horvath & Luborsky, 1993). Furthermore, the structure 
of such scales needs to be assessed at multiple time points during therapy, 
as there may be qualitative as well as quantitative variations across phases 
of treatment in interpersonal constructs. 

Child process research has highlighted the importance of stories and 
narratives in psychotherapy, and continued research in this area could 
prove to be especially productive. Narratives are common in everyday 
discourse, as well as in therapy, and function to organize social experience. 
It is possible that the core schema of self and other working models that 
primes maladaptive emotional and behavioral reactions is represented in 
narrative form (Buchsbaum, Toth, Clyman, Cicchetti, & Emde, 1992; Shirk 
& Russell, 1996). Thus, narratives represent an important target for assess­
ment and intervention. Research on the process of narrative transforma­
tion and its relation to changes in social functioning appears to be a 
particularly promising path for future research. 

In conclusion, our review has uncovered a tradition of child psycho­
therapy process research that extends across six decades. Although the 
methodological shortcomings of this literature are evident, there are nu­
merous examples of innovative approaches to the study of child therapy 
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transactions. Child therapy investigators who take up the study of process 
and process-outcome relations are advised to examine the productive 
paths and blind alleys that have been encountered by their predecessors in 
order to advance this field. 

Finally, the study of therapy process may represent one of the best 
ways to bridge the gap between clinical research and clinical practice. 
Studies on the utilization of psychotherapy research by practitioners indi­
cate that clinicians are unlikely to implement a treatment, even a treatment 
with known efficacy, "if they do not know what the treatment consists of or 
how it should be delivered" (Cohen, Sargent, & Sechrest, 1986, p. 204). Not 
surprisingly, then, Kazdin et al. (1990) found that child practitioners 
viewed studies of therapeutic processes and their relation to outcome to be 
a top priority for future research. It appears that for treatment research to 
be relevant to clinical practice, the processes that constitute treatments 
must be detailed and directly investigated in relation to outcome. The 
studies reviewed here mark potential points for bridging the gap between 
research and practice. 
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4 Parent-Child Interaction 
Approaches to the Treatment 

of Child Behavior Problems 

REBECCA FOOTE, SHEILA EYBERG, 

AND ELENA SCHUHMANN 

1. Introduction 

Behavioral parent training, or parent management training (PMT), refers 
to procedures in which parents are trained to alter their child's behavior at 
home (Kazdin, 1996). The recognition that parents can become effective 
agents of therapeutic change in their children has resulted in the develop­
ment and empirical evaluation of numerous parent training programs. 
Today, PMT is considered the treatment of choice for child conduct prob­
lems (Azar & Wolfe, 1989; Kazdin, 1987) and is gaining popularity as a 
component in the treatment of child internalizing problems as well (Albano 
& Barlow, 1996; Brent et al., 1996; Kendall & Treadwell, 1996; Lewinsohn, 
Clark, Rohde, Hops, & Seeley, 1996; Stark, Swearer, Kurowski, Sommer, & 
Bowen, 1996). 

With the growing body of scientific evidence highlighting the role of 
parents in shaping and maintaining child behavior problems (Denham, 
Renwick, & Holt, 1991; Dix, Ruble, & Zambrano, 1989; Parpal & Maccoby, 
1985), parents are moving from cotherapist to coclient, or even primary 
client for problems in dysfunctional parenting (Kendziora & O'Leary, 
1993). Parent-child interactional approaches to the treatment of child be­
havior problems view parents as coclients. Although the child, not the 
parent, typically receives the diagnosis (e.g., Oppositional Defiant Dis-
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order), his or her behavior problems are considered in the broader context 
of the parent-child interaction and overall relationship. From this perspec­
tive, treatment involves changing both the child's and parent's behaviors, 
thoughts, and feelings that affect the well-being of the other. 

In addition, the recognition of the multifaceted nature of clinical dys­
functions and adjustment (Kazdin, 1995) underscores the need to expand 
the goals of parent training beyond the child's symptoms. Clinical child 
psychologists are increasingly turning to the developmental literature in 
an effort to understand how childhood problems evolve and how to foster 
positive child outcomes. Baumrind's (1967) developmental research asso­
ciating parenting practices with child outcomes in normal populations has 
important implications for intervention. She formulated the authoritative­
authoritarian-permissive parenting theory (Baumrind, 1991) after finding 
that middle-class parents of preschoolers who were less nurturant, less 
involved, and more controlling and punitive had more discontented, with­
drawn, and mistrustful children (Baumrind, 1967). More recently, Baum­
rind (1991) has demonstrated that parents who do not adequately meet 
young children's dual needs for nurturance and for limits are less likely to 
have successful and healthy adolescents. The strong and consistent rela­
tion between certain parenting styles and problematic child outcomes has 
been shown in numerous other studies (e.g., Azar & Wolfe, 1989; Franz, 
McClelland, & Weinberger, 1991; Olson, Bates, & Bayles, 1990; Power & 
Chapieski, 1986). This research clearly suggests that clinicians' efforts 
should be directed toward fostering optimal parenting styles if they are 
interested in promoting optimal child outcomes. 

1.1. Scope of Review 

This review focuses on interactional approaches to parent training, 
which we refer to as parent-child treatments (PCTs). Although they are 
indeed part of the same family, PCT can be distinguished from PMT in 
several important ways. PMT programs typically target specific problem 
behaviors of children, utilize available incentives, and emphasize contin­
gent application of consequences (Eyberg, 1992; Kazdin, 1996). Although 
PMT can result in positive changes in the interaction between parent and 
child, the progress of therapy is guided by changes in the child's behaviors 
rather than by changes in the interaction. Therapists work with parents to 
teach them fundamental principles of child behavior change (e.g., the 
function of positive reinforcement), as well as how to implement changes 
at home. The major task of the therapy session is to review how the treat­
ment program was implemented at home, identify how it can be modified, 
and give feedback, model, and rehearse specific skills with the parent. The 
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child is typically not included in the sessions but may be brought in to 
ensure that he or she understands the program, that the program is imple­
mented as reported by the parent, and to negotiate behavioral contracts 
between parent and child (Eyberg, 1992; Kazdin, 1996). 

In contrast, PCT targets the interaction patterns between parent 
and child for change, rather than specific child behavior problems, and 
emphasizes training in nurturance as well as discipline. This approach 
attempts to reduce children's maladaptive and inappropriate behaviors by 
strengthening the parent-child bond via positive communications, effec­
tive discipline, and problem-solving skills. Because the target of change is 
the interaction and overall relationship, both parent and child attend the 
treatment sessions. Therapists engage in direct coaching of parents as they 
interact with their child. This strategy enables therapists to provide par­
ents with immediate feedback on the implementation of the interaction 
skills taught (Eyberg, 1992). 

Most PCTs target young children and their parents when the patterns 
of parent-child interaction are taking shape, and when children are most 
vulnerable to poor quality parenting (Loeber, 1990). In addition, PCTs have 
thus far focused on children with disruptive behavior problems. There are 
three DSM-IV categories that address these behavior problems: Opposi­
tional Defiant Disorder (ODD), Conduct Disorder (CD), and Attention­
Deficit/Hyperactivity Disorder (ADHD). Even among preschoolers, dis­
ruptive behavior problems represent the majority of referrals seen at men­
tal health centers (Offord, Boyle, & Racine, 1991; Schuhmann, Durning, 
Eyberg, & Boggs, 1996). These early problems also show considerable 
stability in childhood (Campbell & Ewing, 1990). Furthermore, epidemi­
ological research suggests that preschool conduct problems may be part of 
a common pathway for a wide range of adolescent and adult disorders of 
both an externalizing and internalizing nature (Fisher, Rolf, Hasazi, & 
Cummings, 1984; Lerner, Inui, Trupin, & Douglas, 1985). 

2. Theoretical Foundations 

PCT, with its special emphasis on changing parent-child interaction 
patterns and improving the quality of the parent-child relationship, is 
informed by the developmental psychology literature and draws on both 
attachment and social learning theories. Even when the child's problem 
behaviors are strongly influenced by biological characteristics such as a 
difficult temperament or the neurological deficits suspected in hyper­
active, developmentally delayed, or autistic children, many of the behav­
ior problems seem to be intensified by the parent-child interactional 
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patterns (Eyberg & Boggs, in press). Quality of parenting as well as the 
nature of the home environment (e.g., marital discord, poverty) are 
strongly implicated in most cases of child behavior problems (Bearss & 
Eyberg, 1996; Farrington, 1988; Hawkings, Catalano, & Miller, 1992; Loeber 
& Dishion, 1983; Patterson, 1986). 

2.1. Attachment Theory 

Recent theory and observational research on the antecedents and 
correlates of the child's attachment to primary caregivers has provided a 
new perspective and methodology for understanding how the quality of 
the parent-child relationship might influence the child's risk for antisocial 
behavior in later years (Sroufe, Egeland, & Kreutzer, 1990). It has been 
found that preschool children referred to clinics for disruptive behavior 
are more likely to be distressed during separations and to display behav­
iors thought to indicate insecure attachments with their mothers (Green­
berg, Speltz, DeKlyen, & Endriga, 1991; Speltz, Greenberg, & DeKlyen, 
1990). 

2.1.1. Early Child-Parent Attachment Relationships 

The nature of the parent-child relationship during infancy and tod­
dlerhood, as assessed through the attachment paradigm, is believed to be a 
central causal factor in the child's personality development and behavioral 
adjustment (Bowlby, 1982; Bronfenbrenner, 1979). Numerous empirical 
findings indicate that secure attachment with a caregiver in the first 2 years 
of life is related to sociability with other adults and children, compliance 
with parents, and more effective emotional regulation (Ainsworth, Blehar, 
Waters, & Wall, 1978; Richters & Waters, 1991). Insecure attachment prior to 
age 2, in contrast, has been related to lower sociability, anger, poorer peer 
relations, and lower behavioral self-control during the preschool years 
(Greenberg & Speltz, 1988). 

Attachment theory asserts that sensitive and responsive parenting 
during infancy leads the child to develop a cognitive-affective working 
model that he or she will be responded to when necessary. Thus, infants 
whose parents show greater warmth, responsiveness, and sensitivity to 
the child's signals during the first year are more likely to develop a secure 
working model of their relationships (Ainsworth et al., 1978; Bates, Maslin, 
& Frankel, 1985; Egeland & Sroufe, 1981) and more effective emotional 
regulation (Stern, 1985). Isabella & Belsky (1991) demonstrated that it is 
contingent responsiveness, not sheer frequency of involvement, that is 
most important. 
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2.1.2. Early Attachment and Later Behavior Problems 

One of the most informative series of studies has come from the 
Minnesota Mother-Child Project, which followed a high-risk sample of 
children of young, single mothers from birth through adolescence (Ege­
land & Sroufe, 1981; Erikson, Sroufe, & Egeland, 1985; Sroufe, 1983). Find­
ings from this project have consistently shown that children in high social 
risk environments showing early insecure relations are significantly more 
likely to have poor peer relations, depression, and aggression than those 
children who showed early security. Despite a strong relationship between 
the quality of the early attachment relationship and preschool measures of 
behavior problems, this association is mediated by subsequent variations 
in the parent-child relationship and family circumstances such as home 
environment, parenting practices, and maternal psychopathology (Erik­
son et al., 1985; Sroufe et al., 1990). These findings suggest that information 
about attachment security as well as later parent-child and family rela­
tionships are necessary to predict later behavior problems accurately. 

2.1.3. Attachment during the Preschool Years 

In discussing the nature of attachment during the preschool years, 
Greenberg et al. (1991) reported that the development of joint verbal plan­
ning in the parent-child relationship serves to support the child's rudi­
mentary coping repertoire, reduce the child's anxiety regarding separa­
tion, and increase the child's autonomy. However, Greenberg et al. (1991) 
maintain that, as in infancy, the security of the attachment relationship 
depends on a parent's ability to be responsive to the preschooler's emo­
tional needs during separations and reunions. Malatesta-Magai (1991) sug­
gested that a parent who responds to a child's emotional expression with 
empathy and labeling is essentially teaching the young child that emo­
tional expressions are tolerable experiences. In relationships characterized 
by behavior and emotional problems, children often express negative 
affect (Campbell, 1988); however, these expressions, which are often stim­
uli that elicit coercive cycles, are frequently viewed by the parent as 
intolerable (Patterson, 1982). A pattern is then established in which the 
parent indicates to the child that these negative affects are "bad" and does 
not assist the child in developing more mature forms of emotional expres­
sion (Greenberg & Speltz, 1988). Although parents of children with be­
havior problems may show deficiencies in strategies for child control! 
discipline (Patterson, 1986), a more fundamental problem may be their 
inability to be sensitive and responsive to their child's needs for security 
and attention (Greenberg & Speltz, 1988). Furthermore, it has been hypoth-
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esized that many of the behaviors labeled as problems are themselves 
necessary scrategies to engage the attachment/ caregiving behaviors of 
some parents, although clearly maladaptive in the social world at large 
(Speltz et al., 1990). 

Classification systems have been developed for assessing the quality 
of attachment in children between the ages of 3 and 6 years (Cassidy & 
Marvin, 1989; Main & Cassidy, 1985). Two recent studies examined the 
concurrent relations between attachment and peer relations. Cohn (1990) 
found that 6-year-old boys, but not girls, with insecure attachments were 
perceived as more aggressive by peers and were reported by their teacher 
to show significant behavior problems. Using a low-risk sample of English 
4-year-olds, Turner (1991) found that boys with concurrent insecurity 
showed more aggression, disruption, and attention seeking in preschool 
than secure boys. Insecure girls showed more dependent, less assertive, 
and less controlling behavior than did secure girls, but no differences were 
found in aggression or disruption. 

Two studies have examined attachment security in clinic-referred 
samples of children who met criteria for ODD and comparison children 
matched for age, social class, and family composition (Greenberg et al., 
1991; Speltz et al., 1990). In both studies, approximately 80% of the clinic 
children demons crated insecure attachments in comparison to 30% of the 
comparison children, with the insecure-controlling pattern being espe­
cially prominent. 

2.2. Social Learning Theory 

Consistent with social learning theory, PCT assumes that child con­
duct problems are inadvertently established and/or maintained by the 
young child's interaction with the parent (Eyberg, 1992). The dysfunctional 
parent-child interaction is characterized by habitual aversive behaviors 
on the part of both parent and child. Each member in this relationship 
attempts to concrol the behaviors of the other through behaviors (e.g., 
arguing, criticizing, whining, aggression) that are maintained by intermit­
tent positive reinforcement (e.g., compliance, attention). Parents of conduct­
problem children have commonly been found to be both power-assertive 
and lax in their discipline (Baumrind, 1967; Dumas, LaFreniere, Beaudin, & 
Verlaan, 1992; Dumas & Wahler, 1985). These parents often issue vague 
instructions that cannot be obeyed and respond to their children's disrup­
tive behavior in an inconsistent manner, giving it both positive and nega­
tive attention (Dumas & Lechowicz, 1989; Patterson, 1982). Exposure to 
parental coercion and inconsistency fails to control child disruptive behav-
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ior, but rather serves to maintain and strengthen it (Dumas & Wahler, 1985; 
Patterson, 1982; Snyder, 1977). 

Specific interaction patterns have been identified in families of chil­
dren with disruptive behavior problems. Mothers of ADHD children, for 
example, have been found to be more commanding and negative, and less 
responsive to positive or neutral communications from their children than 
mothers of normal children. ADHD children, in tum, have been found to 
be less compliant, more negative, more off-task, and less able to sustain 
compliance to maternal directives than normal children (Cunningham & 
Barkley, 1979). 

Differences in parent-child interaction styles have also been reported 
in the literature on children with developmental delays and/or language 
difficulties (Cross, 1981, 1984; Hopman, 1989). Just as parents of children 
with behavior problems are less positive and accepting of their child's 
conduct, parents of language-delayed children tend to be less positive and 
accepting of their children's utterances than parents of normally develop­
ing children (Cross, 1984). Other studies showed that parent of children 
with developmental delay speak at a significantly faster rate (Hopman, 
1989) and with less fluency and intelligibility during parent-child inter­
actions (Cross, 1981) than parents of nondelayed children. 

Interactional variables appear to suggest whether a family will seek 
help. In a recent study, Dumas (1996) concluded that low levels of positive­
ness and compliance, coupled with high levels of aggression, especially in 
the mother-child relationship, may play an important role in determining 
whether a family will seek professional services for disruptive child be­
havior problems. 

3. Intervention Models 

3.1. A Relationship Approach to Parent Training 

A pioneer in relationship-enhancement therapy for parents and chil­
dren, Guerney and colleagues (1964) developed filial therapy for treating 
emotionally disturbed children. The core feature of this approach is train­
ing parents to conduct client-centered play-therapy sessions at home. The 
goals are to foster increased intimacy between parent and child, greater 
independence and self-acceptance on the part of the child, and an in­
creased acceptance of the child by the parent. In addition, parents are 
expected to improve their own self-concepts through the learning and 
application of general parenting and relationship skills. Although not well 
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controlled, several studies have provided preliminary empirical support 
for the efficacy of this intervention (Oxman, 1971; Sensue, 1981; Stover & 
Guerney, 1967; Sywulak, 1977). 

3.2. Early Behavioral Approaches to Parent Training 

Early behavioral approaches to.parent training such as those devel­
oped by Wahler, Winkel, Peterson, and Morrison (1965) and Patterson 
(1974,1982) focused not on the parent-child relationship but on modifying 
specific child behaviors by application of principles of learning. Outcome 
studies have repeatedly demonstrated the success of these approaches 
(Kazdin, 1987). It is important to note that although this application can 
result in positive changes in the interaction between parent and child, the 
progress of therapy is guided by changes in the child's behaviors rather 
than by changes in the interaction. The importance of changing inter­
actional patterns in addition to teaching behavior modification strategies 
in parent training is suggested by research showing that mothers who are 
not successful in behavioral parent training are more aversive than suc­
cessful mothers in their interactions during pretreatment, treatment, and 
at follow-up phases (Dumas, 1984). 

3.3. A Two-Stage Model 

Hanf (1969) developed a two-stage operant conditioning model for 
treating dysfunctional interactional patterns of multiply handicapped 
young children and their mothers within a play context. In the first stage, 
mothers were taught to allow their children to lead a play activity while 
providing positive attention for appropriate child behavior and ignoring 
all inappropriate behavior. The second stage focused on teaching parents 
to lead the play by giving clear commands, praising obedience, and pun­
ishing disobedience using time-out. As opposed to working with parents 
alone, Hanf's format involved coaching parents in vivo with their child. 

Forehand applied Hanf's model to the treatment of noncompliant 
children. Forehand's program has been evaluated extensively and shown 
to produce positive changes in both parent and child behavior (Forehand, 
Cheney, & Yoder, 1974; Forehand, Griest, & Wells, 1979; Forehand & King, 
1977; Humphreys, Forehand, McMahon, & Roberts, 1978; Peed, Roberts, & 
Forehand, 1977; Wells, Forehand, & Griest, 1980). Studies also indicate that 
treatment effects generalize over time and to nontargeted behaviors (Fore­
hand & Atkeson, 1977). More recently, Pisterman et al. (1989, 1992) have 
demonstrated that the program is effective in treating the behavior prob-
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lems of preschoolers with Attention-Deficit/Hyperactivity Disorder (ADHD). 
In treated parents, there was a significant decrease in the percentage of 
directive and negative behavior, and a significant increase in the percent­
age of positive behavior. All of these changes in parent behavior were 
maintained at a 3-month follow-up (Pisterman et al., 1992). 

4. Parent-Child Interaction Therapy: An Integration 

Parent-child interaction therapy (PCIT; Eyberg & Boggs, 1989) was 
developed as an integration of the traditional and behavioral approaches 
to the treatment of behavior problems in young children. The PCIT pro­
gram borrows from Hanf the two-stage model focusing on modifying 
dysfunctional parent-child interactions through direct coaching of treat­
ment skills. The PCIT program, however, may be distinguished from other 
Hanf-model programs in its emphasis on teaching the relationship­
enhancement skills espoused by Axline (1969) with the primary goal of 
improving the quality of the parent-child relationship. Thus, with its dual 
emphasis on strengthening the parent-child bond and establishing firm 
parental control over disruptive child behavior, PCIT helps parents adopt 
the authoritative parenting style described by Baumrind (1967). 

PCIT is conducted within the context of natural play situations be­
tween each parent and child and has two basic stages labeled child­
directed interaction (COl) and parent-directed interaction (POI). The COl 
focuses most directly on strengthening the emotional bond between the 
parent and child. In this stage, parents are taught nondirective interaction 
skills similar to the techniques used by traditional play therapists to pro­
vide a safe and therapeutic dyadic situation that allows the child to experi­
ment with change. Interpersonal factors such as parental warmth, atten­
tion, and praise serve as nontangible incentives that assist the child toward 
developing internal attributions of self-control (Robinson, 1985). Differen­
tial reinforcement of child behavior through praise directed toward the 
child's appropriate play and consistent ignoring of any undesirable activity 
provides a positive form of behavior management throughout this stage. 

POI focuses on helping parents gain firm control over their child's 
disruptive behavior. Methods of incorporating clearly communicated and 
age-appropriate instructions to the child are taught. Using techniques 
based directly on operant principles of behavior change, parents are 
trained to provide consistent positive and negative consequences follow­
ing the child's obedience and disobedience. In addition, the therapist 
assists the parents in learning how the principles and methods taught in 
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PCIT can be applied to new problems as they arise. These functional 
problem-solving skills serve to increase the generalization of clinic-based 
parent training efforts (Boggs, Stokes, & Danforth, 1986). 

PCIT can be administered in an individual or group format. Therapy 
sessions are conducted once a week and are 1 hour in length. The average 
length of treatment is 10-12 sessions, although there is no fixed number of 
sessions. Termination is dependent on parents' mastery of the skills pre­
sented, improvements in the child's behavior, and increased feelings of 
parental competence. The skills of both phases of treatment are taught via 
didactic presentation, modeling, role play, and direct coaching of the 
parent and child during structured play sessions. In addition, parents are 
required to practice the skills at home during daily play sessions (5 min­
utes per day during COl, 10-15 minutes per day during POI) with their 
child. 

PCIT outcome research has demonstrated statistically and clinically 
significant improvements in child conduct-problem behavior (Eisenstadt, 
Eyberg, McNeil, Newcomb, & Funderburk, 1993; Eyberg, Boggs, & Algina, 
1995; Eyberg & Robinson, 1982; Zangwill, 1984). These studies have docu­
mented change in the interactional style of the fathers and mothers in play 
situations with the child, as evidenced by increases in reflective listening, 
physical proximity, and the percentage of praise; and decreases in percent­
age of criticism and sarcasm. Changes in child compliance and disruptive 
behaviors generalize to the home (Boggs, 1990) and to the child's behavior 
at school (McNeil, Eyberg, Eisenstadt, Newcomb, & Funderburk, 1991). In 
addition, parent behaviors generalize to interactions with other children in 
the family and are reflected in improved behavior of siblings (Brestan, 
Eyberg, Boggs, & Algina, 1997; Eyberg & Robinson, 1982). Newcomb (1995) 
demonstrated maintenance of treatment gains at I-year follow-up for both 
children and parents, although by 2 years following treatment, approxi­
mately half of the treated children again met diagnostic criteria for a 
disruptive behavior diagnosis. 

4.1. Other Applications of the Hanf Model 

4.1.1. Videotape Modeling 

Webster-Stratton (1981b) has developed a low-cost videotape model­
ing program for parents with conduct-problem children based on the Hanf 
model. Concepts such as nurturance, sensitivity, authoritative style, indi­
vidual differences in children, and behavioral management skills are pre­
sented to parents in 10 videotape programs. A more complete description 
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of the lO-videotape training programs is available (Webster-Stratton, 1981b, 
1987). Webster-Stratton has demonstrated the short- and long-term effec­
tiveness of videotape modeling combined with either clinic or nonclinic 
parent discussion groups for changing a broad range of parent-child 
interactions (Webster-Stratton, 1981a, 1981b, 1982a, 1982b, 1984). In addi­
tion, the program has been found to be equally effective when adminis­
tered individually or in groups (Webster-Stratton, 1984). More recently, she 
found that an individually self-administered videotape modeling treat­
ment with or without therapist consultation was effective in reducing child 
behavior problems and parent stress levels (Webster-Stratton, 1990). 

4.1.2. Adaptation for Children with Attention-DeftcitlHyperactive Disorder 

Barkley has applied the Hanf model to a treatment program designed 
specifically for parents of 3- to ll-year-old children with ADHD (Barkley, 
1981, 1987, 1990). This program shares with other PCTs an emphasis on 
changing dysfunctional parent-child interactions and using playtime as a 
means of enhancing the parent-child relationship. However, Barkley's 
multimodal program is unique in several ways. First, a psychoeducational 
component is included in order to increase parental knowledge and un­
derstanding of ADHD. A second distinctive feature is its explicit incor­
poration of cognitive therapy strategies, such as identifying and correcting 
faulty perceptions and Socratic questioning. Finally, a token reinforcement 
system is used. Parenting skills are taught primarily through didactic 
training rather than direct coaching of parent-child interactions, although 
treatment skills are practiced in playtime sessions and other homework 
assignments. 

Significant improvements have been found in child behavior follow­
ing parental participation in the treatment program (Pisterman, McGrath, 
Firestone, Goodman, Webster, & Malory, 1989; Pollard, Ward, & Barkley, 
1983). Anastopolous and colleagues (1993) demonstrated significant im­
provements in school-age children's ADHD symptomatology. In addition, 
they found reduced parent stress immediately following treatment and at 
2-month follow-up (Anastopolous, Shelton, DuPaul, & Guevremont, 1993). 

4.1.3. Adaptation for Children with Language Delays 

Cunningham (1989) has developed an intervention program based on 
the Hanf model for language-delayed children who experience significant 
behavior problems. Like other PCTs, the program coaches parents as they 
interact with their child and uses playas a medium to enhance parent-
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child interactions. Parents develop strategies for improving relationships 
via play, for avoiding escalating conflicts, for encouraging children to use 
problem-solving techniques, for encouraging cooperative prosocial behav­
ior, for establishing limits, and for enforcing these limits with effective 
consequences. The latter part of the program is designed to foster general­
ization of the parents' skills. Cunningham's program formally includes 
siblings of the target children. The sibling group, run conjointly with the 
parent sessions, primarily involves play activities designed to foster the 
development of language and social skills. For siblings with normal lan­
guage skills, the program is designed to assist in developing their own 
solutions to situational problems involving the target child. The effective­
ness of parent training derived from the Hanf model has been demon­
strated with specifically language-delayed children and generally delayed 
children (Cunningham, Siegel, van der Spuy, Clark, Elbard, Nielson, & 
Richards, 1983). 

4.2. Summary of Parent-Child Treatments 

The primary goal of PCTs is to improve parent-child interactions and 
enhance the parent-child relationship by helping parents develop an 
authoritative parenting style. The assumption is that teaching parents to 
apply an appropriate balance between nurturance and firm control will 
result in improvements in the overall adaptive functioning of the child and 
family. In PCTs, the therapist usually works directly with parent-child 
dyads, a format that enables the therapist to coach parents to modify their 
behavior as they interact with their children. In this way, the therapist can 
closely monitor the changes in the parent-child relationship through the 
course of treatment. Although PCTs may draw on different theoretical 
explanations to account for change, they recognize the importance of 
increasing the sense of warmth and intimacy in the parent-child relation­
ship before addressing conflict areas. 

Research has demonstrated that PCTs are effective in reducing child 
behavior problems such as noncompliance and aggressiveness and im­
proving parenting skills and parent functioning more generally. PCTs have 
been demonstrated to result in improvements in the child's behavior at 
home (Boggs, 1990; Eyberg, Boggs, & Algina, 1995) and at school (McNeil 
et al 1991), and to result in improved behavior in untreated siblings 
(Brestan et al., 1997). In discussing the outcome of PCTs, it is important to 
note that treatment evaluation is not restricted to posttreatment assess­
ment. PCTs also depend on close and continuous monitoring of parent­
child interactions to guide the course of treatment. 
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5. The Important Role of Measurement in Parent-Child 
Treatments 

137 

To measure most accurately parent-child interactions, it is necessary 
to use instruments that capture their reciprocal nature. Direct observa­
tional measures of parent-child interactions serve this purpose and are 
central to PCTs. Not only do they provide baseline data of behaviors that 
will be the direct targets of treatment, but they also guide the rate and 
progress of treatment. In PCIT, we use the Dyadic Parent-Child Inter­
action Coding System II (DPICS-II; Eyberg, Bessmer, Newcomb, Edwards, 
& Robinson, 1994) to assess the quality of the parent-child interaction in 
three 5-minute standardized situations that vary in the degree to which 
parental control is required. The DPICS-II Clinic Version provides a quick 
and easy, paper-and-pencil method of recording basic parenting skills in 
addition to child compliance and disruptive behavior. This version allows 
us to give parents immediate feedback about the kinds of skills we empha­
size in PCIT. 

Important process variables associated with healthy parent-child in­
teraction patterns that we are only beginning to identify and operational­
ize for clinical assessment include warmth, genuineness, and other affec­
tive variables. Rather than focusing solely on quantitative approaches, 
assessment researchers may want to incorporate qualitative approaches to 
measurement in order to identify process variables relevant to dyads with 
different demographic and developmental characteristics (Eyberg, 1995). 

Attachment variables can contribute an added dimension to assessing 
the interactive process in dysfunctional parent-child relationships. Ad­
vances in clinic observations of parent-child separations/reunions have 
allowed for the reliable assessment of attachment in the preschool years, 
and preliminary studies have supported the validity of these assessments 
to show distinctly different reunion patterns among clinic dyads with 
highly similar symptom topographies (e.g., Greenberg et al., 1991; Speltz 
et al., 1990). The assessment of reunion and separation patterns may be 
particularly germane to outcome assessment, in that the tasks are develop­
mentally pertinent yet not directly taught during treatment. 

One essential quality of parent-child interactions that has emerged in 
factor-analytic studies is warmth (MacDonald, 1992). Observational at­
tempts to measure warmth in the parent-child relationship have met with 
limited success (Eisenstadt et al., 1993). In Maccoby and Martin's (1983) 
empirically derived model, parent-child interactions range from warm 
(parental acceptance, responsiveness, and child centeredness) to hostile 
(parental rejection, nonresponsiveness, and parent centeredness). This 
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classification scheme might provide a useful framework for the assess­
ment of warmth in parent-child relations. 

Developmentally appropriate measures of the relationship quality 
can not only aid in treatment outcome research, but can also guide the type 
and intensity of recommended treatments. Some families in treatment, for 
example, may show poor behavior management skills but warm and 
nurturing parent-child relationships despite frequent conflict, whereas 
other families may show strong behavior management skills but distant 
and/ or hostile affective relationships (Greenberg et aI., 1993). Although 
the child's behavior might meet criteria for ODD in both cases, different 
intervention formats (e.g., stage sequence, stage emphasis) may be indi­
cated. For example, the former parent-child dyad may benefit from earlier 
or more intensive focus on PDI skills, whereas the latter may need more 
focus on CDI skills (Eisenstadt et aI., 1993). 

In addition to measuring parent-child interactions, PCTs use multiple 
measures to assess other child, parent, and family domains relevant to 
child behavior problems. Such measures include clinical and structured 
diagnostic interviews with parents, cognitive screenings of both parent 
and child, self-report measures of child behavior at home and at school, 
parent psychopathology, parenting stress, parent locus of control, marital 
satisfaction, and parenting alliance. 

6. Methodological Issues and Future Directions 

6.1. Client-to-Treatment Matching 

One compelling area of interest is the issue of treatment specificity or 
prescriptive treatments (Beutler & Clarkin, 1990). It is important to investi­
gate whether PCTs are more effective for families at certain developmental 
stages and with certain types of child and parent problems. 

6.1.1. Child Age 

Although we have focused on the treatment of young children in this 
chapter, there is evidence from the family therapy literature that treat­
ments combining behavioral and relationship-enhancement components 
are effective in treating adolescents with conduct-problem behavior. In 
numerous studies, youth antisocial behavior has been predicted either 
directly or indirectly by central aspects of family relations such as low 
parental monitoring and weak parental attachment (for review, see Heng­
geIer, 1991). Multisystemic therapy (MST; Henggeler & Borduin, 1990) 
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intervenes directly in systemic processes known to be related to antisocial 
behavior in adolescents, including both parenting discipline and family 
affective relations, as well as peer associations and school performance. 
Several controlled outcome studies have shown that MST is a promising 
approach to the treatment of adolescents and multiproblem families (Bor­
duin, Henggeler, Blaske, & Stein, 1990; Henggeler et al., 1986; Mann, Bor­
duin, Henggeler, & Blaske, 1990). Thus, it appears that integrated ap­
proaches can be adapted to children at different ages and developmental 
levels. More empirical work that compares alternative and combined ap­
proaches in families with children at different developmental levels is 
needed. 

6.1.2. Child and Parent Dysfunctions 

Within the clinical intervention literature, outcome studies of PCTs 
have focused on externalizing problems in young children and have yet to 
examine rigorously the impact of parent-child relationship enhancement 
on any of the internalizing disorders. Given that improvements in the 
parent-child relationship have been found to result in improvements in 
self-esteem in children diagnosed with externalizing problems (Eisenstadt 
et aI., 1993), the relationship-enhancement component alone might be 
sufficient for young children whose primary diagnosis is related to a mood 
disorder. In regard to parent dysfunctions, a relationship-approach seems 
particularly well-suited for the problem of child abuse, in which repairing 
and strengthening the parent-child bond is essential. PMT has been found 
to be effective with this population (Denicola & Sandler, 1980; Sandler, Van 
Dercar, & Milhoan, 1978; Wolfe & Sandler, 1981; Wolfe, Sandler, & Kauf­
man, 1981), although PCTs have yet to be evaluated. 

6.1.3. Comorbidity of Child and Parent Disorders 

A related issue is that of comorbidity as it affects the outcome of PCTs. 
Indeed, comorbidity has been described as the premiere challenge facing 
mental health professionals in the 1990s (Kendall & Clarkin, 1992). Comor­
bidity, which generally refers to the co-occurrence of two disorders, is 
typical among childhood disorders. For example, the co-occurrence of 
Oppositional Defiant Disorder (ODD) or Conduct Disorder (CD) among 
children with Attention-Deficit/Hyperactivity Disorder (ADHD) has been 
estimated to range between 20% (Barkley, 1990) and 60% (Biederman, 
Munir, & Knee, 1987). 

Comorbidity can also be considered as a dyadic phenomenon, be­
tween child behavior problems and parent problems (e.g., parent psycho-
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pathology, social isolation, marital distress). Some researchers have sug­
gested that these parent or family problems need to be treated adjunctly 
(Webster-Stratton, 1994), whereas others have suggested that PCTs may 
lead to generalized family improvements that might not require additional 
modules (Eyberg & Boggs, in press). These hypotheses are important to 
pursue further, particularly in light of research findings associating parent, 
family, and environmental variables with treatment efficacy (Dumas & 
Wahler, 1983; McMahon, Forehand, Griest, & Wells, 1981; Patterson, 1974, 
1976; Reisinger, Frangia, & Hoffman, 1976; Strain, Young, & Horowitz, 
1981). Webster-Stratton (1994) has taken steps to address these problems by 
adding a treatment component (ADVANCE) on coping with distress to a 
basic videotape PCT program (GDVM). In her study, parents who received 
ADVANCE treatment versus GDVM alone showed additional significant 
improvements in problem solving, communication, and consumer satis­
faction. 

Miller and Prinz (1990) have reviewed the use of adjunctive treat­
ments to improve outcomes of social learning interventions with conduct­
disordered children. They conclude that although much progress has been 
made, the task is far from complete. Specifically, they emphasize the need 
for long-term evaluation of treatment outcome, and for assessment of 
potential side effects in nontargeted areas. In addition, they discuss the 
need for studies to specify the timing of adjunctive components as well as 
the influence of individual difference variables on the success of adjunc­
tive social learning components. 

6.1.4. Attrition 

PCTs, like other family treatments, make numerous demands on the 
parents. Parents are required to attend weekly treatment sessions consis­
tently, master educational material, practice techniques at home, and ac­
tively respond to therapist feedback. Furthermore, PCTs require parents to 
recognize their influence on their child's behavior. PCTs require parents 
not only to have the financial resources (e.g., fees, transportation, child 
care for siblings) to engage in therapy, but also to be motivated and 
cognitively able to change their own behaviors. Premature dropout, unfor­
tunately, is more the rule than the exception in treating childhood conduct­
disorder populations (Firestone & Witt, 1982; McMahon et al., 1981; Patter­
son, 1982; Reid & Patterson, 1976). In a recent study evaluating the effec­
tiveness of PCIT, 38% of 100 families dropped out of treatment prematurely 
(Eyberg, 1996). Clearly, attrition is an important problem that warrants 
further attention. 

Prinz and Miller (1994) systematically studied dropout of family­
based treatment for childhood antisocial behavior. They found that fami-
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lies whose treatment focused exclusively on parent training and child 
behavior dropped out more often than families who had many oppor­
tunities during treatment to discuss life concerns beyond child manage­
ment. This finding was particularly true for families facing greater adver­
sity. Prinz and Miller suggest that addressing broader contextual issues in 
treatment may be necessary to keep some families in treatment and pro­
mote greater consumer satisfaction. Engaging families in treatment, partic­
ularly those experiencing multiple stressors, may require more flexible 
treatment models (Miller & Prinz, 1990), including home-based implemen­
tation, provision of transportation, flexible hours, and greater sensitivity to 
cultural variation (Prinz & Miller, 1991). 

To reduce attrition in research studies, Mash and Terdal (1980) have 
stressed the importance of presenting a clear and concise rationale at the 
outset that makes the expectations for participation clear. Capaldi and 
Patterson (1987) demonstrated empirically the importance of ongoing per­
sonal relationships with participating families, as well as the influential 
role of monetary incentives for improving retention rates with families. 
Such monetary incentives may act by allowing economically disadvan­
taged families to afford the costs of treatment (e.g., transportation, child 
care) (Eyberg, Edwards, Boggs, & Foote, in press). Black and Holden (1995) 
reviewed several strategies that reduced attrition in previous longitudinal 
studies, including tracking the family's whereabouts by recording the 
names and addresses of other family contacts who would always know the 
location of the family. In addition, strategies that maintain rapport, such as 
sending birthday and holiday cards to the families, sending reminder 
notices, and providing baby-sitting, are effective in reducing attrition 
(Black & Holden, 1995). 

6.1.5. Maintenance of Treatment Gains 

To know whether the effects of PCT are generalizable and durable, 
there is a critical need for follow-up studies. The results of studies that 
have assessed maintenance of effects of PMT beyond 1 year have been 
mixed (Bank, Marlowe, Reid, Patterson, & Weinrott, 1991; Baum & Fore­
hand, 1981; Dumas & Wahler, 1983; Forehand & Long, 1988; Long, Fore­
hand, Wierson, & Morgan, 1994; Patterson & Fleischman, 1979; Wahler, 
1980). Forehand and colleagues have conducted the longest-term studies 
following treatment of young noncompliant children, and these studies 
suggest normal conduct in the youngsters several years later. Most studies, 
however, suggest that a substantial proportion of families fail to demon­
strate continued benefit. 

Webster-Stratton (1985, 1990) has examined long-term maintenance in 
PCTs. She obtained 3-year follow-up data on approximately 82% of fami-



142 REBECCA FOOTE ET AL. 

lies who participated in videotape-based parent training (Webster-Stratton, 
1990). At a 3-year follow-up assessment, only about half of the children 
maintained treatment gains at home. Similarly, only half of those whose 
school behavior was initially problematic were able to maintain treatment 
gains. Those children who did maintain treatment gains tended to come 
from intact, higher SES families without psychopathology. 

Newcomb (1995) examined long-term outcomes in a small sample of 
13 preschoolers and their mothers following PCIT. She found that the 
families in the study moved from outside of normal limits at pretreatment 
to within normal limits at posttreatment and I-year follow-up on measures 
of compliance, conduct problems, activity level, and parenting stress. In 
addition, 12 of the children no longer met diagnostic criteria for a disrup­
tive behavior disorder immediately posttreatment. However, after 2 years, 
only 50% of the children still demonstrated clinically significant improve­
ments in behavior. Data from individual families showed that in this 
sample, more parents than children obtained and maintained clinically 
significant levels of improvement in behavior (i.e., parenting skills) over 
the course of follow-up. These findings raise questions about why some 
children fail to maintain treatment gains. For example, is the maintenance 
of certain parenting skills (e.g., praise, direct commands) more important 
than others in maintaining gains in child behavior? Are certain children 
more vulnerable to peer or other influences? What role do child and/or 
parent comorbid conditions play in long-term maintenance of treatment 
gains? Controlled studies that investigate these and other specific hypoth­
eses are needed to determine why PCTs fail to produce durable results in 
some families. 

In summary, the immediate and short-term outcome for families of 
young children with conduct-problem behavior who participate in PCT is 
successful. However, the continued impact of such training on the devel­
opment of conduct problems in childhood and adolescence is less clear. 
Long-term follow-up studies suggest PCTs may achieve long-term posi­
tive outcomes in only about half those who complete treatment. Addi­
tional studies on long-term maintenance, comparing families who receive 
treatment to those who do not, are necessary before we can be confident in 
the durability of current treatments and our understanding of variables 
associated with long-term outcomes. 

7. Conclusion 

We have attempted to identify the theoretical, clinical, and empirical 
merits of a parent-child interaction approach to the treatment of child 
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dysfunctions. In reviewing PCTs, we have discussed their common em­
phasis on treating the parent-child dyad by improving interaction pat­
terns and enhancing the overall relationship. We are excited by the broad 
implications of an approach to child treatment that teaches parents to 
adopt an appropriate balance between nurturance and effective discipline. 
We readily acknowledge that we have asked more empirical questions 
than we have answered, and hope that our discussion will stimulate 
needed research on PCTs. 
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5 Children's Perception 
of Physical Symptoms 

The Example of Asthma 

SIMON RIETVELD AND PIER J. M. PRINS 

1. Introduction to Symptom Perception 

Distinction between physiological changes and the conscious awareness of 
associated sensations and symptoms is a common phenomenon in health 
and disease. Throughout the chapter, the term sensation will be used to 
denote what subjects feel, whereas the term symptom will be used in 
association with a pathological condition. 

Generally, human beings are incapable of accurately perceiving vege­
tative functions as well as pathophysiological reactions, such as heartbeat, 
blood-glucose level, and cancer or asthmatic airway obstruction (Gannon, 
1984; Skelton & Croyle, 1991). These phenomena are the topic of symptom 
perception research, a relatively new field of medical psychology. Specific 
knowledge on children's symptom perception is just beginning to be 
established (Pennebaker, 1982). This chapter introduces symptom percep­
tion as a concept to explain and understand the often remarkable discor­
dance between objective and subjective symptoms of disease. Contempo­
rary models describing symptom perception and factors that influence 
these symptom perceptual processes are evaluated in light of recent em­
pirical advantages. 

The accuracy of symptom perception is defined in terms of the rela­
tionship between objective (physiological) and subjective variables. How­
ever, accurate symptom perception is a relative term, because for human 
beings a continuous flow of specific afferent stimulation would be imp os-
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sible to cope with. In the course of development, children learn to interpret 
specific peripheral stimuli as high-order sensations, such as hunger, fa­
tigue, or breathlessness. Nevertheless, with respect to disease, it is surpris­
ing that physiological deviations with harmful consequences remain 
largely unrecognized or cannot be perceived with more specificity. 

Accurate symptom perception in disease encompasses (1) early aware­
ness of pathophysiology, and (2) a close relationship between pathophysi­
ology and magnitude of subjective complaints. The exception of a linear 
relationship between objective and subjective symptoms is based on psy­
chophysics, where subjective sensation is a logarithmic function of physio­
logical change. Two basic assumptions in this model are that the physiO­
logical changes are variable and that all other factors are held constant. In 
reality, subjective sensations are not coded in the same way as the under­
lying physiological changes are measured, whereas other factors are very 
rarely constant (Pennebaker, 1982). The difference between objective and 
subjective symptoms is highlighted by an abundance of clinical cases of 
patients who do not recognize a serious condition in time for proper 
medical treatment, which shows that the adequate perception of serious 
symptoms is often illusionary. 

The perceptual systems are an inheritance of the early human envi­
ronment. Unfortunately, this "kindergarten" of human development did 
not provide the broad range of medical remedies for rapidly and properly 
perceived symptoms. Hence, accurate symptom perception was not se­
lected during human phylogenetic development. 

In this chapter, symptom perception is viewed as a process that is 
subject to a variety of influences, both within and outside the individual. 
The output of the symptom perceptual process can be formalized by 
borrowing response options from signal detection theory (Green & Swets, 
1966): (1) correct awareness of a symptom; (2) correct awareness of a 
normal sensation; (3) false awareness of a symptom (during a normal 
condition); and (4) false awareness of a normal sensation (during a patho­
logical condition). Although a false-negative response (option 3) may be as 
inaccurate as a false-positive one (option 4), the latter would imply neglect 
of actual pathology and thereby pose a threat to health and survival. On 
the other hand, erroneously "perceiving" the symptoms of a pathological 
condition can lead to unnecessary consumption of possibly dangerous 
medication, as well as negative affect and unwarranted illness behavior. 

The concept of symptom perception is often overlooked when dis­
cussing issues in medical psychology. For instance, the four response 
options may also be applied to understand aspects of unexplained pain, 
lack of compliance with a medical regimen, placebo responses, somato­
form disorders, and fatal pathophysiology that is not recognized in time 
for treatment. 



CHILDREN'S PERCEPTION OF PHYSICAL SYMPTOMS 155 

A striking feature of symptom perception is the impressive variability 
in perceptual accuracy, both between and within subjects (Gannon & 
Haynes, 1986; Pennebaker, 1982). For instance, several investigators in 
respiratory diseases have claimed that differences in the accuracy of symp­
tom perception cannot be understood within medical parameters (Jones, 
1992; Pratter & Barter, 1991). Because biofeedback research shows that 
neural pathways are often available and that subjects can learn to master 
the use of at least some of them, psychological or situational factors may 
explain differences in symptom perception. 

The study of symptom perception is interesting from both a theoreti­
cal and clinical point of view; it can be studied, for example, in diabetes 
mellitus, childhood cancer, or asthma. There are three arguments why 
asthma provides an excellent opportunity to study children's symptom per­
ception in chronic disease. First, asthma may turn into a life-threatening 
condition, provoking cognitions and emotions that are believed to play an 
important role in symptom perception. Second, asthma is characterized by 
remarkable fluctuations in symptom severity, ranging from the absence of 
symptoms to high severity, allowing investigation of a complete asthma 
attack. Third, objective, pathophysiological variables as well as subjective 
symptoms of asthma can quickly, validly, and reliably be measured. 

In the next section, childhood asthma is introduced, and specific 
features of asthma as well as general features of chronic diseases are 
addressed. Then, seven biomedical and psychological factors that explain 
aspects of symptom perception are evaluated. Finally, developmental and 
gender issues are examined. The chapter attempts to integrate this corpus 
of knowledge and to formulate a new perspective on children's perception 
of physical symptoms in chronic disease. 

2. Childhood Asthma 

Obstructive pulmonary diseases range from episodic exacerbations of 
airway obstruction (asthma) to more chronic obstructive diseases, as are 
usually diagnosed in adults, such as chronic obstructive pulmonary dis­
ease and emphysema. Asthma is the most common chronic disorder in 
childhood, affecting up to 10% of school-aged children in the Western 
world (Creer & Gustafson, 1989). Asthma is characterized by airway 
hypersensitivity to a number of stimuli (e.g., animal products, smoke, and 
physical exercise). There are acute reactions of airway smooth muscle 
constriction, as well as long-term or chronic inflammation and edema of 
lung tissue (Sterk & Bell, 1989). Clinical manifestations are episodic attacks 
of airway obstruction association with difficult breathing, asthmatic 
wheezing sounds, coughing, breathlessness (dyspnea), and eventually 
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hypoxia and cardiorespiratory arrest (Rietveld & Dooijes, 1996). Consider­
ing that a life-threatening attack of airway obstruction can develop within 
1 hour, accurate symptom perception is essential for the early medication 
of symptoms (Carswell, 1985). Other benefits of accurate symptom percep­
tion would be that children learn to leave asthma-provoking situations in 
time, favoring perceived control over symptoms and elevated self-efficacy, 
which in turn are likely to decrease illness-related distress (Bandura, 1990; 
Pennebaker, Burnam, Schaeffer, & Harper, 1977; Yellow lees & Kalucy, 1990). 
Alternatively, poor symptom perception poses a major threat to children's 
well-being. A young boy who loves swimming but is forced to stop with 
his sport after repeated accidents in the swimming pool may eventually 
develop depression. The adolescent girl who experiences unexpected at­
tacks of faintness in the discotheque may be desperate with embarrassment 
and may suffer from a loss of self-esteem. Statistics confirm the high 
incidence of emotional problems in asthmatic children and of psychopa­
thology in asthmatic adults (Boyce et aI., 1995; Yellow lees & Ruffin, 1989). 

2.1. Symptom Perception in Asthma 

In symptom perception research in asthma at least two variables need 
to be measured and compared: lung function and breathlessness. A practi­
cal definition of the accuracy of symptom perception would be a high 
correlation between subjective degrees of breathlessness and objective 
lung function parameters, which, in turn, reflect airway obstruction. The 
assessment of lung function is usually conducted with a spirometer by a 
lung function technician. The subject is breathing through a mouthpiece, 
quietly as well as with maximum effort, while wearing a nose clip. Com­
mon lung function parameters are the vital capacity, peak expiratory flow, 
and the forced expiratory volume in one second, the latter being the golden 
standard of lung physicians. In order to measure fluctuations in peak 
expiratory flow, peak flow meters are increasingly used by family doctors 
and asthmatic patients in the home situation. After initial testing, asth­
matics become familiar with their regular values and may use deviations 
as a basis for medication. Generally, the assessment of lung function in 
children under 7 years of age may be very difficult, restricting symptom 
perception research to the older age groups. 

Breathlessness is the sensation associated with difficult, labored 
breathing, and common descriptions include shortness of breath, tightness 
of the chest, and wheeziness. Breathlessness is usually measured with self­
report scales, such as a Likert-type or a visual analogue scale. The etiology 
of the breathlessness response is still a subject of dispute. This illustrates 
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that the origin of the subjective symptoms associated with a disease is 
often diffuse, puzzling clinicians and experimenters alike. 

Over the years, the occurrence of breathlessness has been related to 
arterial gas mixtures, particularly to increased levels of carbon dioxide. 
In a series of classic psychophysic experiments, Campbell and colleagues 
refuted the importance of gas mixtures in the etiology of the breathlessness 
response and tested the alternative hypothesis that breathlessness is 
caused by afferent information from the respiratory muscles (Campbell, 
Godfrey, Clark, Freedman, & Norman, 1969; Campbell, Robson, & Nor­
man, 1967). They tested this by blocking the afferent pathways with curare. 
Indeed, the paralysis significantly lengthened the time that the subjects 
could hold their breath without breathlessness. Their model predicts that 
the intensity of breathlessness not only arises as the tension in the inspira­
tory muscles increases, but also as their length becomes smaller and the 
inspiratory airflow increases, hence the term length-tension inappropriate­
ness. This model properly explains that breathlessness during prolonged 
exercise results from an increase in both motor command and respiratory 
effort due to inspiratory muscle fatigue. 

Nevertheless, some investigators have maintained that afferent infor­
mation from respiratory muscles is not a necessary condition to evoke 
breathlessness and instead presented findings that supported the assumed 
influence of gas mixtures (Banzett, Lansing, Reid, Adams, & Brown, 1989). 
For example, with a sample of quadriplegic adults paralyzed below the 
neck and fully dependent upon mechanical ventilation of gases, Banzett et 
al. (1990) showed that increased carbon dioxide in the administered gas 
mixture indeed caused substantial "air hunger." Unfortunately, research 
has yielded mixed results, supporting and refuting predictions by the two 
models. For instance, contrary to expectations, normal adults reported no 
breathlessness either during respectively high levels of arterial carbon 
dioxide, or during voluntarily breathing as during an asthma attack 
(Adams, Lane, Shea, Cockcroft, & Guz, 1985). 

Results of a recent study by Rietveld (1997) also provided no support 
for the assumption that breathlessness follows difficult, labored breathing. 
Normal adolescents reported mild levels of breathlessness during respec­
tively one 30-minute, or two 30-minute trials of labored breathing through 
a face mask, which interrupted airflow to a degree analogous to a severe 
asthma attack. Some of these subjects were quite at ease while reading a 
magazine during breathing against an interruption of 64% reduction in 
lung function. Continuous monitoring of respiration sounds in another 
study by Rietveld (1996a) showed that children often did not wake up 
during severe asthma attacks at night. It is evident from these findings that 
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the afferent sensory information associated with respiratory changes often 
lacks clarity and specificity. 

Whereas the above studies demonstrate that breathlessness is not a 
sensitive marker of airway obstruction or inadequate ventilation of gases, 
breathlessness is also not specific for these conditions. In fact, breathless­
ness is common in normal controls (e.g., after physical exercise, as well as 
during anxiety attacks in patients with agoraphobia or panic disorder; 
Carr, Lehrer, & Hochron, 1992). As a consequence, the current view on the 
etiology of breathlessness centers around the notion of a multisystem 
control of respiratory adequacy, in accordance with metabolic demands, 
most of which takes place beyond awareness. 

Because it is difficult to induce a complete asthma-like attack of air­
way obstruction, an analogous method of externally applied resistive loads 
on breathing has been used to investigate symptom perception in obstruc­
tive respiratory disease. In line with signal detection theory, responses to a 
series of sensory stimuli are assessed, usually airflow interruptions of 
varying intensity (Green & Swets, 1966). The distinction between the per­
ception of actual symptoms and the analogous signal-detection method 
addresses the difference between the conscious perception of a patholog­
ical stimulus and the associated aversive sensations of breathlessness. This 
distinction has been neglected in (medical) studies using the term breath­
lessness perception, but should be advocated (Barness, 1992, 1994; Burdon, 
Juniper, Killian, Hargreave, & Campbell, 1982; Burdon, Pain, Rubinfeld, & 
Nana, 1994; Teramoto, 1995). 

Theoretically, each stimulus relevant to human survival is believed to 
be emotionally connotated and to trigger extensive cognitive and emo­
tional elaboration. This elaboration can be directed to particular aspects of 
a stimulus. Instead of focusing on the actual stimulus features, subjects 
may unconsciously mobilize interpretative cognitive strategies to attend to 
either the objective, sensory component of the stimulus, or to the subjec­
tive, cognitive, and evaluative components (Pennebaker, 1982). Conse­
quently, airflow detection or perception of asthma symptoms may be a 
perceptual event without negative emotions being involved. On the other 
hand, patients with obstructive diseases may report aversive sensations 
without actually knowing that something is wrong with their airways 
(Dirks & Schraa, 1983; Rietveld, 1996a). A child may feel miserable and 
complain of the flu, when in fact a severe degree of airway obstruction 
could explain the condition. A 10-year-old boy in a study by Rietveld 
(1996a) reported chronic fatigue, which his mother attributed to family 
problems (divorce); however, lung function testing revealed a reduction of 
up to 70% of the capacity predicted for a healthy boy. 

Although the perception of airway obstruction and the sensation of 
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breathlessness are usually mutually influential, they should be regarded as 
distinct response systems. In this respect, the classic psychological defini­
tion of breathlessness is still valid (although subjects may feel breathless 
without recognizing its origin): "Breathlessness encompasses (a) the real 
or fantasized perception of airway obstruction, as well as, (b) the reaction 
to this perception" (Heim, Blaser, & Waidelich, 1972). The difference be­
tween perception and breathlessness is evident from the modest correla­
tion (r = .31) between the accuracy of detection of airflow obstruction and 
the accuracy of perception of actual airway obstruction (Mas, Dahme, & 
Richter, 1992). In clinical reality, asthmatics may consider themselves 
symptom-free in the midst of an asthma attack, whereas they may also 
report severe breathlessness without airway obstruction (Boulet, Des­
chesnes, Turcotte, & Gignac, 1991). 

Clinicians may commonly observe patients with very poor lung func­
tion who produce obvious asthmatic wheezing sounds, but who maintain 
that they feel quite well. By testing the physical condition of school-aged 
children, school physicians or epidemiologists often diagnose asthma in 
children who are unaware of having the disease. In the often-cited study 
by Rubinfeld and Pain (1977), approximately 15% of adult asthmatics were 
incapable of perceiving a reduction as large as 50% in lung function. Other 
experimental data confirmed that some asthmatics are completely incom­
petent perceivers of airway obstruction, and that probably all asthmatics 
may occasionally fail to perceive the symptoms of asthma properly 
(McFadden, Kiser, & de Groot, 1973; Perrin, MacLean, & Perrin, 1989; 
Silverman et aI., 1987; Wolkove et aI., 1992; Yamamoto, Inaba, Nishimura, 
Kishi, & Kawakami, 1978). Detection experiments-with all variables be­
ing held constant except for resistive load intensity-also showed that a 
majority of subjects poorly perceive differences in airflow obstruction 
(Burki, Mitchel, Chaudhary, Zechman, & Campbell, 1978). 

Children seem also be to inaccurate in the perception of airway ob­
struction, although experimental results are just beginning to provide 
insight into their perceptual capacity (Ergood, Epstein, Ackerman, & fire­
man, 1985; Sly, Landau, & Weymouth, 1985). For example, in a study by 
Rietveld, Prins, and Kolk (1996d) only 7 of 36 children with asthma had a 
"just noticeable difference" (analogous to a reduction in lung function of 
64%), compared with 16 of 36 normal contrQls. Note that in signal detection 
theory, a just noticeable difference (jnd) is defined as the stimulus intensity 
that is properly detected in >50% of stimulus presentations. Ten of the 
normal controls in this study had also a jnd at the stimulus intensity 
analogous to 39%. Whereas some children responded remarkably accu­
rately within seconds to airflow interruptions, other youngsters did not 
respond at all, or responded falsely. 
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To summarize, the accuracy of symptom perception in asthma is 
assessed by measuring and comparing lung function and breathlessnes, or 
by means of the analogous method of detecting external airflow interrup­
tions. Clinical and experimental studies showed that adults and children 
are predominantly inaccurate perceivers of airway obstruction, although 
some asthmatics can quite properly perceive an upcoming attack of 
asthma and may accurately estimate the state of their airways. 

Thus, inaccurate symptom perception is not a general characteristic of 
asthma. Breathlessness is a highly subjective sensation. Moreover, its ori­
gin is subject to debate, and its magnitude is not well understood. 

3. Factors Influencing Symptom Perception 

There are at least seven factors that influence symptom perception in 
asthma, and most of these factors would be applicable to symptom percep­
tion in other chronic diseases as well. The factors refer to biomedical and 
psychological influences. 

3.1. Biomedical Factors 

Biomedical factors consist of biological circadian influences, differ­
ences in pathophysiology, and organic or neurological pathology. 

3.1.1. Biological Circadian Influences 

The correlations between breathlessness and lung function are gener­
ally significantly smaller in the afternoon than in the early morning. This 
suggests a biological! circadian influence on the accuracy of symptom 
perception (Bagg & Hughes, 1980; Peiffer, Marsac, & Lockhart, 1989). 
Obviously, circadian influences are often difficult to assess and may be 
intertwined with other influences, such as the competition of stimulus 
cues as described below. 

3.1.2. Differences in Pathophysiology 

In asthma and other obstructive respiratory diseases, three general 
and overlapping physiological explanations for variance in accuracy of 
symptom perception are present. The mediators between pathophysiol­
ogy and perceptual accuracy include the different clusters of receptors and 
afferent pathways involved. 

Acute versus gradual or chronic airway obstruction. There is modest 
support that acute obstructive reactions are more accurately perceived and 
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evaluated than a gradual deterioration of airway quality (Rietveld, 1997; 
Turcotte, Corbeil, & Boulet, 1990). In other words, the perception of acute 
smooth muscle contraction is perceived more accurately than chronic 
obstruction due to airway inflammation and edema. The contraction of 
smooth muscles, for instance, to protect against inhalation of noxious 
gases, would be an adaptive response, likely to reach awareness. An 
explanation for the phenomenon of absence of breathlessness during air­
way obstruction would be that asthmatics habituate to the modest signals 
associated with a prolonged or chronic obstruction (Bonnel, Mathiot, 
Jungas, & Grimaud, 1987). Breathlessness is associated with physical exer­
cise and fatigue, and, eventually, asthmatics with prolonged or chronic 
obstruction may learn to protect themselves against breathlessness by 
restricting high-energy activities. 

Acute obstructive reactions, however, could overwhelm asthmatics in 
the midst of an activity and would be reflected in relatively high breath­
lessness. Consequently, acute versus chronic obstructive reactions would 
be associated with robust differences in accuracy of symptom perception, 
although this has not been studied systematically. Rietveld (1997) found no 
support for habituation in a sample of normal adolescents in a signal 
detection experiment. While subjects were breathing through a face mask 
and a tube device that interrupted airflow, breathlessness did not diminish 
after an hour of labored breathing. Other studies have revealed that re­
peated exposure to external airflow obstruction leads to diminished 
breathlessness reporting upon subsequent occasions (Wilson & Jones, 
1990). A similar effect with actual airway obstruction in asthma patients 
should be doubted, however, as we will argue in a later section (see 3.2). 

Different agents provoking obstructive reaction. Asthma can be provoked 
by a variety of stimuli, and various patterns of subjective responses are 
likely (Rietveld, 1996a). High levels of breathlessness in asthmatic children 
during histamine provocation (which is an aversive test to assess hyper­
responsiveness of airways) as compared to physical exercise has been 
attributed to excessive saliva and mucus secretion, and test-related dis­
tress (Rietveld, 1996a). However, Turcotte et a1. (1990) found no significant 
difference in breathlessness reporting by adult asthmatics during three 
different forms of induction of airway obstruction. Although children may 
respond differently to a particular medical setting than adults, a problem is 
that secondary symptoms or levels of negative affect are generally not 
assessed in symptom perception research. 

Central versus peripheral airway obstruction. Sensory information from 
obstruction in the central airways may be different from sensory informa­
tion from central as well as peripheral obstruction, although this difference 
may not be evident from lung function parameters (McFadden, 1975). For 
instance, asthmatics could experience breathlessness associated with pe-
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ripheral airway obstruction, which could be underestimated by a peak 
flow meter. Naturally, this would affect the correlation between breathless­
ness and lung function. 

To summarize, differences in pathophysiology may often influence 
the relationship between objective and subjective variables, affecting the 
accuracy of symptom perception. The three factors described would often 
be overlapping and may be difficult to test and control in symptom percep­
tion research. 

3.1.3. Organic or Neurological Pathology 

An influential assumption in symptom perception research has been 
that the accuracy of symptom perception can be affected by a deterioration 
of receptor sensitivity and neurological pathways, resulting from chronic 
pulmonary pathology (Cherniack, 1987). Detection experiments provided 
some support for this assumption, because normal controls generally 
performed somewhat better than asthmatics, whereas the latter performed 
better than patients with chronic obstructive pulmonary disease (Burki et 
al., 1978; Cote, Leblanc, & Boulet, 1987; Gottfried, Altose, Kelsen, & Cher­
niack, 1981). This suggests that some variance in accuracy of symptom 
perception can be explained by variables denoting airway quality. How­
ever, Montserrat et al. (1988) found no effect of severe asthma and near­
fatal asthma attacks on the ability to detect external resistive loads on 
breathing. Other empirical studies showed that the accuracy of symptom 
perception generally does not relate to objective variables of asthma, such 
as duration of the disease, symptom severity, prescribed medication, air­
way hyperresponsiveness, or current lung function (Burdon et al., 1982; 
Janson-Bjerklie, Ruma, Stulbarg, & Kohlman-Carrieri, 1987; Rietveld, 
1996a; Rubinfeld & Pain, 1977). This suggests that pathophysiology may 
affect the accuracy of symptom perception in asthma only occasionally. 

An evaluation of the three biomedical factors indicates support for the 
general notion that these factors are of some importance, but convincing 
empirical data on group effects have not been presented in the literature. 
To the contrary, results have shown that subjective symptoms are gener­
ally independent of objective, medical variables. In addition, these bio­
medical influences would usually remain beyond testable parameters for a 
psychologist. 

3.2. Psychological Factors 

The psychological factors consist of competition of sensory informa­
tion, selective perception, cognitive compensation, and emotional influences. 
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3.2.1. Competition of Sensory Information 

A basic model in symptom perception research relates to the competi­
tion between internal and external stimuli (Blitz & Dinnerstein, 1977; 
Pennebaker & Lightner, 1980). The main idea is that the human capacity to 
process sensory information is limited and that the probability of noticing 
internal cues can be expressed as a function of the ratio of available 
internal and external information. For instance, with an abundance of 
external stimulation, hardly any capacity for processing internal cues is 
left. Cioffi (1991) illustrated this by pointing toward a sudden worsening of 
an ache or pain in the dead of night, as the house grows still, and the 
previously ignored internal state comes to attention. This is also illustrated 
by the fact that children's complaints of breathlessness are more severe at 
night than during daytime, irrespective of degree of airway obstruction 
(Weiss, 1966). In an experiment with adult subjects who performed an 
exercise task of treadmill running, it was found that those who listened to 
magnified street noise reported significantly less bodily symptoms than 
those who were not distracted by sounds (Pennebaker & Lightner, 1980). 
The subjects in a third condition listened to magnified breath sounds and 
reported the most symptoms, which was interpreted in line with the 
concept. However, the manipulation in this condition could best be inter­
preted in terms of selective attention (see next paragraph). 

In a second experiment, subjects ran significantly faster across coun­
try than on a monotonous training track, although the physiological pa­
rameters in the two settings were similar. The result supported the hypoth­
esis that running pace depends on the perception of fatigue, and that 
subjects processed more internal cues on the training track-facilitating 
perception of fatigue-than running across country (Pennebaker, 1982). 
Pennebaker extrapolated these experimental results to lifestyle and medi­
cal consumption. People with demanding jobs and a rich social life would 
be less likely to report symptoms than those unemployed and lonely, 
presumably because their highly taxed processing capacities only allow 
for "real emergencies." 

The concept of a "competition of cues" seems attractive for the expla­
nation of variance in the accuracy of symptom perception, particularly the 
within-subject variability. However, several studies provided mixed em­
pirical support for the concept. Fillingim and Fine (1986) studied joggers in 
an exercise setting and observed that distraction only influenced task­
related symptoms. In another experiment, adult subjects rated their heart­
beat while watching a variety of slides. The degree of interest for the slides 
correlated significantly with heartbeat estimates (r = - .51), showing that 
very interesting slides coincided with a poor estimation of heartbeat. 
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However, the accuracy was similar for pleasant or aversive, interesting or 
boring, slides (Pennebaker, 1982). 

A limitation of the concept of "a competition of cues" was elucidated 
in one of our signal detection experiments with samples of asthmatic and 
nonasthmatic children who were to detect externally applied airflow inter­
ruptions. Children generally responded less frequently to perceived air­
flow interruptions when they were distracted by the external stimulation 
of film clips (Rietveld, Kolk, Prins, & Van Beest, 1996a). Because there were 
much fewer false-positive responses during distraction, the overall accu­
racy of detection remained similar in nonasthmatic children and improved 
significantly in asthmatics. This may indicate that the quality (correct 
responses) and quantity of responses (correct + false responses) should be 
differentiated in the "competition of cues" model (Fillingim, Roth, & 
Haley, 1988; Williams & Lees-Haley, 1993). 

3.2.2. Selective Perception 

Symptom perception comprises the integration of afferent stimuli 
with knowledge structures from memory. Instead of passive information 
processors, human beings can be activated to attend selectively to particu­
lar sensations that influence the outcome of their symptom perception. In 
other words, whereas afferent sensory information may eventually reach 
conscious awareness (bottom-up information processing), selective atten­
tion may facilitate conscious awareness of symptoms (top-down informa­
tion processing). 

When healthy individuals are requested to report illness-related 
symptoms, they may selectively attend to their sensations and report one 
or two symptoms. Medical students are often inclined to "interpret" their 
own harmless general sensations in terms of the serious diseases they have 
studied (Fitzpatrick, O'Donnell, Getson, & Sahler,1993). Selective attention 
for particular symptoms in line with knowledge-based expectations has 
also been experimentally demonstrated. Normal subjects who were pre­
sented with an ambiguous physical stimulus reported pleasant or unpleas­
ant sensations, depending on the information they had received prior to 
testing (Anderson & Pennebaker, 1980; Burnam & Pennebaker, 1977). 

As will be argued herein, patients with a chronic disease are more 
likely to perceive symptoms following top-down perceptual strategies. 
The lay assumption would be that the symptom perception of a particular 
disease becomes more accurate with an increasing knowledge of, and 
experience with, its symptoms. Consequently, experienced patients with 
chronic diseases and a long history of symptoms would be more accurate 
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than novices (Bishop, 1987; Pennebaker, 1982). However, in reality, symp­
tom perception in chronic disease often becomes less accurate over time. 
Pennebaker (1982) emphasized that selective perception comprises the fol­
lowing mechanisms: (1) selective monitoring of particular sensory sources; 
(2) priority for processing of illness-related information; and (3) illness­
congruent interpretation of ambiguous sensory information. 

As has been emphasized by Pennebaker (1982), selective perception of 
illness-related information will usually enhance the magnitude of self­
reported symptoms. During experiments in a physical exercise setting, 
children with asthma reported consistently more breathlessness than nor­
mal controls, which could not be explained by differences in physical 
condition or lung function. This result could, however, be explained by 
selective perception of a wide array of potentially relevant information, 
facilitating the integration of relatively irrelevant, exercise-related sensa­
tions in the symptom perceptual process, which increases breathlessness. 
Whereas some children may either unconsciously or consciously attend to 
possible illness-related information, others would either neglect such in­
formation or apply strategies to keep this sensory information beyond 
conscious awareness. Yellowlees and Ruffin (1989) confirmed the existence 
of such distinct symptom perceptual strategies in adult asthmatics, who 
were either anxious perceivers of real or fantasized symptoms, or ne­
glected their symptoms completely. These strategies had a decisive influ­
ence on asthma management and medical consumption. 

The process of selective symptom perception would be triggered by 
asthma-related external cues and by emotions associated with asthma. 
Another factor may be worrying, which is viewed as a special state of the 
cognitive system, and which prepares the individual to anticipate a future 
danger. Worry involves rehearsing possible aversive events and outcomes, 
coincident with a search for ways of avoiding them (Matthews, 1990). 
Different levels of worry seem to differentiate children with mild versus 
high levels of anxiety, and likewise, illness-related worry could differenti­
ate high versus low levels of perceptual accuracy via the mediating impact 
of schema-driven symptom perception (Silverman, LaGreca, & Wasser­
stein, 1995). Rietveld and Brosschot (1996) suggested that the highest im­
pact of selective perception could be expected in a situation in which 
asthmatics were uncertain about the condition of their airways, partic­
ularly with availability of ambiguous sensory information. 

To summarize, the tendency to selectively attend to aspects of physi­
cal symptoms gradually increases in chronic diseases as a result of the 
influence of illness schemas that contain illness-related information and 
associated emotional experiences. This process of selective perception and 
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illness-schema-guided information processing may become a self-enhancing 
system toward distorted symptom perception, fitting psychopathological 
disorders. 

3.2.3. Cognitive Compensation 

Perception and cognition are complementary processes. Cognition 
may dominate the symptom perceptual process. The term cognitive com­
pensation refers to the relative dominance of top-down over bottom-up 
information processing. A maximum effect of cognition can be expected 
when sensory information is highly emotionally connotated and ambig­
uous, particularly in subjects with a tendency to dwell extensively on the 
consequences of the disease (Rietveld & Brosschot, 1996). 

A first information-processing strategy would be that subjects attend 
to secondary symptoms or to external, situational information and inte­
grate this information in the process of symptom perception, either fully 
aware or not (Rietveld, 1996a). This implies that sensory information that is 
merely associated with, and not causally linked to the disease may influ­
ence symptom perception. Children who were familiar with using peak­
flow meters in the self-management of asthma appeared easily influenced 
by false peakflow information when reporting breathlessness (Rietveld, 
Kolk, & Prins, 1996c; Higgs, Richardson, Lea, Lewis, & Laszlo, 1986). After 
a running task, these children unknowingly were presented peakflow 
meters with a scale value of either 30% below or 30% above the actual 
value. The "optimistic" lung function indicated by the second meter had 
no impact on self-reported breathlessness. However, asthmatic children 
who saw that their lung function after exercise went down by at least 30% 
reported high breathlessness. This difference suggested that false peak­
flow information was potent only when it confirmed children's expecta­
tions with respect to their airways. A reduction in peakflow after exercise 
would be understandable, whereas an increased value would not. Chil­
dren without asthma were not at all influenced by false peakflow informa­
tion (Rietveld, Kolk, & Prins, 1996c). In another study, asthmatic children 
who listened to false feedback of wheeze after physical exercise reported 
significantly more breathlessness than children who did not listen to re­
corded sounds (Rietveld, Kolk, Colland, & Prins, 1996b). Asthmatic respi­
ration sounds or wheezes are associated with airway obstruction. In this 
study, all children were invited to listen through a headphone to their 
actual respiration sounds and after physical exercise were again invited to 
listen, but this time recorded sounds were presented, varying from asth­
matic wheezes to quiet respiration sounds. Immediately following this, the 
children were requested to report breathlessness. False feedback of respi-
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ration sounds did not enhance breathlessness in nonasthmatics, and false 
feedback of quiet respiration sounds had no effect in either group. It was 
assumed that children who listened to false feedback of respiration sounds 
would likely interpret the false wheezes as a confirmation of their expecta­
tion of exercise-induced airway obstruction. It may be worthwhile to 
speculate how such external information affects the child's symptom re­
porting. First, a child with asthma knows that a running task may induce 
symptoms of airway obstruction. Second, sensory information associated 
with airway obstruction generally lacks specificity. Third, the child is to 
evaluate his/her condition after running. In this ambiguous situation, 
with diffuse, general, exercise-related sensations available, and the need to 
introspect, the child is likely to interpret sensations in line with expecta­
tions, irrespective of objective symptoms of asthma. 

A second information-processing strategy would be a false interpreta­
tion of sensory information, with two reciprocal mechanisms affecting the 
accuracy of symptom perception: false interpretation of general bodily 
sensations as the symptoms of asthma, and false interpretation of actual 
symptoms as general, harmless sensations (Dirks & Schraa, 1983). Clinical 
studies have confirmed that adult asthmatics may erroneously interpret 
worry, general sensations, and emotional arousal as the symptoms of 
asthma (e.g., irritability, anxiety, fatigue, hyperventilation/hypocapnia, or 
heart pounding; Dirks, Schraa, & Robinson, 1982; Silverglade, Tosi, Wise, & 
D'Costa, 1993). Dirks and Schraa (1983) suggested that all asthmatics make 
these interpretative errors occasionally, and some of them quite often. 

Whereas the information-processing strategies so far described would 
generally favor the overperception or overprediction of symptoms, other 
strategies may favor underperception. The absence of breathlessness dur­
ing severe pathophysiology is one of the remarkable features of asthma 
and has never been explained sufficiently, although some investigators 
have suggested the mechanism of repression. Because sensory information 
associated with potential harm is extensively elaborated beyond cortical 
control, following phylogenetically old pathways, keeping such informa­
tion from awareness could possibly be reached only via biased symptom 
perception, that is, false interpretation of actual symptoms as general, 
innocent sensations (Rietveld & Brosschot, 1996). This mechanism, how­
ever, would be distinguishable from higher order cognitions only with 
great difficulty. Because the assessment of subjective symptoms demands 
some evaluation and reasoning, high-order cognition may dominate the 
outcome of symptom perceptual processes. Although biased symptom 
perception would seem to be associated with very severe asthma, empiri­
cal results suggest that all asthmatics are vulnerable to biased symptom 
perception (Costa & McCrae, 1985; Watson & Pennebaker, 1989). In fact, 
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mild symptoms with ambiguous clarity and specificity would be most 
likely subjected to biased symptom perception. 

To summarize, the cognitive compensation for the often ambiguous 
sensory information associated with pathophysiology is characterized by 
integration of external, situational information in the symptom perceptual 
process and by interpretation of information in congruence with illness­
schemas. There are two reciprocal mechanisms responsible for a false 
interpretation of sensations and symptoms, resulting in either overpercep­
tion or underperception of pathophysiology. The eventual verbal expres­
sion of symptoms is subjected to high-order cognitions. Hence, the process 
of biased symptom perception may operate from the stimulus-level to 
high-order reasoning, and the latter may either facilitate or interfere with 
the results of unconscious perceptual processes. As shall be argued in the 
following paragraph, emotional factors may constitute alternative or com­
plementary explanations for inaccuracies in symptom perception. 

3.2.4. Emotional Influences 

The strong relationship between stress, negative emotions, and 
asthma has been demonstrated by a longitudinal study between 1939 and 
1949. By far the highest incidence of fatal asthma occurred during the 
Second World War, particularly during the Battle of Britain (Friedman, 
1984). Part of this mortality may have been associated with asthmatics 
living under continuous stress, interfering with adequate symptom per­
ception. Asthmatics are aware of the risks of severe airway obstruction, 
and exacerbations of asthma are associated with worry, irritability, anxiety, 
fear, and eventually depression (Badoux & Levy, 1994; Colland, 1993). In 
fact, approximately two-thirds of children experience panic when they 
notice the onset of airway obstruction (Janson, Bjornsson, Hetta, & Boman, 
1994). Major topics that children worry about are school, health, and 
personal harm-all of which are involved in childhood asthma and likely 
to enhance illness-related distress and anxiety (Band & Weisz, 1988; Ben­
nett, 1989). 

Symptom perception, negative affect, and subjective symptoms are to 
some degree mutually influential (Davis & Offenkrantz, 1976). There is 
some evidence that negative affect may induce airway obstruction, but 
irrespective of this relationship, substantial evidence supports the effect 
of negative affect on both accuracy of symptom perception and magnitude 
of reported subjective symptoms. 

3.2.4.1. Effect of Emotions on Accuracy of Symptom Perception. The 
relationship between negative affect and symptom perception comprises 
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at least three different mechanisms. First, the accuracy of symptom percep­
tion generally relates negatively to anxiety and distress (Dahme, Konig, 
Nussbaum, & Richter, 1991; Hollandsworth, Kirkland, Jones, Van Norman, 
& Glazesky, 1979; Hudgel, Cooperson, & Kinsman, 1982). High levels of 
emotional arousal may either completely block pain perception or make 
conscious awareness of symptoms a function of survival-related behavior 
(Flor & Turk, 1989; McGrath, 1990; Peterson, Kimmel, Sacks, & Mesquita, 
1991). Second, the occurrence of negative emotions may trigger the inter­
pretation of general bodily sensations as the symptoms of disease. As 
discussed earlier, the false interpretation of sensations is one of the fea­
tures of distorted symptom perception in chronic disease. The presence of 
negative affect, coinciding with previous asthma attacks and, as such, 
stored in memory, may trigger selective symptom perception and asthma­
congruent interpretation of ambiguous symptoms. This suggestion was 
supported by the results of the study by Rietveld and Prins (1996) with 
asthmatic children who participated in one of four experimental condi­
tions with (1) induction of negative affect, and (2) induction of sensations 
by means of physical exercise, presented in different order. The highest 
breathlessness was observed in the condition with negative affect preced­
ing exercise. Exercise-induced sensations seemed to be interpreted in 
congruence with asthma when asthmatics were in a negative mood. Indi­
rect support for this assumption came from a study in which asthmatics 
who frequently falsely interpreted symptoms had the highest incidence of 
emotional lability, anxiety, and depression (Dirks et aI., 1982). Third, nega­
tive emotions may be interpreted as actual symptoms of a chronic disease 
(Rainville, Feine, Bushnell, & Duncan, 1992; Watson & Clark, 1984; Watson 
& Pennebaker, 1989). Dirks and Schraa (1983) suggested that asthmatic 
adults may falsely interpret negative emotions as the symptoms of asthma. 
Cardiac patients may interpret the emotional arousal associated with sex­
ual excitement as cardiac symptoms and may be overwhelmed with dis­
tress (Cioffi, 1991; Easterling & Leventhal, 1989; Ehlers, Margrat, Roth, 
Taylor, & Birbaumer, 1988). In chronic-pain patients, a negative relation 
between pain and anxiety supported the hypothesis of a somatic instead of 
a cognitive interpretation of anxious arousal (DeGood, Buckeelew, & Tait, 
1985). As Johnson (1973) emphasized, subjects who can attribute their 
psychological arousal to a neutral source will be less apt to label their state 
"emotional" than when the arousal is to be attributed to a threatening 
source. Considering the close association between severe chronic disease 
and emotions, asthmatics may have more problems finding such neutral 
causes than normal controls. 

To summarize, asthma and negative affect are intertwined, and inde­
pendent causal relationships are hard to distinguish. The main theme 
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would be the mutual enhancement of negative affect and symptoms. This 
illustrates the importance in assessing negative affect when conducting 
symptom perception research. The main conclusion from the current para­
graph would be that negative affect worsens perceptual accuracy, may 
trigger extensive elaboration of possibly relevant sensory information, and 
may be interpreted as actual symptoms of asthma. 

3.2.4.2. Effect of Emotions on Breathlessness. Factor analysis of symp­
toms during asthmatic exacerbations showed that breathlessness may 
consist of five distinct factors: panic-fear, awareness of airway obstruc­
tion, hyperventilation, fatigue, and irritability (Brooks et aI., 1989). Only 
panic-fear appeared to be a stable factor. It has been hypothesized that the 
weight of these constituents would determine the magnitude of breath­
lessness, whereas different configurations of factors could correlate with 
particular conditions (Rietveld, 1996a). Simon et a1. (1990) went so far as to 
suggest that different configurations of factors could be associated with 
different respiratory diseases. Wilson and Jones (1991) confirmed that 
breathlessness and distress during induced airway obstruction overlap 
broadly. However, a methodological problem may be that emotional 
arousal influences the respiratory pattern and may eventually provoke 
airway obstruction-and breathlessness (Bass & Gardner, 1985). This illus­
trates the close relationship between asthma and negative affect but also 
suggests that the occurrence of either negative affect or the awareness of 
asthma may initiate a vicious circle of negative emotions and illness­
related distress. 

Another influence in excessive-breathlessness reporting would be 
neuroticism, perhaps less influential in children, but nevertheless a potent 
determinant of subjective symptom reporting in adults (Affleck, Tennen, 
Urrows, & Higgins, 1992; Costa & McCrae, 1987). The negation of negative 
affect that enhances subjective symptoms is that absence of negative affect 
diminishes the magnitude of breathlessness, irrespective of the level of 
airway obstruction (Lehrer, Isenberg, & Hochron, 1993; Osward, Waller, & 
Drinkwater, 1970). This would be an explanation for the classic experimen­
tal observations by Rubinfeld and Pain (1977) on adult asthmatics who 
reported no symptoms at the end of a provocation test, while their lung 
function was still severely reduced (see also the cognitive explanation in 
3.2.3.) Support for this explanation (i.e., lack of negative affect) could only 
be a matter of reasoning, because the levels of distress and negative affect 
were not assessed in this study. Rietveld (1996a) argued that subjects 
regained control and felt relief by the end of the test, which was reflected in 
low levels of negative affect and breathlessness. 

In a signal detection experiment by Rietveld (1996b), children with 
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and without asthma breathed through a face mask with airflow interrup­
tions of different magnitude, ranging from 5% to 64% reduction in forced 
expiratory volume in 1 second. The children continuously reported breath­
lessness by moving a lever. Remarkably, the magnitude of breathlessness 
was completely independent of the intensity of airflow interruption. Over­
all breathlessness remained mild, and there was no difference between 
asthmatics and normal controls. These results showed that when negative 
emotions are held constant by random presentation of different intensities 
of airflow interruption, breathlessness is not linearly related to intensity of 
airflow interruption, remains quite mild, even during severe airflow inter­
ruption, and is fairly similar in children with and without asthma. In other 
words, breathlessness without emotional influences becomes a reflection 
of increased respiratory effort. Labored breathing to an external obstruc­
tion may be exhausting or unpleasant but seems quite distinct from the 
suffering during an actual asthma attack. Consequently, the lack of subjec­
tive symptoms during severe pathophysiology, previously attributed to 
impaired perception, repression, ignorance, or neglect of symptoms, could 
be explained by the absence of negative affect (Steiner, Higgs, Fritz, Lazlo, 
& Harvey, 1987). The distinction between unconscious repression of symp­
toms and conscious neglect of symptoms has not been addressed in 
asthma research. However, as Cioffi (1991) pointed out, aversive sensations 
cannot be ignored for long, and attempts to distract from them will fail 
(Avia & Kanfer, 1980). Consequently, a lack of subjective symptoms during 
obvious pathophysiology could well be explained by the false interpreta­
tion of symptoms or by the absence· of negative affect. 

In summary, negative affect and breathlessness are overlapping cate­
gories, and presence and magnitude of emotions may favor either overper­
ception or underperception of physical symptoms. 

4. Developmental and Gender Influences 

In ontogenetic development, children's cognitive and perceptual ca­
pacities gradually become more sophisticated. They may recognize spe­
cific sensory information, and, at the same time, learn to interpret specific 
sensory information as general sensations. Symptom appraisal in toddlers 
is in accordance with the mother's attitudes and eventually will be inter­
nalized, influencing subsequent symptom perception (Gauthier et al., 
1977; Jordan & O'Grady, 1982; Steinberg & Laird, 1989). 

Campbell (1975) suggested that mothers modify their children's expe­
riences of symptoms in a casual learning process. Occasionally, parental 
influence may exceed the normal pattern, with the child's symptom per-
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ception and symptom evaluation completely overruled by parental domi­
nance, such as is the case in Munchausen by proxy syndrome (Harbeck­
Weber & Peterson, 1996). As was addressed in 3.2.2., external information 
with respect to illness, including parental verbal interpretations of symp­
toms, is stored in cognitive schemas that guide and influence subsequent 
sensory information processing. Consequently, developmental level plays 
a crucial role in symptom perception but has not been studied system­
atically. The relationship between children's growth from concrete concep­
tions of reality to more complex ones and changes in the content of illness­
related fears has been emphasized (Burbach & Peterson, 1986). Future 
studies should address these factors within the framework of child-parent 
interactions. 

The interaction between developmental level and fear may play an 
important role in the perception of symptoms associated with diseases 
with a life-threatening connotation. Parental expressions of fear may dom­
inate children's rudimentary awareness of symptoms. Although these 
parental characteristics are eventually internalized, children's own, real 
experiences are gradually modifying their attitudes toward negative 
events. They become increasingly able to anticipate future events and to 
reason about their implications. They develop the capacity to worry about 
an ever-increasing variety of threats (Vasey, 1993; Weinberger & Bushnell, 
1994). This capacity may closely be related to the cognitive distortions 
addressed in 3.2.3. 

Another important developmental issue would be the capability to 
select topics to which to attend. Attending to a particular feature of sen­
sory information requires (1) that irrelevant stimuli can be analyzed aut{)­
matically at semantic levels (where they may cause intrusion/interference 
effects), and (2) that selection can be achieved by habituation to and 
inhibition of the irrelevant stimuli (Tipper, Bourque, Anderson, & Brehat, 
1989). The inhibitory mechanism may only be developed after second 
grade (i.e., 7 to 8 years of age), suggesting that from that age on, cognitive 
sophistication on the one hand may favor adequate symptom perception, 
and on the other hand may make biased symptom perception possible. In 
addition, the lesser capability of younger children to master inhibitory 
strategies in attentional tasks would make them vulnerable to greater 
distractibility. This suggests that younger children are less inclined to false 
symptom perception. Empirical results confirm that young subjects are 
generally more accurate symptom perceivers than the elderly (Tack, AI­
tose, & Cherniack, 1982). On the other hand, toddlers with severe illness 
may not be able to (1) perceive and evaluate symptoms beyond parental 
dominance, (2) integrate available sensory information into adequate 
symptom perception, and (3) have lower levels of illness-related worry. 
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Experimental studies showed that at least some 7- and 8-year-old children 
were influenced by false feedback of illness-related information (lung 
function information and respiration sounds) when reporting breathless­
ness, demonstrating that "sophisticated" symptom perception can be de­
veloped in school-aged children (Rietveld et al., 1996b). Studies with chil­
dren under 7 years of age have not been conducted, but empirical results 
suggest that there is generally no age effect on the accuracy of symptom 
perception in school-aged children and adolescents, neither in airflow 
detection nor actual airway obstruction (Fritz, Klein, & Overholser, 1990; 
Rietveld, 1996a). Some modest age effects have been reported on the 
magnitude of breathlessness. Janson-Bjerklie et al. (1987) observed a nega­
tive correlation between age and breathlessness, suggesting that young 
children reported more breathlessness at a given degree of airway obstruc­
tion (see Quirk & Jones, 1990). 

Generally, females score more subjective symptoms than males, 
which was confirmed for breathlessness in the study by Janson-Bjerklie et 
al. (1987). However, Quirk and Jones (1990) found no gender influence in 
the level of breathlessness-related distress. In children, young girls worry 
more than boys, which could be reflected in levels of breathlessness, but 
several studies have found no such effect (Fritz et al., 1990; Rietveld, 1996a). 
It may be concluded that knowledge on developmental and gender influ­
ences on symptom perception is severely limited. 

5. Conclusions 

There is abundant support that the sensory information underlying 
the symptom perceptual process in a chronic disease, such as asthma, is 
often neither clear nor specific. The accuracy of symptom perception is de­
fined as the correlation between objective measures of pathophysiology 
and subjective symptoms. Additional information can be provided by 
experiments involving signal detection. The commonly observed discor­
dance between objective, pathophysiological, and subjective symptoms 
often poses a threat to illness management, with both medical, psychologi­
cal and psychosocial consequences. 

There are seven factors influencing symptom perception, gathered 
under the headings "biomedical" and "psychological" factors. The bio­
medical factors include biological circadian influences, differences in 
pathophysiology, and organic or neurological pathology. The circadian 
influence may affect many research findings. The correlation between 
objective and subjective symptoms may vary as a function of this circadian 
influence. The concept has hardly been investigated in symptom percep-
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tion and may be of marginal explanatory power, however. The modest 
empirical findings do not address symptom severity, confounding data­
based conclusions. For instance, a lack of a correlation between objective 
and subjective variables during particular hours of the day may simply be 
explained by limited variance in symptom severity, whereas high correla­
tions in the early morning may coincide with relative high symptom 
severity. Generally, subjective symptoms are relatively higher during the 
night than during the day, affecting such correlations too. It may be that 
circadian influence merely affects physiological changes as reflected in 
lung function parameters. 

The accuracy of symptom perception may differ as a result of the in­
fluence of (1) acute versus prolonged or chronic airway obstruction, 
(2) central versus peripheral obstruction, and (3) different agents provok­
ing obstruction. These differences are probably associated with different 
receptors and neurological pathways, determining the afferent informa­
tion in the symptom perceptual process. Different agents provoking air­
way obstruction may be associated with different subjective symptoms 
(e.g., excessive mucus or saliva). These physiological differences may not 
be reflected in lung function measures and thereby enhance a discordance 
between objective and subjective symptoms. Although chronic asthma 
may eventually affect receptor sensitivity, results so far have demonstrated 
that the accuracy of symptom perception is independent of objective 
variables denoting asthma severity, suggesting that organic pathology 
may only modestly explain variance in perceptual accuracy. 

Four different psychological factors influencing symptom perception 
have been described: competition of sensory information, selective per­
ception, cognitive compensation, and emotional influences. The human 
capacity to process information is limited, and the probability of detecting 
internal cues can be expressed as a function of the ratio of available 
internal and external information. Although this concept may to some 
degree be useful in explaining intraindividual differences in the accuracy 
of symptom perception, several issues are yet to be investigated, such as 
the difference between quality and quantity of subjects' responses. Infor­
mation and experiences with respect to a disease are integrated in cogni­
tive illness-schemas, guiding and influencing subsequent information pro­
cessing. The result may be selective perception of possible illness-related 
information, favoring the likelihood that symptoms are really perceived. 
Some perceptual processes are unconscious, but subjects may also actively 
and selectively monitor for possible relevant information. Selective per­
ception for particular information will generally enhance the reporting of. 
subjective symptoms. 

ConSidering that asthma is a potential life-threatening condition, 
asthma-related information undergoes extensive cognitive and emotional 
elaboration. With sensory information often being vague or ambiguous, 
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cognition may have a dominant effect. First, as a consequence of illness­
schema-guided symptom perceptual strategies, sensory information with 
possible relevance to the disease may be subjected to illness-congruent 
interpretation. Second, external, situational information with possible rele­
vance to the disease may be integrated in the symptom perceptual process. 
Information-processing biases or distortions are likely to result in either 
overperception or underperception of symptoms. High-order cognitions 
may modify the outcome of the symptom perceptual process when report­
ing subjective symptoms. Emotional factors may constitute alternative or 
complementary explanations for inaccuracy in symptom perception. Neg­
ative emotions are particularly dominant in magnitude of subjective 
symptoms. First, negative affect and the accuracy of symptom perception 
correlate negatively. Second, negative emotions may trigger the illness­
congruent interpretation of ambiguous sensory information in terms of the 
disease. Third, negative emotions may be interpreted as symptoms of the 
disease (e.g., anxious arousal may be subjected to a somatic interpreta­
tion). Fourth, high levels of negative emotions enhance subjective symp­
toms, whereas a lack of negative emotions may explain the absence of 
subjective symptoms during pathophysiology. A child may perceive 
symptoms of asthma in full awareness, knowing that symptoms are gener­
ally mild and can be cured easily. Hence,negative affect remains minimal 
and so does breathlessness. On the other hand, a child who panics when 
perceiving asthma onset is likely to report high levels of anxiety, illness­
related distress, and breathlessness. 

The capacity of children to integrate illness-related sensory informa­
tion may be developed by the age of 7 years. However, the influence of age 
and gender influences has not been studied systematically. Initial findings 
suggest that they may be of marginal influence in school-aged children 
and adolescents. The concept of symptom perception deals adequately 
with a number of problems associated with the discordance between 
objective and subjective symptoms in health and disease across both gen­
der and age. Finally, symptom perception could also be used to investigate 
aspects of a wide array of problems facing physicians and psychologists, 
such as unexplained pain, lack of compliance with a medical regimen, 
placebo responses, somatoform disorders, and fatal pathology not recog­
nized in time for treatment. 
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6 Common Feeding Problems 
in Young Children 

KAREN S. BUDD AND CARY S. CHUGH 

1. Introduction 

Even before a baby is born, parents watch carefully for signs of their 
expectant child's health and development. The growing emphasis on 
prenatal care reflects a greater awareness of the effects of maternal health 
behaviors on the unborn child. However, concerns and questions about 
the child's developmental progress do not abate after birth. In fact, the 
most common questions asked of pediatricians by parents of infants and 
toddlers concern what is normal for a child at different ages (Reisinger & 
Bires, 1980; Riter, personal communication, October, 1995). Parents typ­
ically ask, "When will my child develop a stable sleep schedule?"; "When 
should I begin potty training my child?"; and "When will my child [reach a 
particular developmental milestone]?" 

Feeding is no exception to this list of questions. In fact, it may be 
especially pertinent, as feeding is the first activity in which the parent and 
child work together toward a common goal, namely satiation of the neo­
nate's hunger. Years later, parents may still recall vividly the first time they 
fed their baby after arriving home from the hospital, or the weary hours of 
trying to feed and calm their colicky infant. Disturbances in the area of 
feeding are likely to engender considerable parental concern, both with 
regard to parents' competence as caregivers and with regard to their 
child's well-being. 
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Estimates of the prevalence of feeding problems in children vary, with 
some sources reporting rates around 20% (Beautrais, Fergusson, & Shan­
non, 1982; Lindberg, Bohlin, & Hagekull, 1991), others between 30% and 
45% (Bentovim, 1970), and some as high as 62% (Reau, Senturia, Lebailly, & 
Christoffel, 1996). The wide discrepancy in figures across studies results in 
part from differing age groups sampled, sources of information (i.e., 
health-care professionals, parents, clinical records), and criteria for defin­
ing feeding problems. Studies also include differing subcategories of feed­
ing concerns, such as undereating, picky or selective eating, overeating, 
vomiting or rumination, infant crying during or after meals, and ingesting 
inedible substances (pica). More stringent criteria in defining feeding 
problems yield a much lower estimate of prevalence, as exemplified by 
Dahl and Sundelin's (1986) finding of a 1-2% prevalence of persistent 
feeding problems in infants. 

Even though many children experience feeding difficulties that are 
not diagnosable by the DSM-IV (American Psychiatric Association, 1994), 
their parents are nonetheless concerned about these problems. Feeding 
difficulties presumably make mealtimes more difficult and frustrating for 
caregivers. Suggestive of this is the finding that parents of children with 
feeding disorders use more negative and coercive verbalizations with their 
children during meals when compared to parents of children without 
feeding disorders (Sanders, Patel, LeGrice, & Shepherd, 1993). Addi­
tionally, parents of children with feeding problems are more likely to have 
negative feelings about their children (Hagekull & Dahl, 1987), presum­
ably because of their frustration with the feeding situation. Such negative 
experiences associated with persistent feeding difficulties have been hy­
pothesized to affect children's psychosocial development and their subse­
quent interactions with others (Hufton & Oates, 1977; Oates, Peacock, & 
Forrest, 1985). 

Whereas much has been written about assessment and treatment of 
clinically significant pediatric feeding conditions (e.g., Drotar, 1985; Ke­
desdy & Budd, in press; Kirschenbaum, Johnson, & Stalonas, 1987; Lin­
scheid, 1992; Woolston, 1991), writing in the area of subclinical feeding 
concerns is relatively sparse. Given the high prevalence of these less severe 
forms of feeding problems, it is likely that the practicing clinician will 
encounter children and parents struggling with feeding-related issues that 
do not fit the criteria for full-fledged feeding disorders. This chapter 
reviews the development of normal feeding practices, describes common 
subclinical deviations from normal feeding in otherwise healthy children, 
and discusses clinical assessment and management issues related to these 
feeding difficulties. The emphasis is on the developmental periods of 
infancy and early childhood, because these are the peak times for most 
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feeding difficulties, as well as on the changing implications of overeating 
from infancy to latency periods. 

2. Normal Feeding 

Feeding mirrors other basic childhood skills in that it develops 
through a series of progressions over time. In the early stages of infancy, 
eating behaviors are a result of reflex reactions, presumably in response to 
the sensation of hunger and the pleasure of substances entering the mouth 
(Lipsitt & Behl, 1990). However, as the infant grows and develops, primi­
tive reflexes begin to disappear, usually between 3 and 5 months of age 
(O'Brien, Repp, Williams, & Christophersen, 1991). It is about this time that 
the infant begins to acquire new oral-motor skills, including munching (5 
months), tongue lateralization (7 months), biting (7 months), and the 
development of a mature chewing pattern (between 8 and 36 months) 
(Howard, 1984). 

The child's increasing oral-motor capacity permits a wider range of 
food intake and allows for the child's participation in the feeding process. 
Between the ages of 4 and 6 months, bottled formula or breast milk is 
gradually replaced or supplemented with solid foods (e.g., pureed fruits, 
infant cereal) (Moss & Moss, 1980). Around 7 months of age, the infant 
begins to finger feed (Christophersen & Hall, 1978). As teeth appear and 
chewing skills improve, the child can consume more textured foods, mov­
ing from pureed to semisolid, to chopped, and then to chewy and crunchy 
consistencies. Self-feeding skills improve by the 12th month to the point 
where the use of a utensil is often possible; at around 15 months of age, the 
infant begins to engage in self-feeding (Christophersen & Hall, 1978). 

Between the ages of 1 and 5 years, a child's appetite changes from 
being relatively stable to becoming more erratic and unpredictable. The 
child's food interests have been hypothesized to change through the ef­
fects of learning and experience (Birch, 1990), and as part of a developmen­
tal pursuit for autonomy and control (Erikson, 1950). Because of these 
naturally occurring shifts in the child's appetite, coupled with numerous 
cognitive and social developments, it is during the toddler and preschool 
years that issues around feeding are most likely to arise (Bentovim, 1970). 
Noncompliant behaviors and strong preferences during feeding as well as 
other child-care situations (e.g., bedtime, dressing) are normal and even 
necessary opportunities for the child to mature socially (Linscheid, Budd, 
& Rasnake, 1995). However, when feeding difficulties become exaggerated 
or persist over several weeks or months, they can engender considerable 
parental concern. 
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3. Deviations from Normal Feeding 

Pediatric feeding problems exist on a continuum from minor disrup­
tive behaviors at mealtimes to complete rejection of, or lack of control 
around, food, which may result in severe medical difficulties (Kedesdy & 
Budd, in press; Luiselli, 1989; Woolston, 1991). Even mild forms of feeding 
problems can be worrisome to parents, make mealtimes unpleasant, and 
have the potential, if they persist, to impair other aspects of a child's 
functioning. Commonly occurring subclinical feeding problems are pre­
sented in Table 1, alongside their clinical counterparts. Subclinical devia­
tions include finicky eating habits, overeating, mouthing nonfood sub­
stances, spitting up and vomiting, and colic. Additional behaviors during 
mealtimes (e.g., sloppy or slow eating) that do not directly affect food 
intake also may concern parents. Each of these patterns will be reviewed in 
tum. 

3.1. Finicky Eating Habits 

Anyone who deals with children on a regular basis knows that their 
appetites, far from being constant, are quite variable over time. Foods 
favored one day are likely to be rejected the next. In fact, during the 
preschool years, mercurial feeding patterns are considered normal in 
young children (e.g., Bentovim, 1970). 

The term finicky eater is used here to describe a child who refuses a 
wider range of foods than is considered normal for a given chronological 
age. This "picky eating style" is seen in 20-30% of all children at some 
point in their development (e.g., Bentovim, 1970; Marchi & Cohen, 1990) 
and is often accompanied by other feeding habits, such as eating small 

TABLE 1 
Deviations from Normal Childhood Feeding or Growth 

Subclinical condition 

Finicky eating habits 

Overeating 
Mouthing nonfood substances 
Spitting up and vomiting 

Colic 

Clinical counterpart 

Chronic food refusal 
Failure to thrive 
Psychosocial dwarfism 
Feeding disorder of infancy or early childhood 
Obesity 
Pica 
Rumination 
Gastroesophageal reflux 
Illness (e.g., food allergy, intestinal disease) 
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portions of food, eating slowly, and showing a low level of interest in 
eating (Marchi & Cohen, 1990). Finicky eating is distinguished from its 
clinical counterpart, chronic refusal of major food groups or textures (Lin­
scheid, 1992), and also from failure to thrive (FTT), a growth deficiency that 
can result as a consequence of chronic undereating. FIT is characterized 
by weight below the 5th percentile for age, weight that is less than 80-85% 
of the child's ideal body weight, or a marked deceleration in the child's 
weight indicated by the loss of two or more percentiles in the infant's 
growth chart (Drotar, 1985). Woolston (1991) argued that a further distinc­
tion needs to be made between these conditions and psychosocial dwarf­
ism. Psychosocial dwarfism is not a feeding problem per se; instead, it 
involves a marked deceleration in growth accompanied by disturbances in 
behavior (e.g., sleep disorder). These problems are thought to stem from a 
poor, unnurturing environment and improve upon change in the child's 
psychosocial environment. The DSM-IV includes a category called Feed­
ing Disorder of Infancy or Early Childhood to denote feeding disturbances 
characterized by persistent failure to eat adequately, FIT symptoms, and 
no known medical causes (American Psychiatric Association, 1994). This 
diagnosis indicates a more serious problem than is implied by the term 
finicky eating habits. 

Because wide variability in feeding behaviors is typical of young 
children, guidelines are needed for determining when such behavior tran­
scends the boundaries of normalcy. Based on their review of the literature, 
Kedesdy and Budd (in press) suggest criteria for distinguishing subclinical 
from clinical undereating in children. Both types of feeding disturbances 
are characterized by parental complaints or concerns about the child's 
mealtime behavior. If the problem can be explained by a medical disorder, 
or if it interferes with the child's physical, social, or emotional develop­
ment, it is considered to be of clinical significance. Alternatively, finicky 
eating habits without biomedical origin or negative consequences for the 
child fit Kedesdy and Budd's definition of subclinical feeding problems. 

3.2. Overeating 

Most parents concerned with their child's overeating fear obesity as a 
likely consequence of this eating pattern. Obesity is assumed to result from 
consistently consuming more calories than the body expends during the 
day. In fact, Dietz (1987) asserted that excess imbalances of as little as 50 
calories per day can lead to obesity over time. 

In a cross-sectional study, Gortmaker, Dietz, Sobol, and Wehler (1987) 
examined trends in obesity for 6- to ll-year-olds over the period 1963 to 
1980. They found that the prevalence of obesity and superobesity, as 
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assessed by tricep skinfold measurements, was 27.1% and 11.7%, respec­
tively, in the period 1976-1980. These figures represent a 54% increase for 
obesity and a 98% increase for superobesity from statistics collected from 
1963 to 1965. The authors cite increased television viewing, changes in diet, 
and decreased physical activity in American youth as possible causes of 
this trend. 

The recommended criterion for obesity is 20% above the child's ideal 
body weight (Israel, 1990). A child with a subclinical overeating problem 
falls below this level of excess weight but exhibits weight gain and/or 
eating habits tending toward obese status. Children with mild overeating 
may encounter some of the social and physical repercussions of their obese 
counterparts. 

Although the immediate effects of mild to moderate obesity on the 
health of the child are not yet clear, the consequences of obesity for adults 
(e.g., cardiovascular disease, noninsulin-dependent diabetes) are better 
understood. As obese children get older and maintain their oversized 
physique, they are more likely to become obese adults (Epstein, Wing, & 
Valoski, 1985). For this reason, overeating and early signs of atypical 
weight gain in children are justifiable concerns. These concerns are less of 
an issue with infants, however, as there is a considerable rate of sponta­
neous remission in this group across time. Dietz (1984) reviewed several 
studies that followed infants who were diagnosed as being obese during 
the first 6 months of life. Upon reexamination at 48 months of age, a range 
of 25-44% of the infants remained obese. Therefore, although it is common 
for parents to have some concerns about the future weight status of their 
"chubby" babies, this research suggests that obesity in infancy it is not 
highly predictive of later body size. 

In addition to the health-related implications of overeating, over­
weight children often experience social rejection and teasing, and have 
lower self-concepts than their lean peers, as do obese adults (Foreyt & 
Goodrick, 1988). In studying the perceptions of obese elementary-school 
children around eating and dieting, Thelen, Powell, Lawrence, and Kuhn­
ert (1992) found that fourth- and sixth-grade girls were more concerned 
about becoming overweight than their second-grade counterparts and all 
of the male groups. When asked about their dietary habits, over one-fourth 
of the second-grade girls and one-third of the older girls reported dieting 
at some point. This research supports the notion that by middle elemen­
tary school, even nonobese children (as indicated by not weighing more 
than their ideal body weight) may have concerns about their body size and 
shape. These concerns may also be reflected in the way popularity of 
children in school is affected by body size, with heavier or bigger children 
being less well-liked than their lean classmates. Being unpopular or self-
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conscious about one's weight may lead to a decrease in children's partici­
pation levels in social activities and an increase in isolated, more sedentary 
behaviors, such as television watching. These effects may, in turn, reduce 
children's overall activity level and increase their opportunities to eat, 
thereby creating a self-perpetuating cycle. 

3.3. Mouthing Nonfood Substances 

Mouthing objects is one of the primary ways infants explore their 
environment. Mouthing, sucking, and even swallowing nonnutritive sub­
stances (e.g., dirt, paper, buttons) are relatively common occurrences in 
infancy. Mouthing some substances can result in serious consequences 
(e.g., choking, poisoning) for the infant or toddler; however, mouthing 
usually is not seen as reflecting physical or emotional disturbance but 
rather children acting on their curiosity. It has been suggested that the 
eating of nonnutritive substances is an imitative behavior, based on find­
ings that young children in homes with pets and siblings of children with 
pica are more likely to ingest these substances (Feldman, 1986). When 
mouthing occurs repeatedly or involves dangerous substances, it may 
signal an impoverished environment or negligent care on the part of the 
parent. 

Pica is much more severe than innocent exploration of one's environ­
ment. Rather, it is the persistent eating of nonnutritive substances that are 
neither age-appropriate nor culturally sanctioned (American Psychiatric 
Association, 1994). The prevalence of pica in the general population is 
unknown; however, it is associated with other disorders (e.g., mental 
retardation, pervasive developmental disorders) and appears to increase 
in prevalence with the severity of the associated disorder (American Psy­
chiatric Association, 1994). Pica often co-occurs with lead poisoning in 
children, presumably due to the child's ingestion of bits of lead-based 
paint, particularly in areas of deteriorated housing (Madden, Russo, & 
Cataldo, 1980). The results of lead poisoning can be severe and lasting, 
including neurological damage and developmental impairment. 

3.4. Spitting Up, Vomiting, and Colic 

Spitting up and, to a lesser extent, vomiting during infancy are norma­
tive feeding difficulties. Forsyth, Leventhal, and McCarthy (1985) found 
moderate to severe levels of spitting up during feeding in 10% of breast-fed 
and 18% of formula-fed infants at 4 months of age. Some babies vomit 
occasionally after they are fed, although daily vomiting is a less common 
occurrence (Dahl & Sundelin, 1986). Allergies or other health problems 
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often are suspected when vomiting persists, but some infants vomit peri­
odically with no known cause (Satter, 1986b). One physical problem that 
must be ruled out when vomiting occurs is gastroesophageal reflux, an 
involuntary, spontaneous return of stomach contents into the esophagus 
(Woolston, 1991). 

Although spitting up or occasional vomiting is quite common among 
infants, this benign pattern can be distinguished from its more severe 
clinical deviation, rumination. The latter behavior is characterized by 
preparatory movements followed by the voluntary bringing up of food 
and rechewing or sucking that seems pleasurable to the infant (American 
Psychiatric Association, 1994). Rumination disorder occurs relatively infre­
quently in the general population. It is most often seen in infancy, although 
older children and adults may develop habitual rumination as well (Reis, 
1994). 

Typically, rumination in infancy has a high spontaneous remission 
rate (American Psychiatric Association, 1994). It is believed that infants 
with this disorder use rumination to provide themselves with oral stimula­
tion. The findings that these infants are typically under- or overstimulated, 
have anxious or depressed caretakers, and come from stressful environ­
ments support this hypothesis (American Psychiatric Association, 1994; 
Sauvage, Leddet, Hameury, & Barthelemy, 1985). 

Another common feeding-related disturbance is colic, which is char­
acterized by inconsolable crying after feeding. Colic is diagnosed by exclu­
sion, in that persistent crying may signal an allergic reaction to milk or 
formula, intestinal pain from infection or blockage, or other medically 
treatable conditions. In their review of the colic literature, Hewson, Ob­
erklaid, and Menahem (1987) noted the prevalence of colic to be between 
20% and 30%, and lasting between 13 and 16 weeks. In fact, Lindberg et al. 
(1991) found colic to be the most commonly reported problem related to 
feeding in early infancy. They found that the mothers of infants with colic 
in their sample reported more problems with their children during meals 
even after the colic had been resolved. Vomiting was rated as a problem 
twice as often as colic during the latter half of infants' first year of life, and 
into the beginning of the second year, although both problems declined in 
frequency from early infancy. 

3.5. Other Problematic Eating Patterns 

In addition to the behaviors described, some children's eating styles 
may be frustrating or worrisome to parents, even if they do not impact on 
food intake. These include sloppy eating, eating too fast or too slow, 
packing food in the mouth, and failing to practice acquired self-feeding 
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skills. These patterns may raise concerns about the child's development, 
precipitate gagging or choking on food, or make mealtimes unpleasant for 
other family members. More clinically severe forms of these problems are 
seen mainly in children with developmental delays or oral-motor impair­
ments (Ginsberg, 1988; Kedesdy & Budd, in press). 

4. Etiology of Common Feeding Problems 

There are many theories as to how feeding problems develop and are 
maintained. Potential etiological variables for subclinical feeding diffi­
culties are likely to be similar to those for the more severe feeding prob­
lems. Kedesdy and Budd (in press) proposed eight major causal areas: 
diet, physical (i.e., oral-motor and neuromuscular) competence, appetite, 
illness, interaction/management problems, child constitution (e.g., tem­
perament, developmental functioning), caregiver competence, and sys­
temic variables (e.g., family stressors). Mild or subtle expression of these 
factors can contribute to the development of less severe feeding problems 
as well. Increasingly, research in this field is looking at the interplay of 
physiological, social, and behavioral factors to better understand the na­
ture of these problems (Budd et al., 1992; Linscheid, 1992). The following 
discussion pertains mainly to etiological precursors of finicky eating and 
overeating, reflective of the greater amount of research and clinical atten­
tion to these mild feeding problems. 

4.1. Biological and Conditioning Factors 

Although the contribution of biological factors to overeating (to be 
described) is generally supported, its influence is less clear in the develop­
ment of finicky eating. Kedesdy and Budd (in press), in reviewing the 
literature on etiological factors for finicky eating habits, found that biolog­
ical factors related to physical competence and chronic illness are less 
frequently postulated as causes of mild selectivity but are thought to play 
an increasingly significant role in the emergence of extreme selectivity. 
Dahl and Sundelin (1992) found that children identified at 3-12 months 
with refusal-to-eat problems were smaller physically from birth than a 
matched control sample. This suggests that normal variations in health 
status, growth parameters, or appetite may predispose some children to 
mealtime problems. Likewise, subtle oral-motor weaknesses may contrib­
ute to a child's resistance to accepting textured foods or refusal of solid 
foods (Skuse, 1993). Mild oral-motor difficulties may be suggested by 
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prolonged chewing, frequent drooling while eating, or occasional gagging 
on coarse foods. . 

Both biological and environmental factors influence overeating and 
obesity, and it is often difficult to separate the effects of these variables. For 
example, the connection between parents' weight and their children's 
weight has been well documented (e.g., Gam & Clark, 1976; Stunkard et 
aI., 1986). Homeostatic mechanisms (e.g., set point and fat cell stores) and 
constitutional differences in the palatability of high-calorie foods have 
been hypothesized to explain individual differences in weight status. Bal­
lard, Gipson, Guttenberg, and Ramsey (1980) stated that "obese children 
are more highly influenced by the relative palatability of food than their 
normal-weight peers" (p. 599). In their comparison of consumption trends 
in obese and nonobese 9- to ll-year-old children, these authors found that 
although all children left approximately the same amount of food on their 
trays when finished eating, obese children ate twice as much of their 
"palatable food" (i.e., main course, bread, dessert) as did the nonobese 
children. There was no significant difference between the two groups in 
the amount of "unpalatable food" (i.e., vegetable, salad, fruit). It is not 
clear if these differences are due to the biological makeup of the children or 
if these are learned behaviors. 

Research also has demonstrated the similarity between infants' feed­
ing styles and those of their parents (Agras, Berkowitz, Hammer, & 
Kraemer, 1988). Specifically, Agras and colleagues found that infants were 
most like their mothers in terms of bite frequency and most like their 
fathers in terms of how long they spent eating. They found that some 
children, whose mothers ate quickly and whose fathers spent a long time 
to eat, ate more calories than other children in the study. This research 
suggests a possible hereditary or familial determinant of overeating. It also 
illustrates the difficulties of separating out the roles of biology and experi­
ence in the etiology of feeding patterns. 

Physiological cues can be important in determining the quality and 
quantity of the child's food intake. At birth, neonates have the capacity to 
distinguish certain tastants from one another (Desor, Maller, & Andrews, 
1975). Research evidence with human infants supports the notion of an 
innate preference for the sweet taste (e.g., Nowlis, 1973; Steiner, 1977) and 
an innate aversion to bitter foods (Rozin, 1984). There is also support for 
the existence of neophobia, or the fear or dislike of novel tastants (Birch, 
1987). This neophobia is greatest when the child has had limited exposure 
to the disliked food (Zajonc, 1968), again indicating the contributory influ­
ence of experience. Indeed, Birch (1979) found that familiarity with foods 
was the most influential factor in determining a child's preference for that 
food. Sweetness was the second most predictive factor. 

Birch and Deysher (1986) demonstrated that children have the capac-
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ity to regulate intake of calories based on internal cues of hunger and 
satiety. Birch, McPhee, Shoba, Steinberg, and Krehbiel (1987) took this 
finding one step further by demonstrating that the methods employed by 
our society for determining when and how much a person should eat 
predispose us to having difficulty in aligning our food intake with our 
energy needs. Specifically, Birch and colleagues trained preschool children 
to focus either on their internal hunger cues when determining their food 
needs or on external cues (i.e., time of day, amount left on the plate, 
extrinsic rewards for eating). Children in the internal condition were able 
to vary their food intake according to the calorie level of a snack given 
prior to eating, whereas those in the external condition showed no such 
responsiveness. This research suggests that despite having the capacity to 
self-regulate intake of calories based on internal cues, children can easily 
be redirected to eat for reasons other than hunger cues (i.e., external cues), 
thereby making it more difficult to match energy intake with energy needs. 

Another way a child's eating can be affected is through negative 
conditioning. It has been found that long-standing aversions to foods can 
be created through the association of flavor cues of the food with negative 
consequences (e.g., nausea, vomiting) that are brought about by its inges­
tion or that occur simultaneously with ingestion due to other factors (e.g., 
illness). Once such associations are made, they can be very resistant to 
change (Garb & Stunkard, 1974). 

The subclinical problems of mouthing, spitting up, vomiting, and 
colic are usually developmentally time-limited patterns. Colic, in particu­
lar, appears briefly (albeit intensely) and typically is resolved by 4 months 
of age (Hewson et al., 1987). Little research has identified specific biological 
precipitants for mouthing nonfood substances, spitting up, or vomiting, 
and their usual pattern of spontaneous remission complicates the search 
for etiological factors. Colic has been hypothesized to be the result of the 
infant's reaction to various allergens in the mother's breast milk or infant 
formula (Hewson et al., 1987). Stifter and Braungart (1992) provide partial 
support for this theory. In observations of infants during colicky periods, 
they noted that many of these infants display behaviors indicative of 
gastrointestinal pain (e.g., flatulence, pained facial expressions). This the­
ory might help explain the finding that colicky infants were found to be 
more irritable during meals, even after the colic had resolved (Lindberg et 
al., 1991). 

4.2. Social and Behavioral Factors 

Satter (1986a) and others conceptualize feeding disorders as being 
heavily influenced by social and emotional factors . She argued that in 
addition to the biological causes of feeding disorders, the social influence 
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of the family plays an important role. In particular, feeding problems are 
likely to develop when families attempt to override the physical and 
physiological makeup of the child in order to fit their image of the proper 
body size and feeding practices for children. Several researchers have cited 
parent-child interactions as being important in the development of feed­
ing difficulties, and representative findings of this research are described 
next. In addition, other social influences such as media and cultural prac­
tices are described. 

Maladaptive patterns of parents' interactions with the child have been 
implicated in the development of feeding problems. Power struggles be­
tween the parent and child over feeding (Chatoor & Egan, 1983), insuffi­
cient knowledge of nutrition (Pugliese, Weyman-Daum, Moses, & Lifshitz, 
1987), and lack of responsiveness to the child's behaviors during the meal 
(Bradley, Casey, & Wortham, 1984; Pollitt, Eichler, & Chan, 1975) are among 
the identified problematic behaviors that may contribute to the develop­
ment and/or maintenance of the feeding problem. Christophersen and 
Hall (1978) suggest that the attention the child receives because of spitting 
up can be enough to perpetuate the behavior even after the aversive food 
has been removed. One etiological hypothesis of colic is that parental 
anxiety prestages or perpetuates infant crying, although other factors (e.g., 
intestinal gas and discomfort) are thought to playa complementary role 
(Hewson et aI., 1987). 

Behavioral mismanagement refers to the maladaptive practices used 
by a child's caregivers that strengthen problematic mealtime behaviors 
(Linscheid & Rasnake, 1985). Such maladaptive practices include provid­
ing an irregular or disorganized feeding environment, discouraging or 
responding inconsistently to the child's feeding initiatives, and failing to 
provide consistent consequences for undesired behaviors during meals 
(Drotar, 1991). In comparing mealtime interactions of mothers and children 
with or without persistent feeding difficulties, Sanders et a1. (1993) found 
that the interactions of the feeding-difficulties dyads were more likely to 
include aversive behaviors (e.g., negative physical contact, prompts to eat, 
comments on eating). They further demonstrated that overall level of 
maternal aversive behavior was a significant predictor of child disruptive 
behavior during meals. These findings support the hypothesis that mis­
placed social contingencies in parent-child interactions play a role in 
maintaining problematic feeding patterns. 

Parents also can influence a child's eating patterns through the dietary 
menu and the timing of meals and snacks. Particularly for infants and 
young children, parents determine the foods offered to children. The work 
of Birch (1990) and colleagues suggest that repeated exposure to novel 
foods is instrumental in shaping children's willingness to accept a variety 
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of foods. When parents stop offering a menu item based on the child's 
refusal, or when they substitute a familiar food to suite the child's tastes, 
they may be inadvertently reinforcing picky eating habits (Skuse, 1993). 
Likewise, the timing of eating occasions affects appetite. Offering a child 
food on an inconsistent or overly frequent basis can disrupt development 
of a normal hunger-eating-satiety pattern that supports adaptive eating 
habits. Irregular meals and free access to food across the day may contrib­
ute either to overeating or finicky eating patterns in children (Pipes & 
Trahms, 1993). 

In addition to the structure and contingencies of interactions, model­
ing is another means by which the social environment influences chil­
dren's eating (Bandura, 1969). Observation of others accounts for an enor­
mous amount of children's learning about appropriate behavior. Likewise, 
by watching poor models, children may learn to refuse nonfavored foods, 
that high-calorie foods are preferable to "healthy" foods, and/or that 
snacking throughout the day, or "grazing," is acceptable. 

Parents' methods of handling mealtime situations not only affect the 
child's behavior during the meals, but they also have been shown to 
correlate with their physical growth. Klesges et a1. (1983) found that young 
children's (aged 12-30 months) weight was positively correlated with the 
parents' prompts to eat, parents' offers of food, and the parents' encour­
agement to eat. Although these data are not sufficient to support a causal 
relationship among these variables, they suggest an interaction between 
social factors and children's eating habits. 

Stein, Woolley, Cooper, and Fairburn (1994) studied mothers with 
eating disorders (i.e., DSM-III-R diagnoses of Bulimia Nervosa and/or 
Eating Disorder Not Otherwise Specified) and their mealtime interactions 
with their infants. They found that the amount of conflict experienced 
during the meal was inversely related to the weight of the child, as was the 
degree to which the mother was concerned about her body shape. In other 
words, parents who were more intrusive and interruptive with their chil­
dren during meals, and had more concern about their own body weight, 
raised children who weighed less than those whose parents were not 
intrusive with their children or who did not have concerns about their 
body shape. Because feeding is one of the earliest forms of communication 
between parents and their children, and because children seem to be like 
their parents in terms of eating styles (Agras et aI., 1988), this connection 
between maternal eating disorders and their children's health outcomes is 
an important one. 

In addition to social influences of the family, children increasingly 
learn through other environmental contexts such as media, neighbors, and 
peers. With children in the United States watching an average of 4 hours of 
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television per day (Federal Trade Commission, 1981, as cited in Dawson, 
Jeffrey, & Walsh, 1988), there is growing interest in exploring the effects of 
television viewing on children's behavior. Children see an estimated 
22,000 commercials each year (Choate, 1976, as cited in Signorielli & Lears, 
1992), with the majority of television commercials aired during children's 
shows being for highly sweetened snack foods (Condry, Bence, & Scheibe, 
1988). 

The viewing of television commercials for low-nutrition foods has 
already been found to affect children's self-reported preference for those 
foods (Goldberg, Gorn, & Gibson, 1978). Signorielli and Lears (1992) found 
a significantly positive relationship between television viewing and poor 
eating habits. They also found some support for a link between high levels 
of television viewing and poor understanding of nutrition and food. An­
other important aspect of television watching is that it is a sedentary 
behavior. As pointed out by Dietz and Gortrnaker (1985), the length of time 
engaged in behaviors that require limited physical activity, such as televi­
sion viewing, has been linked to obesity. 

Prevailing cultural patterns also influence a child's eating habits. 
Rozin (1984) points out the importance of culture and experience in deter­
mining the child's understanding about what foods are edible, inedible, 
dangerous, beneficial, bad tasting, and good tasting. Indeed, several re­
search studies support the importance of environmental context in deter­
mining eating habits by demonstrating a link between low socioeconomic 
status and obesity (Sobal & Stunkard, 1989). Interestingly, Siddamma 
(1979) found the opposite to be true for people in India; obesity is more 
prevalent in the upper classes, and severe obesity was non-existent in their 
sample for the lower classes. These findings support the importance of 
considering the broader cultural and social context in determining the 
likelihood of obesity or other feeding problems. Specifically, Siddamma 
speculates that the stigma attached to obesity is far less in India than in 
Western countries. 

4.3. Behavioral Correlates of Feeding Problems 

It is often the case that the child with a feeding problem exhibits 
concomitant behavioral deviations in other areas. In their research investi­
gating the variables associated with feeding problems in young children, 
Pelchat and Pliner (1986) found that those children who were reported to 
have problems with acting out, toileting problems, and fearfulness had 
higher levels of feeding difficulties. 

As discussed earlier, Sanders et a1. (1993) found that interactions 
between mothers and children with feeding problems were more aversive 
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than interactions between normal control dyads. In addition to displaying 
a greater number of direct food refusals, the children were found to exhibit 
higher levels of noncompliance with a parental request, verbal complain­
ing, oppositional behavior (e.g., teasing, breaking family rules), and play­
ing with food. These behaviors can add to the negative atmosphere of the 
meal and serve to perpetuate aversive interactions between the child and 
parent. 

Research on obese individuals has tended to focus more on eating 
styles than on mealtime interactions. Obese people are thought to have an 
eating style that is different from normal-weight people. Characteristics of 
this eating style include taking large bites, having shorter meals, and 
eating quickly. Although the evidence in support of obese people taking 
larger bites than normal is inconsistent (e.g., Dodd, Birky, & Stalling, 1976; 
Marston, London, & Cooper, 1976), there is some support for the existence 
of a more rapid eating pace among obese people (e.g., Geller, Keane, & 
Scheirer, 1981; Marston et al., 1976). This finding has been shown in chil­
dren as young as Ph to 2 years of age (Drabman, Cordua, Hammer, Jarvie, 
& Horton, 1979). 

Lindberg et al. (1991) reported that both colic and vomiting were 
associated with some additional behavioral difficulties in young children. 
Although both conditions were correlated with feeding difficulties among 
siblings and problems with breast-feeding, the vomiting group differed 
significantly in weight compared to a no-problem control group. The colic 
group experienced more diarrhea, and their mothers experienced more 
physical problems during pregnancy, including anemia, hypertonia, and 
sciatica. 

5. Assessment of Subclinical Feeding Concerns 

The previous discussion clarifies that deviations in children's feeding 
patterns can evolve as a result of biological, conditioning, social, and/or 
behavioral factors. Assessment of feeding and associated factors is needed 
in order to determine whether the patterns are of clinical concern and how 
best to respond to them. 

When concerns about feeding-related behaviors arise, parents are first 
likely to address these issues with the child's pediatrician. In assessing the 
degree of severity of a feeding problem, health professionals evaluate 
physical growth by comparing the child's height, weight, and head cir­
cumference with a set of national norms (Hamill et al., 1979). A more 
detailed assessment of physical growth can include triceps skinfold mea­
surements and arm circumference measurements. The health professional 
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also looks for any telltale signs of specific vitamin and/ or mineral deficien­
cies (Pipes & Trahms, 1993). Typically, the child is deemed to be growth 
deficient if the weight for height falls below the 5th percentile, or exceeds 
the 95th percentile, if the child's growth is accelerating or decelerating 
markedly, or if the child is showing any signs of specific nutritional defi­
ciencies (e.g., degeneration of the retina in vitamin A deficiency) (for a 
review, see Walker & Hendricks, 1985). 

Even when feeding problems are thought to be minor, physical or 
organic causes for the child's difficulties need to be ruled out through 
medical examination. Depending on the medical findings, the child may 
be referred to a variety of health-care professionals. For example, should 
questions arise about the child's ability to chew and swallow, a referral 
may be made to an occupational therapist, a speech/language pathologist, 
or another oral-motor feeding specialist. When dietary patterns appear 
inadequate, nutritionists are often consulted. When social, behavioral, or 
emotional aspects of the child or family environment are posited to con­
tribute to feeding concerns, referrals may be made to psychologists or 
social workers. 

Mental health assessment of children with mild, feeding-related prob­
lems typically entails a clinical interview, observation, and parent-collected 
records of relevant feeding patterns. The content and structure of feeding 
assessments for more serious clinical cases have been described elsewhere 
(e.g., Kedesdy & Budd, in press; Linscheid et al., 1995; Luiselli,1989; Satter, 
1986a), and segments from these sources are suggested here for mild 
problems. Although the current discussion pertains to assessment of 
feeding-related behavior, the clinician typically gathers information on 
broader aspects of the child's functioning (e.g., developmental status, 
behavioral adjustment at home and school, current stressful family condi­
tions) (d. Schroeder & Gordon, 1991). 

When interviewing parents about their child's feeding difficulties, it is 
important to gather information about the following topics: (1) the specific 
nature of their child's feeding problem, (2) the factors that precede and 
follow the problematic behavior, (3) when the problem began and how the 
parents believe it developed, (4) fluctuations in the problem (e.g., "Does it 
vary depending on who feeds the child?"), (5) how the problem has been 
handled and prior professional consultation related to the problem, (6) the 
impact of the problem on mealtimes, (7) what typical meals include, (8) the 
child's food likes and dislikes, (9) the child's typical feeding schedule, and 
(10) who else eats with the child. With older children, many of these 
questions can be asked directly of the child. This can be particularly 
helpful when the problem is specific to settings outside of the home (e.g., 
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school). Exploring possible peer influences can be important in these cases 
as well. 

To supplement the interview, a written questionnaire may be helpful 
for gathering information about caregivers' perceptions of the child's feed­
ing problems. The Children's Eating Behavior Inventory (CEBI) is de­
signed to screen for mealtime problems in 2- to 12-year-old children (Ar­
cher, Rosenbaum, & Streiner, 1991). The CEBI is a relatively recent measure 
and thus has been subjected to limited research; however, it has been 
shown to differentiate clinic from nonclinic populations. A more general 
child behavior questionnaire, such as the Eyberg Child Behavior Inventory 
(Eyberg & Ross, 1978) or the Child Behavior Checklist (Achenbach, 1991, 
1992) also is useful for examining the range and intensity of child diffi­
culties perceived by the parents. These instruments are widely used and 
have been validated through extensive psychometric research; however, 
they each contain only one or two items directly related to feeding, and 
neither applies to children under 2 years of age. 

In addition to questioning the parent about feeding practices and 
mealtime routines, observing a meal in the clinic setting is highly informa­
tive in learning how parent and child interact during meals and relating 
their interactions to the presenting concerns. If the clinical concerns relate 
to mouthing nonfood substances, spitting up, vomiting, or colic, it may be 
helpful to observe parent-child interactions outside of feedings (e.g., by 
simulating the conditions in which the problem is most likely to occur). 
Collecting sample menus and daily records of the child's food intake and 
other behaviors of concern (e.g., vomiting, prolonged crying) can provide 
insight into how often the child eats during the day, who else is present 
during meals, who is responsible for the child's feeding, and when prob­
lematic behaviors occur. It is also important to get a sense of other factors 
that might be contributing to the presenting concerns, such as the child's 
activity level, the parent's knowledge of an age-appropriate diet for the 
child, and the parent's ability to afford sufficient food. 

In cases of clinical disorders, Drotar and Crawford (1987) advocate the 
use of home observation in assessing children, suggesting that factors that 
are influential in the home may not be readily observable in clinic settings. 
For children with persistent feeding difficulties, Budd, Chugh, and Berry 
(in press) describe how home observations can provide information that 
is different from data gleaned from clinic observations. Having parents 
record an audiotape or videotape sample of the problem at home can be 
highly useful for depicting behavioral characteristics and parental man­
agement strategies (Madison & Adubato, 1984). This information is then 
used to develop appropriate intervention strategies. For subclinical devia-
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tions from normal feeding, however, simple information gathering is often 
sufficient for helping the parent to begin addressing the presenting con­
cerns. 

6. Management Approaches 

Mild feeding conc~rns may be handled in several different ways, 
depending on whether the assessment reveals that the patterns are, in fact, 
developmentally inappropriate and whether parents are motivated to 
change aspects of the child's environment or their child-related interac­
tions. Parents may receive informal suggestions in the form of anticipatory 
guidance, or a mental health professional may introduce parents to spe­
cific techniques, such as those listed in Table 2. The most commonly used 
techniques for mild, feeding-related concerns include repeated exposure, 
modeling, differential attention, stimulus control, and various combina­
tions of behavior management strategies. 

6.1. Anticipatory Guidance 

Anticipatory guidance, often offered by the pediatrician, is essentially 
a prevention effort (Brazelton, 1995). It involves providing advice and 
information at well-child visits about how to handle typical developmen­
tal progressions (e.g., introducing solid foods) and responding adaptively 
to children's ploys (e.g., insisting on having cookies for breakfast). Provid-

TABLE 2 
Management Approaches to Mild Feeding Problems 

Behavioral 
technique 

Repeated 
exposure 

Modeling 

Differential 
attention 

Stimulus control 

Key concept 

Regularly present the child with new foods and foods initially 
rejected, and encourage sampling of these foods. 

Provide opportunities for the child to observe others who 
exhibit the desired behaviors and who receive reinforcement 
for doing so. 

Follow desired behaviors with praise and positive conse­
quences, and follow undesired behaviors with the brief re­
moval of attention. 

Arrange events or conditions associated with reinforcement of 
the desired behavior to occur regularly, and remove stimuli 
associated with undesired behavior. 
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ing parents with guidance about what to expect with the developing child 
is likely to assuage some fears parents might have. For example, simply 
reminding parents about the normal development of feeding practices, 
suggesting healthy foods that often are attractive to children, and empha­
sizing that appetites vary considerably in early childhood may prevent 
mealtimes from becoming a source of undue stress and worry. Primary 
care professionals may also ask parents about their infant's cues of satiety 
(i.e., spitting out the nipple, dozing off during feedings, biting or playing 
with nipple) and encourage them to respond to these signals to prevent 
problems related to overfeeding. For infant colic, pediatricians typically 
offer parents tips on possible ways to reduce crying, including using a 
pacifier, laying the infant prone, rocking, or swaddling (Hewson et al., 
1987). 

Unfortunately, as Reisinger and Bires (1980) found, anticipatory guid­
ance makes up only a small fraction of the typical well-child visit (approx­
imately 8% of the total time spent with the pediatrician). As noted previ­
ously, lack of nutritional knowledge on the part of the parent has been 
implicated in the poor nutrition of children (e.g., Pugliese et al., 1987). 
Although feeding appears to be the area of most discussion during well­
child visits (Reisinger & Bires, 1980), the amount of time is still very low 
and appears to be insufficient for the effective prevention of problems 
around feeding. 

To assist pediatricians in offering anticipatory guidance within this 
limited time frame, written guidelines have been developed for parents 
around typical feeding concerns. For example, Finney (1986) summarized 
behavior management techniques that can be used to prevent common 
feeding problems. Pamphlets (e.g., National Live Stock and Meat Board, 
1992) illustrating recommended dietary ingredients and serving sizes for 
children provide useful ideas for planning meals and snacks. However, 
little research has examined the effects of these methods as prevention or 
remediation strategies for mild, feeding-related problems. 

6.2. Repeated Exposure and Modeling 

Of the many factors that affect a child's food preferences, exposure 
and modeling can be utilized as strategies for dealing with mild food 
selectivity in children. For instance, one method for increasing children's 
range of food preferences is to present new foods to them repeatedly. 
Several studies support the effectiveness of repeated exposure of foods in 
enhancing children's preference for these foods (e.g., Birch & Marlin, 1982; 
Pliner, 1982; Sullivan & Birch, 1990). Although it may be tempting for 
parents to give up presenting a food the child initially rejects, repeated 
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exposure to that food increases the chances that the child will sample it and 
eventually like it. Birch and Marlin's (1982) research suggests that chil­
dren's preferences for novel foods change after a mean of 10 exposures to 
them. However, although the logic of repeated exposure is persuasive, and 
research in laboratory settings suggests its effectiveness, it has yet to be 
studied as a clinical strategy with children who exhibit mild or severe 
feeding problems. 

Another way to change children's feeding behavior is through model­
ing. Christophersen and Hall (1978) suggest that when parents want their 
child to eat fewer snack foods, the parents themselves should try to avoid 
eating these foods in front of their children. Correspondingly, arranging 
for the child to observe others, particularly a person valued highly by the 
child, eating a particular food can increase the likelihood that the child will 
try it as well (Greer, Dorow, Williams, McCorkle, & Asnes, 1991). Support 
for the notion that modeling is important in the shaping of children's 
consumption patterns is given by Birch (1980). This research demonstrates 
the effects of peers' food choices on the types of food the target children 
request. Specifically, 17 children in this study were asked to rate their 
preferences for various vegetables. During lunchtime, these children were 
matched with several other children who strongly disliked one of the 
target child's favorite foods, and who strongly liked one of the target 
child's least preferred foods. At each meal, all of the children were asked to 
select one of two vegetables for lunch that day. The two vegetables were 
the same for each meal. Records for each child were collected over 4 
consecutive days. While 15 of the 17 target children initially chose the food 
they indicated they preferred most, by day 4, 10 of the 17 chose the food 
they originally indicated they liked least. Birch explains these shifts in food 
choice in terms of the modeling effect of the children's peers. 

6.3. Differential Attention 

Because parent-child mealtime interactions have been posited to con­
tribute to the development and/ or maintenance of feeding patterns, help­
ing parents to alter their methods of responding to their child is a logical 
approach to changing their child's feeding behavior. Differential attention 
is based on operant conditioning and refers to the purposeful giving of 
attention to strengthen certain behaviors, and the purposeful removal of 
attention to weaken others (Bijou & Baer, 1965). For example, if the goal is 
to increase the number of bites of vegetables a child eats during a meal and 
to decrease the child's refusal of vegetables, using differential attention 
would involve having the parent provide positive attention (e.g., praise 
and approval) immediately after the child takes a bite of vegetables and to 
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remove attention (i.e., briefly ignore the child) when refusals or food 
complaints occur. Social praise may be paired intermittently with tangible 
rewards, such as a favored drink or access to a toy, in order to strengthen 
the reinforcing value. Parents' ability to learn and use these techniques 
effectively with their children during mealtimes has been well docu­
mented (e.g., Stark, Powers, Jelalian, Rape, & Miller, 1994; Werle, Murphy, 
& Budd, 1993). 

Differential attention also forms a core ingredient of strategies for 
modifying other mild, feeding-related problems. To reduce children's 
overeating, parents can provide social approval for eating "healthy" foods, 
eating at planned times and locations, and engaging in alternative behav­
iors such as physical exercise (Kirschenbaum et al., 1987). Finney, Russo, 
and Cataldo (1982) showed that pica in children with lead poisoning can be 
reduced by providing social reinforcement and food treats for increasing 
periods of time without any mouthing of inedible objects (i.e., differential 
reinforcement of other behavior-ORO). This study suggests the viability 
of using ORO to decrease less severe forms of mouthing as well. However, 
given that mouthing nonfood items appears to be a developmentally 
normative behavior in infants that provides oral stimulation, ensuring the 
child's access to safe mouthing toys and precluding access to dangerous 
items (as noted in section 6.4) may be more productive than social atten­
tion alone. Problematic behaviors such as sloppy eating, eating too fast or 
too slow, packing food in the mouth, and resisting use of utensils also can 
be approached through differential attention procedures. By identifying 
acceptable alternative responses, parents can shift their attention from 
disruptive or dawdling tactics to occasions of appropriate eating styles. 

Behavior management techniques have less relevance to reducing 
behaviors such as spitting up, vomiting, or colicky crying, because these 
patterns are thought to be determined largely by maturational factors. 
Still, differential attention principles are helpful to keep in mind, mainly to 
avoid the parent's unintentional reinforcement of these patterns through 
excessive social attention. 

Some controversy exists about the efficacy of differential attention 
techniques to modify feeding patterns in normally developing children or 
those with mild feeding problems. Birch (1990) has cautioned, based on her 
research, that preschool-aged children are able to decipher obvious praise 
or food rewards for eating certain foods as a "ploy," and she notes that, 
over time, these foods are likely to be less, rather than more, attractive to 
children. This caution implies that reinforcement should not be the pri­
mary means used to shape a child's food patterns. Because Birch's work 
was carried out in a laboratory, preschool setting with normal children, it is 
unclear whether her findings are directly applicable to the family mealtime 
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setting with children who exhibit mild feeding problems. However, con­
sidering that children's feeding patterns are influenced by many variables, 
including appetite, exposure, and social contingencies, it makes sense to 
structure the timing of eating opportunities to take advantage of children's 
hunger. Likewise, it seems wise to incorporate other techniques (e.g., 
modeling, stimulus control) that can assist the child in developing desir­
able eating habits. 

6.4. Stimulus Control 

Arranging events or conditions that are associated with reinforcement 
for specific behaviors is another strategy for influencing the likelihood of 
these behaviors. Stimulus control involves repeatedly pairing a particular 
stimulus with reinforcement for engaging in the desired behavior (Bijou & 
Baer, 1965). For example, if a boy is routinely fed when sitting in a booster 
seat with his bib on at the kitchen table, he learns to associate the booster 
seat, bib, and table with eating occasions. Instructions to him can acquire 
stimulus control when they are systematically followed with praise or 
other positive consequences for compliance. For example, by telling him to 
"Blow on the soup to cool it off," and then praising him for doing so, a 
parent is using stimulus control tactics to teach the child how to eat hot 
foods safely. Another variation on this tactic is to provide a child with a 
choice between two alternatives (e.g., offering the child either applesauce 
or a banana), thereby setting the occasion for social reinforcement of the 
selected option. 

Stimulus control also can be used to decrease problematic behaviors 
by removing stimuli associated with the behavior. Sucking or mouthing 
nonfood items is an example of a behavior that can be decreased via 
stimulus control. With the exception of addressing immediate health con­
cerns based on what the child ingested (e.g., household cleaners), mouthing 
nonnutritive items often can be handled by "child-proofing" the environ­
ment to ensure that access to unsafe products is restricted. Alternatively, 
teaching the child to discriminate items that are inedible may be helpful 
(Finney et al., 1982). 

Shaping of the environment can also be helpful with children who 
overeat or who eat too much "junk food." Making high-calorie snack foods 
less available and more healthy foods accessible can have an obvious and 
immediate effect on the child's consumption patterns. This would also 
likely impact the consumption patterns of others in the house, which 
would change the modeling the target child receives. Parental monitoring 
can help by determining the situations in which the child is likely to 
overeat. If it is determined, for instance, that television watching is highly 
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associated with the eating of high-calorie snack food, a stimulus control 
approach might involve providing the child with low-calorie snack foods 
during these times, or limiting television watching during eating. 

6.5. Bibliographical Strategies 

The option of receiving advice and guidance in behavior management 
strategies from a health-care professional is not always possible for parents 
because of time and/ or monetary considerations. In a few studies, the use 
of printed materials, or bibliotherapy, has been shown to produce positive 
results in terms of teaching behavioral techniques for altering the parents' 
and, as a result, the child's mealtime behaviors. McMahon and Forehand 
(1978) demonstrated that a brochure detailing the principles of differential 
attention and time-out was useful in teaching these principles to parents 
and in reducing inappropriate mealtime behaviors of the children. Bau­
man, Reiss, Rogers, and Bailey (1983) demonstrated the effectiveness of 
their advice package for taking children to restaurants. Their study found 
that parents could improve the mealtime situation simply by reading the 
brochure and implementing it on their own. Advice given in the package 
included specifying to their children the behaviors appropriate for the 
setting and structuring the setting in the restaurant (e.g., choosing a booth 
away from the crowd, separating the children, moving silverware from the 
children's reach, bringing toys for the children to play with prior to the 
beginning of the meal, removing toys when food arrives). The advice 
package was successful in helping the parents reduce their children's 
inappropriate mealtime behavior, and parents rated the package as being 
helpful to them. 

7. Conclusions 

Mild feeding difficulties, such as finicky eating habits, overeating, 
mouthing nonfood items, spitting up and vomiting, and colic, are quite 
common across childhood. A variety of biological, conditioning, social, 
and behavioral factors can contribute to the development, exacerbation, 
and maintenance of disturbances in the feeding practices of children. 
These disturbances can have negative effects on the child, the parents, and 
their interactions. In order to differentiate subclinical from clinical feeding 
problems and to determine if intervention is appropriate, a thorough 
assessment needs to be conducted. While mild feeding problems some­
times can be prevented through anticipatory guidance, behavioral strate­
gies (e.g., repeated exposure, modeling, differential attention, and stim-
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ulus control), alone and in combination, are promising strategies for man­
aging common feeding concerns. More attention has been paid to finicky 
eating and overeating; less investigation has been made into applications 
of behavior management to other subclinical feeding problems. 

Review of the current knowledge on prevalence, etiology, and treat­
ment of common feeding-related concerns suggests several fruitful areas 
for further research. First, because most research has concentrated on 
nonproblem samples or on clinically severe manifestations of feeding 
problems, relatively less is known about interventions with children who 
display mild feeding deviations. For example, studies with normative 
samples suggest that repeated exposure to novel foods results in children's 
increased preference for these foods (Birch, 1990). Is repeated exposure to 
nonpreferred foods an effective method for increasing preference and food 
acceptance in children with mild food selectivity, or are additional strate­
gies (i.e., social contingencies, withholding of preferred foods) needed? 
Similarly, a small literature suggests that bibliographic methods are suffi­
cient to teach parents how to increase children's cooperation during meal­
times (Bauman et al., 1983; McMahon & Forehand, 1978). Can parents of 
mildly overweight children learn to safely modify their children's dietary 
intake (and related behaviors) through a bibliographic approach? The 
effectiveness of such low-cost interventions would seem to be a valuable 
topic of study, given the prevalence of mild feeding problems in children. 

A second area for further research relates to the lack of objective 
criteria for distinguishing clinical feeding problems from subclinical feed­
ing problems. In order for researchers to communicate effectively about 
the prevalence, impact, and modification of mild, feeding-related condi­
tions, a common set of definitions for mild feeding deviations is needed. 
The wide discrepancy among prevalence estimates of pediatric feeding 
problems underscores the need for more precise terminology and data 
gathering. 

Although, in many cases, the subclinical problems of mouthing, spit­
ting up, vomiting, and colic are sufficiently benign or short-lived that they 
do not require professional intervention, these behaviors nevertheless are 
worrisome and stressful for parents. A third research topic suggested by 
the current review entails examining how these problematic patterns are 
actually handled by parents. It would be informative to compare parents' 
methods of responding to specific subclinical feeding problems with the 
methods health-care professionals recommend. Such descriptive research 
could identify effective versus ineffective parental strategies, culturally 
specific practices, and caregiving practices that signal the need for profes­
sional attention (such as misinterpreting normal mouthing or spitting up 
as intentional child misbehavior). Research suggests that it is the accumu-
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lated, everyday stresses of child rearing, rather than extreme incidents, 
that frustrate parents and can escalate into child maltreatment (Wolfe, 
1988). Common feeding-related problems represent one such area of vul­
nerability; thus, practicing clinicians need to be versed in methods of 
assessing and counseling parents regarding everyday feeding concerns. 
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7 New Developments 
in Assessing Pediatric 

Anxiety Disorders 

JOHN S. MARCH AND ANNE MARIE ALBANO 

1. Introduction 

Presumably because it is associated with significant suffering, disruption 
in normal psychosocial and academic development and also family func­
tioning, pathological anxiety is among the more common causes of referral 
to children's mental health-care providers (Black, 1995a; Simon, Ormel, 
VonKorff, & Barlow, 1995). From a diagnostic point of view, however, fears 
and anxieties are ubiquitous, so that clinicians and researchers interested 
in childhood anxiety disorders face the daunting task of differentiating 
pathological anxiety from fears occurring as a part of normal developmen­
tal processes (Costello & Angold, 1995c). Ideally, diagnostic tools designed 
specifically to assess anxiety in young persons should (1) provide reliable 
and valid ascertainment of symptoms across multiple symptom domains; 
(2) discriminate symptom clusters; (3) evaluate severity; (4) incorporate 
and reconcile multiple observations, such as parent and child ratings; and 
(5) be sensitive to treatment-induced change in symptoms. Other factors 
influencing instrument selection include the reasons for the assessment 
(e.g., screening, diagnosis, or monitoring treatment outcome), as well as 
time required for administration, level of training necessary to administer 
and/ or interpret the instrument, reading level, and cost. With the increas­
ing emphasis on multidisciplinary approaches to assessment and treat-
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ment, assessment tools also must facilitate communication not only among 
clinicians, but also between clinicians and regulatory bodies such as utili­
zation review committees within managed care environments. 

While currently available instruments fall well short of these goals, a 
complex matrix of tools for assessing normal and pathological anxieties is 
now available, potentially making the choice of instruments for evaluating 
a particular child or adolescent seem daunting. In this chapter, we describe 
recent important developments in the assessment of anxiety in children 
and adolescents. Excellent reviews of pediatric anxiety disorders in gen­
eral (March, 1995), and assessment issues in particular (Barrios & Hart­
mann, 1988; March & Albano, 1996) are available. The interested reader is 
referred to these general reviews and to more specific reviews for a de­
tailed discuss of assessment tools (March & Albano, 1996; McNally, 1991; 
Thyer, 1991; Wolff & Wolff, 1991), neuropsychological assessment (Conners, 
March, Erhardt, & Butcher, 1995; Hooper & March, 1995), structured inter­
views (Kearney & Silverman, 1990; Silverman, 1991, 1994), developmental 
nosology (Rutter, Tuma, Lann, & Irma, 1988; Weiss et a1., 1991), observa­
tional measures (Barrios & Hartmann, 1988), and family assessment 
(Dadds, Barrett, Rapee, & Ryan, 1996). 

2. Background 

2.1. Developmental Perspective 

Since most fears occurring during childhood are developmentally 
appropriate to the context in which they occur, anxiety usually refers to 
developmentally inappropriate fears or to developmentally appropriate 
fears that produce excessive distress or dysfunction (Barrios & Hartman, 
1988; March & Albano, 1996). Phobias are excessive and disruptive fears 
that are attached to specific objects and usually provide avoidance, such as 
the fear of snakes or heights. Anxiety is typically more diffuse than either 
normative fear or specific phobias, so that it is attached to myriad different 
situations and events. Thus, one distinguishing feature of anxiety-as in 
separation or generalized anxiety disorders-as contrasted to phobias, is 
that the latter are more sharply circumscribed. Nonetheless, the distinction 
is to some extent academic. For example, social phobia can be both gener­
alized (fear or rejection or embarrassment in a variety of social situations) 
and narrowly defined (circumscribed public-speaking anxiety). Similarly, 
traumatic simple phobias grade into posttraumatic stress disorder (PTSD) 
insofar as anxiety is diffuse and phobias tend to generalize into an ever­
widening circle of life circumstances. 
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Anxiety disorders are best viewed as comprised of sets of related fears 
or worries selected from among common fears that are present during 
childhood. Based on a rather large literature focused mostly on validating 
clusters of symptoms, the DSM-IV includes four specifically childhood­
onset anxiety disorders: Generalized Anxiety Disorder, Social Phobia, Se­
lective Mutism, Separation Anxiety Disorder (SAD; and its older age 
correlate, Panic Disorder [PD]) (American Psychiatric Association, 1994). 
Clinically, fears become pathological when excessive, unremitting, out of 
sequence developmentally, and/or when they are associated with mal­
adaptive coping behaviors. In DSM-IV, fears that are normative are said to 
become anxiety disorders when they induce distress and dysfunction. 

Despite substantial face validity, the DSM taxonomy reflects expert 
consensus rather than empirical findings regarding the true clustering of 
anxiety symptoms in the pediatric population (Shaffer, 1989); empirical 
support in some cases is questionable (Beidel, 1991b). Recently, in an effort 
to make OSM-IV more relevant to pediatric psychiatry, several OSM-III-R 
anxiety disorders of childhood (Overanxious and Avoidant Disorders, in 
particular) were collapsed into the adult categories (Generalized Anxiety 
Disorders and Social Phobia, respectively). However, the DSM-IV criteria 
sets themselves do not in general reflect a developmental perspective 
(Cantwell & Baker, 1988; Costello & Angold, 1995b), and it therefore falls to 
the clinician to translate the OSM-IV into terms that are relevant for the 
age, gender, and cultural background of the child. 

Children with Generalized Anxiety Disorder are typically charac­
terized as perfectionistic "worriers" who are constantly asking for reas­
surance (Silverman & Ginsburg, 1995). Children with Social Phobia show 
an exaggerated concern with self-presentation (Albano, 1995; Albano, Di­
Bartolo, Heimberg, & Barlow, 1995). Constantly in fear of saying or doing 
something foolish or embarrassing, they are exquisitely sensitive to rejec­
tion and humiliation and often feel socially scrutinized, which they usually 
handle by avoiding social interchange, particularly where it involves pub­
lic speaking (Beidel & Morris, 1995). Selective Mutism is a subset of Social 
Phobia, in which younger children will not talk (despite normal language) 
to other than "safe" friends and adults (Black & Uhde, 1995; Leonard & 
Dow, 1995). Separation Anxiety Disorder (SAD) is characterized by an 
intense fear of harm surrounding important attachment figures. While the 
literature on SAD is considerably less robust than the Adult Panic Disorder 
literature (Black, 1995b), many researchers now suspect that separation 
anxiety and panic disorder (PD) reflect developmentally different presen­
tations of the same underlying diathesis, much like Selective Mutism is a 
youthful variant of Social Phobia (King, Ollendick, & Mattis, 1994; Ollen­
dick & Huntzinger, 1990; Ollendick, Mattis, & King, 1994). As with PO, 
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SAD typically begins with somatic/autonomic complaints, with symp­
toms when escalating to full panic and, understandably, to activation of 
attachment mechanisms as a means of coping with panic. Thus, the fear of 
not being able to escape to a safe place in PD is not unlike the need to have 
a parent immediately available in SAD; both involve acute proximity 
seeking as a means of arousal/fear reduction (Black, 1995b; Ollendick et 
aI., 1994). Nevertheless, despite epidemiological evidence suggesting a 
strong association between parental anxiety disorder, behavioral inhi­
bition in offspring, and subsequent childhood-onset separation/panic 
symptoms (Rosenbaum et aI., 1991, 1992), the assertion that separation is 
simply a youthful variant of PD remains controversial (Black & Robbins, 
1990; Kearney & Silverman, 1991, 1992). 

Comorbidity among the anxiety disorders, and between the anxiety 
disorders and other internalizing and externalizing disorders, complicates 
the diagnostic picture (see Albano, Chorpita, DiBartolo, & Barlow, 1996). 
For example, a wide variety of specific phobias commonly accompany the 
anxiety disorders, including fear of the dark, monsters, kidnappers, bugs, 
small animals, heights, and open or enclosed spaces. Nighttime fears, 
resistance to going to bed, difficulty falling asleep alone or sleeping 
through the night alone, and nightmares involving separation themes are 
not uncommon. These specific phobic symptoms are common triggers for 
panic/ separation anxiety and are responsible for many of the avoidance 
and ritualized anxiety-reducing behaviors (Black, 1995b). Anxious chil­
dren also show high rates of comorbid depression (Curry & Murphy, 1995). 
In younger children, SAD precedes depression in approximately two­
thirds of cases and may form the nidus for recurrent affective illness and 
PD if left untreated (Kovacs, Feinberg, & Crouse, 1984). 

Anxiety symptoms vary with developmental stage, and longitudinal 
comorbidity is as, if not more, important than cross-sectional comorbidity. 
Thus, when considering how best to inventory anxiety symptoms, it is 
necessary to first consider the severity and age-dependent prevalence of 
fears (Rutter, 1993a). For example, certain specific phobias, such as night­
time fears, are age dependent in that they are much more common in 
preschool and early elementary-school children (King, Tonge, & Ollen­
dick, 1992). When present in older children, however, such fears may more 
reliably be seen as indicating psychopathological anxiety. Similarly, sep­
aration anxiety seems more prominent in younger children, where it is 
developmentally appropriate in very young children and becomes in­
creasingly less appropriate as the child moves through middle childhood 
into adolescence (Black, 1992). Other fears, such as fears about self­
presentation and, consequently, social phobia become more common as 
children mature into adolescence (Costello & Angold, 1995a). Clinically, 
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for example, many children first present with behavioral inhibition and 
subsequently proceed to prepubertal separation anxiety and later to PD as 
adolescents (Biederman, Rosenbaum, Chaloff, & Kagan, 1995). 

3. Self-Report Measures 

3.1. Overview 

As noted earlier, a wide variety of normal fears and worries are 
omnipresent among youth; pathological anxieties are less common but not 
rare (Costello & Angold, 1995c; Ollendick, Matson, & Helsel, 1985). Cogni­
tive targets, such as separation fears or social anxiety, appear to undergo a 
developmentally sanctioned progression (Keller et aI., 1992; Last, Strauss, 
& Francis, 1987). Some symptoms, such as refusing to attend school in the 
patient with PD and agoraphobia, are readily observable; other symptoms, 
such as interoceptive panic cues, are open only to child introspection and 
thus to child self-report. Unfortunately, because of a lack of acceptable 
measurement tools (March & Albano, 1996), the age-specific population 
prevalence of these childhood-onset fears, and even more, the factor struc­
ture of anxiety symptoms in community samples, has until now remained 
unclear, as has the relative importance of specific anxiety dimensions 
within gender, ethnic, or cultural groupings across time (Costello & An­
gold, 1995c; Last, Perrin, Hersen, & Kazdin, 1992). 

Though interview techniques are necessary for diagnosis, self-report 
measures of anxiety, which provide an opportunity for children to reveal 
internal or "hidden" experience, are uniquely suited to examining the 
developmental epidemiology of anxiety symptoms and how they cluster 
together in the real world. Typically, self-report measures use a Likert-type 
scale format in which a child is asked to rate each questionnaire item in an 
ordinal format anchored to frequency or distress/impairment, or a combi­
nation of the two. For example, a child might be asked to rate "I feel tense" 
on a four-point frequency dimension that ranges from Almost Never to 
Often. Self-report measures are easy to administer, require a minimum of 
clinician time, and economically capture a wide range of important anxiety 
dimensions from the child's point of view. Taken together, these features 
also make self-report measures ideally suited to gathering data prior to the 
initial evaluation, because self-report measures used in this fashion in­
crease clinician efficiency by facilitating accurate assessment of the prior 
probability that a particular child will or will not have symptoms within a 
specific symptom domain. 

Currently published self-report pediatric anxiety scales for the most 
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part represent age-downward extensions of adult measures (March & 
Albano, 1996). The Fear Survey Schedule for Children-Revised (FSSC-R; 
Ollendick, 1983) focuses primarily on phobic symptoms, including fear of 
failure and criticism, fear of the unknown, fear of injury and small animals, 
fear of danger and death, and medical fears. Another widely used scale, 
the Revised Children's Manifest Anxiety Scale (RCMAS), provides three 
factors: physiological manifestations of anxiety, worry and oversensitivity, 
and fear/concentration (Reynolds & Paget, 1981). However, the presence 
of mood, attentional, impulsivity, and peer-interaction items on the 
RCMAS clearly confounds other diagnoses, such as attention-deficit/ 
hyperactivity disorders (ADHD) and major depression (Perrin & Last, 
1992). Another widely used measure, the State-Trait Anxiety Inventory for 
Children (STAIC; Spielberger, Gorsuch, & Luchene, 1976), consists of two 
independent, 20-item inventories that assess anxiety symptoms from a 
variety of domains but do not by any means exhaustively cover the 
symptom constellations represented in DSM~IV. The State scale purports 
to assess present-state and situation-linked anxiety; the Trait scale ad­
dresses temporally stable anxiety across situations. Numerous authors 
have questioned the validity of the state-trait distinction (Kendall, Finch, 
Auerbach, Hooke, & Mikulka, 1976), and the nature of item selection for 
the STAIC (Finch, Kendall, & Montgomery, 1976; Perrin & Last, 1992). 
Thus, clinicians and researchers generally agree (see, e.g., Jensen, Salzberg, 
Richters, & Watanabe, 1993; March & Albano, 1996) that new instruments 
are necessary if the field of pediatric anxiety disorders is to progress 
scien tificall y. 

3.2. The Multidimensional Anxiety Scale for Children (MASC) 

For these and other reasons, March and colleagues recently described 
the development and psychometric properties of a new pediatric self­
report anxiety scale, the Multidimensional Anxiety Scale for Children 
(MASC; March, Parker, Sullivan, Stallings, & Conners, 1997). Table 1 sum­
marizes differences between the MASC and other widely available instru­
ments. Unlike older assessment tools, the MASC represents the population 
factor structure of anxiety and captures clinically relevant anxiety symp­
toms at both the factor and item level; viewed within and across factors, it 
approximates the DSM-IV pediatric anxiety disorders, shows excellent 
internal and test-retest reliability, and finally, demonstrates both conver­
gent and divergent validity for depression and externalizing symptoms 
(March et al., 1997). 

The MASC takes a somewhat different approach to identifying and 
labeling anxiety symptoms than that taken in DSM-IV (Widiger et al., 
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TABLE 1 
Anxiety Rating Scales 

MASC RCMAS FSSCR STAI-C 

Broad conceptualization Yes Yes No Yes 
Specific dimensions Yes Three Phobias No 
Approximates DSM-IV Yes No No No 
Reliable Yes Yes Yes Trait scale 
Convergent validity Yes Yes Yes Yes 
Divergent validity Yes No No No 

1996). In contrast to a categorical approach based on investigator's beliefs 
about the nature and course of fears and worries in pediatric samples, the 
MASC was developed to sample key anxiety symptoms from the universe 
of anxiety symptoms that has captured the attention of clinicians and 
researchers working with anxious children and adolescents (March et al., 
1997). Only the most important symptoms and symptom clusters survived 
this process, so that the MASC can be seen as representing the population 
factor structure of anxiety in pediatric samples. Within each factor and 
sub factor, the specific items included in the MASC are those that proved to 
be psychometrically most robust with respect to a particular symptom 
domain. Stated differently, the items in the MASC were selected empiri­
cally, unlike the items in the DSM-IV, which, although validated in other 
ways, did not come from a "field" trial looking for the best and most 
important items comprising anxiety symptoms in the youth. 

The MASC consists of 39 items distributed across four major factors, 
three of which can be parsed into two subfactors each (Table 2). Main and 
sub factors include (1) physical symptoms (tense/restless and somatic/ 
autonomic), (2) social anxiety (humiliation/rejection and public perfor­
mance fears), (3) harm avoidance (perfectionism and anxious coping), and 

TABLE 2 
MASC Factors 

Physical symptoms 
Tense 
Somatic 

Harm avoidance 
Perfectionism 
Anxious coping 

Social anxiety 
Humiliation fears 
Performance fears 

Separation/panic 
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(4) separation anxiety. Multisample confirmatory factor analysis demon­
strates that the four-factor solution for the 39 MASC items is equivalent for 
males and females, as well as for younger and older children. As expected, 
females show greater anxiety on all factors and sub factors than males 
(March et al., 1997). 

The empirically derived MASC factor structure to some extent vali­
dates the DSM-IV diagnostic clusters of social phobia, separation/panic 
and, averaged across all four factors, generalized anxiety disorder. Addi­
tionally, the hypothesized division of anxiety into physical symptoms and 
approach-avoidance behaviors also received empirical support. This is 
not particularly surprising, because social phobia and separation anxiety 
represent external threats; conversely, physical symptoms and harm 
avoidance represent physical and behavioral responses to threat, respec­
tively. Both have received substantial support in the literature (March & 
Albano, 1996), but until now, no single scale has allowed their ascertain­
ment in relationship to each other in the individual child or in subgroup­
ings of children. 

The factor structure of the MASC also is unique among extant scales 
in its subdivision of main factors into subfactors with considerable explan­
atory power in their own right. Although almost all correlations between 
MASC factors and sub factors are significantly correlated, the absolute 
magnitude of the shared variance is in the low to moderate range for most 
pairs (March et al., 1997). This suggests that the MASC is indeed measur­
ing separate dimensions of anxiety, even at the sub factor level, which in 
turn should make it ideally suited to discriminate patterns of anxiety in 
subgroups of children with anxiety disorders. 

Last, the MASC shows excellent internal and test-retest reliability. 
Internal reliability-defined as consistency between items within a group 
of items comprising a discrete factor (Chronbach, 1970) for the MASC­
ranges from .7 to .9 for all main factors and subfactors. Thus, the individual 
items share factor-level variance but also contribute unique variance to the 
specified constructs. Stated differently, the individual items are not redun­
dant with respect to information content, which is what one would want in 
a scale purporting to measure individual symptoms with unique clinical 
validity. In contrast to internal reliability, test-retest reliability represents 
consistency in a set of scores by the same rater (single case intraclass 
correlation coefficient; ICC) or set of raters (mean ICC) over time (Shrout & 
Fleiss, 1979). Test-retest reliability varies with the conditions under which 
the test is administered, practice or memory effects, and true change in the 
variable(s) of interest plus an instability component due to measurement 
error attributable to the instrument itself. Without adequate test-retest 
reliability, it is not possible to determine whether differences in scores 
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between individuals or within-subjects' over time are due to "true" differ­
ences or to "chance" error. Using the mean ICC, which enumerates the true 
variance accounted for as a proportion of the total variance plus error 
(Shrout & Fleiss, 1979), the MASC shows good to excellent test-retest 
reliability at 3 weeks (ICC = .78) and 3 months (ICC = .93). Although these 
findings are not dissimilar to those for the RCMAS (Wisniewski, Mulick, & 
Coury, 1987), the FSSC-R (Ollendick, 1983) and the trait scale of the STAIC 
(Spielberger et al., 1976), the later studies were performed in "captive" 
school-based population samples, whereas this study was completed in a 
clinical sample of children presenting to anxiety and ADHD subspecialty 
clinics. Not surprisingly, stability is in part a function of symptom domain 
and interval, with physical symptoms, social phobia, and separation anxi­
ety showing considerable stability, and harm avoidance showing less 
stability over the 3-week time interval (March et al., 1997). 

Although additional research is clearly necessary, the MASC appears 
to be a valid and reliable tool for its intended purpose. In research settings, 
the MASC likely will find wide use in documenting the relationship 
between anxiety and other variables. For example, the MASC already has 
been utilized as the sole measure of self-reported anxiety in the NIMH­
funded Multimodal Treatment of ADHD (MTA) study and in our studies 
of cognitive-behavioral psychotherapy for pediatric PTSD and OCD. Par­
enthetically, the latter studies demonstrate that the MASC also is change 
sensitive, which is one reason why the MASC has been chosen as a 
primary dependent measure in the randomized clinical trial of a selective 
serotonin reuptake inhibitor in anxiety-disordered children conducted by 
the NIMH-funded Research Units for Pediatric Psychopharmacology 
(RUPP). In clinical settings, the MASC is ideally suited to gathering data 
prior to the initial evaluation. Used in this fashion, the MASC should 
increase clinician efficiency by facilitating accurate assessment of the prior 
probability that a particular child will or will not have symptoms across 
the domains of anxiety relevant to DSM-IV (March, Mulle, Stallings, 
Erhardt, & Conners, 1995). 

4. Diagnostic Interviews 

4.1. Overview 

Dimensional self-report measures such as the MASC can point clini­
cians toward clinically relevant symptoms and, because of their dimension­
ality, are better able to gauge the severity of symptoms. Conversely, estab­
lishing a DSM-IV diagnosis generally requires a clinician-administered, 
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interview-based approach. This structured approach to diagnosis is neces­
sary for establishing the reliability of the diagnosis, accurately defining 
and tracking target symptoms, and, in both clinical and research en­
deavors, making comparisons of results across settings (e.g., Lann, 1991; 
Silverman, 1994). The structured interview format provides a method for 
quantification of clinical data, reduces the potential for interviewer bias, 
and enhances diagnostic reliability (Eisen & Kearney, 1995). Semistruc­
tured interviews present diagnostic criteria and related clinical inquiries in 
a standardized format, while allowing the clinician a limited range of 
flexibility for elaboration and probing of symptoms and criteria. Thus, a 
clinician may adapt the wording of a particular question to meet the 
cognitive-developmental level and/or cultural context of the child. In 
contrast, there is little or no variation allowed during the structured inter­
view format. 

A number of structured and semistructured interviews are available 
for use with children and adolescents (see March & Albano, 1996; and 
Silverman, 1994). Among such interviews are the Diagnostic Interview 
Schedule for Children (DISC; Costello, Edelbrock, Dulcan, Kalas, & Klaric, 
1984), the Children's Assessment Schedule (CAS; Hodges, Cools, & 
McKnew, 1989), the Kiddie Schedule for Affective Disorders and Schizo­
phrenia (K-SADS; Puig-Antich & Chambers, 1978; Modified K-SADS; Last, 
1986), Diagnostic Interview Schedule for Children and Adolescents (DICA; 
Herjanic & Reich, 1982), the Interview Schedule for Children (ISC; Kovacs, 
1985), and the Child and Adolescent Psychiatric Assessment (CAPA; An­
gold, 1997). 

Despite some shared features among these interviews (e.g., age range, 
interview of parent separate from child), the aforementioned interviews 
vary widely in their methods of administration, scoring, level of structure 
demanded by the interview, and decision rules for combining parent and 
child data (Silverman, 1991). Also, there is wide variability in the degree to 
which each of these interviews covers the anxiety disorders. Silverman 
(1994) presents a detailed review of currently available child interview 
methods, reporting that methodological differences among studies of 
structured interviews preclude forming any conclusions regarding their 
comparative reliability. 

4.2. The Anxiety Disorders Interview Schedule for DSM-IV, Child 
Version (ADIS-IV-C) 

In response to the wide variability of interview methods and rela­
tively low reliability coefficients reported for the anxiety disorders across 
studies, Silverman and Nelles (1988) developed the Anxiety Disorders 
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Interview Schedule for Children (ADIS-C), a downward extension of the 
Anxiety Disorders Interview Schedule (ADIS; DiNardo, O'Brien, Barlow, 
Waddell, & Blanchard, 1983). Since its inception, the ADIS-C has under­
gone revisions to be consistent with the DSM-III-R (American Psychiatric 
Association, 1987), and, most recently, with DSM-IV (American Psychiatric 
Association, 1994). The Anxiety Disorders Interview Schedule for DSM-IV, 
Child Version (ADIS-IV; Silverman & Albano, 1996) is a semistructured 
clinical interview assessing the range of anxiety disorders, mood dis­
orders, externalizing disorders, and related behavioral disturbances in 
children and adolescents. The ADIS-IV-C is appropriate for children ages 6 
to 17, with developmentally appropriate wording and descriptors pro­
vided for the clinician within the interview. In structure, the ADIS-IV-C 
actually consists of two separate interviews, a child interview schedule 
and a parent interview schedule. Thus, data is first gathered separately 
from the child and parent(s) and then combined into an overall composite 
diagnosis. The authors recommend administration of the ADIS-IV-C by 
one evaluator. In general, administration takes upwards of 3 hours to 
complete both the child and parent interview schedules. Because the child 
is interviewed separately from the parent(s), the general rule is that data 
gained from one source not be used in or divulged to the second source. 
The authors recommend that researchers randomize the order of the inter­
views (parent or child seen first) in order to control for order effects 
(Albano & Silverman, 1996). Also, it is preferable to have both parents 
present for the interview. 

The ADIS-IV-C allows a formal diagnosis be assigned for the follow­
ing DSM-IV categories: SAD, Social Phobia, Specific Phobia, PD, Agora­
phobia, Generalized Anxiety Disorder, Obsessive-Compulsive Disorder, 
PTSD / Acute Stress Disorder, Major Depressive Disorder, Dysthymia, and 
ADHD. New to the ADIS-IV-C is the inclusion of a screening section for 
selective mutism (SM). As previously mentioned, investigators have hy­
pothesized the relationship between SM and social phobia (Black & Uhde, 
1992), with SM being construed as an extreme variant of the latter anxiety 
disorder. To date, SM has been an understudied and poorly understood 
childhood disorder. The inclusion of a screening for SM to the ADIS-IV-C 
will alert investigators and clinicians to the presence of the disorder and 
prompt for further evaluation, if necessary. The ADIS-IV-C also includes 
screening questions for a range of disorders in youth, including substance 
abuse, somatoform disorders, eating disorders, and psychosis. The parent 
version of the interview also screens for enuresis, sleep terror disorder, 
pervasive developmental disorders, mental retardation, learning dis­
orders, and provides full diagnostic criteria for conduct disorder and 
oppositional defiant disorder. 
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Within each disorder covered in the ADIS-IV-C are sections that guide 
the clinician in assessing essential DSM-IV criteria and accessing ratings of 
interference in functioning. The Initial Inquiry and Interference sections 
are required for making a DSM-IV diagnosis. Several disorders are accom­
panied by additional sections designed to examine the phenomenology 
and behavioral limits of the child. As such, the Initial Inquiry section 
provides questions for determining presence of specific diagnostic criteria 
for each individual disorder, with instructions to skip out strategically 
placed if threshold criteria are not met. The Interference section allows an 
assessment of the informant's subjective report of the degree of distress 
and impairment associated with each diagnosis. This section provides a 
quantifiable rating on a 0 to 8 scale of subjective distress from the child's 
perspective, or perceived distress from the parent's observation of the 
child. The "Feelings Thermometer," a visual prompt that accompanies the 
interview, can be used to assist younger children with anchoring subjec­
tive ratings of fear or distress. 

Information gained from the Initia:l Inquiry and Interference sections 
are combined by the interviewer in assigning a clinician severity rating for 
each diagnostic category. The clinician severity rating (CSR) is assigned 
on a 0-8 scale, reflecting increasing distress and disability. Additional 
sections are provided to examine more fully the phenomenology of the 
disorders and degree of impairment in specific areas of functioning, and to 
explore relevant developmental questions pertaining to these disorders in 
youth. A detailed clinician's manual accompanies the instrument (Albano 
& Silverman, 1996). An additional packet of research questions is available 
from the authors. 

Presently, the authors of the ADIS-IV-C are conducting reliability 
studies of the interview schedules (A. M. Albano, personal communica­
tion, March 1997). However, reliability of both the child and parent ver­
sions of the interview has been evaluated previously for both the DSM-III 
and DSM-III-R versions. For example, in a study of 51 outpatients using 
the interviewer-observer paradigm, Silverman and Nelles (1988) found an 
overall kappa coefficient of .75, with kappas ranging from .64 for over­
anxious disorder to 1.00 for specific phobia. Subsequently, Silverman and 
Eisen (1992) examined test-retest reliability in a sample of 50 outpatients 
presenting to the same child anxiety specialty clinic. Again, the overall 
kappa was .75, with kappas ranging from .64 for overanxious disorder to 
.84 for specific phobia. More recently, a study conducted in Australia with 
161 outpatients found kappas for the composite diagnoses ranging from .59 
to .82 (Rapee, Barrett, Dadds, & Evans, 1994). This study utilized an 
interrater reliability paradigm, involving a live interview with the child 
and videotaped interview with the parent. Consistent with previous find-
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ings (see Silverman, 1994, for a review), parent-child agreement was poor 
for most diagnostic categories, with kappa values ranging from .11 to .44 
(Rapee et al., 1994). However, despite differences in parent and child 
reports, reliability studies of the ADIS-C and ADIS-P demonstrate that 
independent clinicians have little difficulty in evaluating the presence and 
severity of diagnoses based on the child's report, parents' report, and in 
formulating the composite (Silverman & Nelles, 1988; Silverman & Eisen, 
1992; Rapee et al., 1994). Overall, these studies support the utility of the 
prior versions of the children's ADIS interview schedules. Refinements in 
the diagnostic criteria for most of these disorders as applied to children are 
expected to bolster the reliability of the ADIS-IV-C. 

5. Specific Behavioral Assessment Methods 

5.1. Overview 

Following the diagnostic evaluation, which preferably should begin 
with dimensional measures and proceed to a semistructured interview, 
additional "pretreatment" assessments are generally required to collect 
additional data regarding a child's specific anxiety symptomatology. For 
example, much more data are required to establish a fear hierarchy, a 
necessary measure for implementing treatment, than is necessary for es­
tablishing a diagnosis of obsessive-compulsive disorder (OCD) or social 
phobia. Supplementary, largely ideographic data will serve as a basis for 
evaluating the progress and rate of treatment, and for identifying targets 
for specific interventions. At the most basic level, at least from a behavioral 
perspective, assessment in this sense consists of the administration of a 
standardized inventory for assessing the specific domain of anxiety and 
the construction of an individualized hierarchy of feared situations (e.g., 
Fear and Avoidance Hierarchy; FAH), with corresponding Subjective 
Units of Distress (SUDS) ratings. Patients also are sometimes given in­
struction in the use of a continuous, self-monitoring diary to complete 
during a pretreatment baseline and for the duration of treatment, and are 
asked to participate in behavioral observational assessments. 

5.2. Behavioral Observations 

Behavioral observation is the cornerstone of behavioral assessment 
and a vital step in developing a formal functional analysis of the child's 
presenting problem (Barrios & Hartmann, 1988; Dadds, Rapee, & Barrett, 
1994).Yet relatively few standardized behavioral observation systems exist 
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that have demonstrated reliability and validity. Exceptions to this trend 
include two standardized observation methods used to observe children 
in medical settings. The Behavior Profile Rating Scale (BPRS; Melamed, 
Yurcheson, Fleece, Hutcherson, & Hawes, 1978) assesses behaviors associ­
ated with dental anxiety, and the Observer Rating Scale of Anxiety (ORSA; 
Melamed & Siegel, 1975) was developed for observing anxiety behaviors 
in medical and dental situations. Both scales have adequate reliability and 
validity. 

One additional standardized method is the Preschool Observation 
Scale of Anxiety (POSA; Glennon & Weisz, 1978). Raters note the presence 
of behavioral symptoms of fear and anxiety such as crying, nail-biting, 
whining/whimpering, physical complaints, and verbal expressions of fear 
or worry. The POSA is useful for evaluating a child during compulsory 
separation and social situations occurring during school hours. Psycho­
metric evaluation of the POSA has revealed adequate reliability and valid­
ity (Glennon & Weisz, 1978). 

In contrast to a standardized method, the most widely employed 
measure of behavioral observation is the behavioral avoidance task (BAT), 
sometimes also known simply as behavioral tests or behavioral avoidance 
tasks. In a typical BAT, an individual is exposed to relevant, anxiety­
provoking situ ions while corresponding measures of approach and sub­
jective distress dre taken (Kendall et al., 1991; Ollendick & Francis, 1988). 
The duration of a BAT will vary according to the demands of the stimulus 
situation and behavioral limits of the participant. For example, in assessing 
the subjective discomfort of an adolescent who fears engaging in conversa­
tions, a typical BAT may involve initiating and maintaining a conversation 
with a confederate. In order to access an adequate sample of the adoles­
cent's behavior, the clinician may want to observe a minimum of 10 min­
utes of the interaction. In this way, behaviors that may occur in any 
conversation would have a chance to happen (e.g., asking and answering 
questions). However, if an adolescent refuses to engage in the situation, or 
asks to prematurely terminate the interaction, then important information 
is gained regarding the limits of that particular adolescent's tolerance of 
anxiety and anxiety-provoking stimuli. In addition to the behavioral ob­
servations accessed during the BAT, following each task the participant is 
asked to list his/her thoughts or describe the images he/she recalled 
having while engaging in the BAT (or anticipating the BAT, in the case of a 
refusal). Thought listing is an easy method of assessing the cognitive 
component of anxiety. SUDS ratings are also taken during a BAT, typically 
at specified intervals during the ongoing task (e.g., each minute). These 
tasks are invaluable methods of accessing clinical information regarding 
individual-patient behavioral coping or escape/avoidance behaviors. 
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Moreover, repeating the BAT at midtreatment and posttreatment will 
provide the clinician with an ongoing measure of change. 

5.3. Family Assessment 

Until recently, investigations examining the interaction among child 
and family variables in the etiology and maintenance of anxiety in children 
and adolescents were practically nonexistent. Although an extensive liter­
ature exists promoting the utility of family evaluation in the study of 
externalizing disorders (d. Dadds, 1995; Patterson, 1982; Wahler, 1976), 
empirical assessment studies are only beginning to appear examining the 
interaction patterns of anxious children and their families (e.g., Barrett, 
Rapee, Dadds, & Ryan, 1996; Chorpita, Albano, & Barlow, 1996). 

Paper-and-pencil instruments such as the Issues Checklist (IC; Prinz, 
Foster, Kent, & O'Leary, 1979), Conflict Behavior Questionnaire (CBQ; 
Prinz et aI., 1979), the Parent Expectancy Scale (PES; Eisen, Spasaro, Kear­
ney, Albano, & Barlow, 1996), and the Family Environment Scale (FES; 
Moos & Moos, 1986) may be utilized to assess descriptive characteristics of 
families of anxious children as well as suggest areas that might benefit 
from intervention or further empirical examination. The IC and CBQ are 
measures that tap "hot" topics or issues that cause conflict between family 
members, and the frequency with which these issues arise in a particular 
family. The IC and CBQ are completed by both the parents and child. The 
IC and CBQ have been found to discriminate distressed from non­
distressed mothers, fathers, and adolescents, and the CBQ is also sensitive 
to change following intervention (see Foster & Robin, 1988). The PES is a 
relatively new scale that measures parents' expectancies across five dimen­
sions of the child's functioning: academic, extracurricular, household, so­
cial, and general success. This measure is completed by the parents. Pre­
liminary studies indicate good reliability for the PES (Eisen et aI., 1996), 
with examination of validity currently underway. Finally, the FES provides 
an assessment of the family climate, structure, and values, and is com­
pleted by parents and child. Norms are provided for distressed and non­
distressed families, and the psychometric properties are generally good for 
the measure (Moos & Moos, 1986). The utility of the FES for evaluation of 
families dealing with anxiety disorders is currently being examined. Each 
of these measures can provide the clinician with information to incorpo­
rate into the case formulation and aid in treatment planning. 

Only recently have investigators begun to examine molecular pro­
cesses involved in the interactions between anxious children and their 
parents. Initial hypotheses proposed by Dadds and colleagues in Australia 
has prompted research in this area (Barrett et aI., 1996; Dadds, 1995; Dadds 



228 JOHN S. MARCH AND ANNE MARIE ALBANO 

et aI., 1996; Dadds et aI., 1994). Specifically, these investigators suggest that 
anxiety in children is modeled or reinforced through a series of interper­
sonal behaviors and interactions occurring between parents and the child. 
Results of a series of investigations suggest a specific interaction of cogni­
tive processing biases for threat, combined with interpersonal interactions 
between family members, which set the occasion for the development and 
maintenance of anxiety. 

Dadds and colleagues devised a family behavioral test situation in 
which children are presented with an ambiguous situation, asked to give a 
rating of their anxiety if confronted with the situation, and then provide an 
interpretation and action plan in response to the situation. For example, a 
child may be given the following situation: "You are in the school cafeteria, 
looking for a place to sit. You notice a table with several children, and an 
empty chair. You decide to go join these children. As you approach, you 
notice that some of the children are laughing. What do you think is 
happening? What would you do? How anxious would you be?" After each 
child provides an individual response to the situation, the parents are then 
called in and presented the same scenario and then asked to discuss the 
situation as a family. After a 5- to 10-minute discussion, the child is again 
asked to provide an interpretation, action plan, and subjective rating of 
anxiety. 

Preliminary analyses at several centers have revealed that an interest­
ing phenomenon occurs between parents and their anxious children in 
response to discussion of these ambiguous situations (Barrett et aI., 1996; 
Chorpita et aI., 1996; Dadds et aI., 1996). Parents are observed to inadver­
tently reinforce avoidance or escape from these situations, as opposed to 
approach and problem solving. Moreover, although some anxious chil­
dren initially indicate an approach plan, following the discussion with the 
family, these children are observed to change their plans to an avoidant or 
escape solution. Termed the "FEAR" effect (Family Enhancement of Anx­
ious Responding), investigators hypothesize that the parents are attempt­
ing to protect the child from experiencing anxiety and the ensuing nega­
tive affect, but unfortunately, then, the child never gains experience with 
such situations, and hence the development of coping skills and process of 
habituation to anxiety is stalled (Barrett et aI., 1996). In other words, 
children will encounter potentially threatening (anxiety-provoking) situa­
tions on a daily basis. During these situations, the average child will 
engage in particular behaviors that lead to certain outcomes. The situation 
itself, the child's response, and the outcome each can be accompanied by 
some degree of subjective anxiety. With repeated experience in such situa­
tions, the child learns certain skills and behaviors to manage the situations 
and any difficulties, and deal with both the anxiety response and resultant 



ASSESSING PEDIATRIC ANXIETY DISORDERS 229 

outcome. Continued exposure to these situations results in a decreased 
intensity of the anxiety response (habituation) and a more efficient and 
effective management (coping skills) of any remaining anxiety. If parents 
intervene and take over the management of these situations, or if they 
encourage avoidance of situations, the developmental process of learning 
skills and habituating to anxiety may not occur. The Family Anxiety 
Coding Schedule (see Dadds et aI., 1994) provides a means to examine 
family interactions and quantify the data for statistical purposes. Although 
studies are just underway, it is expected that invaluable information will 
be gained regarding the complex interactions of child and family charac­
teristics in the maintenance of childhood anxiety. 

6. Neuroscience 

6.1. Overview 

Although not yet practical from a clinical diagnostic perspective, 
emerging neuropsychiatric models of the genesis and maintenance of 
anxiety disorders hold considerable promise for further refining our diag­
nostic nomenclature and for more precisely specifying psychosocial and 
somatic treatments (Hooper & March, 1995; March, Leonard, & Swedo, in 
press; Sallee & Greenawald, 1995). Here, we review some recent develop­
ments in psychophysiological assessment and introduce the topic of cogni­
tive neuroscience as applied to developmental psychopathology (Harris, 
1995; Rutter, 1993b), focusing for heuristic purposes on the overlap be­
tween anxiety and attention deficit disorders. 

6.2. Psychophysiological Assessment 

Anxiety is conceptualized as a complex emotion consisting of three 
separate yet interrelated components: cognitive, physiological, and behav­
ioral (Lang, 1968, 1971). Studies of childhood anxiety typically focus on the 
cognitive and overt behavioral components, with less attention given to 
assessment of the physiological domain. However, the paucity of empiri­
cal attention to children's physiological functioning is not due to a lack of 
interest in the area. King (1994) presents a comprehensive and scholarly 
review of the history and current status of physiological assessment of 
anxious emotional states in children. As noted in this review, Mary Cover 
Jones (1924) described the physiological responses of young Peter in the 
infamous case study of the deconditioning of a child's fear. Despite an 
early clinical interest in the physiological changes accompanying anxious 
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states in youth, until recently, only little empirical work was conducted 
examining clinically anxious children and adolescents. 

Only one group of investigators has examined systematically the 
utility and reliability of psychophysiological assessment with anxious 
children (Beidel, 1988, 1991a, 1991b; Turner, Beidel, & Epstein, 1991). Prelim­
inary data suggest that physical responses to stressful situations (e.g., 
heart rate) may signal the presence of an anxious biological predisposition 
(cf. temperament) in a subset of children (Beidel, 1989). For example, 
socially relevant tasks (e.g., reading aloud) have been associated with 
increased heart rate in socially anxious children (Beidel, 1988, 1991b). Inter­
estingly, no baseline differences in physiological arousal were noted be­
tween socially anxious and normal control children during these assess­
ments. However, in contrast to nonanxious children, clinical children 
appear to exhibit continually elevated heart rate throughout the task with­
out evidence of habituation (Beidel, 1988, 1991b; Turner et al., 1991). Inter­
estingly, ongoing research at the Harvard Medical School suggests that the 
temperamental construct of "behavioral inhibition" in children may be a 
precursor to, or risk factor for the development of anxiety disorders during 
childhood (Biederman et al., 1995; Hirshfeld et al., 1992); however, it is not 
clear to what extent behavioral inhibition maps reliably onto psycho­
physiological disturbances. Thus, while theoretically interesting, the clini­
cal utility of these measures has yet to be demonstrated. 

6.3. Cognitive Neuroscience 

Despite abundant data linking impairment in specific neurocognitive 
processes to pediatric emotional disorders (Harris, 1995), the DSM-IV 
diagnostic criteria largely rely on behavioral symptoms (American Psychi­
atric Association, 1994). Although this approach has advanced the cause of 
developmental neuropsychiatry by encouraging the formation of diagnos­
tically homogeneous groups, underlying neuropsychological constructs 
are not well represented (Pennington & Welsh, 1995). Recent developments 
in the cognitive neurosciences, which have shown a remarkable ability to 
correlate functional neuroanatomy with central nervous system (eNS) 
information processes (Gazzaniga, 1995), suggest a way out of this tax­
onomic conundrum (e.g., core neurocognitive processes such as attention 
and fear and their interrelationship, inform most behavioral! symptomatic 
constructs; see, e.g., Shaywitz & Shaywitz, 1991) and so may provide one 
explanation for the extraordinary degree of comorbidity between neuro­
psychiatric disorders. 

Although neuropsychiatric disorders have been viewed neurocog­
nitively as involving under- or overallocation of attentional resources 
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(Lorys, Hynd, & Lahey, 1990; Matthews & Margetts, 1991), it is critical to 
remember that allocation of CNS processing resources may be dysregu­
lated at any of several information-processing steps, including orienting of 
attention, sustained attention, visual-spatial-organizational skills, cogni­
tive and/ or behavioral inhibition and/ or executive dysfunction (Hooper 
& March, 1995), each of which shares overlapping hierarchically distrib­
uted neural networks (Posner, 1992). Note that when engaging this issue, it 
is also crucial to avoid confusion over level of analysis (Fletcher & Taylor, 
1984). Although neurocognitive tests may both model symptomatic behav­
ior and reflect underlying CNS function, poor test performance does not 
permit inference of CNS dysfunction in the absence of experimental evi­
dence linking different levels of analysis. 

From the standpoint of pediatric neuropsychiatry, the contrast be­
tween ADHD and the anxiety disorders (ANX) holds particular heuristic 
value. ANX and ADHD contrast sharply in risk factors, developmental 
course, and response to treatment. Curiously, however, these two appar­
ently distinct psychopathological groupings, which together affect 10-15% 
of youths, share a high degree of comorbidity (Costello & Angold, 1995c). 
Indeed, it is often difficult to determine whether the symptoms of restless­
ness, inattention, and disorganization belong to one or the other of the 
disorders, which may imply that ADHD and ANX share common under­
lying neurocognitive processes that result in comorbidity at the symptom 
level while showing distinctive patterns at the neurocognitive level. For 
example, ADHD and ANX share inattentiveness and distractibility (d. 
DSM-IV criteria), but one might hypothesize that ADHD children are 
distractible because their noradrenergically mediated automatic attention 
to sensory cues is underactivated, leading them to be underfocused, 
whereas pathologically anxious children are noradrenergically overacti­
vated, causing high levels of vigilance to potentially threatening external 
cues. Although presenting behaviorally as "distractible," highly anxious 
children might show highly efficient and precise automatic responses to 
sensory cues at the neurocognitive level; with ADHD the opposite occurs. 
Behaviorally, both ADHD and ANX children are easily disinhibited and 
therefore impulsive, but perhaps for quite different reasons. ADHD chil­
dren could have low levels of response inhibition due to underactivation 
of response control mechanisms, whereas ANX children under pressure 
might blur the distinction between target and nontarget stimuli, thus 
responding too often to both. In signal detection terms, ADHD children 
have an altered response-criterion bias, or beta-function, so that speed 
becomes more important than accuracy, whereas ANX children have inef­
ficient signal discrimination, or d-prime, so that anxiety is seen to interfere 
with distinguishing among a range of external cue characteristics. In both 
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disorders, the same neurocognitive systems are involved (arousal, activa­
tion, automatic and voluntary attention, vigilance), but take on different 
values. 

Although attention is a core component in the ADHD diagnostic 
construct (Barkley, Grodzinsky, & DuPaul, 1992), numerous hypotheses 
regarding attentional dysfunction in ADHD have been proposed and later 
discarded (Conners et al., 1995). Current theories focus on dysregulation in 
short-term orienting of attention (Swanson et al., 1991) and vigilance or 
sustained attention. Attentional factors in anxiety-disordered adults are 
beginning to be explored along similar lines (see, e.g., Fox, 1994; McNally, 
Riemann, Louro, Lukach, & Kim, 1992); however, much less has been done 
in the pediatric population (Hooper & March, 1995). Only one study has 
focused on the issue of comorbidity from the standpoint of neurocognitive 
processing. In this pioneering study, Pliszka and colleagues compared 
children with nonanxious ADHD to children with comorbid ADHD and 
overanxious disorder, and found that the combination of ADHD and ANX 
reduced the risk of comorbid conduct disorder, decreased impulsive re­
sponding on a continuous performance task (CPT), and produced sluggish 
reaction times on a Memory Scanning Test (Pliszka, 1989). This study 
suggests that arousal level, which by itself influences a wide range of 
primary attentional functions (McBurnett et al., 1991), may be a critical 
variable when interpreting the results of neurocognitive tests across differ­
ent disorders. 

Impairments in visual-spatial-organizational skills also have been 
the subject of increasing investigation in ADHD (see, e.g., Branch, Cohen, 
& Hynd, 1995) and ANX (summarized in Hooper & March, 1995). Poor 
nonverbal reasoning skills are typically found in ADHD without hyper­
activity and may partially account for the frequently observed overlap 
between ADHD and ANX (Lahey & Carlson, 1991). Such children often 
suffer from a specific academic disability characterized by slow processing 
speed, dysgraphia, dyscalculia, and poor written language, highlighting 
the overlap between neurodevelopmental and emotional disabilities 
(Rourke, 1989; Voeller, 1991). As yet, however, most studies in this area 
have not distinguished between orienting of attention, vigilance, or visu­
ospatial skills in different diagnostic groupings, nor have they related 
dysregulation in these areas to behavioral symptoms. 

At both the behavioral and neurocognitive levels (Conners & Wells, 
1986; Zacks & Hasher, 1994), the ability to inhibit cognitions and behaviors 
is a cardinal feature of attentional control mechanisms. Thus, difficulty 
delaying impulsive responding (manifested as increased commission er­
rors on a CPT) has proven the most reliable finding in ADHD (Conners et 
al., 1995). In contrast, early investigations using negative priming models 
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suggest that cognitive inhibitory mechanisms may be dysregulated in 
ANX (Fox, 1994). No pediatric negative-priming studies have yet been 
published, but preliminary data from our laboratory suggest that negative­
priming effects do not discriminate ANX from ADHD (unpublished data). 

Finally, CNS imaging technologies permit researchers to link brain 
structure to brain function, with magnetic resonance imaging (MRI) and 
positron emission tomography (PET) showing more utility for structural 
localization and event-related potentials (ERPs) showing more utility for 
understanding the temporal aspects of CNS information processing (Pfef­
ferbaum, Roth, & Ford, 1995; Rapp et al., 1989). PET studies are as yet 
impractical in most pediatric mental disorders, though studies in adults 
with childhood-onset disorders show some promise (Swedo et al., 1989; 
Zametkin, Nordahl, Gross, King et al., 1990). In contrast, preliminary 
studies using ERPs indicate that ADHD exhibits electrophysiological 
markers of a disturbed attentional orienting system (Klorman, 1991). No 
QEEGjERP studies have yet been done in children with ANX, though 
QEEG studies in anxious adults suggest overfocused sustained attention 
(see, e.g., Towey, Tenke, Bruder, Leite, et al., 1994). 

7. Conclusion 

Researchers have just begun to explore methods for the comprehen­
sive multimodal assessment of anxiety in children. Future efforts will 
inevitably focus on the integration of assessment methods that serve to 
explicate the relationship between cognitions, behaviors, and neurocogni­
tive and neurophysiological responses associated with anxiety in youth. In 
addition, relatively little work has examined the utility of assessment tech­
niques within specific diagnostic categories, yet examinations of diagnos­
tic differences are crucial to our understanding of the nature of childhood 
anxiety disorders (March & Albano, 1996; Albano et al., 1995). Comprehen­
sive and multimodal assessments that examine the interrelationship be­
tween the child's developmental level, anxiety, and related constructs (e.g., 
family characteristics, social skills, self-competence) are sorely needed as 
well. Importantly, these assessment procedures must maximize not only 
our understanding of the childhood-onset anxiety disorders but must also 
facilitate appropriate prescriptive treatment planning and outcome mon­
itoring (Albano, Knox, & Barlow, 1995; March & Albano, 1996). 

In this chapter, we reviewed a wide variety of currently available and 
investigational assessment methods and instruments that have been ap­
plied to pathological anxiety in pediatric populations. It should be ap­
parent that considerable progress has been made over the past 10 years. 
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Self-report (e.g., MASC) and interviewer-based (e.g., ADIS) instruments 
now provide reliable and valid ascertainment of symptoms across mul­
tiple symptom domains. These, and construct-specific instruments (e.g., 
STAIC), reliably identify the major symptom clusters in anxious children, 
though further research is clearly necessary before discriminant validity 
can be claimed between specific anxiety disorders or between the anxiety 
disorders and other internalizing and externalizing conditions. With re­
spect to "severity," the availability of normative data and specific criteria 
for assessing functional impairment are strengths of some but by no means 
all instruments, and much work remains to establish the clinical implica­
tions of categorical or dimensionalized ratings on available assessment 
tools. Moreover, our understanding of how best to incorporate and recon­
cile multiple observations, such as parent and child ratings, is limited, 
particularly since child and parent concordance is weak for some domains 
of anxiety, and the ascertainment of concordance is confounded by intra­
and interrater reliability in any case. Finally, the development of new, 
empirically validated treatments (e.g., Albano, Marten, Holt, Heimberg, & 
Barlow, 1995; March & Mulle, 1995) is just beginning to drive the evaluation 
of whether newer instruments are sensitive to treatment-induced change 
in symptoms. 

Further investigations examining the reliability and validity of these 
assessments with anxiety-disordered children within a developmental 
context are clearly warranted. Although complex assessments-whether 
clinically based or part of a research protocol-often are best carried out 
within an anxiety disorders subspecialty clinic, few children currently 
have access to sophisticated services outside academic centers. Thus, tech­
nology transfer from the research setting, where instruments such as the 
ADIS and the MASC have been developed, to everyday clinical practice is 
imperative if the nascent field of child and adolescent anxiety disorders is 
to progress. 
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Measurement of Coping 

in Children and Adolescents 

1. Introduction 

TIM S. AYERS, IRWIN N. SANDLER, 

AND JOAN L. TWOHEY 

Recent years have seen a significant increase in the number of efforts to 
conceptualize and measure coping and to examine the role it plays in 
effecting the development of symptomatology for people in stressful situa­
tions (e.g., Billings & Moos, 1981; Carver, Scheier, & Weintraub, 1989; 
Endler & Parker, 1990; Folkman & Lazarus, 1980; McCrae, 1984; Miller, 
1987; Pearlin & Schooler, 1978). Although the vast majority of these efforts 
at conceptualization, measurement, and research have involved adult 
populations, there has been an increase in the number of studies concern­
ing coping by children or adolescents (e.g., Ayers, Sandler, West, & Roosa, 
1996; Band & Weisz, 1988; Brodzinsky, Elias, Steiger, & Simon, 1992; Causey 
& Dubow, 1992; Compas, Malcarne, & Fondacaro, 1988b; Curry & Russ, 
1985; Phelps & Jarvis, 1994; Rossman, 1992; Ryan-Wenger, 1990; Wertlieb, 
Weigel, & Feldstein, 1987; Zeitlin, 1980). 

Thus, it is now timely to examine some of the conceptual, theoretical, 
methodological, and developmental issues related to the assessment of 
coping in children and adolescents (for earlier reviews of coping measures, 
see, Knapp, Stark, Kurkjian, & Spirito, 1991; Ryan-Wenger, 1994). This 
chapter begins by briefly reviewing alternative definitions and conceptual 
issues prerequisite to a discussion of the measures of coping, such as what 
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represents the proper domain of coping and the dimensionality of coping. 
The discussion will proceed to the methods and current assessment instru­
ments that have been used with children and adolescents, and the ob­
served relations between these measures of coping and adjustment. Fi­
nally, the chapter discusses more general issues that are important for 
future research in the assessment of coping, such as theoretical versus 
empirical approaches to measurement development and the importance of 
adopting a developmental perspective in the assessment of coping during 
childhood and adolescence. 

2. Conceptualization of Coping 

A brief, although necessarily selective review (see Compas, 1997; 
Lazarus & Folkman, 1984; Moos & Billings, 1982; Moos & Schaefer, 1993; 
Skinner & Wellborn, 1994; Suls & Fletcher, 1985) of the literature and the 
definition of coping is presented to provide a framework for understand­
ing recent efforts at measuring children's coping. 

2.1. Definition of Coping 

From a psychoanalytic perspective, coping typically has been referred 
to as those thoughts and behaviors that reflect the most advanced or mature 
ego processes. Within these formulations, coping is often defined as realis­
tic and flexible thoughts and acts that solve problems and thereby reduce 
stress. As an example, Haan (1977, 1982) offers a theoretical model involv­
ing a tripartite hierarchical arrangement of coping, defending, and frag­
mentation. Generic ego processes can be expressed at each of these three 
levels. For example, sensitivity to others' thoughts and feelings can be 
expressed as empathy (the coping mode), projection (the defensive mode), 
and delusions or ideas of reference (the fragmentary mode). 

The recent literature has tended to reject the psychoanalytic approach 
to defining coping in such hierarchical and structural terms for two pri­
mary reasons. First, to define coping as those processes that solve problems 
automatically eliminates many thoughts and behaviors that individuals 
utilize but which are not successful. Investigators in the area have pointed 
out that conceptualizing coping in this fashion increases the risk of con­
founding the measurement of the construct with the assessment of out­
come, in essence creating a tautology (that which is most efficacious pre­
dicts better outcomes, and that which creates better outcomes is judged as 
the most adaptive; see Lazarus, 1993; Stone, Helder, & Schneider, 1988). 
Understanding which particular coping efforts are effective in a given 
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situation first requires a "neutral stance" regarding the efficacy of any and 
all coping efforts. 

The second trend in the conceptualization of coping is a change from 
viewing coping in more structural and dispositional terms to adopting a 
more transactional perspective. The most prominent description of the 
transactional perspective was offered by Lazarus and Folkman (1984), who 
take a cognitive-phenomenological approach to the problem. They define 
coping as "constantly changing cognitive and behavioral efforts to manage 
specific external and/ or internal demands that are appraised as taxing or 
exceeding the resources of the person" (p. 141). This relational definition 
emphasizes that coping should be viewed as all cognitive and behavioral 
efforts, regardless of their outcomes, that are taken in response to specific 
external and internal demands. In this conception there is also an emphasis 
on the importance of understanding the specific characteristics of the 
situation and an individual's appraisal as to whether it is threatening, and 
whether a coping response is necessary. 

2.2. Conceptualizing Coping as a Process versus a Trait 

A significant part of a transactional perspective is that coping is seen 
as part of a dynamic, ongoing, and constantly changing process (Lazarus, 
1993; Lazarus & Folkman, 1984). Lazarus and Folkman (1984) argue that 
there are three main features to a process approach. First, the assessment of 
coping needs to be concerned with what a person actually thinks or does in a 
stressful situation. This is in contrast to examining coping dispositions, 
styles, or traits, which are what a person usually does in a stressful situation. 
Second, the assessment of coping behaviors needs to be examined within a 
specific context. The coping strategies an individual chooses are, in part, 
dependent upon the demands of the particular situation. Finally, a process­
oriented approach focuses on the change in coping thoughts and acts as the 
stressful encounter unfolds (e.g., Folkman & Lazarus, 1985). 

Several authors argue that although many tout the importance of 
adopting a transactional perspective, the typical approach in developing 
and using existing coping measures has followed a dispositional or styl­
istic orientation (Coyne & Gottlieb, 1996; Lazarus, 1993; Stone, Kennedy­
Moore, Newman, Greenberg, & Neale, 1992). Rather than arguing that the 
process-oriented approach is necessarily more appropriate than a disposi­
tional- or trait-oriented approach to coping, Lazarus and Folkman (1984) 
note that such trait-oriented approaches tend to "grossly simplify complex 
patterns of coping into unidimensional schemes .... which have little ex­
planatory and predictive value for what a person actually does in particu­
lar contexts" (p. 178). Later, Lazarus (1993) would comment that "even 
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when multidimensional measures are employed, ... environmental condi­
tions eliciting the coping process tend to be ignored because the focus is 
centered on consistent coping styles" (pp. 241-242). 

Lazarus (1993) recently acknowledged that the most serious weakness 
of conceptualizing coping as a process is that "coping process measures 
would be far more meaningful and useful it we knew more about the 
persons whose coping thoughts and actions in specific contexts are being 
studied" (p. 242). He notes that probably the most serious omission within 
such a process-oriented approach has tended to be a lack of attention to the 
motivational aspect of the personality, that is, the "general goals and 
situational intentions that mobilize and direct the choice of coping strate­
gies employed" (p. 243). As we will discuss later in the chapter, the 
theoretical orientation that one adopts has implications for both the devel­
opment of measures and the psychometric characteristics one can antici­
pate for those measures (Schwarzer & Schwarzer, 1996). 

3. Dimensionalization of Coping 

3.1. Classification of Coping 

Coping has been classified by the function or purpose it is intended to 
serve (Billings & Moos, 1981; Lazarus & Folkman, 1984; Pearlin & Schooler, 
1978). Lazarus and Folkman (1984) distinguish between coping efforts that 
are directed at managing or altering the stressful situation (problem­
focused) and those efforts that are directed at regulating emotional re­
sponses to the situation (emotion-focused). 

Rothbaum, Weisz, and Snyder (1982; Weisz, Rothbaum, & Blackburn, 
1984), working within an attributional framework and emphasizing con­
trol perceptions, make a distinction between primary and secondary con­
trol. Primary control pertains to coping that is aimed at influencing objec­
tive conditions or events so as to reduce punishment or enhance reward. 
Secondary control is coping aimed at maximizing one's goodness of fit 
with the conditions as they are, thus reducing punishment and enhancing 
reward.1 

In their longitudinal studies of personality development in childhood, 
Murphy and Moriarty (1976) identified two major types of coping tech­
niques, which they labeled Coping I and Coping II. Coping I was defined 
as the "capacity to cope with opportunities, challenges, frustrations, (and) 

IThey also define a third category called "relinquished control," in which there is no apparent 
goal-directed behavior. 
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threats in the environment" (p. 117) and is characterized by a more active 
problem-solving approach to coping with the environment. Coping II is 
defined as the "capacity to manage one's relation to the environment so as 
to maintain integrated functioning (free from marked tenseness, un­
manageable anxiety, deterioration of speech, disorganization of thought 
processes, loss of motor coordination, and so on)" (p.1l7). Murphy and her 
colleagues (Murphy, 1974; Murphy & Moriarty, 1976) gathered an impres­
sive array of data on the developmental and individual differences of the 
children they have followed longitudinally and propose that their data 
support the heuristic value of the Coping I and Coping II distinction for 
studying coping processes in children and adolescents. 

Moos and colleagues (Ebata & Moos, 1991; Holahan, Moos, & Schae­
fer, 1996; Moos & Schaefer, 1993) maintain that two main approaches to the 
classification of coping efforts have predominated. The first approach 
emphasizes the focus or function of the coping efforts (i.e., the person's 
orientation in response to a stressor). The second approach has empha­
sized the method of coping that people employ (i.e., a response that in­
volves primarily cognitive or behavioral efforts). They cross these two 
methods of classification and suggest that coping can be conceptualized 
based on an individual's orientation to the stressor, that is, either approach 
(active) versus avoidance (passive), and that both of these domains can be 
further subdivided into categories that reflect cognitive or behavioral 
coping. Therefore, they propose cognitive approach, behavioral approach, 
cognitive avoidance, and behavioral avoidance as four basic categories of 
coping processes and suggest that various subtypes of copi~g efforts, such 
as resigned acceptance or taking problem-solving action, can be cate­
gorized into these categories (in these instances, cognitive avoidance and 
behavioral approach). 

3.2. Coping from a Motivational Perspective 

Skinner and colleagues (Skinner & Wellborn, 1994, 1997) offer a con­
ceptualization of coping using a perspective derived from a motivational 
theory of psychological needs. They define coping as "children' s regulation 
of their behavior, emotion, and motivational orientation during psycho­
logical stress" (Skinner & Wellborn, 1994, p . 107). The motivational theory 
they employ posits three basic, innate psychological needs: relatedness, 
competence, and autonomy (Connell & Wellborn, 1991). Stressful events 
are those that threaten or challenge these three motivational needs. Thus, 
they suggest that there are three dimensions of the social context that are 
viewed as psychologically stressful: neglect (vs. involvement), which 
threatens the need for relatedness; chaos (vs. structure), which threatens 



248 TIM S. AYERS ET AL. 

competence; and coercion (vs. autonomy support), which threatens the 
need for autonomy. 

Skinner and colleagues (Skinner & Wellborn, 1994, 1997) note that the 
source of the stress can be the self or the environmental context, and that 
the individual's appraisal of the extent to which the event or context is 
meeting their psychological needs determines the perceived severity 
(threat vs. challenge) of stress. The extent to which these basic psychologi­
cal needs are met determines whether individuals will be engaged versus 
disaffected. Tying this notion of being engaged or disaffected together 
with their definition of coping as involving children's regulation of their 
behavior, emotion, and motivational orientation suggests that children's 
efforts can reflect energized versus enervated behavior, positive versus 
negative emotion, and committed versus alienated orientation to the goals of 
developing relatedness, competence, and autonomy. 

Skinner derives a set of 36 ways of coping with problems in friendship 
or academic domains from this motivational theory of coping (Skinner, 
Altman, & Sherwood, 1991; Skinner & Wellborn, 1997) by crossing the 
targets of regulation (behavior, emotion, and orientation) with the motiva­
tional needs (relatedness, competence, and autonomy), and the source 
(self vs. context) and the perceived severity (threat vs. challenge) of stress. 
Skinner notes that these 36 categories of coping can also be classified by the 
more traditional ways of classifying coping in terms of approach versus 
avoidance, passive versus active, positive versus negative, but suggests 
that such dimensions will not go far in terms of describing the adaptive­
ness of these modes of coping. These authors (Skinner et aI., 1991; Skinner 
& Wellborn, 1997) draw from the emotion-regulation literature (e.g., Eisen­
berg, Fabes, & Guthrie, 1997) and suggest that coping will be adaptive to 
the extent that it is organized (vs. disorganized), flexible (vs. rigid), and 
benign (vs. punitive). To illustrate how this conceptualization moves be­
yond an approach versus avoidance distinction in offering potentially 
more accurate predictions about relations to adaptation, Skinner suggests 
that two forms of approach coping, such as, strategizing versus perse­
verance, might be shown to be differentially adaptive because the first is 
flexible, whereas the latter reflects a more rigid approach. 

Skinner and colleagues argued that there are several advantages to 
using this conceptualization of coping (Skinner & Wellborn, 1994, 1997). 
Besides being part of a larger theory of motivation, it is tied closely to the 
literature on self-regulation, ego resilience, and ego control; thus, one can 
use what is known about the development of behavioral, emotional, and 
motivational regulation to outline and begin to develop a theory of the 
epigenesis of regulated coping behaviors (Skinner & Wellborn, 1994; p. 
113). It is also the only conceptualization that explicitly adds an orientation 



CONCEPTUALIZATION AND MEASUREMENT OF COPING 249 

or outlook component to the conceptualization of coping (Skinner & Well­
born, 1997). An additional advantage is that there is more of an emphasis 
on a wider range of "positive coping" in that there is a one-to-one corre­
spondence between positive and negative modes of coping in their con­
ceptualization. Finally, they suggest that their coping categories imply 
several differentiations that might be useful in other areas of research, such 
as help seeking, perceived control, and autonomy. As an example, help­
lessness due to perceived incompetence may manifest itself differently in 
terms of a child's behavior than helplessness due to perceived noncon­
tingency. 

4. Domain of Coping 

What to include within the definition of coping responses is one of the 
most vexing problems in the area. Lazarus and Folkman (1984) empha­
sized in their definition, that it includes all responses a person shows 
"when demands are appraised as taxing or exceeding a person's re­
sources" and yet in their definition of coping limited it to those efforts 
"which require(s) mobilization and exclude(s) automatized behaviors and 
thoughts which do not require effort" (pp. 141-142). Compas (1987), in his 
seminal review of child and adolescent coping, noted that it is "necessary 
to limit the use of the term to a subset of adaptational actions involving 
effort" (p. 399). 

The decision to limit the definition of coping only to those behaviors 
that are "effortful" or purposeful has recently been challenged (Coyne & 
Gottlieb, 1996; Skinner & Wellborn, 1994). Skinner and Wellborn (1994) 
argue that in doing this, one excludes phenomena that are potentially very 
interesting aspects of coping. As an example, they note that Compas (1987) 
discussed learned helplessness as a form of coping, and this pattern of 
responding would, by most theoreticians' definitions, not reflect effortful 
or intentional behavior. More importantly, they argue that when one de­
fines coping as intentional or effortful, some of the more important devel­
opmental questions such as the epigenesis of coping are more difficult to 
address. Many of the behaviors that infants and toddlers emit could not be 
considered intentional, effortful, or purposeful, yet may be important pre­
cursors to other behaviors that reflect coping by children or adolescents. 

Coyne and Gottlieb (1996) take issue with the decision to exclude 
habitual or automatic behaviors from the domain of coping. Over time, 
people refine and develop routinized" coping" strategies that have proved 
to be effective for them in dealing with stressful circumstances. Coyne and 
Gottlieb ask the question: "Once a set of dependable, routine stress man-
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agement behaviors have been developed, are they no longer to be consid­
ered coping?" (p. 963). At the same time, there are automatic and habitual 
patterns of response that are the crux of ineffective coping. As an example, 
automatic, negative thoughts have been implicated in exacerbating de­
pression in individuals (e.g., Beck, 1967). Coyne and Gottlieb (1996) also 
question the decision to exclude behaviors that are anticipatory from the 
domain of coping. They suggest that much "effective" coping is anticipa­
tory, that is, behaviors that are enacted prior to the occurrence of stressful 
circumstances that may actually avert the occurrence of the particular 
stressor entirely. Coyne and Gottlieb argue that to exclude these behaviors 
from the domain of coping gives one a distorted picture of the stress and 
coping processes. 

Recently, Compas and colleagues (Compas, Connor, Harding, Saltz­
man, & Wadsworth, in press; Compas, Connor, Osowiecki, & Welch, 1997; 
Compas et al., 1997) put forth a model that places coping as a construct 
within a broader context of responses to stress. These authors offer a 
hierarchy that at the first and highest level makes a distinction between 
responses to stress that are effortful versus involuntary (Le., temperamen­
tal or overlearned). They note that responses to stress vary in the degree 
to which the individual experiences them as under volitional or effortful 
control. Involuntary responses are both cognitive and behavioral response 
to stress that are experienced by the individual as unintentional or not 
under personal control. Responses to stress are not necessarily always 
predefined as effortful or involuntary; that is, through repeated practice, 
some effortful processes can be automatized or experienced as involun­
tary, some involuntary responses to stress can eventually be brought un­
der personal, and therefore effortful control. In discussing this distinction, 
they argue that the construct of coping should be limited to those re­
sponses to stress that are effortful. In this sense, they disagree with Skinner 
and Wellborn's (1994) decision to conceptualize nonvolitional or noneffort­
ful responses as coping. 

At the second level of the hierarchy, the responses to stress vary in the 
degree to which they reflect engagement versus disengagement from the 
stressor. Engagement responses are oriented toward either the stressful 
relationship with the environment or one's emotional responses to the 
stressor, whereas disengagement responses are directed away from the 
stressful relationship with the environment or one's emotional responses. 
Compas and colleagues (1997) argue that this distinction can be made for 
both effortful or involuntary responses and is related to the basic dimen­
sion of approach-avoidance discussed elsewhere in the literature (e.g., 
Billings & Moos, 1981; Ebata & Moos, 1991). These authors hypothesize that 
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both effortful and involuntary disengagement responses, and involuntary 
engagement responses are associated with greater symptomatology, 
whereas effortful engagement responses are expected to be associated 
with lower symptomatology. They acknowledge that there may be some 
differences in these associations when examining subtypes of responses 
within these broader categories. 

Compas and colleagues (1977) suggest a number of candidates for the 
distinction at the third level of the hierarchy and believe that this dimen­
sion still needs to be determined empirically. They point to prominent 
distinctions offered in the literature: (1) those that focus on the goals of the 
individual (e.g., primary control vs. secondary control coping; Rothbaum 
et al., 1982) or problem- versus emotion-focused coping (Lazarus & Folk­
man, 1984); (2) self- versus externally focused responses, which is related 
to the work of Nolen-Hoeksema and colleagues (Nolen-Hoeksema & Mor­
row, 1993) on rumination (self-focused) and distraction (external focus) 
and Pyszczynski and colleagues' (Pyszczynski & Greenberg, 1987; Py­
szczynski, Greenberg, Hamilton, & Nix, 1991) research on depressive self­
focusing styles following failures; (3) the distinction between cognitive 
and behavioral responses (e.g., Ebata & Moos, 1991); and (4) the distinction 
between personal and social resources in coping. It should be noted that 
many of these distinctions (e.g., primary vs. secondary control coping or 
problem- vs. emotion-focused coping) would apply only to the effortful 
responses to stress (i.e., coping). 

Within this hierarchy, the habitual or automatic behavior, which 
Coyne and Gottlieb (1996) believed should be included as part of the 
domain of coping, reflects important responses to stress but would not be 
conceptualized necessarily as reflecting coping on part of the individual 
because the behavior is not viewed as being effortful (Compas et al., 1997). 
However, within their conceptualization, Compas and colleagues (Compas 
et al., 1997, in press) do seem to agree with Coyne and Gottlieb (1996) about 
the importance of habitual, automatic behaviors, noting that involuntary 
processes can frequently constrain the types of coping responses that an 
individual can generate. Understanding the relationships between coping 
and involuntary, overlearned, or habitual patterns of responding to stress 
is therefore critically important. 

5. Measurement of Coping in Children and Adolescents 

In this section, we examine several efforts that attempt to measure the 
coping styles or strategies of children and adolescents. The review will be 
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limited to measures that can be used in a variety of contexts and attempt to 
measure a range of types of coping responses or styles. We will not review 
measures that assess coping behaviors in response to specific stressors, 
which are not readily adaptable to other settings (see Miller, Sherman, 
Combs, & Kruus, 1992, for a review of coping assessments for children 
undergoing medical or dental procedures), or those that focus on one or 
two coping resources/ strategies, for example, interpersonal problem solv­
ing (Spivack, Platt, & Shure, 1976) or social support measures (Wolchik, 
Beals, & Sandler, 1989). 

We have organized our review of the assessment of coping measures 
based on whether the instruments were designed to assess the use of a 
variety of coping strategies in response to specific stressor(s) or whether 
they were intended primarily to measure general coping styles. This orga­
nization reflects the distinction between conceptualizing coping from a 
transactional perspective, in which the focus is on strategies used in specific 
situations, and from conceptualizing coping from a dispositional or styl­
istic perspective. Aldwin (1994) makes the point that this conceptual dis­
tinction is often overlooked in the measurement of coping. The instruc­
tions given to the respondent are key to the distinguishing between coping 
strategies and styles. In this review, studies that ask the respondent to 
report what he/ she usually does to handle problems without referring to a 
specific problem were classified as measuring coping styles. Included with 
measures of coping style are those studies that ask children or adolescents 
to report their coping efforts in response to a hypothetical event (Asarnow, 
Carlson, & Guthrie, 1987; Danvosky, Rapoff, & Houston, 1995; Hoffner, 
1993). In addition, studies that asked children to respond by "mentally 
aggregating" their coping efforts in response to multiple incidents of a 
certain class of problems (e.g., Causey & Dubow, 1992; Reid, Dubow, & 
Carey, 1995), we believe, represent a stylistic approach to assessing chil­
dren's coping. Studies that asked children or adolescents to describe a 
specific stressful event and then to report their coping efforts in response to 
this event were classified as measuring coping strategies. 

Tables 1 and 2 are included to summarize information regarding the 
assessment of coping strategies and styles, respectively. The tables sum­
marize studies to assess coping in terms of the characteristics of the sample 
used, the methodology, coping categories, and information about the re­
liabilities and validity of the instruments when available. The tables are 
organized by type of measure, that is, interview, questionnaire and behav­
ioral observation measures, and by author within each of these segments. 
Space limitations do not permit a discussion of each article included in the 
tables. However, several studies have been selected as illustrative exam­
ples of different approaches to the measurement of coping. 
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6. Assessment of Coping Strategies 

Table 1 highlights the variety of approaches that have been taken to 
assess coping strategies by using interview schedules (e.g., Band & Weisz, 
1988; Compas et al., 1988b; Wertlieb et al., 1987), questionnaire formats 
(Ayers et al., 1996; Brodzinsky et al., 1992; Dise Lewis, 1988; Frydenberg & 
Lewis, 1991), and, occasionally, behavioral observations (Curry & Russ, 
1985; Hyson, 1983). 

The types of stressful experience for which respondents have been 
asked to report coping efforts have varied from a discrete, rather circum­
scribed event (e.g., dental or medical visit; Curry & Russ, 1985; Hyson, 
1983; Miller, Roussi, Caputo, & Kruus, 1995) to several different domains of 
experience that have been suggested as potential sources of stress for 
children and adolescents (e.g., Band & Weisz, 1988; Wertlieb et al., 1987). 
Studies that have utilized primarily a self-report methodology either by 
semistructured interview or by use of a questionnaire wilJ be discussed 
first, followed by those studies that have included an observational mea­
sure of coping behaviors. 

6.1. Interview Measures of Coping Strategies 

Two studies will be discussed to illustrate the use of semistructured 
interviews to measure coping strategies. Compas et al. (1988b) used a 
structured interview format in which they asked 130 children aged 10 to 14 
to describe two stressful events, one interpersonal and one academic, that 
happened to them in the last 3 months. They asked the children to rate the 
degree of control they had over the cause of the event, to generate a list of 
all the possible ways they could have handled or dealt with the event, and, 
finally, to report in their own words which strategies they actually used to 
cope with the stressor. The children's responses were classified by the 
coping function they served. Compas et al. (1988b) used Folkman and 
Lazarus's (1984) conceptual distinction between problem- and emotion­
focused coping as their guide for classifying the children's responses. 

Compas et al. (1988b) reported very good interrater reliabilities for 
categorizing children's responses into problem- versus emotion-focused 
coping (see Table 1) for both stressors and noted low to moderate levels of 
consistency in both the alternatives generated and the strategies used for 
the two stressors. Significant negative correlations between problem­
focused coping and emotional-behavioral problems, based on child and 
maternal report, supported concurrent validity. The pattern of the correla­
tions was significant but in the positive direction for emotion-focused 
coping and emotional-behavioral problems. 
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Working from a slightly different theoretical framework, Band and 
Weisz (1988) investigated the coping functions and strategies of children 
using a semistructured self-report interview with 73 children who ranged 
in age from 6 to 12. They asked children to report about their coping (what 
they did and what they thought) in six different domains of stressful 
situations that occurred in the past year (e.g., separation from a friend, 
going to the doctor's to get a shot, getting a grade on an exam they did not 
like). They also probed for information about children's goals in each 
situation and their sense of efficacy about their coping responses. 

Band and Weisz (1988) classified the children's coping strategies in 
two different ways. They coded each strategy generated as representing 
one of three broad categories (i.e., primary, secondary, or relinquished 
control). They also initially used Folkman and Lazarus's (1984) adult­
based "ways of coping" model to classify each strategy on a more fine­
grained, descriptive level. They discovered that 40% of the children's 
responses fell outside the "ways of coping" categories, which forced the 
development of new categories. The 10 categories that resulted from a 
content analysis and the interrater reliabilities for classifying their re­
sponses are listed in Table 1. 

6.2. Questionnaire Measures of Coping Strategies 

Three studies illustrate the use of a closed-ended questionnaire to 
assess coping strategies for a specific stressful event. Ebata and Moos 
(1991) developed the Coping Responses Inventory-Youth Form on which 
adolescents reported the coping strategies they used for the most impor­
tant problem faced in the prior 12 months. Forty-eight items were devel­
oped on a rational basis to represent eight conceptually distinct dimen­
sions that included both cognitive and behavioral methods of coping. 
These methods were collapsed into two broad-band dimensions of ap­
proach versus avoidance based on the focus of coping with examples of 
behavioral and cognitive methods within each broad-band dimension. 
Approach methods such as logical analysis and problem solving represent 
attempts to understand, resolve, or master the stressor. Avoidant methods, 
such as cognitive avoidance or emotional discharge, represent indirect 
methods to either avoid thinking about the stressor or to manage the 
tension created by the stressor. Internal consistency reliabilities of the eight 
coping scales were modest (a's.55 to .79). Evidence for concurrent validity 
was that adolescents who were identified as having psychological prob­
lems (depression and conduct disorder) were more likely to use avoidant 
than approach coping strategies. In addition, after controlling for gender, 
background variables, and severity of stressor, avoidant coping scales 
predicted higher levels of symptoms, whereas approach-oriented strate­
gies predicted lower symptoms. 
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Brodzinsky et al. (1992) used exploratory factor analysis to develop 
the 44-item Coping Scale for Children and Youth (CSCY), a self-report 
measure of children's coping. In the development of the CSCY, the authors 
culled items from the existing literature that they could reliably categorize 
into five general strategies of coping: cognitive/affective engagement, 
behavioral engagement, cognitive/affective avoidance, behavioral avoid­
ance, and passive resignation. Results from the exploratory factor analysis 
indicated that their preliminary conceptual structure was only partially 
confirmed, and four factors were identified: (1) assistance seeking, repre­
sented by items that reflected interpersonal problem solving; (2) cognitive­
behavioral problem solving, reflected by both cognitive/affective and 
direct behavioral actions; (3) cognitive avoidance, measured by cognitive 
redefinition, selective attention, and minimization of the problem; and 
(4) behavioral avoidance, which included both direct means, such as re­
moving oneself from the stressor, and indirect means, such as displace­
ment of anger on to another person. The authors report a comparable 
factor structure across the two grades (6th and 8th) and gender of the 
participants. As noted in Table I, acceptable internal consistencies were 
found for the four dimensions. A readministration of the CSCY 1 week 
later to a random subsample of 145 children responding to the same 
stressor identified previously yielded satisfactory test-retest correlations 
(.70 to .81) for the four dimensions. 

Brodzinsky and colleagues (1992) addressed construct validity of the 
CSCY in two studies. The first study examined the relationship of the 
CSCY to the Kidcope (see Table 1 or Spirito, Stark, & Williams, 1988) and 
found the highest correlations between the CSCY and the Kidcope be­
tween the coping categories that were conceptually most similar. The 
second study supported construct validity of the CSCY in that assistance 
seeking and cognitive-behavioral problem solving were positively associ­
ated with perceived self-efficacy, whereas cognitive avoidance and behav­
ioral avoidance were negatively associated with perceived self-efficacy. 

Ayers and colleagues (1996) utilized confirmatory factor analysis to 
develop a 45-item, self-report measure of children's coping called How I 
Coped under Pressure Scale (HICUPS). The chosen confirmatory factor­
analytic approach has the advantage of testing the adequacy of an a priori 
specified theoretical model of the dimensional structure of coping, and 
thus is more likely to yield conceptually meaningful and replicable dimen­
sions. Instrument development for the HICUPS followed from the devel­
opment of a dispositional measure of coping that will be described in more 
detail later. The HICUPS assesses 11 dimensions of coping that were theo­
retically derived through a review of the existing literature and a careful 
content analysis of children's coping (Ayers et al., 1989; Sandler et al., 1990). 
Children reported their coping efforts in response to a stressful event that 
occurred in the past 3 months and was selected as having the highest 
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nomothetically based rating of "stressfulness" of all experienced events. 
Confirmatory factor analysis tested three theoretical models of the under­
lying dimensional structure of 10 coping dimensions.2 The data collected 
with the HICUPS fit a four-factor theoretical model of coping better than 
the problem-focused versus emotion-focused model (Lazarus & Folkman, 
1984) or the approach versus avoidant coping model (Ebata & Moos, 1991). 
The four latent constructs identified through this confirmatory factor anal­
ysis include active coping strategies, distraction strategies, avoidance 
strategies, and support-seeking strategies (Ayers et al., 1996). Table 1 pro­
vides a list of the dimensions that represent each latent factor and the 
internal consistencies for both the dimensions and factors. 

The measurement and factor structure of the HICUPS was tested 
across age and gender and found to be invariant (Ayers et al., 1996). 
Relationships between these latent factors and measures of outcome based 
on maternal and child report were examined within structural models, and 
no significant relationships were found (Ayers, 1991). 

6.3. Behavioral Observation Measures of Coping Strategies 

A few investigators have developed coping measures that rely upon 
clinician/ researcher, parent, and/ or teacher observation of coping efforts 
by children or adolescents. Most efforts in this area have focused on 
measuring coping with a particular type of stressor, such as dental visits 
(Curry & Russ, 1985; Miller et al., 1995), medical procedures (Hyson, 1983), 
or angry interactions (Cummings, 1987; Cummings & Cummings, 1988). A 
few other observational measures of coping might be more accurately 
described as general measures of psychosocial development or compe­
tence (e.g., Hoffer & Thompson, 1986; Zeitlin, 1980). Because other reviews 
have examined children's coping with aversive medical or dental proce­
dures (e.g., Miller et al., 1992; Peterson, Harbeck, Chaney, Farmer & 
Thomas, 1990; Rudolph, Dennig, & Weisz, 1995), we generally chose to 
exclude those studies from this review. However, for purposes of illustra­
tion, we will discuss one study in this section that utilized a behavioral 
observation strategy to assess coping in response to a particular stressor 
(i.e., medical visit). 

Hyson (1983) developed an observational instrument to measure chil­
dren's coping in response to a pediatric examination for 48 children, 6-12, 
18-36, or 42-60 months old. In order to classify children's behavioral 

20ne dimension, Expressing Feelings, was dropped from all analyses due to poor internal 
consistencies and a concern the dimension might be contaminated with measures of symp­
tomatology (see also Stanton, Danoff Burg, Cameron, & Ellis, 1994). 
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responses, Hyson operationalized White's (1974) "strategies of adapta­
tion." White has suggested that responses to a stressful situation might 
include one, two, or all of the following: (1) information seeking, (2) 
maintaining internal equilibrium, and (3) maintaining autonomy re­
sponses. Hyson had an observer keep a continuous narrative account of all 
behavior that occurred during the visit. This transcript was divided into 
three discrete time periods that reflected preexam behavior, exam behav­
ior, and postexam behavior. Using a behavioral coding scheme, all behav­
iors from each time period were coded into one of the three categories 
mentioned. 

Hyson (1983) found that use of specific coping strategies at each time 
period varied with age. Not surprisingly, when the autonomy category 
was divided into expressive and instrumental behaviors, there were more 
instrumental behaviors during the preexam period and more expressive 
protest behaviors during the exam period. In addition, the proportion of 
expressive protest decreased in a linear fashion with age, whereas the 
number of instrumental behaviors increased proportionately. In summary, 
Hyson suggested that these findings emphasized the importance of under­
standing the adaptive context of children's coping efforts and the contribu­
tion that developmental factors play in the child's interpretation of and 
response to a stressful event. We will return to the discussion of these 
points later in the chapter. 

6.4. Issues in the Assessment of Coping Strategies 

There are several issues that researchers should consider in the mea­
surement of coping strategies used by children and adolescents. These can 
be broadly grouped into two areas, the strategies and techniques used in 
the design and development of the coping measures and the methodology 
and design of studies that examine the relationships between coping 
efforts and measures of adaptation. 

In the development of the coping measures, some investigators have 
been diligent in their efforts to sample the entire domain of coping efforts 
for children or adolescents within particular age ranges (e.g., Ayers et aI., 
1996; Band & Weisz, 1988; Brodzinsky et aI., 1992; Ryan, 1988, 1989). Al­
though this practice has been more closely followed in the development of 
measures for elementary and middle-school-aged children, it has not been 
typically the practice in measures of coping strategies developed for ado­
lescents (Frydenberg & Lewis, 1991; Halstead, Johnson, & Cunningham, 
1993; Phelps & Jarvis, 1994; Stern & Alvarez, 1992). Some authors have 
either modified an adult measure of coping to make it more appropriate 
for adolescents (Halstead et aI., 1993) or initiated an investigation to deter-
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mine whether the underlying factor structure of an adult measure (e.g., 
COPE; Carver et al., 1989) was the same when used with adolescents 
(Phelps & Jarvis, 1994). Checking to determine whether the measure has 
the same underlying factor structure (e.g., Phelps & Jarvis, 1994) represents 
an improvement over uncritically adopting the factor structure identified 
for adults (Frydenberg & Lewis, 1991; Stem & Alvarez, 1992) but still 
ignores the possibility that the instruments may not adequately sample the 
full range of coping efforts used by adolescents. This question needs to be 
systematically investigated so that the measures developed for middle and 
late adolescents adequately sample the domain of coping. 

Attention needs to be paid to the scores that are created as summaries 
of children's coping. As an example, Ryan-Wenger (Ryan, 1988, 1989; Ryan­
Wenger, 1990, 1992), in a careful series of reports, has developed taxono­
mies of coping strategies from children's own reports (Ryan, 1989) and 
from a review of the existing literature (Ryan-Wenger, 1992). This information 
was used to select the most commonly named strategies of the categories 
identified and these were used to create the Schoolagers' Coping Strategies 
Inventory (SCSI); see Ryan-Wenger, 1990). In this instrument, children are 
asked to report both their frequency of use of the coping strategies and the 
effectiveness of these strategies on a four-point scale. Unfortunately, Ryan­
Wenger (1990) chose to create overall summary scores of frequency and 
effectiveness and a total of SCSI score based on these two other scales. This 
approach undoubtedly was taken in order to maintain high internal con­
sistency of the scales, yet it ignores some of the potential richness the data 
might yield regarding the effectiveness of different types of coping strate­
gies. In addition, combining the frequency and effectiveness scales con­
founds judgments of coping efforts and coping efficacy (Schwarzer & 
Schwarzer, 1996; Stone et al., 1992) and ignores the conceptual distinctions 
Lazarus and colleagues (Lazarus, 1991; Lazarus & Folkman, 1984) have 
encouraged investigators to make between primary and secondary ap­
praisal processes, coping efforts and judgments of coping efficacy. 

When discussing the methodology and design of studies in this area, 
Lazarus and Folkman's (1984) transactional perspective on coping is valu­
able. As defined here, measures that assess coping strategies (i.e., coping 
with a specific stressor) are most useful in exploring the relationships that 
might exist between a person's appraisal, coping, and efficacy judgments, 
and the characteristics of a stressful situation and/ or context. Investigators 
have begun to explore issues related to the impact of situational charac­
teristics (Compas et al., 1988b; Dubow, Roecker, & Donaldson, 1995; Reid et 
al., 1995; Zeidner, 1994) and appraisal and efficacy judgments (Compas, 
Banez, Malcarne, & Worsham, 1991; Compas, Forsythe, & Wagner, 1988a; 
Forsythe & Compas, 1987) on the selection of coping strategies. 

Related to the design of these studies, it is important for investigators 
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to clearly specify the time frame that respondents use when reporting on 
their coping efforts to a specific stressful situation. Currently, coping mea­
sures have referenced a wide range of time periods. Some investigators 
apparently have not specified any time frame (e.g., Bull & Drotar, 1991; 
Colletta, Hadler, & Gregg, 1981; Frydenberg & Lewis, 1991; Ryan, 1989; 
Wertlieb et al., 1987), others have been nonspecific (e.g., the last few 
months; Brodzinsky et al., 1992), whereas others have asked respondents 
to identify any events that have occurred within the past 2 weeks (Elwood, 
1987) up to 1 year (Ebata & Moos, 1991). Shortening the time frame so that 
reports of coping are to more immediate stressful events would help 
alleviate concerns that investigators have voiced regarding the question­
able ability of children or adolescents to recall all of their coping efforts to 
events that have occurred more than a month ago (Causey & Dubow, 1992; 
Stone & Kennedy-Moore, 1992). 

Surprisingly, there has been little systematic research assessing a wide 
range of children's coping efforts in settings where the impact of different 
stressors and contextual factors can be controlled. Such studies can begin 
to consider the temporal aspects of coping efforts and the impact that 
different stages of the stressor have on coping responses (Peterson et al., 
1990; Stone et al., 1992). A process-oriented approach by Cummings (1987; 
Cummings & Cummings, 1988), which examines child coping with adults 
anger, represents an excellent example for other coping investigators in 
that it illustrates how laboratory and field studies jointly can be used to 
describe systematically children's cognitive, social, emotional, and physio­
logical responses to a stressor and how these responses change over time. 

As a starting point, the literature might benefit from distinguishing 
coping efforts used across different stages of a stressor, from prior to the 
onset of the stressor, to while it is occurring and following its occurrence 
(Stone & Kennedy-Moore, 1992). There is a need for a greater number of 
studies that examine coping responses over time and across stressors. 
Research investigating responses to aversive medical or dental procedures 
(Miller et al., 1995; Peterson et al., 1990; Rudolph et al., 1995) offers some 
interesting leads and methodologies in this respect. Investigators in this 
area (Rudolph et al., 1995) have indicated a need for more sophisticated 
conceptual models of coping that consider children's overall coping reper­
tories, profiles, and, importantly, the temporal sequences of their coping 
responses. 

7. Assessing Coping Styles in Children and Adolescents 

This section first addresses the degree of consistency in coping across 
situations and then reviews four different methods of assessing coping 
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styles: coping in response to hypothetical situations, coping styles in spe­
cific kinds of situations, coping styles across all recent stressful situations, 
and coping intentions across situations. 

7.1. Consistency in Coping across Situations 

An assumption of a stylistic approach to coping assessment is that 
there is some consistency in child and adolescent use of coping strategies 
across stressful situations. Three studies provide empirical evidence that 
this assumption is quite reasonable for children and adolescents. As noted 
earlier, Compas et a1. (1988b) used a semistructured interview to study 
coping strategies reported by ten 14-year-olds for two different kinds of 
situations: interpersonal and academic related stressors. Correlations be­
tween coping strategies reported across academic and interpersonal 
stressors were calculated separately for girls and boys and ranged from .25 
to .43 (median r = .30). Causey and Dubow (1992) used a self-report 
questionnaire to assess five dimensions of coping strategies and found that 
the cross-stressor correlations between reported use of the same coping 
strategy ranged from .38 to .68 (median r = .53). These authors point out 
that although the correlations between use of the same coping strategies 
across situations were moderately high, children reported different levels 
of use of strategies in different situations. Gamble (1994) used a self-report 
questionnaire to assess the coping of fourth- through eighth-grade stu­
dents across three kinds of stressors. The mean correlations for the same 
coping strategy across the three stressful situations were similar to that 
reported by Causey and Dubow (range of r = .44 to .62, median r = .55). It 
should be noted that the cross-situational consistency in coping reports 
found for children and adolescents is considerably higher than that re­
ported for adults (see Aldwin, 1994). This may reflect either greater cross­
situational consistency in coping for children, perhaps due to less differen­
tiation of the coping requirements of different situations or less differentia­
tion in their coping repertoire. Alternatively, it may be that children's 
reports of coping are more affected by common method variance than are 
the reports of adults. 

7.2. Interview Measures of Coping Styles 

As indicated earlier, we have classified all studies that have utilized 
hypothetically stressful situations (e.g., Asarnow et aI., 1987; Brown, 
O'Keeffe, Sanders, & Baker, 1986; Hoffner, 1993; Krantz, Clark, Pruyn, & 
Usher, 1985; Mooney, Graziano, & Katz, 1985) as attempts at measuring 
coping styles of children or adolescents. One example is discussed as 
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illustration of work in this area that uses a semistructured interview 
format. Asarnow et al. (1987) developed the Coping Strategies Test (CST) 
in which they have subjects imagine three different stressful situations 
(i.e., disciplinary crisis, parental conflict, and bereavement). These authors 
presented cards depicting each situation and then followed up with probes 
designed to assess the child's interpersonal sensitivity, expectancies, num­
ber of alternative solutions generated, and number of solutions generated 
after the examiner placed an obstacle in the path of one of the child's 
solutions. The CST was administered to a sample of 30 inpatients (age 8-
13), and the content of the children's responses were classified into coping 
categories. These authors report good interrater reliability for the coding 
of all responses into the categories (all kappas> .88). Little validity data 
are provided for this interview schedule. However, exploratory analyses 
suggest that within this small sample, depressed children were more likely 
to generate physically aggressive coping strategies than were nondepressed 
children, and suicidal children were less likely to generate active, cognitive 
coping strategies as compared to nonsuicidal children. 

7.3. Questionnaire Measures of Coping Styles 

This section will review illustrative studies that have used closed­
ended questionnaires for the assessment of coping styles. Three different 
approaches have been used in these questionnaires to assess coping styles: 
coping styles in specific kinds of situations, coping styles across all recent 
stressful situations, and the assessment of coping intentions across situa­
tions. 

In the development of their coping measure for children, Causey and 
Dubow (1992) chose to assess coping styles in specific kinds of situations. 
They asked respondents to report their coping efforts in response to two 
stressors (poor grades, peer conflict) using the following type of instruc­
tional set: "When I get a bad grade in school, one worse than I normally get 
I usually ... " without asking students to describe a specific incident. These 
authors state that they chose to ask children how they usually respond to a 
small class of problems, because they believed it represented an improve­
ment over the focus and scope of previous studies that referenced "prob­
lems in general" or the single, most important stressor they experienced in 
the past year. 

Causey and Dubow's (1992) 33-item measure was designed to exam­
ine five domains of coping. Four coping domains were based on Roth and 
Cohen's (1986) approach-avoidance conceptualization of coping, in which 
two subscales assessed approach strategies (i.e., seeking social support 
and self-reliance/problem solving) and two subscales assessed avoidance 
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strategies (Le., distancing and internalizing). One added domain called 
"externalizing" reflected coping strategies focused outward. Principal 
component factor analyses with varimax rotation were conducted sep­
aratelyon responses to coping with a poor grade and with a peer argu­
ment, and were found to be robust with respect to gender. Internal consis­
tencies, which are satisfactory, and evidence for concurrent validity are 
presented in Table 2. 

Causey and Dubow (1992) also sought independent verification of the 
coping strategies reported. They used a peer nomination procedure in 
which they had children rate how likely each of their classmates might use 
certain strategies to cope with one of the two stressors. They found modest 
to moderately positive relations between the corresponding subscales of 
the self-report and peer-rated coping measures for the problem-solving, 
seeking-social-support, externalizing, and internalizing subscales. They 
suggested that children's self-report was at least somewhat consistent with 
the way in which their peers viewed their coping efforts. 

In the development of one of our coping measures, the Children's 
Coping Strategies Checklist (CCSC; Ayers, 1991; Ayers et al., 1996; Sandler, 
Tein, & West, 1994), we took a stylistic approach that asked respondents to 
report on their coping styles across all recent stressful situations. As with 
the HICUPS, discussed earlier, the CCSC was developed to assess 11 
dimensions of coping that were theoretically derived through a review of 
the existing literature and a careful content analysis of children's coping 
(Ayers et al., 1989; Sandler et al., 1990). A four-factor model provided an 
acceptable fit to the data and was more parsimonious than the originally 
proposed five-factor model (see Ayers, 1991). The four coping factors 
identified were the same as the HICUPS, namely, active coping strategies, 
distraction strategies, avoidance strategies, and support-seeking strate­
gies. This four-factor structure has been cross-validated on two indepen­
dent samples (Ayers et al., 1996; Sandler et al., 1994) and found to be 
invariant across age and gender in both samples. In cross-sectional analy­
ses (Ayers, 1991), the use of an avoidant style of coping was positively 
related to depression and conduct problems, and negatively related to self­
esteem. The inverse was found for active coping, which was positively 
related to self-esteem and negatively related to depression. Sandler et al. 
(1994) found that avoidance coping partially mediated the positive rela­
tionship between negative events and depression, anxiety, and conduct 
problems. In longitudinal analyses, they found negative significant rela­
tions between active coping and distraction coping at Time I, and inter­
nalizing symptomatology at Time 2. 

Wills (1985,1986) developed a 54-item factorial-based coping inven­
tory, which was refined during a four-wave, longitudinal study. Subjects 
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for the study were two cohorts of seventh- and eight-grade, urban adoles­
cents. The items of the inventory were presented to the subjects with the 
heading "When I have a problem, I ," and subjects are 
asked to report the frequency with which they engage in the stated behav­
ior on a scale of 1 to 5 with Never and Usually as anchor points. Exploratory 
factor analysis of the 54 items using the second cohort of adolescents 
resulted in an 11-factor solution. A list of the 11 factors can be found in Table 
2. Wills (1985, 1986) provided no information about the internal consis­
tency of the subscales or the test-retest reliability of the instrument. Al­
though he does not use confirmatory factor analyses to examine the invari­
ance of the factorial structure, he did report separate factor analyses for 
each measurement period and suggested that the factor structure of the 
measure was stable over time. 

Wills (1986) found evidence of the concurrent validity of the instru­
ment in the observed relations between adolescent reports of their coping 
styles and substance use, which were similar to the work of Patterson and 
McCubbin (1987b). They found that independent of the other predictors, 
four of the coping styles (behavior coping, cognitive coping, adult social 
support, and relaxation) were inversely related to substance use, whereas 
three of the coping styles (peer support, distraction coping, and aggressive 
coping) were positively related to substance use. Wills (1986) also found 
interactions consistent with stress-buffering hypotheses for the behavioral 
coping, cognitive coping, and adult support coping styles. 

Glyshaw, Cohen, and Towbes (1989) utilized Wills' Behavior-Based 
Coping Inventory in a 5-month, prospective study with junior and senior 
high school students. They administered the scale to 396 junior and senior 
high school students and then conducted a series of factor analyses to 
examine the stability of the factors across time, gender, and grade level. 
Five factors consistently emerged from these factor analyses, which were 
identical to 5 of the 11 factors found in Will's (1985) study (i.e., problem 
solving, cognitive coping, peer support, social entertainment, and physical 
exercise). Pearson correlations between assessments at Time 1 and Time 2 
ranged from .44 to .63 across all five categories for both the junior and 
senior high school samples supported the temporal stability of the coping 
styles measures. 

Glyshaw and her colleagues (1989) directly addressed the issue of 
independent validation of child or adolescent self-reported coping styles 
by assessing the relation between child and parent measures of the same 
coping styles (d. Causey & Dubow, 1992). They found moderate and 
significant correlations between mothers' reports of their adolescents' cop­
ing styles and the adolescents' own report. Since, one would not expect the 
mothers to have complete knowledge of their adolescents' coping styles 
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(especially the strategies that reflect cognitive styles or efforts), their find­
ings provide fairly strong support for the validity of the adolescents' self­
reports of coping styles. 

With regard to concurrent validity, Glyshaw and her colleagues (1989) 
found significant, negative relations between the coping styles of problem 
solving, peer and parental support, and psychological distress in the cross­
sectional analyses, but there were no significant relations between coping 
styles and psychological distress in the prospective longitudinal analyses. 
Interestingly, they did find that initial distress was positively related to 
subsequent reliance on cognitive coping strategies 5 months later. This 
suggests that cognitive coping strategies (e.g., trying to put it out of mind) 
can be the effect and not the cause of maladjustment. Other studies need to 
be attentive to such bidirectional relationships between coping styles and 
mental health outcome variables (e.g., Aldwin & Revenson, 1987). 

An alternative approach to assessing coping styles comes from the 
adult literature on coping. Due to the results of some of their initial pilot 
work, Stone and his colleagues (Stone, Greenberg, Kennedy-Moore, & 
Newman, 1991; Stone & Neale, 1984) have been critical of using a checklist 
or behavior-based approach when assessing coping, and eventually re­
jected a checklist assessment instrument in favor of a more open-ended 
procedure (Stone, Kennedy-Moore, & Neale, 1995; Stone & Shiffman, 
1992). 

As an example of the problems they identified, Stone and Neale (1984) 
found that when subjects were given a sorting task and allowed the 
freedom to classify the coping items in as many categories as they wished, 
they often felt that a particular item could indeed represent more than one 
coping strategy. Thus, one potential problem with coping questionnaires 
becomes evident; subjects might interpret an item to reflect entirely differ­
ent coping categories. As an example, some individuals might interpret 
the item "Go to a movie" as reflecting the coping strategy of relaxation, 
whereas others might view this as a form of distraction. The differences in 
the way in which individuals interpret similar coping items may be one 
explanation for the often low internal consistency of subscales on coping 
measures (e.g., A-COPE has some alphas in the .50-.60 range; Patterson & 
McCubbin, 1987b).3 

3It is also the case that the subscales of the A-COPE with the lowest alpha coefficients also 
have the fewest items. There is an argument posed in the literature that states that internal 
consistencies may not be a useful form of reliability when evaluating coping inventories 
(Holahan & Moos, 1987; Stone & Kennedy-Moore, 1992; Stone et al., 1992). The reasoning is 
that the use of one behavioral or cognitive strategy from a list of several strategies that 
compose the coping subscale may be the only strategy that a particular individual will need 
to cope with the stressful situation. Since subjects are not endorsing other items from that 
subscale, the internal consistency will necessarily be attenuated. 
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Taking these findings into consideration, Stone and Neale (1984) of­
fered an alternative method for assessing coping in adults that focused on 
assessing the intentions of the person who was describing his/her coping. 
In their daily coping scale, they allowed subjects to indicate which classes 
of coping behaviors they used during a specific stressful situation. They 
presented subjects with one-sentence descriptions of coping categories 
and then asked them to check whether they did or thought anything that 
fit into these categories. They followed up a positive response with open­
ended questions asking what the specific thoughts and actions were that 
reflected the strategy they checked. 

Wills (1986) developed a coping inventory for adolescents that uses a 
methodology similar to that developed by Stone and Neale (1984). In the 
Intention-Based Coping Inventory, Wills provided adolescents with eight 
coping goals (see Table 2) and asked them to indicate whether they do 
something with the intention of achieving a particular goal during a 
problem situation. Wills had adolescents report on the coping behaviors 
they used for five different problem types: school, parents, health, feeling 
sad, and problems with friends. High consistency in the reported use of a 
given coping response across the five problems was found. 

One practical advantage to an intention-based approach is that the 
coping instruments are typically much shorter than in a behavior-based 
approach. This is because only one item assesses each category in the 
intention-based approach versus several items for each category in the 
behavior-based approach (for an exception, see Spirito et al., 1988). Due to 
the brevity of many intention-based instruments, they are ideal for assess­
ing coping strategies or styles over multiple points in time. A relative 
advantage of the behavior-based approach, with its multiple items for each 
category of coping, is that it might capture a broader range of coping 
strategies when used with younger or middle-school-aged children. 

In considering whether to use either a behavior-based or intention­
based approach, a critical concern had to do with the age and developmen­
tal level of the respondent. Although it probably is not difficult for most 
adults (and some adolescents) to make the necessary abstraction that they 
engaged in certain coping behaviors (e.g., going to the movies) in order to 
avoid thinking about the problem situation or alternatively to just relax, 
these kinds of abstractions (or at least the verbal expression of such) 
become more difficult for younger children. 

7.4. Behavioral Observation Measures of Coping Strategies 

Zeitlin (1980) has developed an observational instrument called the 
Coping Inventory, which was based on Murphy and Moriarty's (1976) 
longitudinal study of children's coping behavior. It is composed of 48 
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items that are rated by a teacher or some other person who has a continu­
ing relationship with the child. The items are rated on a scale of 1 (reflecting 
no or minimal competency) to 5 (behavior is effectively demonstrated). 
The items fall into two categories-coping with the environment, and 
coping with the self-which are analogous to Murphy and Moriarty's 
major categories of Coping I and Coping II, respectively. Within each 
category, items represent three bipolar dimensions that are used to de­
scribe the coping style: productive-nonproductive, active-passive, and 
flexible-rigid. Using two different samples composed of both normal and 
handicapped children, Zeitlin reports high interrater reliabilities (range 
from .78 to .98) and split-half reliability coefficients (range from .96 to .99). 
Zeitlin (1980) and Kurtz (1994) provide some limited information regard­
ing the concurrent validity for the scale. Zeitlin listed the types of coping 
behavior that most differentiated handicapped from nonhandicapped 
young children, and Kurtz reported that children of divorced families had 
a more restrictive range of coping styles than their peers with nondivorced 
parents (see Table 2). 

8. Guidelines for the Assessment of Coping Styles 

From this review of instruments assessing coping styles a few guide­
lines are offered that should aid in the revision and development of future 
coping inventories. 

8.1. Assessing Children's Coping: Using Hypothetical versus Actual 
Events 

As suggested by the review of the efforts to assess coping styles, 
methods have included both self-reports of coping efforts in response to 
hypothetical event stimuli (e.g., Altshuler & Ruble, 1989; Asarnow et al., 
1987; Brown et al., 1986; Egan, Linney, & Forman, 1989) and actual stressful 
events that have occurred in the respondent's lives (e.g., Ayers et al., 1996; 
Band & Weisz, 1988; Compas et al. 1988b; Ebata & Moos, 1991; Wertlieb et 
al., 1987). Investigators have argued that coping should be concerned with 
what a child actually thinks or does to deal with specific problems rather 
than rely on hypothetical situations (e.g., Compas, 1987; Compas, Wor­
sham, & Ey, 1992b; Murphy & Moriarty, 1976; Zeitlin, 1980). The reasoning 
behind this stated preference is the questionable likelihood that the child 
would actually use the coping responses he/ she describes in response to a 
hypothetical situation when confronted with a similar situation in "real" 
life (Lazarus, 1993; Schwarzer & Schwarzer, 1996), the external validity 
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issue. However, one advantage of using hypothetical situations, either 
through written descriptions (Asarnow et al., 1987) or videotape (Egan et 
al., 1989) as stimuli, is that the researcher has more control over the nature 
of the stressful situations to which the child responds, an important inter­
nal validity issue. 

The concern about the external validity of the use of hypothetical or 
actual events mirrors a more basic issue that deserves further investiga­
tion, which is the general relationship between child report of coping to the 
coping behaviors actually performed. Independent verification is obvi­
ouslya difficult challenge for this area, because many coping efforts can be 
assumed to be cognitive in nature and not immediately accessible. As 
noted earlier, some investigators have tackled this problem by assessing 
parental report (Glyshaw et al., 1989) or peer report (Causey & Dubow, 
1992) of children's coping and found moderately high correlations be­
tween the two reporters. 

8.2. Assessment of Coping Styles: Theoretical and Empirical 
Approaches 

Three approaches to the assessment of the dimensions of children's 
coping styles will be discussed: rational or theoretical approaches, empiri­
cal approaches using exploratory factor analysis, and the use of confirma­
tory factor analysis to test both the adequacy of theoretical models and to 
account for the empirical relations found between reports of coping styles. 
Rational approaches use theory to develop dimensions of coping and 
develop items that are derived specifically to assess those dimensions. 
Such scales were often readily interpretable as representing the theoretical 
dimensions of coping and have reasonable psychometric properties and 
relations with measures of children's adjustment (e.g., Herman Stahl, 
Stemmler, & Petersen, 1995). However, it is not known whether these 
dimensions are a good representation of the empirical covariation between 
the items on the scales. 

An exploratory factor-analytic approach typically does not start with 
a theoretical model but identifies dimensions of coping based on the 
covariation between children's reports of coping on the items of the scale. 
Two problems with this approach are that the dimensions are often diffi­
cult to interpret and do not replicate well across populations. As an exam­
ple, closer examination of Wills's Behavior-Based Inventory reveals the 
lack of conceptual clarity that can result with such an atheoretical ap­
proach. In the measure, the subscale Cognitive Coping appears to measure 
two conceptually distinct coping strategies. The majority of the items 
reflect what typically is referred to as positive cognitive restructuring (e.g., 
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"Try to notice only the good things in life"), whereas a subset of the items 
on this same subscale appears to measure strategies that might be better 
labeled as cognitive avoidance (e.g., "Try to put it out of my mind"). These 
types of subscales leave considerable ambiguity in terms of what construct 
the sub scale is actually assessing. 

The second problem associated with these scales derived using ex­
ploratory factor analytic-methods has to do with the stability of the factor 
structure (i.e., subscales) when the instrument is used with other samples. 
Subscales derived by using these techniques are well known for not being 
replicated or cross-validated when the factor structure is tested in other 
samples (Horn, 1967). Often, if the new sample is different in some of the 
subject characteristics, the factor structure does not generalize, even when 
using the same method of extraction, rotation, and rules for determining 
the number of factors as was used in previous investigations. 

As reported earlier, the development of Wills's Behavior-Based Cop­
ing Inventory (1985) provides a good illustration of a situation in which the 
factor structure originally derived using junior high school students was 
not fully replicated in a new sample (Glyshaw et al., 1989). Glyshaw and 
colleagues (1989) used Wills's same inventory in their prospective study of 
coping strategies in junior and senior high school students. Using the same 
factor-analytic technique that Wills had used, they found only 5 of the 11 
factors that replicated those in Wills's original analysis.4 

A confirmatory factor-analytic approach begins with a theoretical 
model of the dimensions of coping and assesses how well this model (or 
alternative theoretical models) accounts for the covariation between re­
sponses on the coping measure. As a reminder, Ayers et al. (1996) found 
that an a priori specified, four-dimensional model of coping provided a 
better fit to the empirical covariation between coping responses than 
alternative two-dimensional models (problem- vs. emotion-focused, or 
approach vs. avoidant coping). In this case, the factor structure was repli­
cated in separate analyses on children in the general population (Ayers et 
al., 1996) and children of divorce (Sandler et al., 1994), reflecting the greater 
likelihood of cross-validating the factor structure when using confirma­
tory factor-analytic methods.5 

Several researchers in the area of the assessment of adult coping 

4Note that these five factors were not the same factors that would have resulted had Wills 
(1985) used the Kasier-Guttman rule or screen test in determining the number of factors to 
retain. 

sAs an aside, the measures of coping style (i.e., CCSC) and the measure of coping strategies 
used in specific situations (i.e., HICUPS) also yielded similar, although not identical factor 
structures (see Ayers et al., 1996). 
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(Aldwin & Revenson, 1987; Carver et al., 1989) and child and adolescent 
coping (Ayers et al., 1996) have recommended that coping instruments 
need to be developed using a theoretical approach. Constructing instru­
ments that are designed to measure a priori the constructs identified 
through careful content analyses yield scales composed of items that are 
clearer measures of the coping dimensions of interest. This has the advan­
tage of greatly simplifying the understanding of the relationships of each 
dimension to theoretically linked outcomes. These theory-based scales can 
be developed and refined in a number of ways. Item response theory 
(Waller, Tellegen, McDonald, & Lykken, 1996) and confirmatory factor 
analysis (Mulaik, 1988) can provide statistical methods for assuring that a 
scale is unidimensional and that the items measure the construct of inter­
est. Given the successful test of an a priori theoretical model of the under­
lying dimensions of coping, the results can be expected to replicate in 
future samples from the same population. 

In a related vein, because these measures of coping styles are intended 
to assess relatively stable dimensions, it is important the instruments de­
veloped have adequate psychometric properties, including but not limited 
to internal consistencies, test-retest reliabilities, and stable factor struc­
tures (as discussed earlier). In this respect, progress in the area of assessing 
child and adolescent coping has been made, yet similar to conclusions 
reached by other recent reviews of primarily adult measures (e.g., Parker 
& Endler, 1992; Schwarzer & Schwarzer, 1996), further work still needs to 
be done. In doing this work, investigators also need to attend to establish­
ing the construct validity of the measures developed. Benson and Hagtvet 
(1996) outline traditional (e.g., correlational and multitrait-multimethod 
designs) and more recent methodological developments and designs (e.g., 
multifaceted measurement designs, generalizability theory, and structural 
equation modeling) that can aid coping investigators in establishing con­
struct validity. 

B.3. Assessing Coping from a Transactional Perspective 

Although use of factor-analytic methods to develop coping checklists 
is probably the most prevalent method, it is notable that some have argued 
that this approach is not consistent with a transactional model of coping 
(e.g., Coyne & Gottlieb, 1996; Stone et al., 1988, 1991). Coyne and colleagues 
(1996) have argued passionately about the problems inherent in the incon­
gruence between the checklist method and a transactional conceptualiza­
tion of coping. Several different types of coping might be used by an 
individual during the process of dealing with any particular stressful situa­
tion or circumstance (Folkman & Lazarus, 1985; Stone et al., 1991). All of 
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these different strategies would theoretically be checked by the individual 
responding to a coping checklist. Factor analysis as a statistical method 
might then create scales that combine the very different coping methods 
into a single factor, simply because they covary temporally. These authors 
(Coyne & Gottlieb, 1996; Stone et aI., 1991) argue that this type of assess­
ment procedure thus effectively obscures potentially interesting patterns 
that may occur during the coping process. 

These authors highlight a limitation of the measures of coping styles 
in that these measures do provide a summary of coping efforts across 
multiple events, and in doing so might not assess how well coping efforts 
match the demands of specific stressful events. To the extent that this match 
between the demands of the situation and the coping strategies used is 
important, the summary measures of coping will underestimate the effects 
of the coping efforts. Investigations that carefully examine the process of 
coping, using the measures coping strategies, do need to be done, and 
these intraindividual approaches to the assessment of coping can illumi­
nate many important issues in the area. However, many of the findings 
regarding significant relationships between coping and outcomes (com­
pare evidence of validity in Tables 1 and 2) have resulted from using 
inventories that assess coping styles, that is, an interindividual approach in 
the assessment of coping (e.g., Causey & Dubow, 1992; Glyshaw et aI., 1989; 
Patterson & McCubbin, 1987a; Sandler et aI., 1994; Wills, 1985, 1986). Based 
on this progress, it seems premature at this point to abandon efforts to 
assess an individual's preferred coping styles in favor of a solely situation­
specific assessment of coping behaviors. 

9. Assessment of Coping from a Developmental Perspective 

Assessment of children's coping necessarily requires attention to de­
velopmental issues. A number of studies have noted age differences in 
problem- and emotion-focused coping (e.g., Altshuler & Ruble, 1989; Band 
& Weisz, 1988; Brodzinsky et aI., 1992; Compas et aI., 1988b; Curry & Russ, 
1985; Ebata & Moos, 1994; Rossman, 1992; Wertlieb et aI., 1987). Specifically, 
the majority of studies (e.g., Altshuler & Ruble, 1989; Band & Weisz, 1988; 
Compas et aI., 1988b; Curry & Russ, 1985; Wertlieb et aI., 1987) have found 
that self-report of emotion-focused coping increases with age (for an ex­
ception, see Rossman, 1992). These studies have led some investigators to 
conclude that emotion-focused strategies increase with age (Compas, Oro­
san, & Grant, 1993; Compas et aI., 1992b). The research on problem-focused 
coping is less consistent and has variously found increases (Ebata & Moos, 
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1994), decreases (Band & Weisz, 1988; Brodzinsky et al., 1992; Curry & Russ, 
1985; Reid et al., 1995) or stability in coping with age (Altshuler & Ruble, 
1989; Compas et al., 1988b; Dusek & Danko, 1994; Phelps & Jarvis, 1994; Wert­
lieb et al., 1987). Further research that focuses on a more fine-grained anal­
ysis of these coping strategies might help to clarify these equivocal findings. 

Although some of these studies suggest that age is associated with 
changes in self-reported coping strategies, they do not indicate how cop­
ing strategies might change with the cognitive, social, and/or emotional 
development of children or adolescents. An initial distinction that needs to 
be made is that changes in chronological age are not necessarily equivalent 
to changes in developmental level. Changes in children's cognitive, social, 
and emotional development may have pervasive effects on the formation 
of various coping styles and strategies. In a reciprocal fashion, the way 
children cope may influence future cognitive, social, and emotional devel­
opment. Although such issues are obviously complex, focusing on these 
relationships is critical to furthering our understanding of the develop­
ment of coping behaviors in children and adolescents. Thus, a develop­
mental perspective should guide the conceptualization and measurement 
of coping processes. 

An extensive review of the potential developmental issues related to 
coping is beyond the scope of this chapter (for recent reviews, see Aldwin, 
1994; Compas, Malcarne, & Banez, 1992a; Compas et al., 1992b). We will 
limit ourselves to several important developmental issues and their impli­
cations for measurement of coping processes. Some argue that individuals 
begin to effortfully cope with their environment from an early age (Ald­
win, 1994). Aldwin notes that "infants are not passive recipients of parental 
care" (p. 218) and points out that babies use a number of strategies to 
regulate their external (e.g., they bat at blankets covering their head) and 
internal environments (e.g., they regulate the amount of stimulation by 
closing their eyes and comfort themselves by sucking their own thumb). If 
we adopt Compas and colleagues' (1997, in press) distinction between 
voluntary and involuntary responses to stress, to the extent that these are 
volitional attempts to deal with stress, these strategies could be considered 
problem- and emotion-focused coping, respectively. If we do not have 
confidence that these behaviors represent volitional attempts, they un­
doubtedly are important in the development of future coping strategies or 
repertoires. 

As children mature, more complex strategies and cognitive strategies 
emerge. For example, Spivak et al. (1976) found that the ability to generate 
multiple solutions to interpersonal problems emerges as early as 4-5 years 
and that more complex means-ends thinking appears between ages 6-8. 
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However, even for children as old as 5 years, "simple" coping strategies 
such as thumb sucking and rocking are still present. In these early years, 
coping responses are largely behavioral. Aldwin (1994) suggests that it is 
possible that some children may not develop cognitive strategies to regu­
late emotion and may continue to rely largely upon behavioral emotion­
focused strategies. This suggests the importance of continued assessment 
of these behavioral emotion-focused strategies. 

During middle childhood and adolescence, the development and 
increase in metacognitive functioning (e.g., Flavell, 1985) may be an impor­
tant skill that allows an older child to consider several different cognitive 
strategies at a time. This ability may account for the increase in cognitive 
coping strategies that older children report generating and utilizing dur­
ing stressful problem situations (Band & Weisz, 1990; Brown et al., 1986; 
Curry & Russ, 1985; Wilson, Hoffner, & Cantor, 1987). 

Another developmental issue relevant to coping assessment is that 
children's sources of support change over time, shifting from a heavy 
reliance on parental figures to peers. Maccoby (1983) emphasizes that for 
young children who lack a large repertoire of coping strategies, a primary 
strategy operates; that is, "In case of threat, go to attachment figures" (p. 
223). She suggests that the mere presence of an attachment figure facilitates 
the coping of young children. However, peer support is particularly salient 
for adolescents. The type of coping assistance children desire (e.g., secu­
rity, help solving a problem) may also change with age, and/or become 
more situation-specific. The measurement of children's support-seeking 
coping should attend to these issues, considering both the potential 
sources and functions of support. In addition, the presence or absence of 
attachment figures during stressful situations may be an important aspect 
of young children's coping. 

Developmental changes in the appraisal of the stressor may influence 
children's coping. Boekaerts (1996) suggests that as children age and gain 
experience with different situations, they become more skilled at apprais­
ing the dimensions of a stressful situation. Specifically, their ability to 
ascertain the valence, controllability, changeability, ambiguity, recurrence, 
and familiarity of the situation develops. The ability to match the demands 
of the situation with appropriate coping responses may also improve with 
development. There is some evidence that appropriate judgment of con­
trollability and coping matching improves with age (Blanchard-Fields, & 
Irion, 1988). Blanchard-Fields and Irion (1988) found that although adoles­
cents use more emotion-focused coping regardless of controllability, older 
adults use more problem-focused coping for controllable stressors and 
more emotion-focused coping for uncontrollable stressors. This implies 
that the investigation of the development of children's coping would 
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benefit from attention to developmental changes in situational appraisal 
processes. Finally, it is important to recognize that the function of a particu­
lar coping strategy may differ by developmental level. This could call into 
question the proposition that emotion-focused and problem-focused di­
mensionality meaningfully distinguishes coping functions across all de­
velopmentallevels. Indeed, Compas and colleagues (Compas & Worsham, 
1991, as cited in Compas et al., 1992b) have found that the use of complex 
coping strategies that serve dual purposes (emotion- and problem-focused) 
increases with age. 

It is clear that developmental considerations should play an impor­
tant role in both the conceptualization and measurement of children's 
coping. This is particularly important as research on children's coping 
turns to study of the development of children's coping strategies and 
styles. To embark on this line of investigation, it is crucial that instruments 
are sensitive to developmental issues and tap a broad range of cognitive 
and behavioral coping strategies. In doing so, the instruments are more 
likely to be socially and ecologically valid. 

10. Conclusion 

The assessment of coping strategies and styles in children and ado­
lescents has benefited greatly from the adult literature. The dominant 
conceptualizations of the construct have moved gradually toward a more 
transactional perspective that recognizes the importance of both the char­
acteristics of the situation and the appraisal processes of the individual 
and the significant influence these factors have upon an individual's cop­
ing response. The conceptualization and classification of coping strategies 
and styles is still hotly debated, yet the relative advantages and disadvan­
tages of assessing either coping strategies and styles are becoming clearer 
to researchers in the area. Current work has suggested that a further 
understanding of coping processes might benefit from a more fine-grained 
analysis of coping thoughts and behaviors. In addition, little is currently 
known about the influence that cognitive, social, and emotional develop­
mental processes may have on the development of children's coping styles 
or strategies. The investigation of the development of coping strategies 
and styles in children presents itself as a complex and difficult task for 
future researchers in this area. Such research will most likely require 
different measures of children's coping that are age appropriate, reliable, 
and valid. The review of the current literature and the suggestions offered 
in this chapter should help guide the development of future coping instru­
ments that meet these standards. 
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9 New Developments 
in Services Delivery Research 

for Children, Adolescents, 
and Their Families 

ANDRES J. PUMARIEGA AND SAUNDRA GLOVER 

1. Introduction 

1.1. Significance of Services Research 

Child and adolescent mental health services research is a relatively new 
field in the behavioral sciences, but one that has gained increasing atten­
tion and significance. It involves the study of the access, utilization, financ­
ing, and clinical- and cost-effectiveness of mental health services provided 
to children and adolescents, as well as the functioning and effectiveness of 
child mental health, health, and social service systems of care. 

A number of recent trends have led to the increasing importance of 
this field. First, the increasing utilization and demonstrated need for child 
mental health services in the United States and other Western nations has 
spurred rapid growth of such services. Although child and adolescent 
mental illness and emotional disturbance were once thought to be rela­
tively rare events, recent studies suggest an overall prevalence rate of 15% 
to 19% and 3% to 8% for serious mental illness and emotional disturbance 
(Knitzer, 1982; Tuma, 1989). However, at anyone time less than 1% of 
children in the United States receive mental health treatment in hospital or 

ANDRES J. PUMARIEGA • Department of Psychiatry and Behavioral Sciences, James H. 
Quillen College of Medicine, East Tennessee State University, Johnson City, Tennessee 
36714. SAUNDRA GLOVER • School of Public Health, University of South Carolina, Co­
lumbia, South Carolina 29208. 

Advances in Clinical Child Psychology, Volume 20, edited by Thomas H. Ollendick and Ronald J. 
Prinz. Plenum Press, New York, 1998. 

303 



304 ANDRES J. PUMARIEGA AND SAUNDRA GLOVER 

residential settings and another 5% in outpatient or community-based 
settings, with the majority of children in need receiving insufficient ser­
vices or no mental health services whatsoever (Inouye, 1988; Tuma, 1989). 
In spite of this, the budgets dedicated to financing both public and private 
mental health services for children have grown exponentially since the 
1970s, with total expenditures growing to $4.8 billion, comprising approx­
imately 7% of the total national mental health budget (Burns, Taube, & 
Taube, 1990). A broad array of morbidities associated with emotional 
disturbances and mental illness are increasing at alarming rates among 
children and youth, including suicide, homicide, substance abuse, child 
abuse, teenage pregnancy, school dropout, youth crime, and associated 
institutionalization and incarceration. A number of health and human 
service agencies (schools, social welfare agencies, child protective agen­
cies, juvenile justice, public health), in addition to mental health agencies, 
have experienced the increasing impact of these psychosocial morbidities 
being experienced by children and youth. Most frequently, each of these 
agencies addresses a piece of the service system puzzle with little or no 
coordination with other agencies often serving the same youth (Knitzer, 
1982). 

There is increasing need and utilization of mental health services by 
culturally diverse populations of children and adolescents. Such popula­
tions are increasing both proportionately and in overall numbers in the 
United States and Western Europe. This is as a result of higher birth rates 
and accelerating immigration. Children from these populations experi­
ence higher levels of stressors, such as poverty, discrimination, accultura­
tion stress, and exposure to violence and trauma associated with their 
minority status in society, as well as the stressors involved in immigration. 
However, these populations traditionally have been underserved in terms 
of mental health, health, and human services, both in terms of overall 
access to services as well as the cultural competence of the services avail­
able to them. The increasing cost of serving these populations of children 
and adolescents is set in contrast to the cost of the high level of psycho­
social morbidity they contend with, both in terms of lost potential produc­
tivity as citizens and the costs of welfare dependency and institutionaliza­
tion (Cross, Bazron, Dennis, & Isaacs, 1988; Pumariega & Cross, 1997). 

At the same time as these needs are recognized, there are increasingly 
limited resources available to fund child mental health and human ser­
vices. An increasing suspicion of governmental programs and weariness 
over increasing taxation have led politicians and policy makers to look for 
ways of limiting or even cutting public budgets dedicated to health and 
human services. Private funding for such services has experienced similar 
constraints, with business and industry expressing increasing concerns 
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about the rising costs of health and mental health care, especially the 
growing percentage of such spending on child and adolescent mental 
health. These trends have increased pressures on child mental health 
service providers and systems of care to demonstrate improved clinical 
and cost-effectiveness so as not to face the restriction or curtailment of 
services. The role of services research in informing providers, policy 
makers, and payers on clinically and cost-effective approaches is becom­
ing progressively important (Hoagwood, Jensen, Petti, & Bums, 1996). 

1.2. Emergence of Children's Mental Health Systems of Care 

From its earliest origins, mental health services for children have 
emphasized a community orientation. These services in fact began in the 
United States in response to the perceived need for counseling juvenile 
offenders rather than incarcerating them with adult offenders. This was 
the case in the 1890s, when America, much as today, was undergoing rapid 
cultural changes due to immigration as well as rapid industrialization and 
urbanization. These social strains led to marked increases in crime com­
mitted by juveniles. Enlightened reformers saw the need for detaining 
young offenders separately from adult prisoners, adjudicating them in a 
separate court system (thus, the beginning of the juvenile courts) and pro­
viding rehabilitative services to them. The juvenile court clinics in Chicago 
and Boston gave rise to the first child mental health services in the nation. 
The success of these clinics led the Commonwealth Foundation to commis­
sion a study that recommended the development of child guidance clinics 
throughout the United States, and that these be staffed with interdisciplin­
ary teams of professionals who could serve the child and the family. These 
clinics at first were primarily staffed by social workers but later attracted 
pediatricians, psychologists, psychoanalysts, and psychiatrists, and later 
served as the bases of the first child psychiatry programs in the nation. 
These clinics were quite removed from the specialty-driven medical sys­
tem that was evolving in tertiary medical centers, and particularly apart 
from the practice of hospital-bound care. They provided low-cost services 
oriented to the needs of the child and the family, with treatment modalities 
evolving to include individual psychodynamic psychotherapy, family 
therapy, crisis intervention, and even day-treatment programs. Many have 
survived to this day and have served as the core for the child mental health 
services in many community mental health centers (Berlin, 1991). 

The move toward the medicalization of psychiatry served to move 
child and adolescent mental health services toward a more hospital-based, 
tertiary-care model. This left the child guidance clinics and the community 
mental health centers that followed them without significant psychiatric 



306 ANDRES J. PUMARIEGA AND SAUNDRA GLOVER 

input as well as generally understaffed and underfunded, neglecting the 
development of children's services. In the meantime, the United States 
experienced an explosion in the population of poor, minority children who 
needed significant mental health services but could not access them easily, 
leading to increasing morbidity among them. Many of these children came 
into the custody of child service agencies due to their parents' inability to 
care for them in their home environments and went on to be cared for in 
residential and detention facilities. In the meantime, the use of hospital­
level care for the psychiatric treatment of children and adolescents in­
creased exponentially throughout the late 1970s and 1980s, leading to 
spiraling costs for private and public insurers alike. 

The modern era of community-based systems of care was ushered by 
the publication of Jane Knitzer's (1982) groundbreaking book Unclaimed 
Children, which exposed the aforementioned consequences of neglecting 
the provision of commUnity-based mental health services for children and 
their families. Her advocacy, as well as that of others, led to the develop­
ment of such services as the Child and Adolescent Service System Program 
(CASSP), which assisted all 50 states in the development of an infrastruc­
ture for publically funded community-based services (Lourie & Katz­
Leavy, 1986). The CASSP initiative was supported by the conceptual work 
of Stroul and Friedman (1986), who coined the phrase "community-based 
system of care for seriously emotionally disturbed children" and advo­
cated interagency coordination among all of the child service agencies in 
the provision of mental health services for children and related family 
support services. Stroul and Friedman proposed that such services be 
delivered as close to the child's home and community as possible to avert 
the use of more restrictive levels of care, which often served to separate 
children from natural family and community supports, and that families 
be involved as partners in the effective treatment for the child (Friesen & 
Koroloff, 1990). 

The CASSP initiative set forth the initial principles inherent in 
community-based systems of care as developed by Stroul and Friedman 
(1986). The key aspects of these systems include access to a comprehensive 
array of services, treatment individualized to the child's needs, treatment 
in the least restrictive environment possible (with full utilization of the 
resources of the family and the community), full participation of families 
as partners in services planning and delivery, interagency coordination, 
the use of case management for services coordination, no ejection or 
rejection from services due to lack of "treatability" or "cooperation" with 
interventions, early identification and intervention, smooth transition of 
youth into the adult service system, effective advocacy efforts, and non­
discriminating, culturally sensitive services. 
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This latter principle was further developed by the CASSP Minority 
Initiative into the principles of culturally competent systems of care for 
children with serious emotional disturbances (Cross, Bazron, Dennis, & 
Isaacs, 1988), which proposed that systems of care include practitioner 
guidelines for necessary attitudes, skill and knowledge base to serve 
minority and culturally diverse children and families in their commu­
nities, as well as policies and procedures to remove barriers for access to 
services. The concept of culturally competent systems of care was a natural 
outgrowth from that of community-based systems of care, because the 
latter endorses many of the traditional cultural values of ethnic minority 
populations in the United States. These are particularly consonant with the 
cultural values of ethnic minority populations, which emphasize strong 
extended family involvement in the life and upbringing of children and 
the use of natural community resources first in dealing with the emotional 
and physical problems of family members. These factors have been shown 
to be protective from some of the morbidities associated with emotional 
disturbance, such as substance abuse and suicidality (Pumariega, Swan­
son, Holzer, Linskey, & Quintero-Salinas, 1992). 

Another important principle inherent in this approach is that of the 
targeting of services to what are termed "seriously emotionally disturbed 
children." The formal definition of serious emotional disturbance is listed 
in Table 1. This definition, though it includes the presence of an Axis I 
diagnosis under the Diagnostic and Statistical Manual of Mental Disorders 
(DSM-IV; American Psychiatric Association, 1994) as a criterion, places 
equal emphasis on the child's inability to function in at least one of his Iher 
life domains (school, home, socially with peers, etc.). This is reflective of 
the difficulty that many children and their families have had in accessing 
necessary services when their diagnoses were not "severe enough," or 
when they reflected a disruptive behavior disorder. This bias still exists 
among many child mental health professionals, particularly psychiatrists, 
and ignores some key clinical and research observations. First, most clini­
cians have had children in treatment who have been diagnosed with 
serious disorders, such as schizophrenia, but have been totally able to 
function in their homes with treatment and some community supports, 
whereas other children with diagnoses reflecting disruptive behavior dis­
orders have necessitated the most restrictive levels of care available. Some 
studies indicate lack of clarity and validity in clinical child diagnosis, 
especially in relation to the prognosis of the child, with many children with 
disruptive behavioral disorders having comorbid serious mental illness 
when evaluated systematically (Caron & Rutter, 1991). These problems are 
more pronounced in the diagnostic assessment of ethnic minority youth 
with serious emotional disturbance, with serious underestimation of com-
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TABLE 1 
Federal Definition of Childhood Serious Emotional Disturbancea 

Children with a serious emotional disturbance are persons: from birth up to age 18; 
who currently or at any time during the past year have had a diagnosable mental, 
behavioral, or emotional disorder of sufficient duration to meet diagnostic criteria 
specified with DSM-III-R, that resulted in functional impairment which substan­
tially interferes with or limits the child's role or functioning in family, school, or 
community activities. 

These disorders include any mental disorder (including those of biological etiol­
ogy) listed in DSM-III-R or their ICS-9-CM equivalent (and subsequent revisions), 
with the exception of -R "V" codes, substance use, and developmental disorders, 
which are excluded, unless they co-occur with another diagnosable serious emo­
tional disturbance. All of these disorders have episodic, recurrent, or persistent 
features; however, they vary in terms of severity and disabling effects. 

Functional impairment is defined as difficulties that substantially interfere with or 
limit a child or adolescent from achieving or maintaining one or more develop­
mentally-appropriate social, behavioral, cognitive, communicative, or adaptive 
skills. Functional impairments of episodic, recurrent, and continuous duration are 
included unless they are temporary and expected responses to stressful events in 
the environment. Children who would have met functional impairment criteria 
during the referenced year without the benefit of treatment or other support 
services are included in this definition. 

-Center for Mental Health Services (1993). Federal Register, 58, 29422-29425. 

orbid affective and substance abuse disorders and overestimation of psy­
chotic and organic disorders by clinicians (Kilgus, Pumariega, & Cuffe, 
1995). Other studies indicate that the level of care received by children is 
only partially accounted for by their clinical diagnoses, with much of it 
accounted by their level of function and psychosocial stressors (Silver et 
al.,1992). 

1.3. Emergence of Child Mental Health Services Research 

The emergence of epidemiological and public health models as ap­
proaches in understanding health and disease was a necessary first step 
toward the development of child mental health services research. These 
models presented a population model for the understanding of health and 
disease that is consistent with the philosophy behind community-based 
systems of care. These approaches converge with respect to (1) an under­
standing of ecological factors involved in health and disease and (2) an 
orientation toward prevention using the natural supports found in the 
population. 
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The research methodology that has emerged to support the public 
health model is consistent with a systems-of-care and community-based 
approach. This methodology involves the use of systematic population­
survey approaches using reliable and valid instruments that are acceptable 
and appropriate for the population being studied. It includes qualitative 
ethnographic and anthropological methods that place systematic, quan­
titative measures in an appropriate ecological context. The development of 
more systematic and efficient measurement and data collection methods in 
mental health has contributed to the feasibility and validity of mental 
health services research (Costello, Burns, Angold, & Leaf, 1993). 

These advancements influenced the development of mental health 
epidemiological research. They culminated with the Epidemiologic Catch­
ment Area (ECA) Study, funded and fielded by the National Institute of 
Mental Health, to assess the mental health status and needs of adults in the 
United States. This landmark study included the first large-scale use of 
standardized instrumentation for the measurement of symptomatology 
and psychopathology. The methodology established a community-based, 
household-sampling frame in multiple sites, geared to developing a re­
gionally and nationally representative sample. The ECA study surveyed 
respondents on their utilization of mental health and substance abuse 
services, as well as on associated factors such as socioeconomic status and 
ethnicity. It established the first accepted prevalence rates for overall men­
tal illness/ emotional disturbance, as well as the underutilization of formal 
mental health services by adults, with most going untreated or partially 
treated by primary care practitioners. The significant findings of the ECA 
with adult populations spurred the development of child mental health 
epidemiological research and services research (Robins, 1985; Robins, 
Helzer, Ratcliff, & Seyfried, 1982). 

2. Methodological Challenges in Child Mental Health Services 
Research 

Child and adolescent mental health services research involves a num­
ber of special methodological challenges beyond those faced in the study 
of adults. Conceptual models outlined by Hoagwood et al. (1996), Puma­
riega, Holliday, and Holzer (1995), and Pumariega (1996) provide guides 
for the methodological issues that need to be addressed in conducting 
such research. The main areas of methodological focus in child mental 
health services research are outlined here, along with recent advances and 
current approaches used to address them. 
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2.1. Participant Sampling and Recruitment 

The sampling and recruitment of participants involve a number of vari­
ables and limitations presented by the approaches used. In studying gen­
eral populations, the two main approaches used are community /household 
sampling and school-based sampling. Community-based sampling has 
the advantage of being able to study the child's mental health status and 
use of services within the context of family and neighborhood/ community, 
both of which present important facilitating and inhibitory factors toward 
service use. Community-based sampling facilitates the evaluation of eco­
logical factors such as geographic location, socioeconomic status,and 
culture and ethnicity. It also facilitates parental involvement in studies. 
However, such an approach is extremely resource-intensive and expen­
sive, given the need for a large number of field interviewers, access to 
extensive background data for sampling frames (census data, utility hook­
up data, etc.), and difficulty in obtaining sufficiently large samples. 

A unique available alternative with children and adolescents is 
school-based sampling. The ready access to children within school settings 
has a number of inherent advantages. The high concentration of partici­
pants within schools and the availability of classrooms for group instru­
ment administration (which is a familiar, structured setting for test admin­
istration for children) leads to much higher levels of efficiency and lower 
resource utilization. Schools offer readily available collateral databases 
that can be used for establishing sampling frames as well as for collateral 
and confirmatory data, particularly data valuable to determine the child's 
cognitive capacities and functional status. The availability of teachers 
provides access to more objective observer informants who have the built­
in advantage of regular contact with large cohorts of children for compari­
son. Schools already provide a large proportion of the mental health 
services utilized by children and adolescents, particularly services to less 
severely disturbed children, much as primary care practitioners with 
adults, so they are primary sites for studying service delivery. The dis­
advantages of school-based sampling and administration include the lack 
of family and community context, the relative lack of access to parents and 
family respondents, and greater administrative and communication prob­
lems involved in obtaining consent and in-depth data collection. For 
community-based studies, a combination of these approaches, using 
schools for screening phases/stages, and households for more in-depth 
data collection and follow-up, may be the most effective approach (Puma­
riega et al., 1985). 

A number of issues in the recruitment of subjects are important to 
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address regardless of the sampling setting. Consent procedures with chil­
dren are more complicated, because their dependent legal and intellectual 
status necessitates greater protection. Direct consent by parents, as well as 
assent from adolescents and older children, must be obtained in any study 
that pursues any in-depth information or involves the recording of the 
respondent's identity. In minimal, school-based surveys where limited, 
nonsensitive data are obtained, "passive" consent procedures at times can 
be utilized where the parent is notified of the survey and given the oppor­
tunity to review the instruments at the school, with ample time to object to 
the child's participation. However, these require approval from an institu­
tional research board (IRB) and the school's administration. Family and 
child recruitment, however, are essential given the importance of multi­
informant data collection with children's mental health data collection (see 
section 2.2.1). To successfully obtain community support in order to maxi­
mize recruitment and involvement, researchers must present the rationale 
of the study and the potential general benefits in terms of improving 
services to children to community leaders at various levels. Community 
leaders can give input on study design and implementation, which can 
improve acceptability of the methodology and prevent costly pitfalls. 
Recruiting research assistants from the community being studied can 
promote acceptance by that community as well as provide invaluable 
informal consultation on the customs, values, and concerns of the commu­
nity and local culture. The latter two approaches are particularly impor­
tant for longitudinal studies, where the ability to track respondents is 
essential (Pumariega et aI., 1995; Pumariega, 1996). 

Institutional sampling from clinics, treatment centers, and social ser­
vice agencies is often the crux of mental health services research, because 
these are often the sites where services are delivered, but it presents unique 
challenges. The sampling frames are typically developed out of institu­
tional databases and rosters, which have variable levels of reliability and 
validity (see section 2.3). However, access to clinically and functionally 
relevant database information, which can be contrasted with systematic 
data, access to the service delivery process and data, and access to service 
providers, can be particularly valuable. Limitations of institutional sam­
pling include limited access to family and school collateral respondents, 
the interface between the clinical/intervention process and the research 
process (which can confound either process), complications in obtaining 
consent from parents or custodial agencies, and the lack of context within 
the community. Again, combining institutional with community-based 
sampling and data collection can balance the limitations and advantages of 
these approaches. 



312 ANDRES J. PUMARIEGA AND SAUNDRA GLOVER 

2.2. Measurement and Instrumentation Techniques 

2.2.1. Characteristics of Instruments 

A number of characteristics are essential in any instruments used in 
child mental health services research. Children's cognitive and emotional 
status lead to limitations in their serving as sole informants on their 
behaviors, particularly on externalizing behaviors. However, the child's 
perspective is equally important as that of parents and other observers, 
particularly in internalizing problems. Parents have limitations in their 
objectivity as respondents about their child's behavior, and their utiliza­
tion and response to interventions. Multi-informant approaches to data 
collection, which use input from the child, parent(s), and other significant 
adult observers (such as teachers, clinicians, and mentors), are particularly 
important and have been shown to offer a higher level of validity (Verhulst 
& Koot, 1992). 

Validity and reliability of instrumentation or any other data source are 
critical to the validity and significance of results. Increasingly, instruments 
have the requisite reliability and validity data, although this is not always 
the case across gender and ethnic groups. Another common source of con­
found for reliability and validity of responses that is inherent in mental 
health services research is that of response burden. This is particularly true 
for structured diagnostic interviews, although a similar risk is present in 
any lengthy direct data-collection procedure. A phenomenon can result in 
which the validity of such a lengthy instrument can greatly exceed its 
reliability due to respondent retest learning and fatigue, with the respon­
dent deducing the most expeditious approach to finish the instrument 
regardless of validity of response. The development of brief and time­
limited instrumentation and data-collection procedures, focused on criti­
cal aspects of hypothesis testing, and the development of approaches to 
inquiry that can maximally engage the respondent are essential. Addi­
tionally, the collection of critical data from collateral sources can help 
preserve informant responsiveness (Verhulst & Koot, 1992; Pumariega et 
al.,1995). 

2.2.2. Database Data Collection 

Mental health services research is frequently dependent on informa­
tion from established service-based databases. These offer a number of 
advantages as well as containing a number of inherent limitations. Ready 
access to information that is already collected during the process of service 
delivery offers real-time data collection at the time of service delivery, 
which is potentially more reliable than retrospective consumer or provider 
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data on actual service utilization. It reduces the burden on informants by 
using collateral sources of information. With the use of electronic data­
bases, it is possible to pursue interlinkage of databases across multiple 
providers and sources as long as there are common identifiers for individ­
ual data. This allows the merging and concurrent analysis of data on 
different types of service utilization (mental health, social services, educa­
tional services, juvenile justice, etc.), cost and expenditures on services 
(form Medicaid or other third-party payers), indirect functional outcomes 
and associated morbidities (from service agencies listed earlier). Such data 
are invaluable in a comprehensive service system design, as well as in 
policy and cost-related service system planning. 

Obviously, the ideal would be the design of databases based on 
systematic data collection at the time of service that integrates useful data 
fields and objective rating instruments, as well as outlines clear procedures 
for reliability in coding and data entry and data reliability checks. How­
ever, the reality is that most services research utilizes databases that were 
designed and implemented prior to the study, with the primary goal of 
administrative management. There are a number of limitations and pitfalls 
that need to be considered in the use of preexisting databases. Reliability of 
coding and entry needs to be closely examined, particularly the degree of 
subjective interpretation used by coders and entry personnel. Generally, 
the closer to service provider entry, the more confidence in the validity and 
reliability of the data. Data collection and inscription procedures (and 
associated training for such), clarity of coding, and ease of translation from 
paper data need to be examined. Changes in coding and data fields that 
may have occurred over time in the development and maintenance of the 
database may need to be identified and conformed. Unique identifiers for 
clients are necessary in order to prevent duplicate entries, as well as being 
able to accurately link individual clients to their unique characteristics and 
service utilization. There may be other technical issues involved in the 
compatibility of the software used in developing and collecting the 
database with other databases and with data-analysis packages. The com­
bined use of information collected directly from consumers and providers, 
as well as from databases, lends a useful balance in any services research 
design (Pumariega et al., 1995). 

2.3. Domains of Measurement 

2.3.1. Respondent and Family Identifiers 

Age, gender, socioeconomic status, ethnicity, geographic location (in­
ner city / urban, rural, suburban, neighborhood, etc.), cognitive and educa­
tional status, parental marital status, legal status, and custodial status are 
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only a few identifiers that are important variables in service access, utiliza­
tion, and outcomes. The face validity and reliability of these data are rarely 
questioned, yet the source and manner in which they are collected can con­
found these essential characteristics. For example, respondents can with­
hold data out of fear of how they could be used (e.g., termination of custody, 
termination of benefits, or stigmatization), at times calling into question 
the validity of other information obtained simultaneously. When these 
data are presented in a categorical manner, the categorical sets may not 
correspond to the respondents' perspective on the variable. At times, a 
given respondent may not be able to respond to particular variables, such 
as a child often not knowing their parent(s) educational level, their par­
ents' marital status or their own custodial status, or even whether they live 
in a rural or suburban setting. Careful consideration needs to be given to 
the appropriate source for given identifiers, the categorization used for 
them, assurance of confidentiality when obtaining certain information, 
and the importance of such variables in answering a particular research or 
evaluation question. The use of valid and reliable collateral sources (such 
as databases) and measures for these variables can help provide external 
validity as well as reduce respondent burden (see section 2.2.1). For exam­
ple, a novel approach to determine urbanicity as well as the geographic 
distribution of a number of identifiers is the technique of geocoding. This 
technique uses mapping technology linked to various databases to iden­
tify the socioeconomic and sociocultural characteristics of various regions 
and neighborhoods. This technique can greatly enhance the ecological 
context in which identifiers are placed, as well as reduce the reliance on 
individual responses for certain identifiers (Pumariega, 1996; Pumariega et 
al.,1995). 

2.3.2. Clinical Instruments: Symptomatic and Diagnostic 

The development of symptomatic and diagnostic instruments have 
been based on three major directions within child mental health research 
and clinical measurement: 

1. The emerging psychiatric diagnostic nosology, based on a more 
descriptive, nontheoretical approach, eventually led to the development of 
the Diagnostic and Statistical Manual of Mental Disorders (American Psychi­
atric Association, 1994). This nosology has facilitated the development of 
systematic diagnostic instruments, such as the Diagnostic Interview 
Schedule for Children (OISC; Shaffer et al., 1996) and the Diagnostic Inter­
view for Children and Adolescents (OICA; Herjanic & Reich, 1982), which 
can be administered either by clinicians or trained lay interviewers to 
systematically evaluate the presence of diagnosed mental or emotional 
disorders as the presence of subdiagnostic symptomatology. 
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2. The development of diagnostic- or syndrome-related symptom 
checklists, facilitated the identification of particular disorders in at-risk 
individuals and the measurement of symptom reduction by focused inter­
ventions can either be self-rated by the child and significant respondents 
such as parents or teachers, or can be clinician-rated based on contact with 
the child. Included among these are the Conners Scales (Conners, 1969), 
the Child Depression Inventory (Kovacs, 1981), and the State-Trait Anxiety 
Scale (Spielberger, 1973). 

3. Empirically derived instruments, which measure behavioral symp­
tomatologyand social function, have been developed as means of identify­
ing children with significant emotional or behavioral disturbances, offer­
ing an alternative to diagnostically driven identification. Additionally, 
these serve as efficient means of screening populations of children, be­
cause many are directly self-administered by key informants, such as the 
child, parent, and teacher, without needing significant interviewer assis­
tance. The Child Behavior Checklist and related instruments developed by 
Achenbach (1991) serve as the prime example of and standard for this type 
of instrument. 

2.3.3. Functional Status of the Child and Family 

The community-based systems approach has raised an important 
concern that has been supported by research findings (Caron & Rutter, 
1991) as well as clinical experience. Quite often, the severity of a child's 
condition is not necessary related to his/her diagnostic or formal clinical 
status. It may be more clearly expressed in an inability to meet the expecta­
tions and requisite adaptive behaviors necessary to successfully negotiate 
roles within the family, with peers, and in school or other organized 
settings. This has led at times to the exclusion of children with so-called 
behavioral disorders that have no immediately identified biological basis, 
often referred as having serious emotional disturbance, from treatment 
settings. Another reason for exclusion is the fact that treating and caring 
for such children may actually be more difficult and taxing on mental 
health professionals than children with readily identified, biologically 
based disorders. Additionally, treatment plans and interventions may at 
times improve more formal clinical symptoms but may not address the 
child's function in the Significant areas of life. This may in fact be explained 
by the focus on negative behaviors or symptoms in treatment and care 
planning, while the development of positive adaptive capacities receives 
secondary or incidental attention. 

In order to more accurately reflect the true level of function in children 
with serious emotional disturbances, as well as to measure the outcome 
effectiveness of treatment interventions on children's positive functional 
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skills, a group of children's functional rating measures have been devel­
oped over the past few years. These are generally clinician-rated, or at 
times parent-rated, and evaluate the child's function across different im­
portant areas of daily function. Previously, the Global Assessment of Func­
tioning developed for the DSM and a children's adaptation titled the 
Children's Global Assessment Scale (C-GAS; Shaffer et al., 1983) served as 
the main methods of functional assessment. However, these were non­
specific to area of function and did not reflect clinical reality with children 
and adolescents, who can vary in their functioning across domains. These 
new scales address the issue of severity not only from the standpoint of 
overall function, but also the pervasiveness of the child's inability to 
function. The Child and Adolescent Functional Assessment Scale by 
Hodges (Hodges & Wong, 1996) is currently considered the best such 
measure, but many others are in development or being implemented in 
system-of-care studies. 

Another area of functioning that has received attention from child 
mental health researchers in recent years has been that of family function­
ing. A number of reliable and valid measures have been developed that 
evaluate family functioning objectively, integrating the responses of mul­
tiple family members into a common score. The paradigms on which these 
measures are based focus increasingly on empirical and atheoretical do­
mains such as communication, resolution of conflict, problem-solving ca­
pacity, organization, role definition, and consistency of expectations/rules. 
The Family Assessment Device (FAD; Epstein, Baldwin, & Bishop, 1983), 
the Family Adaptation and Cohesion Evaluation Scale (FACES; McCubbin 
& Patterson, 1981), and the Family Assessment Measure III (FAM III; 
Skinner, Steinhauer, & Santa-Barbara, 1984) are the most widely used 
family-functioning instruments in the context of evaluating children's 
mental health status and services outcomes. 

2.3.4. Associated Psychosocial Morbidities 

A negative aspect related to function is the identification of associated 
adverse social and behavioral morbidities in children served within sys­
tems of care. This includes such behaviors as truancy, runaway behavior, 
school dropout, teen pregnancy, HIV-infection rates, youth offenses, incar­
ceration or other institutionalization, youth homicide, and youth suicide. 
Such morbidities are rarely the responsibility of the formal mental health 
system, and are more likely assigned to the child welfare, juvenile justice, 
educational system, courts, and public health system. However, a public 
health approach is most valuable and effective in influencing systems of 
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care to address these morbidities. The measurement of such morbidities in 
populations of children and youth provides valuable outcome domains, 
especially given the high social and financial costs of their increasing 
prevalence. Data on such behaviors and events are most reliably found in 
agency databases, though the reliability of the data can vary greatly. Self­
report or family-report data can be useful but may suffer from validity 
problems unless verified through multiple informants (Pumariega et aI., 
1995). 

2.3.5. Consumer Attitudes/Satisfaction 

With the increased emphasis on the needs and empowerment of 
consumers and families, child mental health services research has begun to 
focus on the attitudes and perceptions of consumers, how these are influ­
enced, and, conversely, how these influence mental health service delivery 
and outcomes. Consumer satisfaction is perceived to be an important 
outcome from services, particularly because it determines the acceptability 
of services and, consequently, whether services are accessed and utilized. 
However, initial studies indicate that consumer satisfaction is a domain 
that is independent from level of function and symptomatic level resulting 
from interventions (Rosenblatt, 1996). Therefore, all three need to be con­
sidered separately and not inferred from the others in any services evalua­
tion or research design. The degree of involvement of consumers in the 
treatment-planning and selection process, and the sensitivity and respon­
siveness to individual consumer and family developmental, functional, 
and cultural needs, are important process variables to be considered in 
conjunction with consumer satisfaction. Conversely, preexisting consumer 
attitudes, values, and beliefs can impact on whether accessing services is 
even considered in the first place. Issues of societal stigma, consumers' 
culturally determined values and beliefs about mental health, and the 
underlying value assumptions in service systems and interventions are 
important process variables to examine the interaction between consumer 
attitudes, provider attitudes, and access to services (DeChillo, Koren, & 
Schulte, 1994). Measures such as the Family Empowerment Scale (Singh et 
aI., 1995) and the Family Involvement Scale (Singh et aI., 1996a, 1996b) have 
been developed to measure the degree of family involvement, participa­
tion, and input into the treatment planning and implementation process. 
Garland and Besinger (1996), Young, Nicholson, and Davis (1995), and 
Schwab and Stone (1983) give excellent in-depth reviews of the consumer­
satisfaction literature in child mental health services, as well as compre­
hensive discussions of current methodologies. 
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2.3.6. Services Access and Utilization 

Two important areas of focus for services research are (1) the access 
that potential clients and families have to particular services or a service 
system as a whole, and (2) the actual degree of utilization of services in 
given populations. Lack of access to particularly effective services may 
result in the relative ineffectiveness of those services or the service system, 
with resultant increased disturbance and morbidity. Variables such as 
location of services, acceptability of the services, access procedures, socio­
economic resources, client perceptions, provider biases, and culture/ 
ethnicity can serve as facilitating or inhibiting factors in accessing services. 
Perceived accessibility, actual services utilization versus need, measured 
attrition in the referral process or administrative procedures, such as 
waiting lists and registration, are important variables to consider in eval­
uating access to care or services. Services utilization is obviously related to 
access and can serve as an indirect measure of access. However, utilization 
of particular services and levels of care can serve as an indicator of the 
functioning of a system of care; for example, if more restrictive and costly 
services are overutilized, if lengths of stay are excessive while awaiting 
case management, or if community-based services are underutilized due 
to access barriers or limited capacity. Important measures include lengths 
of stay, number of visits or contacts, anticipated versus actual utilization, 
and service capacity at the levels of care being measured (Hoagwood et al., 
1996). 

2.3.7. Provider Characteristics and Attitudes 

As mentioned earlier, provider attitudes and the interaction with 
consumer attitudes can have a significant impact as early as the point of 
access to services, as well as later in the treatment process. Attitudes 
regarding particular clinically, culturally, and socioeconomically defined 
populations can impact on access procedures, clinical decision making, the 
strength of the therapeutic alliance, and, potentially, outcomes from treat­
ment. Degree of training and education, provider personality characteris­
tics, provider cultural competence, provider match to consumer and fam­
ily cultural background and values/beliefs, and provider or institutional 
orientation toward consumer-oriented, community-based treatment can 
be important process variables to measure. Services utilization versus 
need, dropout rates, clinical! functional outcomes, and consumer satisfac­
tion can be used in determining the outcome of these factors. For example, 
a study by Morrisey et al. (1995) evaluated different clinician characteris­
tics with respect to impact on hospitalization decisions with suicidal ado-
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lescents. Using 64 vignettes that systematically varied six common risk 
factors highly associated with suicidality, they found that proneness to 
hospitalization was related inversely to professional experience, and the 
decision to hospitalize was highly correlated to all established risk factors 
except gender. 

2.4. Research Design 

The nature of the chosen design can be a significant issue in mental 
health services research. Cross-sectional designs are most often used to 
address questions related to the current status of the level of care or service 
system being examined, including access, utilization, and process of care. 
Longitudinal designs following a cohort of clients over time are most 
appropriate in examining process and outcome of care. One drawback is 
the potential of behavioral changes, which may be specific to certain 
"cohort" groups that share many life experiences in common, and which 
make it hard to generalize results to other groups. Recruitment of a diverse 
sample of respondents that is well stratified for significant individual and 
family characteristics is important in this approach. The most difficult 
aspect of longitudinal designs is the problem of respondent attrition, 
which needs to be examined to determine the significance of findings. 
Studies in geographically stable populations and special procedures to 
track respondents can help reduce this problem. Pre-post or multiple 
baseline designs are often used to evaluate the effectiveness of a given 
treatment modality or service system. However, populations being served 
frequently change over time for other reasons than interventions pro­
vided, such as intervening events in their lives or in the community and 
cultural transition in culturally distinct populations. It is important to track 
such intervening changes as part of these designs. Single-case methodol­
ogy, which is increasingly used in behavioral intervention studies, is useful 
in evaluations involving small numbers. These can serially follow rating of 
certain target behaviors pre- and postintervention to determine effect. 
Experimental designs (random assignment to different interventions) are 
often considered the "gold standard" scientifically. These are at times 
difficult to achieve in the reality of service provision, can result in ethical 
problems when any group is not receiving a worthwhile intervention, and 
thus reinforce suspicions in respondent populations. However, an increas­
ing number of level of care studies use random assignment designs. More 
commonly used are control populations that are closely matched and 
receive different interventions or services. The degree of validity of indi­
vidual identifiers (see section 2.2.2) is critical for the success of population 
match assumptions (Pumariega et aI., 1995). 
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2.5. Definition of Process and Outcome Variables and Domains 

As part of designing an outcome evaluation design for either a pro­
gram or a system of care, population/ client, process, and outcome vari­
ables or indicators need to be defined. This allows the evaluation to answer 
the key questions of which interventions work, for whom, and how. 
Program characteristics are key in developing an evaluation design. The 
philosophy of the program or system determines the service model! 
modalities delivered (how it expects to facilitate change) and the associ­
ated process (performance) variables or indicators to be examined. Process 
indicators can include referral processes, access procedures and portals of 
entry, type and frequency of interventions, length of stay or number of 
visits, the degree to which individual treatment goals on care plans are 
met, staff involved in interventions, and demonstration of precursor 
changes or behaviors as a result of applying interventions. Outcome indi­
cators in evaluation usually involve domains of symptom change, func­
tional change, safety, cost, community tenure and level of restrictiveness, 
and consumer/family burden and satisfaction (Windle, Jacobs, & Sher­
man, 1986). 

2.6. Impact of Culture, Ethnicity, and Social Class 

Sampling of culturally diverse groups must assure that the racial! 
ethnic, socioeconomic status, age, and gender composition of any sample 
reflects the service population. However, sampling within a given region 
or cultural group / subgroup leads to limited applicability of the results to 
that group. Sampling across different regions or subgroups often requires 
a much larger sample. Oversampling or "stratification" of samples may be 
necessary if the samples of culturally diverse individuals are too few in 
number to be representative (Pumariega, 1996). 

Instrumentation and measurement strategies require many cultural 
considerations. Very few instruments are appropriate for use across differ­
ent cultural groups, and some have subtle but distinct cross-cultural biases 
and require significant adaptation and testing to establish operational 
equivalence (Guillermin, Bombardier, & Beaton,1993; Pumariega, 1996). A 
common issue that arises is that of using monocultural instruments versus 
cross-cultural instruments. Monocultural instruments may be necessary 
when specific aspects of a culture are being evaluated as a variable in the 
impact of a program, such as ethnic pride/ ethnic identification in a partic­
ular culture or particular cultural beliefs/practices. Such instruments 
should be normed for the particular group or subgroup studied. Cross­
cultural instruments, or instruments that theoretically can measure con-
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structs cross-culturally, are necessary when making comparisons across 
cultural/ ethnic groups. It may be necessary to develop parallel versions of 
instruments that are specific for different groups, or even to pilot-test 
instruments with community populations to obtain normative data and to 
identify problems in acceptability and response (Flaherty et aI., 1988; 
Pumariega et aI., 1995). 

Qualitative or ethnographic approaches may be useful in obtaining 
information about culturally related variables, eliciting important percep­
tions or attitudes without the stringent categorical limits of rating instru­
ments (Thornton & Garret, 1995). These approaches are often consonant 
with cultural values and means of transmission of information in many 
communities, which include differences in traditions of oral versus written 
language and what types of information are to be shared with whom and 
when. Such methods include open-ended questions, questionnaires, inter­
views, or observational data. Focus groups of community members or 
leaders can discuss certain problems to be addressed by intervention and 
develop associated themes. These can be compared to similar groups 
postintervention. Ethnographic measures can be used in combination with 
standardized instruments or to develop culturally sensitive standardized 
measures (Pumariega, 1996). 

There are special issues to be considered around the measurement of 
specific, culturally related variables. The measurement of cultural identi­
fication and cultural value orientation presents particular challenges. The 
construct that is most commonly endorsed in the cross-cultural mental 
health field is that of biculturality or multiculturality (i.e., that culturally 
diverse individuals by necessity are bicultural or multicultural in order to 
adapt successfully). The domain of cultural/ethnic identification must 
allow for this construct and take into account a number of domains, such 
as self-identification, relational patterns, culturally related traditions and 
preferences (clothing, foods, traditions, language, media), and cultural 
value orientation. In order to measure the latter, one must decide on a 
model for value orientation and on which dimensions to measure (e.g., 
attitudes vs. behaviors). For children and for many families, the measure 
of concrete behaviors or activity orientations (culturally related activities 
of daily living) are a valuable means of assessing cultural identification. 
These include simple activities such as the amount of time spent with 
family, religious activity, and time spent exposed to the media (Pumariega 
et aI., 1992). As mentioned previously, the measure of functional status 
needs to differ ecologically according to cultural expectations for role 
functioning. Measures of socioeconomic status need to be nonintrusive 
so as to assure cooperation and valid responses. The implementation 
of traditional cultural healing methods requires special measures and 
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methods for certification of the appropriate application of the intervention 
by a healer/practitioner, as well as for the expected behavioral or attitudi­
nal responses. The collaboration of spiritual healers in developing such 
measures may be crucial, so that they are relevant as well as acceptable 
(Pumariega, 1996; Robbins, 1994). 

3. Approaches to Children's Mental Health Services Research 
and Literature Review 

3.1. General Service Need, Utilization, and Access Studies 

A number of studies have been devoted to examining the factors that 
lead to access to and utilization of child mental health services. Barber, 
Rosenblatt, Harris, and Attkisson (1992) reported high levels of family 
dysfunction as well as physical and sexual abuse and neglect in their 
population in San Francisco. Furthermore, they found that age, race, his­
tory of physical and sexual abuse, and history of psychiatric diagnosis 
were correlated to previous out-of-home placements. In an epidemiologi­
cal survey of Puerto Rico, Staghezza-Jaramillo, Bird, Gould, and Canino 
(1995) evaluated the utilization of mental health services and barriers to 
access in 777 children and adolescents recruited from a probability sample. 
They found the overall service use was 6%, compared to 26% of children 
who had definite emotional disturbances and 5% who had probable dis­
turbances. Services were provided for the most part by psychologists and 
social workers in school settings and general medical facilities . In 60% of 
the children who did not receive services, parents saw their problems as 
"not serious," with children more likely to use services if teachers per­
ceived the need or if the rated high levels of parental criticism and hostility. 
Cullinan, Epstein, and Quinn (1996) examined individual identifying vari­
ables and their relationship to personal and family service utilization and 
level of placement in a suburban Chicago area system of care. They gener­
ated five "placement clusters": Cluster 1 (few placements), Cluster 2 (psy­
chiatric hospital), Cluster 3 (correctional), Cluster 4 (relative/friend and 
psychiatric hospital), Cluster 5 (foster care in combination with moderate 
extent of psychiatric hospital, group home, and residential placement). 
Clusters did not differ significantly by age group, diagnostic group, IQ, 
parental marital status, maternal employment, mental illness risk, sub­
stance abuse risk, criminal convictions risk, within-family violence risk, or 
total risks. However, they differed by sex, DSM status, medication usage, 
adjudications, living arrangements, and public assistance. Pavuluri, Luk, 
and McGee (1996) evaluated barriers to help seeking of preschool children 
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with behavioral problems using a screening and evaluation study of 320 
preschool children. Only 19% of children with behavioral disturbances had 
parents who crossed all filters in the screens for help seeking. Major blocks 
to help seeking were parental recognition of problems and overcoming 
perceived barriers to care. Parents sought help more frequently from 
informal sources and sought less help when they were separated, had a 
lower income, and faced multiple adversities, which are themselves risk 
factors for childhood behavioral disturbances. Leaf et al. (1996) reported 
on the mental health service utilization data from the Methodological 
Epidemiological Catchment Area (MECA) study, which is the methodo­
logical precursor to the national mental health epidemiological and ser­
vices study of children and adolescents, titled UNO-CAP (Utilization, 
Need, and Outcomes for Child and Adolescent Psychopathology). In this 
study, an instrument called the SURF (Services Utilization and Risk Factor 
Interview) was administered along with the DISC 2.3 diagnostic interview. 
It contained items on services utilization, barriers to access, demographic 
factors, functional impairment, and risk and protective factors to over 
1,000 respondents selected through community probability sampling at 
four sites (New York suburban, San Juan, New Haven, and Atlanta). 
Different patterns emerged in the four communities, with youth in New 
York being more likely to receive mental health services (18%), whereas 
youth in San Juan had the lowest utilization (7.4%); youth in New Haven 
were 3-3.5 times as likely to have services delivered in general medical 
settings as youth in New York and San Juan. Overall service use differed 
little in the three U.s. mainland sites, approximately 23% when parent and 
child reports (which were often divergent) were combined. About 38-44% 
of youth with psychiatric diagnoses received services in the last year, with 
youth with both psychiatric diagnoses and low levels of function as mea­
sured by the C-GAS being 6.8 times as likely to receive services as youth 
with neither condition. Both diagnostic status and level of function were 
found to contribute to service use equally in this study. 

3.2. Level-oj-Care Studies 

3.2.1. Inpatient and Residential Treatment 

Psychiatric hospitalization and residential treatment for children and 
adolescents was relatively rare until the 1970s and 1980s, when there was 
explosive growth in frequency and utilization as a result of higher levels of 
third-party reimbursement (England & Cole, 1992). More recently, it has 
been viewed with greater skepticism given its high cost as well as limited 
documentation of outcome. Some studies have supported the role of psy-
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chiatric hospitalization as only one component of the continuum of ser­
vices. They point to predictors of positive outcome from hospitalization, 
such as child and family characteristics, diagnostic features, length of stay, 
and aftercare (Blotcky, Dimperio, & Gossett, 1984; Curry, 1991; Dalton, 
Muller, & Forman, 1989; Parmalee et aI., 1995; Pfeiffer & Strzelecki, 1990). 
However, the child's adjustment within the hospital setting failed to pre­
dict long-term subsequent adjustment, with family support being a more 
significant predictor (Curry, 1991). The few studies that have compared 
inpatient treatment with nonresidential alternatives in children have not 
examined comparability of outcomes, but studies with adults have indi­
cated that alternatives to hospitalization had better outcomes, particularly 
in terms of clinical status, subsequent employment, independent living, 
expense of treatment, and readmission (Braun et aI., 1981; Kiesler, 1993). 
Hoagwood and Cunningham (1992) studied outcomes of all children and 
adolescents (n = 114) with serious emotional disturbances placed by school 
districts for educational purposes over a 3-year period. Total expenditures 
in treating these children totaled $5 million, averaging $80,000 per child. 
Only 25% of the children had a positive outcome, defined as return to 
school of a vocational placement, whereas another 11% made substantial 
progress, and 63% made minimal to no progress. There was no correlation 
between cost and outcomes, although positive outcomes were associated 
with shorter lengths of stay. Students with positive outcomes had more 
severe emotional disturbances at the outset. Again, family involvement 
and the availability of community-based services at discharge were the 
most likely reasons for positive outcomes. 

3.2.2. Community-Based Residential Services 

A number of innovative, community-based residential programs 
have been piloted, which offer an intermediate level of care with some of 
the advantages of traditional residential treatments without the degree of 
restrictiveness, cost, stigma, or disruption of family and community sup­
port usually associated with these. Few of these have been subjected to 
systematic evaluation in terms of outcomes and the process of care. For 
example, Chamberlain (1990, 1996), and Chamberlain and Weinrott (1990) 
reported on studies in which children were assigned to therapeutic foster 
care or regular care, with symptoms, function, and system outcomes being 
measured. Results indicated that children receiving this intervention could 
be better maintained in their communities with substantially lower costs 
than for control group homes. On 2-year follow-up data, fewer youth in 
the experimental group were rearrested (50% vs. 94%). In the only other 
control study of therapeutic foster care (Lee, Clark, & Boyd, 1994), fewer 
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aggressive behaviors and fewer general behavioral problems were re­
ported by children treated in therapeutic foster care compared to group 
homes. Friman, Toner, Soper, Sinclair, and Shanahan (1996) evaluated a 
program to protect the placements of 23 highly disruptive youth in volun­
tary residential care. They found that reduced client-to-staff ratios helped 
to reduce incidents of program restrictiveness and increased program 
success to a level comparable to that of a much less disruptive cohort. 
Teare, Authier, and Peterson (1994) studied the transition of youth from 
community shelters to formal treatment settings in 154 youth departing a 
homeless and runaway shelter. They found that youth at higher risk of 
suicide, and who came from more dysfunctional families, departed to 
more restrictive environments. 

3.2.3. Community-Based Nonresidential Services 

A number of innovative approaches that go far beyond traditional 
outpatient services in providing more intensive and individualized ser­
vices have been developed recently and are undergoing initial evaluation 
studies. Kiser, Culhane, and Hadley (1995) documented the increasing 
utilization of day treatment programs for the treatment of children and 
adolescents in their national survey of day-treatment programs. Out of 560 
programs nationally, 95 indicated that at least 50% of their clients were 
children and youth, with 29% of the programs providing acute care (under 
30 days), 29% providing intermediate care (30-90 days), and 50% provid­
ing long-term care (over 91 days) . For-profit programs had lower mean 
lengths of stay, treated more youth with affective disorders and substance 
abuse, provided more hours of psychological assessment per week, and 
charged more per day. Not-for-profit programs had longer lengths of stay, 
served more youth with conduct disorders, and reported lower costs. 
Bandoroff and Scherer (1994) evaluated a treatment program that combined 
a wilderness intervention with an intensive family-therapy intervention. A 
group of 66 youth initially underwent the wilderness intervention, with 27 
of them having families who also underwent the family-therapy interven­
tion. There was a high level of family satisfaction with both interventions 
(92%), with FAM III scores showing reductions from clinical levels to 
normal levels for families who underwent both interventions. Youth who 
underwent both interventions, as well as those who only received the 
wilderness intervention, experienced significant improvements in self­
concept and decreased reports of delinquency. These interventions are 
aided by the increasing effectiveness of cognitive, behavioral, family­
based, and psychopharmacological therapies. Behavioral and cognitive 
interventions have demonstrated effectiveness in depressive disorders, 
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anxiety disorders, psychosomatic disorders, and conduct disorders (Van 
Hasselt & Hersen, 1993). Diamond, Serrano, Dickey, and Sonis (1996) 
reviewed selected studies in family-based treatment as well as several 
process and outcome meta-analytic studies. They found that family-based 
therapies have demonstrated effectiveness in the treatment of schizo­
phrenia, conduct disorders, and substance abuse, and some effectiveness 
in the treatment of eating disorders, with family-based therapies being as 
effective as other modalities. Pharmacological effectiveness was demon­
strated in the treatment of attention deficit disorders, conduct disorders 
with aggression, schizophrenia, obsessive-compulsive disorder and other 
anxiety disorders, and beginning evidence of treatment effectiveness in 
the treatment of depressive disorders, eating disorders, and bipolar dis­
orders (Campbell & Cueva, 1995). 

Model programs that consist of multiple, coordinated, community­
based interventions based on an interdisciplinary approach have been 
successfully implemented and tested. For example, Moore (1990) reported 
on a Children's Mobile Outreach service that provides stabilization of the 
child in his/her present location at times of crisis. Their evaluation exam­
ined children who received evaluation services only, as well as children 
who also received mobile outreach services. The children mostly lived in 
natural or adoptive homes; some lived in shelters, group homes, and other 
nontherapeutic residential settings. The most common problems involved 
aggression, oppositional behavior, depression with suicidal ideation, and 
extreme agitation. At I-year follow-up, the program had successfully stabi­
lized 77% of its clients within their current residence, while only 42% of 
clients who received evaluation averted hospitalization. Pastore, Thomas, 
and Newman (1990) reported on the Therapeutic In-Home Emergency 
Services program, which provides a 6-week, home-based crisis interven­
tion and family therapy to youth at risk. In their evaluation of 50 youth 
served in their program, 45 of them remained in their home for over a year 
after discharge. Increases in family activities and extent of family partici­
pation were correlated with reduction in internalizing symptoms and 
improved self-control, and improved individual functioning was corre­
lated overall to family functioning. Doherty, Manderson, and Carter-Ake 
(1987) evaluated a program that offers time-limited hospitalization and an 
array of comprehensive services in the community for children with acute 
psychotic symptoms. They tracked 212 youth over a 3-year period and 
found an average length of stay of 28 hospital days, only 4% failing to 
comply with follow-up, and only 15% needing long-term residential ser­
vices, with 67% discharged to less-intensive outpatient care. Evans et al. 
(1994) randomly assigned children to receive either intensive case manage­
ment or family-based treatment foster care and assessed symptoms, func-
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tioning, parental skills, and placement rates. Outcome data at 6-month 
follow-up show no difference between groups in all variables except for 
parent skills, where greater improvement is seen in the family-based 
treatment group. Another randomized trial of intensive case management 
associated with the Robert Woods Johnson model demonstration program 
(Burns, Farmer, Angold, Costello, & Behar, 1997) found that adding a 
trained case manager to the child's treatment team resulted in longer 
participation in services, use of a wider array of services, use of fewer 
inpatient days, and increased child and family satisfaction, but no im­
provements in symptoms or functional level. Family support services are 
increasingly utilized in systems of care, but only a study by Reis, Bennett, 
Orme, and Herz (1989) has evaluated these services using a controlled 
design. In that study, no relationship was found between support services 
and improvements in symptoms, function, or family characteristics, 
though these need to be evaluated more appropriately from a consumer 
perspective. 

The wraparound model of care embodies this approach toward multi­
modal, community-based interventions. This model emphasizes aggres­
sive outreach, use of least restrictive treatment options, and individu­
alized, flexible, and unconditional child- and family-centered services for 
children imminently at risk or already in out-of-home placements. A 
number of studies of model wraparound programs in different commu­
nities across the nation with diverse populations of at-risk children and 
families have reported positive outcomes in terms of reduction of exter­
nalizing behavioral problems, level of function, reduction in out-of-home 
placement, improved family management skills and function, and consumer / 
family satisfaction (Clark, Lee, Prange, & McDonald, 1996; Eber, Osuch, & 
Redditt, 1996; Evans, Armstrong, & Kuppinger, 1996; Hyde, Burchard, & 
Woodworth, 1996). 

A similar approach that has attracted much attention recently is the 
Multisystemic Therapy (MST) model. This model has been applied with 
youth at risk of detention and incarceration, with significant results in 
reducing out-of-home placement, externalizing criminal problem behav­
iors, and rates of incarceration, particularly with rural minority youth in a 
randomized clinical trial (Scherer, Brondino, Henggeler, Melton, & Hanley, 
1994). As a follow-up to this randomized trial, Henggeler, Melton, Smith, 
Schoenwald, and Hanley (1993) examined the archival juvenile justice in 
the state to evaluate rearrest rates an average of 2.4 years later, and they 
found significantly lower rearrest rates inyouth who received MST. Schoen­
wald, Ward, Henggeler, Pickerel, and Patel (1996) demonstrated that MST 
resulted in sufficient cost offsets in terms of reduction of utilization of 
other more restrictive services (inpatient, residential, and incarceration) by 
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youth offenders with substance-abuse disorders. In the short term, it 
offsets the incremental cost of its implementation and potentially could 
result in longer term cost savings in service utilization. 

3.3. Evaluation of State and Regional Systems of Care 

The demographic, clinical, social, educational, and family functioning 
of children and adolescents served in system of care programs located in 
California (Barber, Rosenblatt, Harris, & Attkisson, 1992; Rosenblatt & 
Attkisson, 1992), Illinois (Epstein, Cullinan, Quinn, & Cumblad, 1994), and 
Virginia (Landrum, Singh, Nemil, Ellis, & Best, 1995) has been reported. 
The individuals served in such systems tend to be older adolescent males 
of average intelligence, who exhibit primarily externalizing disorders of a 
severe nature that are chronic in nature. They have received services from 
multiple agencies, with a high percentage having histories of out-of-home 
placement and being on psychotropic agents for behavioral control. How­
ever, there are few outcome data on the overall service system in these 
states or on the levels of care offered to children within them. In one of the 
few state level studies, Evans, Banks, Huz, and McNulty (1994) evaluated 
the state of New York's Children and Youth Intensive Case Management 
Program, whose goal is to maintain children in the least restrictive envi­
ronment appropriate to treatment needs. They reported on outcomes on 
1,700 children served by this program since 1988. Participation in the 
program was associated with fewer hospital admissions and fewer hospi­
tal days 2 years after intervention as compared to prior to enrollment. 

The Vermont system of care took a particularly innovative approach 
in developing the Wraparound Care Initiative for seriously emotionally 
disturbed children, which formally adopted the wraparound model of 
care. They have recently reported a number of outcome findings from their 
experience with this model. Pandiani, Maynard, and Schacht (1994) re­
ported on a study of service utilization and movement between residential 
options in the Vermont system and used data on 504 children and youth 
served over 3 years to develop a Markov mathematical model for the 
operation of the system in terms of its transition across levels of care. They 
then modeled the impact of home-based services and/ or step-down pro­
cedures, and found that both of these incrementally improved the opera­
tion of the system, with decreasing out-of-home placement and less restric­
tive placements when these were made. Bruns, Burchard, and Yoe (1995) 
evaluated outcomes for 27 youth with serious emotional disturbances 
served in the Vermont system using their wraparound model for over a 
year. They found a significantly lower incidence of negative behaviors 
placing them at risk out-of-home placement, increased compliance behav-
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iors, and decreases in Child Behavior Checklist (CBCL) Total Problem 
T-scores. Whereas 70% of the youth previously required inpatient or resi­
dential care, 89% were maintained in the community after a year, with 
lower total costs of care. Yoe, Santarcangelo, Atkins, and Burchard (1996) 
reported that after 12 months, 40 youth being served in this program were 
in significantly less restrictive community-based placements and had sig­
nificantly fewer problem behaviors than at intake. 

3.4. Evaluation of Model Demonstration Systems 

The emerging community-based, systems-of-care model was intro­
duced and tested over the past 5 years by a number of funding programs 
and in a number of sites. Over 20 pilot community programs were funded 
by the Center for Mental Health Services in the past 5 years and based in 
states and communities with strong child mental health services infra­
structures. The Robert Woods Johnson Foundation (England & Cole, 1992) 
developed and funded eight community-based systems-model demon­
stration sites that utilized existing community-based services and agen­
cies, organized them into networks with access to flexible funding for 
services for seriously emotionally disturbed children, and used actuarial 
models to develop capitation rates for the covered population of children 
as well as subcapitation rates for children with serious emotional distur­
bances. In North Carolina, the state's Division of Mental Health not only 
successfully obtained a model Robert Woods Johnson site in the Asheville/ 
Buncombe County area but was also responsible for the implementation of 
the Ft. Bragg Demonstration Project, the largest totally developed system 
of care and continuum of services project in the United States. 

3.4.1. Ventura Demonstration Project 

The Ventura Demonstration Project was one of the early children's 
system-of-care demonstrations, implemented in Ventura County, Califor­
nia. It piloted the integration of school-based and community-based resi­
dential services in combination with blended multiagency funding and 
services coordination. Jordan and Hernandez (1990) reported that the 
program offset two-thirds of its cost by reducing other public agency costs 
and improved a variety of client-related outcomes. These included re­
duced out-of-home placements, reduced recidivism of juvenile offenders, 
improved school attendance, and improved academic performance. As 
part of their evaluation, Jordan and Hernandez performed a cost-outcome 
analysis of their service planning. They found that treatment outcome was 
not directly related to its cost, suggesting that lower cost alternatives may 
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be as effective as more costly traditional services. Ichnose, Kingdon, and 
Hernandez (1994) evaluated the Ventura interagency resource and plan­
ning approach as applied to special education students with emotional 
disturbances, including developing day-treatment and school-based ser­
vices with blended mental health and school funding. They reported an 
average of 3.5 fewer youth per month placed in group homes, total savings 
of $290,000 in expected placement costs, and total revenues of $280,000 
from their community alternative programs. 

3.4.2. Fort Bragg Demonstration Project 

The Fort Bragg Demonstration Project is one of the largest systems-of­
care demonstration projects attempted so far. The project developed a 
comprehensive continuum of care for the children of military dependents 
at Fort Bragg, North Carolina, with ready access to outpatient and inter­
mediate levels of care, and relatively restricted utilization of residential 
and inpatient services. The outcomes from this system was compared to 
the usual CHAMPUS-funded services accessed by military dependents at 
various military installations nationally. Multiple process, quality, and 
outcome indicators (including clinical indicators, level of function, cost 
of care, etc.) were evaluated and compared across the experimental site 
and the usual service sites. 

The initial results from the evaluation of this project have been widely 
debated in the mental health services literature. They suggest that the 
demonstration project did achieve significantly lower restrictiveness of 
care, higher consumer satisfaction, greatly increased access to services 
(5.9% of children covered by the project were treated, as compared to 1.8% 
at the comparison sites), and greater funding spent in less restrictive 
services (27% spent on inpatient and residential services in the project, 
compared to 84% at the comparison sites). However, clinical and func­
tional outcomes were not significantly different overall, with split differ­
ences in different diagnostic subgroups favoring either the project or the 
comparison sites, and overall outcomes being no different. Additionally, 
costs were not significantly different and possibly were even somewhat 
higher in the demonstration site (Bickman, Heflinger, Lambert, & Sum­
merfeldt, 1996). A number of arguments have been raised regarding the 
lack of outcome effects found in the study, including the timing of the 
project's implementation (during Desert Storm and the Gulf War, which 
artificially drove up utilization); the design of benefits (no copayment), 
and relative lack of utilization review, provider accountability, and inten­
sive case management to mobilize children across levels of care, at a time 
when the implementation of managed care technologies was in full swing 
in private, third-party managers of CHAMPUS benefits; the choice of 
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multiple narrow-band measures of psychopathology, which may have 
inflated nonsignificant results, and the lack of long-term comparisons 
(which are yet to be performed, but are forthcoming); and possible prob­
lems with the interventions themselves, which some believed were not 
sufficiently embedded in the community (Burchard, 1996; Evans & Banks, 
1996; Friedman, 1996; Henggeler, Schoenwald, & Munger, 1996). 

3.5. Minority/Cross-Cultural Services Research 

Services research literature on underserved minority youth has been 
sparse and had initially focused on documenting racial differences in 
services provided. Comprehensive services studies require analyses of the 
relationship between race and service delivery across a range of services to 
include mental health, child welfare, and juvenile justice. However, 
studies to date usually have been iimited to one service area. For example, 
African-American children tend to remain in foster care for longer periods 
of time and have more foster-care placements than European-American 
children (Finch & Fanshel, 1985; Mech, 1983; Seaberg & Tolley, 1986; Shyne, 
1980; Shyne & Shroeder, 1978). Longres and Torrecilha (1992) examined the 
effect of race on the delivery of mental health and found a significant 
relationship between race and the service needs of racial ethnic minorities. 
Another similar finding was established by Hawkins and Salisbury (1983), 
who found that minority juvenile offenders in delinquency prevention 
programs were more likely to receive academic and employment skills in 
comparison to white youth, who were more likely to be given family 
services and affective skills training. 

Studies have shown culturally diverse children to be underrepre­
sented in mental health institutions and overrepresented in child welfare 
and juvenile justice settings and placements (Gruber, 1980). Studies have 
shown that even when the two groups are equally psychiatrically im­
paired, African-American adolescents are more likely to be incarcerated, 
and white adolescents are likely to be psychiatrically hospitalized (Cohen 
et al., 1990; Lewis, Balla, & Shanok, 1979; Lewis, Shanok, Cohen, Klingfield, 
& Frisone, 1980; Westendorp, Brink, Robertson, & Ortiz, 1986). In a large 
study of incarcerated youth in South Carolina (Pumariega et al., 1996a, 
1996b), incarcerated youth, comprised of over 70% African Americans, had 
higher levels of psychopathology than youth treated in community treat­
ment settings, but previously utilized lower levels of mental health ser­
vices. Cuffe, Waller, Cuccaro, Pumariega, and Garrison (1995) found signif­
icantly lower rates for treatment of depression among African-American 
youth as compared to white youth in their community-based longitudinal 
epidemiological study. Pumariega, Glover, Holzer, and Nguyen (in press) 
reported on results from a large school-based study of adolescent psycho-
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pathology and found that lower rates of mental health services utilization 
by Hispanic youth in Texas were related to ethnicity as well as to regional 
service accessibility, socioeconomic status, and family characteristics, con­
firming a more complex picture of factors determining mental health 
service use by underserved minority youth. 

Some studies have focused on biases in diagnostic assessment that 
may lead to different service utilization outcomes for minority youth. 
Kilgus et a1. (1995) examined racial differences in the final discharge diag­
noses of psychiatrically hospitalized adolescents. Mood and anxiety dis­
orders, as well as substance abuse, were more often diagnosed in whites 
than African Americans. They found that African-American adolescents 
were more likely involuntarily committed than white adolescents and had 
significantly more organic/psychotic diagnoses. Fabrega, Ulrich, and 
Mezzich (1993) found that African-American youth were overdiagnosed 
with conduct disorders and disruptive behavior disorders in their clinic 
population. Some authors (Cervantes & Arroyo, 1994) have indicated the 
need for caution in the utilization of the standard psychiatric diagnostic 
nosology across different ethnic groups, where symptom expression and 
clustering may differ. 

4. Future of Child Mental Health Services Research 

4.1. Anticipated Developments and Advances 

4.1.1. Large System Studies 

The immediate future of child mental health services research looks ex­
tremely promising, especially given emerging and newly initiated studies. 
The evaluations of the systems of care model demonstration programs 
funded by the Robert Woods Johnson Foundation, the Casey Foundation, 
and the Center for Mental Health Services are soon to be available, enrich­
ing the knowledge base about the operational characteristics of community­
based systems of care for children and adolescents as well as the methodo­
logical basis for such research and evaluation. The diversity of sites, popu­
lations being served, service system structures, levels of care and interven­
tions, and degree of interagency involvement will provide much data on 
the effectiveness of different systems of care approaches and interventions 
with diverse populations of children and families. 

The implementation and completion of the study on Utilization, 
Needs, and Outcomes for Child and Adolescent Populations (UNO-CAP), 
the national multisite child and adolescent study on the epidemiology, 
services utilization, and outcomes for children with mental! emotional 
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disturbances in the United States, will be completed within the next 3-4 
years. This study will provide data that should help us understand the 
extent of need for child mental health services on a national scale, as well 
as provide information on the effectiveness of our current service systems 
and our evaluation and research methods. The results of UNO-CAP will 
certainly fuel the national debate on the extent of resources that should be 
allocated for child mental health services given both the need for such 
services and their current effectiveness and efficiency (Jensen, Hoagwood, 
& Petti, 1996). 

4.1.2. Methodological Advances 

In addition to the advances in design and instrumentation that the 
aforementioned studies will provide, other developments in the mental 
health services field will impact our capacity to study systems of care and 
their components. The push toward financing and management of costs 
through managed care technologies is contributing to the development of 
more complete and reliable electronic clinical records and databases, 
which include not only client characteristics but also provider characteris­
tics and service provision data. These management-of-information sys­
tems are critical for the calculation of financing formulas, for the measure 
of clinical outcomes, and for quality assurance and improvement. Addi­
tionally, managed care networks are promoting the development of sys­
temwide measures of process and outcome variables for the evaluation of 
contract performance and of quality and cost assessment. For example, 
some state-level public mental health managed care contracts as well as 
model requests for proposals such as that developed by the American 
Academy of Child and Adolescent Psychiatry (Pumariega et al., 1996; 
Pumariega, 1997) call for the development of clear process and outcome 
measures and extensive management of information systems to support 
their measurement and analysis. The advent of electronic clinical records, 
with direct data input by the clinician and including the use of systematic 
clinical and functional rating instruments, could revolutionize the field of 
child mental health services research, making critical data on most of these 
systems readily analyzable (Pumariega et al., 1997b). 

4.2. Future Needs in Services Research 

In spite of research activity currently underway, there are still areas 
where significant deficits exist in our knowledge base on children's mental 
health services and systems of care. The areas listed are identified by a 
number of authors (Hoagwood & Hohmann, 1993; Jensen et al., 1996; 
Kupermine & Cohen, 1995; Pumariega, 1996). 
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4.2.1. Hospitalization and Residential Treatment 

Although these are the most restrictive and costly levels of care in any 
system, there is still a paucity of well-designed studies that document their 
relative effectiveness and appropriateness. Randomized collaborative 
studies with sufficiently large cohorts that examine the relative benefits of 
these interventions in different clinical populations and more clearly de­
fine their role within the service system are still needed. 

4.2.2. Studies of Community-Based Systems of Care Models 

The impact of parent, family, and consumer involvement in systems of 
care has yet to receive much formal attention in spite of data that point to 
the importance of these variables. The system outcomes of increased 
utilization of alternative interventions at less restrictive levels of care, 
interventions and services with preventive value at the most accessible 
levels (such as school and home-based interventions), and the integration 
of these different services using management of information systems 
based on electronic database technologies to facilitate seamless level of 
care transition and continual case management are additional areas of 
focus for future research. 

4.2.3. Culturally Competent and Appropriate Services 

Studies that examine factors impacting on the service need/utiliza­
tion, barriers to access to care, bias in clinical assessment, bias in service 
system triage and referral (mental health vs. juvenile justice or child wel­
fare), and comparable effectiveness of child mental health services for 
underserved minority populations are urgently needed. The impact of 
cultural competence training for providers, culturally competent services, 
and access to professionals of color need to be studied given the rapidly 
rising population of children of color in the United States without a com­
parable increase in professionals of color. These studies should help estab­
lish comparability of outcomes for children of color, who require different 
treatment approaches and different concepts and measures of functional 
and clinical outcomes (Pumariega, 1996). 

4.2.4. School-Mental Health Interface 

The settings where children are most readily accessible, with the 
greatest potential for preventive impact on the largest number of children, 
are school settings. However, relatively few studies have evaluated the 
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impact of school-based mental health services or preventive interventions, 
nor the role of school-based services within a wider system of care. 

4.2.5. Interface with Juvenile Justice and Child Welfare 

The community-based-systems perspective has allowed us to recog­
nize children and youth within these two systems as being highly at risk, 
or already having a high percentage with serious emotional disturbances. 
Given the foreseeable levels of psychosocial morbidity and resulting soci­
etal costs, much attention still needs to be devoted to interventions and 
systems approaches to address their needs. With the juvenile justice popu­
lation, early access to mental health services as a means of diversion from 
incarceration, the impact of court decisions, and access and effectiveness 
of mental health services in preventing recidivism need to be studied. The 
impact of mental health services on children under child welfare custody, 
particularly on permanency planning and reunification for children in 
foster care, deserve continued emphasis. 

4.2.6. Innovative Treatment/Service Approaches 

The effectiveness of such innovative treatment and service approaches 
as family preservation, therapeutic foster homes, wraparound services, 
and other alternative interventions deserve further systematic evaluation 
that both establishes their longer-term effectiveness and appropriateness 
with different populations of seriously emotionally disturbed children and 
demonstrates their cost-effectiveness. 

4.2.7. Cost-Containment and Reimbursement Mechanisms 

The current movement toward managed care should serve as the 
ultimate incentive for right-sizing systems of care, with an inverted pyra­
mid of greatest access and funding to less costly, preventive services and 
least access and funding to more restrictive, costly services. However, 
there is a danger of these changes resulting in services restrictions based 
purely on financial and political pressures and not related to the clinical 
and functional needs of children and families. Research in this area should 
evaluate the application of systems of care principles in children's mental 
health managed care (American Academy of Child and Adolescent Psy­
chiatry, 1996). Studies of state-managed Medicaid waivers need to use 
epidemiological field methods to study their impact on access to care, 
quality of care, patterns of utilization, and outcomes. Studies should evalu­
ate capitated financing in children's systems of care, including sub capita-
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tion for seriously emotionally disturbed, the relative merits of psycho­
social versus medical necessity in establishing service need, and the use of 
blended funding from multiple service agencies while assuming compre­
hensive shared risk for psychosocial morbidities. 

4.2.8. Interagency Collaboration and Coordination 

An increasing trend toward multiagency programs for the coordina­
tion of services to children involved with multiple agencies opens oppor­
tunities for studies of services coordination and planning approaches, 
the use of blended flexible funding, and integrated cross-agency case 
management. 

4.2.9. Consultation-Liaison Psychiatry and Behavioral Medicine 

This area has traditionally involved the delivery of mental health 
services for acutely and chronically ill children and their integration with 
their specialty medical care. With the increasing primary care emphasis in 
medicine, new areas of focus have emerged. These include services inter­
face with family practice and pediatrics, evaluation of mental health ser­
vices delivered by primary care physicians, and effectiveness of integrated 
service delivery models. The effectiveness of services for children with 
medical illnesses and disabilities in reducing their overall health-care 
utilization and improving their individual and family functional status 
deserve further attention. 

4.3. Application of Research Findings in Policy and Service Systems 
Planning 

The ultimate value of child mental health services research is in 
providing an objective basis for rational policy decisions about the organi­
zation and financing of needed services and the service system as a whole. 
The potential impact of this research on state Medicaid waivers and man­
aged care programs, as well as the design of local systems of care, is 
invaluable. The methods that have been developed within a relatively 
short time in child mental health services research make it feasible to 
incorporate ongoing evaluation into systems of care for continual im­
provement and midcourse corrections as the nature of our populations of 
children and youth and the types of problems faced change over time. 
Additionally, such research methods should help us focus increasing at­
tention on preventive strategies that would ultimately benefit society 
the most. 
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